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S i ASSIGNMENT

From: Date: Veh No: SFL Wﬁ Y1 Regn: WJ Sl

Estimatad Cost: Type: | M.Cycle | Bus | Van hLorry | Taxi ] Prima Mover /
[W5|TP BESJUDBESIE‘H’AHH\{_Iﬂ Truck | Trailer or i 2l

To Inspect Vehicie No: S FZ- A0% & Make: 'M—SLITE W 13[ GC ~'§KF%

aWorkshop s “TRANS Tl Colour bt AG:  Insured | S NIENA_

of X1 -;ka (Vo ot SpReading &) v{“" T/Radio: Insured | Stel | NI/ NA

Insured: 124 EngiNao: St :

il v WPo2229¥Z95 132953

Claims Na. Gen. Cond: Good / Faich Poor [ Burnt

Sum Insured: Excoss: Sleering: Igorder JJammed [ Leaked | Burnt or

{Client's Record) Brake: Jnordér | Jammed [ Leaked / Burnt or
Make of Ve: Modi:  Nil | | STD AIRim or
| Tyre Size: B 235 L;_‘S'I-RJK:E__ e
(Policy Condition) T L b s DA ]
Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | /5 | BS/DUN/EXNOVAI GY [FSLIZATMIC | OHTSU | i3] SUMI/
repair at the time of inspection. TOYO | YOKO or
Bal. or Market Value: LIt Eront Rear i
IDAC Accident Rporl; Consistent? : Yes or No RfBal, mm R/Bal. mm
GlA | PR Seen: Consistent? : Yes or No L/Bal. mm L/Bal. mm
Est. Repairs: days ~ Res. Yes or No D. {}A ﬂ}[hL 'ﬁ D.OolL ;‘\;’o{,‘[ﬁ »
Lurm Sum; % 3Val: Yes or No Survey held at
CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS Des. of Damages : Frt | Rear | 05 / NJ'E [ UiC | Rooftop or
Vahlcheo W foOWT} o o o ql__ sl M R e
e Persan Conlacted: The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affecied due 10 colision.
Date  Time | Action / Instruction TR IEHIET e
bﬁf/ﬂ 7 S R U A7) wf’ M A ,muz
e f‘f 4.029. 2L ] 7
ST S "I:-i‘ F £ 1 2 LY .

sl b ey D: Preli. Report
lofoB r‘j
) Ty [ Final Report

CaterTeme, Flie Return lo7

413

Report Format ;
Lump Sum

(¢ £ 294.99 0P)

Days Of Repair: jf' b‘u.
Resurvey No. of Trip: | |Survey Fee: ot K
' Transportation: B0
Add Fee: ‘Site Insp (% )|_8+RS__SI _F-m ik
 Interview {5. £ ; }! Photos i -_’:l}
: Tech. Invs f$.__ _ _ }Ii Diters R
D: Weekend (% ‘JI '
| TOTAL
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o Fie Lid Company Registration Nao. 19360T10ER

£1 UL AVE 1, #02.25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PAREK, SINGAPORE 308933 TEL 1 (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564015

Your Ref: D19003672MFSH Date: 17 June 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19010193/R 1sd3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SFZ 205G _.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 14/06/2019 at the premises of M/s Stuttgart Auto Pte Ltd and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;5% 1542871 8

Revised Estimate Amount 1 8% 8.992.10

“Check” Items Amount : 8% 2.747.79

Total : 5%

Market Value : 8%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

MNett Value 1 53

Description of Damage: -

The vehicle sustained damages

at the o/s front portion. el [ | £ | o

‘*ﬁ:n-&.ijﬁ'

affside

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 5 days

Yours faithfully,
Mohammed Rasul
Automotive Assessor



MS @ FirstCapital

b Raffies Quay #21-D0 Sinpapore 048580
Tet (B5] 6222 2311 Faw: (65) 6222 3547

MS First Capital Insurance Limited comeg bo, 2950000060 C5T Reg Mo M2 QU0LGTS 4

Chalms & Metor Undenwiting Dept 36 Robinson Read E16-01 Cly House Singapore 068877

Tek (5] 6507 3048 Fax: [B5) 6507 3045
wiwhw.msfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
04-08-2019 Qur Ref No.
03-06-2019 Claim Type.
SHABESE6E Third Party Vehicle.

27TA TANJONG PENJURLU

EVA KOK

63310880/ 53310683 Fax No.
DIRECT SETTLEMENT:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA Fax No.

MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D15003672MFSH

Third Party

SFZ905G

63310680

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

STUTTGART AUTO PTE

Attention.
LTD
MA TP Solicitor Fax No.
HEMRY KAOQ

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

MNA

X

N\ | i lll.f. T— .

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is & computer generated letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 August 2019 3:44 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION MS FIRST CAP TP - SFZ905G.xlsx

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email; Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

¥ EAES L.
SR mE = mn Spue ke Earthe Print only when necessary:

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August, 2019 5:47 AM

To: jessicahsi@eurokars.com.sg

Cc: janice.syn@porsche.com.sg; eva.kok@eurokars.com.sg; rickteo@eurokars.com.sg; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: FINALIZATION MS FIRST CAP TP - SFZ905G.xlsx

Hi lessicahs,

Finalise amount confirmed as per attached

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: Azs6-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408033])

SLZRER SR Save the Earthe Print only when necessary:

From: jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg [mailto:jessicahs@eurokars.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August, 2019 9:26 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); Admin A

Cc: janice.syn@porsche.com.sg; eva.kok@eurokars.com.sq; ricktep@eurokars.com.sq
Subject: FINALIZATION MS FIRST CAP TP - SFZ905G. xlsx

Dear Rasul,
Please find our computation attached for your agreement.

COR: $8,399.89 before GST



05 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for liability/wait for
survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH)

Appreciate your confirmation for this case urgently.

Thank you very much.

Regards,

Jessica Shastri

Admin Executive = Insurance Claims

27A, Tanjong Penjuru

Singapore 609042

Dir: +65 6331 0691 Fax; +65 63310690 Email: iessicahs@eurckars.com.sg
Website: www.eurokarsgroup.com




Shirigz Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 12:15 PM

To: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie'; 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003672MFSH/
Attachments: SFZ 905G - Preli Advise .pdf

Dear Henry,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SFZ 905G.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 17 June 2015 12:10 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003672MFSH/1

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailtr:r.cwsrnntorr:]aims@msﬁrstcapitai.mm,sg]

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 5:49 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai lie
<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003672MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WwWW.avg.com




T:E‘TE% STUTTGART AUTO PTE LTD Rl
@2&" 27A TANJONG PENJURU, SINGAPORE 609042 3 EWRORA
i ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIRS
(T == —— ey | ——
S FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD MAME : Ms Teo Yes Wei WIP - 46622
36 Robinson Road, ADDRESS : 174 Jalan Kakatua EXCESS !
City House #16-01 Singapore 598535 DATE: 06.06.2019
singapaore 068877
ATTHM. ; MOTOR CLAIMS TEL :
FAX :
VEH NO : SF79056 DATE IN : CONTACT PERSON : EVA 63310683
CHASSIS NO : WPOZZZ982F5132938 | MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : TP
MODEL : Boxster § DATE REG.: 08.09.2015  |POLICY NO. :
NATURE OF WORKS
S/ND Parts Desm__gﬂor]
aTy REVISED PRICES
i |anrronT Fenper S efledr 1 PS81-503-032-00-GRV 3 1,083.50
2 |rueLFiLer FLap Y ";r — 1 PO81-503-034-00-GRV 5 123.30
3 |River X ; i 3 P939.-591-712-40- § 3,60
4 |FrONT BUMPER F{W‘.\"' 1 P9E1-505-010-51- g 1,739.40
s |Nozzie HOWDERIH 9 nm 1 PO81-505-761-00- $ 30.00
6 |nOz21E HOLDERRH Y& ) 1 P981-505-762-00- s 30.00 |
7 | DIRECTION INDICATOR UGHT (RH)  Set 1 P991-631-156-02- 5 £9.00 {7
8 |Disc WHEEL sen — ¥ A7 1 PO81-362-160-12-887 $ 3,053.10
TOTAL PARTS 5 6,131.90
LESS 10% $ 613.19
TOTAL PARTS COST s 5,518.71
Labour Description
il
1 |TO REPLACE FRONT BUMPER, RH FRONT FENDER & TO REPAIR ALL [ 5Co |5 q,aﬁon
AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT. 4
L
2 |TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER, RH FRONT FENDER & F'LIEf;\L.I"l.P. ;"M 5 &
3 | We-RERAEEa-RC TYRE, 235 / 35 ZR20 ar X s 980.00
4 |TOMOUNT 1 PC SPORT RIM AND CONDUCT WHEEL BALANCING. NETT $ lEﬂ.EEI i
5 |TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY & CONDUCT FULL WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NETT 5 680.00
6 |TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING, METT 5 N 200.00 L~
Fd
7 |TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS. NETT $ - em.f,_ﬂ" L~
8 |SUNDRIES. NEC NETT ) 50011 |
TOTAL LABOUR - 5 9,9 lﬂ.m_
TOTAL PARTS 5 5,518.71

Page 1ol 2



TOTAL 5 2 & 15,428.71
' LESS EXCESS 5 -
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS ] E
GST 7% 5 5
GRAND TOTAL 5 5 =

REMARKS

THIS 15 OMLY AN ESTIMATE FROM VISUAL INSPECTION AND SHOULD THERE
BE MORE DAMAGES FOUND DURING THE PROCESS OF REPAIRING, YOLN WILL
BE INFORMED BEFORE THE REPAIRS ARE BEING CARRIED OUT

TAKE NOTE THAT SHOULD YOU DECIDE NOT TO PROCEED WITH THE REPAIRS, A
QUOTATION FEE OF $400.00 WILL BE APPLY AS ACCORDINGLY FOR MAN-HOLURS INVOLVED
N SOURCING FOR PARTS PRICE AS WELL AS LABOUR CHARGES.

QSN

1—Lf Goojesk ¥

srifuf

rtr[ut(ﬁ & [Lrw

(\Q,_gu-u) ] Qf’ﬁ“ ""L("“"‘f

A
o
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STUTTGART AUTO PTE LTD

K oy 1D
27A TANJONG PENJURU, SINGAPORE 600042 (=) ELROKARS Ol
FINALIZATION COST OF REPAIRS
—I —i =
M5 FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD MAME : Ms Teo Yee Wei Wip : 46622
36 Robinson Road, ADDRESS : 174 Jalan Kakatua EXCESS :
City House #16-01 Singapore 598535 DATE: 06.06.2019
Singapore 068877
ATTN. : MOTOR CLAIMS TEL:
FAX :
VEH NO : SFZ905G DATE IM : CONTACT PERSON ; EVA 63310683
CHASSIS NO ; WPOZZZ9BZF5132538 MILEAGE : TYPE OF CLAIM : TP
MODEL : Boxster 5 DATE REG.: 08.09.2015 POLICY NO. :
NATURE OF WORKS
5/NO Parts riptian
ary REVISED PRICES
1 |RH FRONT FENDER 1 F531-503-032-00-GRY b % 1,083.50
2 |FUELFILLER FLAP 1 PSE1-503-034-00-GRY 5 5 123.30
3 |RIVET 3 P999-591-712-40- 5 5 3.60
4 |FRONT BUMPER 1 P981-505-010-51- $ - 5 1,739.40
5 |MOZZLE HOLDER LH 1 F981-505-761-00- 5 - 5 30.00
& |MOZZILE HOLDER RH 1 P921-505-762-00- 5 5 30.00
7 |DIRECTION INDICATOR LIGHT [RH) 1 P951-631-156-02- - 659.00 | & 69,00
§ |DISC WHEEL 1 POB1-362-160-12-8BZ 5 3,053.10 | & 3,053.10
TOTAL PARTS 5 3,122.10 | & 6,131.90
LESS 10% % 3122115 613.19
TOTAL PARTS COST g 2,809.89 | 5 5518.71
Labour Description
—ee—————
1 |TO REPLACE FROMT BUMPER, RH FRONT FENDER & TO REPAIR ALL 5 - 1,560.00 | & 4,680.00
AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT,
2 |TO RESPRAY FROMT BUMPER, RH FRONT FENDER & FUEL FLAP, 4 240000 | % 2,600.00
3 |TOREPLACE 1 PC TYRE, 235 / 35 ZR20 5 - 5 580.00
4 |TO MOUNT 1 PC SPORT RIM AND CONDUCT WHEEL BALANCING. 5 12000 | & 120.00
5 |TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY & CONDUCT FULL WHEEL ALIGNMENT, 5 -~ 6BO.00 | & 680.00
& |TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER FUNCTIONING. 5 - 20000])5% 200.00
7 |TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR WORKS 5 600.00 | 5 600.00
B |SUNDRIES. & . 3000(5 50.00
TOTAL LABOUR 5 5,590.00 | 5 9,910.00
TOTAL PARTS 5 2,809.89 l & 5,518.71
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TOTAL 5 8,399.89 | & 15,428.71
LESS EXCESS 5 _
TOTAL AFTER EXCESS 5 8,399.89

GST 7% 5 587.99 | § -
GRAND TOTAL 5 8,987.88 | § -

NUMBER OF DAYS: 5 WORKING DAYS{EXCLUDE WAITING FOR SURVEY, AUTHORIZATION, PARTS, SAT,SUN & PH)

Papge 2 of 2



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI9010193/R1sd3n2
#16.01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068577 Date:  22:08:2019 I“I‘l”l""ll”"”"l
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA BESBE Veh. Inspected SFZ 905G
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19003672MFSH Excess () 0.00
Assign From HENRY KAD Assign Date 07/06/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model PORSCHE BOXSTER 981 C.C 3436
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. WPOZZZ987F5132938 Colour BLACK
Odometer 82159 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/35 ZR20 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Front Tyre |235/35 ZR20 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |235/35 ZR20 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |235/35 ZR20 PIRELLI & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  03/06/2013 Inspection Date 14/06/2019
Survey held at STUTTGART AUTO PTELTD
12 SUNGEI KADUT AVE .
SINGAPORE 729648
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTII.I'IATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




7L
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFZ 905G
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|RH FRONT FENDER TO REPAIR SEE 1,083.50 -
LABOUR
1|FUEL FILLER FLAP NOT NECESSARY 123.30 -
J|IRIVET NOT NECESSARY 3.60 -
1|FRONT BUMPER TO REPAIR SEE 1.738.40 -
LABOUR
1|MOZZLE HOLDER LH NOT NECESSARY 30,00
1|NOZZLE HOLDER RH MOT NECESSARY 30.00 -
1|DIRECTION INDICATOR LIGHT (RH) SCRATCHED 69.00 69.00
1|DISC WHEEL SCRATCHED 3,053.10 3,053.10
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -613.19 -312.21
5518.71 2,809.89
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SUNDRIES (SN} MECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|TYRE 235/35 ZR20 (5N) NOT NECESSARY 8980.00 -
1,030.00 30.00
LABOUR
TO REPLACE FRONT BUMPER.RH FRONT FENMDER & TO 4,680.00 1,560.00
REPAIR ALL AREAS AFFECTED BY THE ACCIDENT,
TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER,RH FRONT FEMDER & 2.600.00 2,400.00
FUEL FLAP.
TO MOUNT 1PC SPORT RiM AND CONDUCT WHEEL 120.00 120.00
BALANCING.
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY & CONDUCT FULL 680.00 680.00
WHEEL ALIGMNMENT.
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM FOR PROPER 200.00 200.00
FUMCTIONING.
TO REPROGRAMME AFTER THE ACCIDENT REPAIR 600.00 G00.00
WORKS.
8.880.00 5,560.00
GRAND TOTAL 15,428.71 8,399.89
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 8,399.89|

Report Ref No. CS/IFCI18010193/R1sd3n2



Page No.:2 of 2
Report Ref No. CS/FCM2010193/R1sd3n2

M 2

MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng,AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTEES:- This Report is made solely for the use and banefit of the Cliant namad an tha front page of this Repaen.
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