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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

e —————————

From; Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 9 March 2020 4:28 PM

To: ‘Tan Kah Leong'; 'assignments'

Cc: 'SUR'

Subject: CLOSE FILE FOR SMF B439E- SNM19D202506C02

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already private settled.

Mo survey was done for this case.

we will close this file at our end without billing.

Best Regards

GNIVITHA
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Litd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(4080233)

ﬁ AVG This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
: T wWwwLave.com



View Sent Message

This mail is associated with

“SMFBA39E (SNM19D202506C02)
[GBI522]]
e
JOHNSON KHOO
Jun 6 2019 12:00PM

Bormeo Motors (S) Pre Lid

Resend | View Recipients | _Print Message | Delete Message | Forward |
From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 09/03/2020 16:29 PM.
To KahLeong. Tan@sg.cntaiping.com
Subject SMFE439E
'Dear SirfMdm, . . =

Please be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already private settled,

Mo survey was done for this case.

we will close this file at aur and without bllling,

|Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | emall: assignments@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY ' -

There are no documents,




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

— Case | Notfied | EsiSubmitted | AdjAssigned | AdjRot | Ad)Submitted | Ins Authed | Ststus
07 Jun 2019 10 Jum 2019 New Assignment
Main 14:43 Cancel Case
Assign :

Reference Claim Details
| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS - - [Created by insurer]
| insured: I
Main Claimant: JOHNSON KHOO, ID: 57732996% :
Vehicle Reg. No.. SMFB439E  Dateof Loss: |06/06/2019 12:00 - :59
|| Claim Type: _'!r'F'"ri 'SINHIQDEDZSDECOE Policy/Cover Note No.: | DMCVSN1840211800
I Vehicle Reg. No. (Insured): GB1522) Policy No. {Clalmant):

(55350.00
Repairer:. Borneo Motors (S) Pte Ltd (Ubi) 17 Ubi Road 4, 406611 Lbi - Tel: 6631 1868

. ) China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (MQ) - Tel: 638% 6111 ... [Handied by Tan Kah
" Handling Insurer: Leong - 63896153)

Adjuster: = LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Final Rpt due 19/06/2019]

. ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | Compose Case Mall
I There are ne mail for this case.
=

. ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS

View All |  SearchTasks |  Create NewTask | Camplete |

| Due Data Priority Type Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
I} Ne results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=d... 10/6/2019



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 10 June 2019 9:39 AM

To: Ashlyn Chng; assignments

Ce: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident involving SMFB439EL & GBJ522) DOA
06/06/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Ashlyn,

We refer to your email of 10.06.2019,

We will be assigning M/LKK. Auto Consultants to survey your client’s vehicle on a without prejudice basis.
Aside to LKK,

Please refer to the email below & proceed to survey the third party vehicle.

Thank you.

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assistant Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: {65) 6388 61983 | F: (B85) 6222 1033

W www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook com/chinataipingsg/

Dusclanmer This e-mail and any files transmilfed with if is intended only for the named recipients and may cormtawn confidential infarmation. Any
unauthonzed disclosune, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the infended recipien!, please
nolify the sendar immediately. Please delele the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter

From: Ashlyn Chng [mailto:Ashlyn.Chng@inchcape.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 10 June, 2019 9:09 AM

To: Tan Kah Leong <KahLeong.Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC <SuraidahB.Saidi@inchcape.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident involving SMFB439EL & GBJ522) DOA 06/06,/2019

Dear Kah Leong,
We would like to choose MARCUS CHUA to conduct the assessment. Please revert with your insured liability.
Thank you.

Regards,

Ashlyn Chng

D: 6631 1874 | F: 6872 7260 | E: Ashlyn.chng@inchcape.com.sg
Inchcape Centre




Level 4, Bodycare Centre

2 Pandan Crescent

Singapore 128462

www.bhorneomotors.com.sg | www lexus.com.sg | www.toyotasingapore.com.sg | www.hino.com.sg | www.suzukicar.com.sg

From: Tan Kah Leong <Kahleong. Tan@sg. cntaiping.coms
Sent: Monday, 10 June 2019 8:44 AM
To: Ashlyn Chng <Ashlyn.Chne@inchcape.com . sg>; Suraidah B Saidi PTCBC <SuraidahB Saidi@inchcape.com sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident involving SMF8439EL & GBJ522) DOA 06/06/2019

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization (Inchcape). Do not click links or open
attachments unless you recognise the sender and know the content is safe.

Without Prejudice

Cear Ashlyn,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshop.
We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

ADRIAM LING

LOW SAR HUEI

SEE CHEW SENG

MOHD FADHILAH BIN OSMAN
KING QUO QIANG

KENMETH KONG

HONG FOOK CHOY

CHUA WELIE

MARCUS CHUA

HENRY NG

Please let us know within two(2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor surveyors as a
single joint expert.

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single
joint expert.

Thank you

Regards

Tan Kah Leong
Assisiani Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896193 | F: (B5) 6222 1033

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook.com/chinataipingsg/

Disciaimer This e=mail and any files fransmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information Any
unauthonzed disclosure. wse or dissarmination of this message. either in whole or partial. is prohibited. If you are nol the intended recigient. please
nistify the sender immediately. Please delate the e-mail arnd any copies of if thereaftar



From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Friday, 7 June, 2019 10:50 AM

To: Tan Kah Leong <Kahleong Tan@sg.cntaiping.com>; Ashlyn.Chng@inchcape.com.sg:
SuraidahB.Saidi@inchcape.com.sg

Cc: Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg. cntaiping.com>

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident involving SMF8439EL & GBJS22) DOA 06/06/2019

Dear Kah Leong,

Please conduct PRS — TP: SMF8439E (SNM19D202506) soonest possible.
File with OIC — Kah Leang - 63896193

From: Ashlyn Chng [mailto:Ashlyn.Chng@incheape.com.sg)
Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 10:29 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement (SM) - Accident involving SMF8439EL & GBJS522) DOA 06/06/2019
Hi,
Reference to the above-mentioned.

Please find attached herein a copy of our client’s Accident Report, Damaged Photos & Estimate Invoice for your kind
perusal.

As our client is claiming against your insured GBJ522) thus would appreciate if you could revert to us on the liability
urgently or we could settle the case under Direct Settlement with Car Rental of @ 5130 per day x no. of days as
recommended by your appointed surveyor.

Kindly have your surveyor to contact our Motor Claim Assessor, Sam Joi @ 9847 6209 / 6631 1687 is located at 17
Ubi Road 4 for an appointment to inspect our client’s vehicle (currently vehicle NOT in workshop).

As for liability clearance, kindly revert to this email.

Your kind attention into the above is greatly appreciated.
Thank you!

Regards,

Ashlyn Chng

D: 6631 1874 | F: 6872 7260 | E; Ashlyn.chng@inchcape,com.sg
Inchcape Centre

Level 4, Bodycare Centre

Z Pandan Crescent

Singapore 128462

www.borneomotors.com.sg | www.lexus.com.sg | www. toyotasingapore.com.sg | www.hino.com.sg | www.suzukicar.com.sg
This g=mail (and any attachment) is intended for the addressee(s) only and contains information that is legally privileged and confidential, If vou are not the

intended recipient, please be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any use, dissemination, distribution, printing or copying of this
communication i$ unauthorized and strictly prohibited. Kindly notify us by replying to the sender’s e-mail address and delete this e-mail immediately. E-mail
Lransmissions cannol be guarantesd to be secure or ermor-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, delayed or incomplete, or could
contun viruses. We therefore do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this -mail which arise as a result of e-mail transmission, and
you are advised W carry out vour own virus checks and confirm the accuracy of the contents of this e-mail before relving on it for any purpose.

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.



For more information please visit http://www.svmanteccloud.com

This e-masl (and any anachment) is intended for the addressee(s) only and contung information thet is legally privileged and confidenual, IF vou are not the
intended recipient, please be advised that you have received this e-mail in error and that any use, dissemination, distribution, printing or copying of this
cominunication is unauthorized and strictly prohibited. Kindly notify us by replying to the sender’s e-mail address and delete this e-mail immediately. E-mail
trangmissions cannot be guaranteed to be secure or error-free as information could be intercepted, corrupted, lost, destroyed, delayed or incomplete, or could
contain viruses, We therefore do not accept hability for any errors or omissions in the contents of this e-mail which arise as a result of e-mail transmission, and
you are advised 1o carry out yvour own virus checks and confirm the accuracy of the contents of this e-mail before relying on it for any purpose.

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp://www.symanteccloud.com




