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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 23 September, 2019 3:04 PM

To: claims@teamworkgarage.com; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Taufikh (LKKAuto); Admin A; SUR

Subject: RE: SMF2929Y MITSUBISHI EVO

Attachments: SKM_C300i190923144900.pdf

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

 

Hi Vic, 

 

Kindly assist. 

 

 

Thank You. 

 

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: claims@teamworkgarage.com <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  

Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 3:01 PM 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SMF2929Y MITSUBISHI EVO 

 
Hi All, 
 
Attached LOD for your reference .  

Please let us have the offer soonest. 
 

Thank you and have a nice day! ☺ 
 

Letitia  

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore (408934) 

Tel: 6844 2475|Fax: 6844 2474 

 

From: claims@teamworkgarage.com [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]  

Sent: Monday, September 23, 2019 12:37 PM 

To: 'Taufikh (LKKAuto)' <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: 'TEAMWORK GARAGE CLAIMS' <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 

Subject: RE: SMF2929Y MITSUBISHI EVO 

 
Hi Taufikh , 
 

We confirm COR @ $12500 and DOR @ 10 days 
 

Thank you and have a nice day! ☺ 
 

Letitia  

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore (408934) 

Tel: 6844 2475|Fax: 6844 2474 

 

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) [mailto:Taufikh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Friday, September 20, 2019 12:06 PM 

To: Darren <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 

Subject: Re: SMF2929Y MITSUBISHI EVO 

 
Hi Darren, 

Refer to attached. 

Regards 
Taufikh  
Lkk Auto 
 
 
 
 

Get Outlook for Android 
 
From: Darren  
Sent: Thursday 19 September, 19:15  
Subject: RE: SMF2929Y MITSUBISHI EVO  
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)  

Hi Taufikh,  
   
Please let me have your revised  marked estimate.  
   
Darren  
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd  
53 Ubi Avenue 1  
#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park  
Singapore 408934  
Tel: 68442475  
Fax: 68442474  
   
From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2019 1:13 PM  
To: 'Darren'  
Subject: RE: SMF2929Y MITSUBISHI EVO  
   
Hi Darren,  
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COR l/s$12,500 , 10 days. I have revised some of the part price.  
   
Subject to insurance approval.  
   
Regards  
Taufikh  
Lkk Auto  
   
From: Darren [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]  
Sent: Saturday, 24 August 2019 1:30 PM  
To: 'Veron Chen (LKKAuto)'; taufikh@lkkauto.com  
Subject: FW: SMF2929Y MITSUBISHI EVO  
   
Dear Sir/Mdm,  
   
REMINDER  
   
Its almost 2 months, please assists to finalize asap.  
   
Darren  
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd  
53 Ubi Avenue 1  
#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park  
Singapore 408934  
Tel: 68442475  
Fax: 68442474  
   
From: Darren  
Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 4:47 PM  
To: taufikh@lkkauto.com; veronchen@lkkauto.com  
Subject: SMF2929Y MITSUBISHI EVO  
   
Hi Taufikh,  
   
FYNA  
   
Based on estimate calculate:  
   
COR @ $16900  
DOR @ Counter Propose 12-13 days  
   
Darren  
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd  
53 Ubi Avenue 1  
#01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park  
Singapore 408934  
Tel: 68442475  
Fax: 68442474  
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