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A BE B Pwld Comparry Registration Ne. 190657184

S LI AVE 1 #0225 FAYA LUBLINDUSTHIAL PARK. SINGAPORE J08953 TEL 11065) 02563561 FANX 1063 A15ad8

Your ref: D19003702MESH

Our ref; CS/FCH90100T8/Evd3 Date : 12/6/2019
The Motor Claims Department
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Withowt Prejudice

Dear SirfMadam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO.  SHB 8688H

We thank you for your instruction on  7/6/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
10/6/2019  at the premises of M/s AUTOM v
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §83,189.64

Revised Estimate Amount 1 551,146.89

"Check” ltems Amount : 551,142.75

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5%

Nett Value : 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the rear feond
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

STEVE CHEN
Automative Assessor
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Tel [B5) 6222 2311 Tox (B3] 6IZT 1547

Chatws B Patr Undwiwiling Cept: 35 Ao2insen Anag #] 501 Dty House Smgapore DEEGTT
Tel (B5) 6507 3848 Fax (BS) 6507 3849
A A AFLTEADITAL s K )

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 05-06-2019 Our Ref No. D19003702MFSH
Accident Date 03-08-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC2188T Third Party Vehicle. SHBBEEEH
Survey Location 23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #03-02
Contact Person. GOH WEE DEK
Contact No. 62148BB0/ 65446682 Fax No. 62141511
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:
Appainted LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report,

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST
PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE
: Attention, NIL
Cc : Workshop SERVICES PTE LTD ttention
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey repart via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspaction
This is a computer generatad letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June 2019 10:29 AM
To: Goh Wee Dek; SUR

Subject: RE: SHB 8688H-DOA: 3/6/2019
Dear Wee Dek,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm PxP $1,146.89 before GST (@ 2 working days

Kindly send Final invoice and all supporting documents directly to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Goh Wee Dek <weedek.goh@premiertaxi.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 19 June 2019 8:45 AM

To: Veron Chen [LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SHB 8688H-DOA: 3/6/2019

Dear Veron

Yes, please confirm PxP $1,146.80
No check items

Regards

Goh Wee Dek
Assistant Claims Manager
FPremier Automotive Senvices Pte Lid

Address: 23 Changl South Ave 2, #D1-02 Singapore 486443
Tel: 6214 8880 Ext 068 | DID: 6544 6682 | Fax: 6214 1511

Visit us at: www.premiertaxi.com.5g
Confidentiality Motice | This e-mall message, inciuding any attachments, i3 for the sole use of the intended recipientis and may contain confidenttal or

propretary information. Any unauthonized review, use, disciosure or distribution i prohibited. If you are not the intended reciplent, immediately contact
the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original message.

o4 Please Consider Your Environmental Respensibility Before Printing This E-mail. SAVE OUR TREES and REDUCE POLLUTION
W

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen(@|kkauto.c
sent: Tuesday, 18 June, 2019 5:26 PM



To: Goh Wee Dek
Subject: SHB 8688H-DOA: 3/6/2019

Dear Wee Dek,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us,

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



~Veron Chen !L!{I{.Autnz

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 12 June 2019 9:43 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Ce: ‘Eileen Lee'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003702MFSH/1, SHB B688H
Attachments: SHB 8688H PRELI ADVISED. pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHB 8688H
Date of survey: 10/6/2019
Number of days : 2 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

8lk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 2:05 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Eileen Lee' <EileenLee@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003702MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phane: 6841-1972 | emnil: gssignments@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408031)

Erom: CWS Mator Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg)
Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 12:36 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Eileen Lee <ElleenLee msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003702MFSH/1
1



- Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

. AUG. This emall has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.aVE.com
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> Back to OneMotoring

DADCITAE Dabata Eoesdemp

- Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID;

Vehicle Detalls

Viehicle Mo.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:

First Registration Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid;

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Company
4%75H

SHBB&EBH

No

10 Jun 2019

HYUNDAI

130 GDH LATCISDRDCT
Silver

2017

D4FBHZ 172980
TMAD2B1UVHI1419%90
100.0 kW {134 bhp)
$20,2346.00

08 Nov 2017

08 Nov 2017

0

$12831.00

Yes
07 Nov 2025
$9.623.00

07 Nev 2025

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
8

$33.594.00

$24,915.00

$36,538.00

Please note that the B-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered upen
COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The infarmation contained herein Is correct as at 10 Jun 2019

OK
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PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

SINGAPORE 486442

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #0)-02

bk (STYGETT

TEL: 65446676 / 65446689 FAX: 62141511
CO. REG200707743D  GST REG:200707743D

freets - LAI¢

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR HYUNDAI 130{A) WAGON REGN NO: SHB 8688 H

1pe
1pec
1pc
1pec
2 ps

1 52t
1 5e1

Rear bumper " o ﬂf#ﬂ Hﬂ"
Rear bumper reinforcemant .
Rear bumper reinforcement cantre
Rear bumper nis & ofs side brackst @ $52.20 T %

f ' |“I1I
A

Rear bumper clips 7 e
Reverse sensor ‘]' W A

Sundry A=

To dismanile and replace raverse sensor and les| sysiem

To lanour charge for dismantie and renew the acciden!
damaged pars. Including to knock-out. straighten. repair,
reshape of the end panel eic

To putty and spray painting on the rear bumper. End pane|

To apply rustproofing on the repaired and replaced panels

( ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST )

THE ABOVE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR DD NOT INCLUDE
ANY UNFORESEEN DAMAGES.

1 B11.11
$ 78.20
% E165.64
$ 79.20
$ 10440
5 1,BB9.55
Less 20% 5 NTo
3 1.511.64
48 00
280.00
§ s000 g€
$ 8000 20
s 7oooo JO7
s  s0000 700
$ 12000 22X
Total § 318064
LKK Auto Consutants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:

» To resunviry betore 5fmr sprmy paming

o To dwptay daraged paai doing resunmy

o Parts prices s paomct 5 oS manoe

® Thisd party survey & o= & ¥ ‘o Sme
-Mmm\:dlrc.ﬂq_—hl. e

» Supplememtary ibemie) must be

8 subject to final approval from |sute e Lo e

Achremiecged by Ropaver
Sgratue
(ot




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Pays Ubi Indusirial Park. Singapore 408833

TEL: 62568 3581 FAX: B258 4315

Reg No: 199607188R GST Reg. Mo, 16-8607108-R

e ?"7"1“ ""T""JI.

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

e S

R'll‘ ES-I'FCI‘I 901 Dﬂ?ﬂd’EﬁdEﬂE

Date: 20-068-2018

e

Code: FCI2
1. i RD PARTY CI
Insured Veh. SHC 21887 Veh. Inspected SHB 8888H
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D19003702MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  EILEEN LEE A.lllgn Dll‘.i 07/06/2019
2 i iy T i 5 &
Make & Model HYUNDAIIZ0 c.c 1582
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg 2017
Chassis No, TMADZB1UVHI141880 Colour SILVER
Odometer 136360 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOoOD
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185®&5 R15 MAXXIS 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |18585R15 MAXXIS 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/85R15 MAXXIS 7 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |19585 R15 MAXXIS 7 mm
4. - nag
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REA.R PDRT!DN
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5o L T
Accident Date 03082019
Survey held at PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE BERVICES PTELTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-02 SINGAPORE 486443
5a. = =
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CiIN ACEOHD&NGE TO YOUR INSTRUG’TIQI\E WE I'IAUEHDT FM'I'HURIEED REPAIRS.

5b.




ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHB BEBEH

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1801-25 Pays Ubi industrial Park, Singapore 408033
TEL: B258 3561 FAX: B258 4315
Reg No: 198607108R GST Reg No. 18-66071688-R

1|REAR BUMPER DENTED a1 8111
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE NOT NECESSARY 7820 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 81564 -
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT CENTRE NOT NECESSARY 79.20 .
2|REAR BUMPER N/S & O/S SIDE BRACKET @3$52 20 NOT NECESSARY 104.40 .
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -377.91 -162.22
1511.64 648 89
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS [SN) NECESSARY 48.00 48.00
1|SET REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 280,00 =
1|SUNDRY (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
378.00 78.00
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE AND REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR AND 80.00 2000
TEST SYSTEM
TO LABOUR CHARGE FOR DISMANTLE AND RENEW THE 700.00 200.00
ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS INCLUDING TO KNOCK-
OUT STRAIGHTEN ,REPAIR,RESHAPE OF THE END
PAMNEL ETC
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING ON THE FRONT 400.00 200.00
BUMPER END PANEL
TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING ON THE REPAIRED AND NOT NECESSARY 120,00
REPLACED PANELS
1,300.00 420.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,189.64 1,146.89

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19010078/Evd3n2

CHEN TSUE YEE
Automotive Assessor

J 1SS
ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensed Appraisar
[HSCLAIMER OF LIABEITY TO THIRD PARTIES:: This Aeport is made solaly for Ehe wee snd benefil of the Client named on th front pege of i Beport.




