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.«.CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

|06 Jun 2019

16 Apr 2018 ; New Assignment
Main 11:1: Cancel Cass |

Refarance Claim Detalls Documants

Show AR

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by Insurer)

Insired.

Main

M . GOLDBELL LEASING PTELTD

pencle R GBF3883T Date of Loss: | 14/04/2018 D000 - :59

Claim Type: TP / SNM1BD01949C02 m‘;‘,‘;‘;‘f“ DMHCSN1 740651700

Venicie Reg Policy No 1

No. $IH1519D y No,

[Insured): — fECIIII'I'lIJ'II!. | B
Excess:  1550.00

Reparer.  Sin Sheng Engineering Services (HQ) 3 Tech Park Crescent, Tuss Tech Park, 638129 Tuas - Tel. 68539595

Hendlé  china Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6369 6111 ... [Handied by Tan Kah Leong - 63896 153)]

Agjuster LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel- §256-3561 ... [Final Rpt due 17/06/2019]

#dj Asg.

REmTarks NO EST, ASSIGN TAY BENG HEE AS SJE.

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view &l | Composs Case Mail |

There are no mafl for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete

v ek Graou Sl jw Harntie & wsbgred By Corrrpleled

No results,



2019/6/8 PARF/COE Rebate Enguiry

= Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 1196N
— el GuaE = S S SEEETC T G VR R e e e
Vehicle No.: GBF3883T
Vehicle to be Exported No
Intended Deregistration Date: 09 Jun 2019
Vehicle Make: FIAT
Vahicle Model DOBLO CARGO MAXI 1.4 MTJ) AMT GLAZE
Primary Colour White
Manufacturing Year: 2014
Engine No. 263A50007652037
Chassis No. ZFAZ&300006026217
Maximum Power Output +
Open Market Value: $18.515.00
Original Registration Date 27 Sep 2016
First Registration Date: 27 5ep 2016
Transfer Count 0
Actual ARF Paid: $9256.00
il udiied PARF RECRITOMINI(E 3T i S NI or Ty SR e SO e s S |
PARF Eligibility: MNo
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date .
PARF Rebate Amount $0.00
1= ded COF Rkalle DTl SO0 MCOEIe Qi N TECW oo e e e -
COE Expiry Date 246 5ep 2024
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Perind(Years) 10
PQP Paid £4 80%.00
COE Rebate Amount: £3,509.00
Tatal Rebate Amount: $3,509.00

The infarmation contained herein s correct as at 09 Jun 2019

OK

MOPS (Vnna gov. Sgima: v acuorn enguireren Sy rUDICoINELe S INDUL frUNG | IUN_ILSruausuus | |



shl'rle: Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 June 2019 11:54 AM

To: ‘sinsheng engineeringservices’

Cc: SUR; Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM18D01949 -SJH1519D -Accident involving GBF3B83T with

SJH1519D on 14/04/2018

Dear Susan,
Confirmed final fig 5 400.00 @ 2 days of repairs before GST.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

Thank you.

Best Regards.

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkayuto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981 @gmail.com]
Sent: Saturday, 8 June 2019 9:58 AM

To: LKK_Surveyor <sur@lkkauto.com>; Guo Qiang <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM18D01949 -SJH1519D -Accident involving GBF3883T with SIH1519D on 14/04/2018

Hi Mr Guo Qiang,

Please find attached.

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT **

Thank You
Regards

Susan

Sin Sheng Engineering Services
No 8 Tuas Ave 18

Singapore 638892

(Level 3_Office)

(Level 5_Workshop)

Tel: 6863 9595

Fax: 6863 6477
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SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Plaase repon cofrectly the details of e socident o speed up the claims process
2 This Form must be complsted by the Policyholder and/ar the Autharised Drives

3, Informateon proveded must be an truthful and sccurale as possibla. &ny witul merepresentation o witholding of misterial facts may dllow IMuranRcs companes i
repudiate policy abdity .

4 The meue and acoeptance of e Form By meurnance companss & not an admason of polcy habify an he part of e MEUrANCE COMDANES

5. Any tolse reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation

6 This repor will e forwardsd by the insursn of the GlA Records Managesmen] Canire estabhished by he Ganeral Insurancs Assoiation of Singapote (GIA ) for
archivirg and [hal copses of his repon will, for & lee. be mads suailable upan ppelicabion by imleresiad paries

T E],- tha Iocgarmmsd of thes repart o e meuress you Bierety' consent to the srchiving of tis repor al the centre and 10 copss of 1 fepon Deng maos avalable
aforesand

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Repart
Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Acoident

Country/State ol Loss

150452018 15:35
14/04/2018 1115
ALONG PIE (TUAS)
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number GBF3883T
Insured/Policyholder

Mame Of Registered Owner GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD
Co Reg No 199001 196N

Email Address
Mobile Fhone No

Allemative Phone Mo

NOEMAIL

OFFICE-64942833

Vehicle Particulars
Manulacturer FIAT
Modal DOBLO CARGO MAXI-1.6 D MTJ AMT GLAZE (M)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was baing used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair 1o your vehicle?

If No, Please sials action lo be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mame ol Insurance Company

Type OFf Coverage

Flest Policy

Policy Number

Covear Note Number

Driver

MName of Driver

NO

THIRD PARTY
COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD
THIRD PARTY

YES

29004183

SUN CHENGFE!

Passport No/FIN (Z2446391K
Date Of Birth 210111988
Occupation OUTDOOR

Cate Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Fander

Mabile Number

Fax Mumber
Contact Number

EMail Address

170220156

i YEARS AND 1 MONTH
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-83635447

NOEMAIL



g

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

MNature Of Damage

WNa. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 3ol 18



Sketch Plan #2

SEETOH PLAN
\\ Pie (Tuas)
- —= - LA) Ean\DaAR
> - I
- f e —— - —
-

DESCRIBE CIRCUMISTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

PIE TOWARDS TUAS. VEHICLE B WAS ON MY LEFT. | HAD JUST PASSED

ON MENTIONED DATE/TIME, | WAS TRAVELLING IN THE 2ND LANE ALONG

BEDOK NORTH ROAD EXIT WHEN | SAW VEHICLE B FROM THE LEFT

ATTEMPTING TO ENCROACH INTO MY LANE TO OVERTAKE A 5LOW

MOVING VEHICLE AT THE LEFT LANE. | APPLIED MY BRAKES IMMEDIATELY

BUT | DIDN'T FELT ANY IMPACT, THUS | CONTINUED WITH MY JOURNEY

BUT | WAS STOPPED BY VEHICLE B SOMEWHERE AFTER PAYA LEBAR EXIT.

VEHICLE B'S DRIVER THEN ALIGHTED FROM HIS VEHICLE AND ASKED IF |

REALIZED THAT | HAD COLLIDED INTO HIS VEHICLE WHILE AT THE BEDOK

NORTH ROAD EXIT. | ALIGHTED FROM MY VEHICLE AND WENT TO THE

LEFT TO CHECK. | SAW SOME SCRATCHES AT MY VEHICLE'S LEFT. THE

DRIVER OF VEHICLE B JUST LEFT AFTER INFORMING ME THAT HIS VEHICLE

IS EQUIPPED WITH AN IN-CAR CAMERA. | MANAGED TO TAKE A PHOTO

OF HIS CR AFTER FOLLOWING HIM AT A DISTANCE.

DECLAMATION

e decinrn the fosepong 2ariuless o8 frut i svery relpact

&g A 5 |

Frteytuider s Hyrature Drrver s bgr ety

Bts & Timy {3 rtwns ' et the putrybecader h"ﬂ“'“‘ﬁﬂn
ke & Tams TN
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' SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES

NO 8 TUAS AVE 18

SINCAPORE 638892

Tel No. : 68639595 Fax No. : 6863-6477
E-Mall : sinsheng1981@gmall.com

Buss. Reg. No. : 312029/00D

COLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD Estimate : ES002860
59 SENOKO ROAD
SINGAPORE 758123 Date : 31/05/2019
Vehicle Num. : GBF3883T
i Make/Mode| : FIAT DOBELO 1.6NMUTD-2016
Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Engy : ZFA26300006D26217/263A5000765;
Contact : 6861 0007 Fax No.; 6753 7780 Accldent Date ; 14/04/2018
Claim No. :
Reference - SJH1519D
Policy No. : 29004183
SN  Quantity Particular Unit Price Amount 55
LABOUR :
TO PANEL BEAT/REPAIR LH BODY 25000 (0o
SPRAY PAINTING 50000 2o
LDSS OF USE : 3 DAYS @ 5 120/DAY
Labour Total 55 : 750.00

’Pﬂﬂ«tﬁ.
(s Rio~y ~ 52850282
&y\ﬂ’ Gl-:om! @ IH‘MF' O

o?/g;/r‘j

TD"M( ; $¥ﬁ

rWHWMS

Total 55 750.00
EEmomesmsms= =
LKK Auto Consultants hence notily
o the Rapairer of tha following:
SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES e sy ey
+ 10 Qiplay aamaged baris) dunng resurvey
= Firly proes are st 1o confimation
* Third paimy survey = 00 & “Withoct Prejudion” basis
= o ilegdl modiicesonds ) i
» Byppimward oy ies | st be

Reirowiadged by Aepares
Suratuy
Catg

T ———
B BuEieit 10 findl aporoval Irom insurance Company




Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
__ Cass Notifisd Est Submitted Ad] Azsigned | Adj Rpt adj Submitted | tns Auth'ed Status
06 Jun 2019 Pendi Survey
16 Apr 2018 17:20 * 55400.00 S5400.00 ng for
Main Ednt Estimates. | | view fpe |
£ Ad) kot | Cancei Case |

Reference Claim Details

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by Iinsurer]
Insured: |8, Co Reg. MNo.: D I

Main | l
Clsimant: GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD |

Vehicie Reg, | _ | 14704/2018 00:00 - :55

No.: GBF38837T Date 0f Lass® |14y manths and 18 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)] I
Claim Type: | TP / SNM18D01949C02 PORCY/COVET | DuHCSN1 740651700
Vehicie Reg. N
M. SIH15100
[Insared):

Palicy No
{Claimant):
1= Excess: S$0.00

Repairer: Sin Sheng Enginesring Services (HQ) 1 Tech Park Crescent. Tuas Tech Park, 638129 Tuas - Tel: 6639555

;:.'LT::_“ China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 638% 6111 .. [Mandied by Tan Kah Leong - 62896153]

Adjustar LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel 6258-31561 . [Handled by XING GUO QIANG] ... [Final due 17/06/2019]

i:‘:m;: NO EST, ASSIGN TAY BENG HEE AS SIE.

View All_| _ Compose Case mail |

;Thﬂ'l' are no mall for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ View Al | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | complete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No results

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 13/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*GBF38B83T (SNM1B8D01949C02)
[SIH1519D]
T
GOLDBELL LEASING PTE LTD
Apr 14 ll'.l{l.!l 12:00AM
0
Sin Sheng Engineering Services

Page 1 of 2

| Photos/Images 3 per
I:Hn Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Lﬂ%-!mug#%
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https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 13/6/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

|Photos/Images 3 por page E =)
Ho_ | Relabel/Reorder | LKX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall Print
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139 [10/06/19 09:58 | Chassis Numbaer O | aars | &F
!
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Documents Checklist

|DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | Save | prine |
| Therre are no document checklists configured.

Qur Checklist Remarks - LKK Aute Consultants Ple Lid [HG)

Show Remarks To: [ Handling |nsurer
Hole Lamaris BrE Dl uniEes pou Ahoe 0 B0 other Sarties

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 13/6/2019



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregne 1sseo710em)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignmenis@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/CTI18010063/GSD3

Date: 13/06/2019
REFERENCE
China Taiping Insurance .
Handling insurer: (Singapore) Pte. Ltd Paolicy No: DMHCSN1740651700
E::I:mnl Vehicle GBF3883T I'::url-d Vehicle SJH1516D
Date of Loss:  14/04/2018 Nature of Claim: TP claim - snm18D01849C02
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No GBF3883T
Make & Model :-"II:;T DOBLO CARGOD MAXI, 1.8 D MTJ AMT GLAZE Engine No: 263A50007652037
Reg. Date 27/08/2016 (Man. Year. 2016) Chassis Mo ZFA28300006026217
Colour: While Odomeler BB550 km
Engine Capacity: 1598 cc
Marke! Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (55) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Stleering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification; No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 195/60R 16 Rear Tyre Size: 195/G0R 16
Front Left Side; Pirelll & mm Rear Left Side: Pirelli 6 mm
Front Right Side. Pirelli & mm Rear Right Side: Firelli 6 mm
The above values represant ihe mmaining fyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's " Adjuster's Difference  Diff %]
Parts 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 750.00 400.00 350.00 46.67
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (5§) 750.00 400.00 350.00 46.67
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 52 50 28.00 2450 46.67
Nett Amount (S§) 802.50 428.00 ar4.50 46.67
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 08062018
Date Inspected. O7/08/2018 Inspecied At Sin Sheng Engineering Services (HQ)
3 Tech Park Crescent, Tuas Tech Park
Singapore 638129
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 13/6/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG Manager: Hiew May Fung

NOTE: This report represents our findings af the time and piace of inspaction stafed herein. Such inspechion has been carmisd out lo the best of owr
knowiedge and abifify butt any other Eabidy undar any other crcumstances ir hareby eaprossly exciuded.

hitps://singapore.merimen,com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 13/6/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference
Part Source: MREM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 13 Jun 2019)
Paris: 213 FIAT DOBLO CARGO MAXI 1.6 D MTJ AMT GLAZE (M) (Catalogue:Menmen Singapore 1.0)

Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard List)
|Frtnl. Code: (Unsubmitied, no print-code for GBF3883T)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: llems/values nol in reference catalogue are preficed with an asterisk *_

Recommended Parts

Thare are no new parts salected,
[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 13/6/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous llems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems

1 TO PANEL BEAT/REPAIR LH BODY New 250.00 100.00

2 SPRAY PAINTING New 500.00 300.00

Gross Labour Cost (S5) 750,00 400.00

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out, _—[

< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 13/6/2019



