
1

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Chua Syahirul Syazwani Binte Irwan <ChuaSyaSya@goldbell.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 8 July 2019 4:21 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Ramesh; Brian Eng Kwok Long

Subject: Finalise YQ744B

Attachments: SV.pdf; TAX INVOICE.pdf

Dear Ms Veron,  

 
Kindly see attached for the SV and Invoice.  
Thank you.  
 
Regards,  
 
 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd

Chua Syahirul Syazwani Binte Irwan | Goldbell 
Engineering Pte Ltd 
Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 
 
DID: +65 6268 5390 | Tel: +65 6268 5390 | Fax:  | 
Mobile:  |  
Address: Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd (Pioneer) 
Blk 3 Pioneer Road North #01-24 
Singapore 628457 

 

 
To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
http://www.goldbellcorp.com/images/email/Email-Footer.png

  

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long 

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 11:36 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR 

Cc: Ramesh 

Subject: Re: Finalise YQ 744 B  

  

Hi Veron, 

 

We accept finalise amount $12,340.95 @ 7 working days. 

 

Thanks and Best regards 
To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd Brian Eng Kwok Long | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 
 
DID: +65 6864 0637 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |
Mobile: +65 9755 7336 | Web: http://www.goldbell.com.sg 

 
To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
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From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 11:04:55 AM 

To: SUR; Brian Eng Kwok Long 

Cc: Ramesh 

Subject: RE: Finalise YQ 744 B  
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Dear Brian, 
  
Our finalise amount $12,340.95 @ 7 working days. 
  
Parts-$7220.95 

SN-$40 

Labour-$5080 

Total-$12,340.95 

  
Please check and confirm 

  

  
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Brian Eng Kwok Long <EngKwokLong@goldbell.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 8:40 AM 

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg> 

Subject: Finalise YQ 744 B 

  

Hi Guo Qiang, 

Kindly refer to the attached above. 

Can we finalise the amount @ $12696.72? 

Thanks & Best Regards 

To help protect your privacy, Microsoft Office prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd Brian Eng Kwok Long | Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd 

Customer Service Advisor, Motor Claims 
 
DID: +65 6864 0637 | Tel: +65 6861 0007 | Fax: +65 6863 0425 |
Mobile: +65 9755 7336 | Web: http://www.goldbell.com.sg 
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