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NTUC/TIISHD7281T)
DOA: 28/052019@ 0805

Acriodent Clalm Beperrs, Corrvnlon Welffing. Body Dest Reparia
Spran-Pamamp. Moohaeaal Bopair dad Castomzrng of Cors

BLOCK 1010, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3, #1105, SINGAPORE 158724

BLOCHK 1009, BUKIT MERAH LANE 3_#01-82, SINGAPORE 188723

TEL: G271 7054, 6273 3304 FAX BITIGETE EMAIL chams® mngnet oom.sg

Bus Reg MNo 25151300M GST Reg. Mo MSO3GTAEIL

INDIA INTERNATIONAL INSURANCE PTE LTD

ATTN: THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

THIRD PARTY CLAIM
ESTIMATE COST OF REPAIR FOR VEHICLE NO:
SKZ 9337 C - RENAULT FLUENCE 1.6L CVT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR SR
CHASSIS: VFILZB30TUC248585 (0372011)

I pc Front fender LH
I pc Fromdoor LH 7

LESS 5%

o/
R

Remove and reinstall front door glass & fittings.

Remove necessary parts: jacking, panel beating, repair
and straighten front bumper, front fender LH. front door
protector LH, rear door LH and rear door protector.

Putty and respray front bumper, front fender LH. front
door LH. front door protector, rear door [LH and rear door

protector and LH side mirror cover.

ADD 7% GST

Note: The above is an estimate only. [F other parts requested
during the course of repair, we will inform you accordingly.

All parts are 5ubjr:ct to availability,
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TR el ] BADCIME Bahaba Camiin

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Ownar 1D Type: Singapare MRIC
Cwner ID: 2442G
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: SKZ9337C
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo
Intended Deregistration Date: 10Jun 2019
Wehicle Make: RENAULT
Vehicle Model: FLUENCE 1.6L CVT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR SR
Primary Colour; Sliver
Manufacturing Year: 2011
Engine No.: HAMC721F096564
Chassis No. VF1LZB50TUC248585
Maximum Power Qutput: B2.0 kW (109 bhp)
Open Market Value; $15.864,00
Original Registration Date: 31 May 2011
First Reglstration Date: 31 May 2011
Transfer Count: 2
Actual ARF Paid: $15864.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Ellgibility: s
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 30 May 2021
PARF Rebate Amount: $8,725.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 30 May 2021
COE Category: A - Car [1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $44 000,00
COE Rebate Amount; $8.46%.00
Total Rebate Amount: $17,394.00

The information contained hereln is correct as at 10 Jun 2019

OK

L= PR e ——— AR 4 P T WL 0 AR A L R e | | A W R B I e |



- Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 June 2019 9:10 AM

To: Charn’s Customcraft; ‘sur@lkkauto.com” admin-d@lkkauto.com
Cc: Zuhaidah Samsuri

Subject: RE: Accd Invig: SKZ 9337 C & SHD 72817 on 28.05.2019
Attachments: PRI.PDF

Sensitivity: Confidential

Dear Sir /| Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SKZ9337C and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Aida.
"Kindly upload this survey request email lo merimen,

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
YINGAFDETIR

B4 Cecll Street, #05 - 10B Bullding
Singapore 029711
Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

[nD1A
INT ERNATIONAL
[NsuraNCE

From: Charn's Customcraft [mailto:charns@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: 03 June, 2019 4:54 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim @iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Accd Invig: SKZ 9337 C & SHD 7281 T on 28.05.2019
Impaortance: High

Sensitivity: Confidential

LKK please

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Churn's Customeraft

lel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charns@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M903678631
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Motor Claim - [1I [mailto:motorclaim@iil.com.sq]
Sent: Monday, 3 June, 2019 3:40 PM



" To: Charn's Customcraft
~ Subject: RE: Accd Invig: SKZ 9337 C & SHD 7281 T on 28.05.2019
Sensitivity: Confidential

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your emall.
We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
» Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list,

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee
N G A FO E T

64 Cecil Street; #0S - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711
Tel: 6347 100, Ext - 248

T
INTERNATIONAL
[nsuraNCE

From: Charn's Customcraft [mailto:charns@singnet.com.sg]
Sent: 03 June, 2019 12:25 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>
Subject: Accd Invig: SKZ 9337 C & SHD 7281 T on 28.05.2019

Importance: High
Sensitivity: Confidential

Dear Sir/Madam,

Our client’s vehicle no, SKZ 9337 C would like to submit a third party claim against your insured: SHD
72811

Please find attached relevant documents for your action.

Kindly contact Sharon/Esther on PRI and advise on liability asap.

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customeraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charms@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M903678631L
Company Reg No: 25151300M



~ Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us cull{:cling‘. using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed 10 us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing vour personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and com plying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

[t may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Lid.

Registration No. 198703792-K
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Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto) == -

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 15 June 2019 3:34 PM

To: Charn's Customeraft (chams@singnet.com.sg)

Subject: Your ref SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD
T2B1T(III) & SKZ 9337C ON 28/05/2019]

Attachments: Statement of SHD72817 pdf

Your ref; SK1 9337C Without Prejudice

Our ref: CC4/IN200999%/Epb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 72B1T(Ill) & SKI 9337C ON 28/05/2019
We refer fo the above matter

Flease be informed that liability is unclear. Our insured driver reported that both parties changed lane.
Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

Kindly let us have evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) in order for us to look into the matter.
Appreciate and early reply.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter ks purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settiement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsegquently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultanis Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)



Hsiao Tnng !I.I{I(Autu]

From: Charn's Customeraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 12:55 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SHD 7281T(II1) & SKZ 9337C ON 28/05/2019]

Attachments: 20190528_080055 jpg; 20190528_080103 jpg; 20190528_080109 jpg; 20190528_
080302 )pg

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong

As requested, please find attached photos taken at the scene.

Owr client’s vehicle was in the straight wheel position after the accident.

How about the taxi's in-car camera? Any video foolage to justify the taxi's statement?

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: chams@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com)

Sent: Saturday, 15 June, 2019 3:34 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft (charns@singnet.com.sg)

Subject: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/I1119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(I1I) & 5KZ
9337C ON 28/05/2019]

Your ref: SKI 9337C Without Prejudice
Our rel: CC4/1119009997/Epb3

Dieear Sirs/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 72B1T(Ill) & 5KZ 9337C ON 28/05/201%
We refer o the above matier.

Flease be informed that liability is unclear. Our insured driver reported that both parties changed lane.
Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

Kindly let us have evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) in order for us fo look into the matter.

Appreciate and early reply.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settiement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regarnds,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Hsiao Tnna (LKKAuto)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.comsg>

Sent: Saturday, 2 November 2019 9:58 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE' Your ref SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SHD 7281T(I11) & SKZ 9337C ON 28/05/2019)

Importance: High

il _'_J:"‘
- LS

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Kindly close the case as we did not repair the vehicle.

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customeraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: chams@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Hsiac Tong (LKKAuto) [mallto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, 2 November, 2019 9:44 AM

To: Charn's Customcraft

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 72B1T(11I) & SKZ
9337C ON 28/05/2019]

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to our below email.

Kindly advise if your client is still pursuing third party claim against our insured / M/s India International Insurance
Pte Ltd. If so, kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available for our further action.

Please respond and let us know within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we will proceed to close file
at our end.

Thank you.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resarting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party s not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3107 | emall: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51. Pava Uhi Industrial Park, Uy Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2019 3:55 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft <charm ingnet._com.sg>
Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(Ill) & SKZ 9337C

ON 28/05/2019]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

We refer to our below email.

Kindly get back to us.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admissian of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of llability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Dest Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6rg2-3197 | email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya L Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 B:55 AM

To: Charn's Customeraft <charns@singnel.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your ref: S5KZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5HD 7281T(IIl) & SKZ 9337C
ON 28/05/2019]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



we refer 1o the above maller.
We propose 50/50 on this matter

Please confirm acceplance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without partles resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred

fram this negotiatlon of terms/settiement.

in the event of new evidente being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhté lkkauto.com | fox: 6741-4108
Blk 51 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Saturday, 22 June 2019 2:40 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(II1) & SKZ 9337C

ON 28/05/2019]

withou! Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm.

We refer to your below email.

We are currenily pending instruction from i,
we will get back to you asap.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter s purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liabllity, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settiement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially atfect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regands,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Hondler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Uhi Industrial Park. Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | S{408031)



From: Charn's Customeraft <charns@singnet com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 2:45 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/FEpb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(Ill) & SKZ 9337C
ON 28/05/2019]

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong
Plense advise the below

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Chamn's Customeraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: chams(@'si

(GST Reg. No: MOD367863L
Compuny Reg No: 25151300M

From: Charn's Customcraft [mailto:charns@sinanet.com.sq]

Sent: Monday, 17 June, 2019 12:55 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(III) & SKZ
9337C ON 28/05/2019]

Importance: High

i Hsiao Tong

As requested, please find attached photos taken at the scene.

Our client’s vehicle was in the straight wheel position after the accident.

How about the 1axi’s in-car camera? Any video footage to justify the taxi's statement”

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Cham's Customeraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: chams@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: MO0367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Hslao Tong (LKKAuto) [mallto:chewht@lkkauto,com]
Sent: Saturday, 15 June, 2019 3:34 PM

To: Chamn's Customcraft (charnsisingnet.com,sg)
Subject: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 72B1T(IIT) & SKZ
9337C ON 28/05/2019]

Your ret: SKT 9337C Without Prejudice
Our ref: CCA/IINTY00999%/Epb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(1ll) & SKZ 9337C ON 28/05/201%



" We reler to the above matter.

Please be informed that llability Is unclear. Our insured driver reported that baoth parfies changed lane
Attached ks a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

Kindly let us have evidences (le: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) in order for us fo look into the matter.
Appreciale and early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties an this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed [ inferred
fram this negotiation af terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially atfect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 673z-3197 | email: chewht@kdanito.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Marimen e-Claims

Print Sent Message

TR0

This mail is associated with :

*SKZ9337C (MCT12050772)
[SHD7281T)
"

SOH TZE CHYN (SU ZITIN)
May 28 2019 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTELTD]
Charn's Customeralt

From LKK Autoc Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), senl on 02/11/2019 10:46 AM.
To aldaf@ii.com.sg

ccC ll_SG; chewhi@lkkauto.com; admin-a@ikkaute.com

Subject  <Submit WP Report> MCT19050772

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that third party did not send in vehicle for repair at Charn"s Customcraft.

In view of this, we will proceed to close file and submit WP report to your good office.

|Thank you.

\Hsiao Tong

hitps:/singapore. merimen. com/claimalindex.cfm?flusebox=SVCmail&tuseaction=dsp_Pnm&CFID=618013674CFTOKEN=191d10808508a880-A3... 11



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...{Pending for Survey Report])
we

E
:
g

[
| Case |Matifies Fat Sunmitted | Ad) Assigred Ad) Apt Ad] Submitted _ |Ins Autived [Statn
06 Jun 2019 0t Xk xi $$1,450,00 | 5$1,450.00 PO S0 Sueoy
= EN 00:00 X Tis=q| port
Heg I Bt Ady mpt | Estinates cancal Cusa | |

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Insurea: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD, Co Reg hoo -
Main i
Flaimany: | SOH TZE CHYN (SUZIQIN),  ID: S7202442G
Vehicls ~|28/05/2019 00:00 - :59
e |SKze337C Date of LOSE: | 1o yontivg and 28 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]
Cinim Type: | TP / MCT19050772 PcHCover | McoMoo1S
Vanicle Reg. e
e SHD7285T ey No. | 5103032243
[m— | (Clairmant)
I Excess .
Repairer: |Charn's Customeraft (HQ) Block 1010 Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-105, 155724 Bukit Merah - Te|! 63717054
Hending | gndia tnternational Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tell 63476100 ... [Handied by Zuhaldah Bte Samsuri - 6347 6070]
ﬁ::::_“ HTUC Income Insurance Co-operativa Ltd (HQ) - Tel
Adjuster. | LXK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 . [Handind by CHEN TSUE YEE] . [Final Rpt due 17/06/2018] |

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view 8 |  Campose Case Mas |

s M1_SG (74/06/2019) Alert - Adj Mandate Approved [5$0.00) - SKZ9337C - Claim Handier: Zuhaldah Bte §...
» 115G [11/0B/2015) Alert - Ad] Mandate Maintained - SKZ9337C - Claim Handler: Zuhaldah Bte Samsuri

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view Al | Search Tasks | Create tew Task | camplete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group  Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Croated On  Done?
Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/11/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2

Claim Documents

*SKZ9337C (MCT19050772)
[SHD7281T]

TP
SOH TZE CHYN (5U ZIQIN)
May 28 2019 12:00AM
[COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD]
Charn's Customcraft

[wm {1 per } > & |
{Mo_|Finakized COn India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmnall | Print
| | 11/06/19 14:24 | Video - Accident (OID) [« I
Photos/Images [ ¥l &
fo | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |10/06/15 18:4% | General View 0| aswc | B
'z |1yo6/19 18:49 | General View 0 waws | H
'3 | 10/06/19 18:43 | General View 0 edwc | ¥
& |10/06/19 18:48 | General View 0 | adwc | B
s |1o/0e/10 18:45 | Odometer Reading | € | Loaa Ps ¥
B |10/06/1% 16:48 | Chassls Number O | waaws | B
7 |10/06/19 18:45 | General View © | tediec | B8
|8 |10/06/19 18:49 | General View 0| s | A
9 | 10/06/19 18:4% | General View 0! weare | &
10 |10/06/19 18:49 | General View 0 | edws | B
11 |10/06/19 18:49 | General View Q| weaws | B
17 |10/D6/1% 18:49 | Ganersl View Q| teadrs | A
13 |10/06/1% 16:49 | General View 0| wedws | &
14 |10/06/19 18:49 | General View 0| weaws | A
15 | 10/06/19 18:49 Ganeral View 0| wdwc | A
16 |10/06/19 18:45 | General View | ooows | &
17 | 10/06/19 18:45 | General View 0| eodirc | B
18 |10/06/19 18145 General View 0| odc | B
19 |10/06/19 18:49 | General View O | oaden | A
20 |10/06/19 18:49 Ganeral View g Load pG | BA
21 | 10/D6/19 18:48 | General View 0| waws | 4
72 | 10/06/19 18149 | Ganaral View 0D tcsdwc | M
23 |10/06/19 18:49 | General View 0 | loadirs | B
4 |10/06718 18:49 | General View 0| teadec |
25 |10/06/19 18:49 | Ganersl View 0| aws | A
26 |10/06/19 18:48 | General View 0| waaws | M
27 | 10/06/19 18:49 | Genersl View Q| aws | @A
78 | LOYDE/19 16:49 General View 0| tadrc | A
20 | 10/D6/1G 16:49 | General View 0| s | @
30 |10/06/19 18:49 | General View 0 eadirc | &
31 |10/06/19 18:48 | General View 0| wdirs |
17 |10/06/1% 18:48 General View Q| roedec | B4
13 |10/06/1% 18:49 | General View 0| wadrc | B
14 |10/D6/15 18:45 | General View 0| waarec | A
(35 |10/06/18 18:48 | General View 0| leasiec | A
36 |10/06/18 1848 | Genaral View 0 | adic | A
Bocumentation 1 =] &
No |Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Brint
1 |06/06/1% 17113 | EMAIL FROM III DD 04062019 Load POF

https:ffsingnpnrc.mnn'men.:unﬂclaimsﬁnd:x.cﬁn?ﬁxsebux=mdnc&fuszmiﬂn=dsp... 12/11/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

Video it ~]| &
No | Finalizeg On india International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumtmail | Print
_!_ D/06ES19 1713 TP EST & GIA REPORT - Lood FOF
k] 11/06/10 19:48 TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF
a J2/06/19 1437 Scena photos fram TP Load FOF
-1 02711719 10:42 Emall from TP dd 021119 Load PDF
Mo | Finslized On India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) Thumisaail | Print
1 |o7o8/19 08:52 | Singapore Accident Statement B | Losd POF
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST Reset | Save | print |
Theere are no decument checklists configured.
Duir st = LKK Pie Lid
~
W
Show Remarks To: ] Handling Insurer
Warp SEmarky mrE priesie Eess v b § fn ether peas

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 12/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreg ne 1sesor1ser

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sun@lkkauto.com;assignmenis@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

QOur Flle No:  CC4/MI8009888/EPB302

Dale: 12112018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer India International Insurance Pte Lid  Palicy No: MCOMOD15
Claimant i
Vehicle No SKZg3aarc Insured Vehicle Mo : SHODT7281T
Date of Loss 28/05/2019 MNature of Claim: TP Claim Na: MCT18050772
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SKZ9337C
Make & Model: RENAULT FLUENCE, 1.6 (&) Engine No: H4MC721F0B86566
Reg. Dale: 31/05/2011 (Man, Year: 2011) Chassis No: VF1LZB50TUC248585
Colour: Silver Odometer: 91670 km
Engine Capacity: 1558 cc
Marke! Value/ew Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured [S$): Market Value/Mew Car Price
| F A | F SUR
General Condilion: Steering (Serviceabla): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Fromt Tyre Size: 205/60 R18 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60 R18
Front Lefi Side: Falken 6 mm Rear Left Side: Falken 8 mm
Front Right Side: Falken & mm Rear Right Side: Falken & mm
The above valves fepresan ihe remaining fyre reads depth
(COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's  Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %)
Parts 1,795.50 485.50 1,330.00 7407
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.710.00 1.400.00 310.00 18.13
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 3,505.50 1,865.50 1.640.00 46.7T8
Approved Total (Overridden) {S§) 1,450.00
(S%) 3,505.50 1.450.00 2 05550 58.64
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) 245.39 101.50 143.88 58.64
MNett Amount (5%) 3,750.89 1,551.50 2,199.39 58.64
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 04/06/2019
Date Inspected; 10/06/2018 Inspected Al Charn's Customcraft (HQ)
Block 1010 Bukit Merah Lane 3, #01-
105
Singapore 159724
Estimaled Period of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: CHEN TSUE YEE Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE: Ths repodt represants our fndings af the mwmuwnmw_mwmwmmmwmﬂnw
knowledge and abilly bt any other lnhililty under any ather circumstances is hiveby expressly excluded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page Jof 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

I=I='nr't Source: MEM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 11 Nov 2018)

IF'lll"l:l.: 143 RENAULT FLUENCE 1.6 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

\Print Code: (Unsubmilted, no print-code for SKZ8337C)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Further Info: ltems/ivalues not in reference catalogue are pmfbn_u_d with an n:tnrl:slg ®

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Pari No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT FENDER LH Dented 480,00 FL *480 00 FL
2 1 *FRONT DOOR LH Repair 1,400.00FL *-FL
F=Franchise part. L=LisiitemDisc
Sub Total (S%) 1,890.00 490,00
- List ltem Discount on L ltems 5.00/5.00% (S§) 94 50 24 50
Total Parts (S$) 1,795.50 465.50

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/11/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellanecus Hems selected.

Recommended Labour
Mo Particulars Lab.Type

Repairer's

Page 4 of 4

Amount

Labour ltems
1 REMOVE AND REINSTALL FRONT DOOR GLASS & New
FITTINGS

2 REMOVE NECESSARY PARTS,JACKING PANEL New
BEATING ,REPAIR AND STRAIGHTEN FRONT
BUMPER ,FRONT FENDER LH ,FRONT DOOR
PROTECTOR LH ,REAR DOOR LH AND REAR DOOR
PROTECTOR

3 PUTTY AND RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER FRONT FENDER  New
LH ,FRONT DOOR LH FRONT DOOR PROTECTOR ,REAR
DOOR LH AND REAR DOOR PROTECTOR AND LH SIDE
MIRROR COVER

60.00

550.00

1,100.00

0.00

400.00

1,000.00

Gross Labour Cast (S5)

1,710.00

1,400.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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