Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 2 November 2019 9:58 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SHD 7281T(Ill) & SKZ 9337C ON 28/05/2019]

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Kindly close the case as we did not repair the vehicle.

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charns@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, 2 November, 2019 9:44 AM

To: Charn's Customcraft

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(III) & SKZ
9337C ON 28/05/2019]

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to our below email.

Kindly advise if your client is still pursuing third party claim against our insured / M/s India International Insurance
Pte Ltd. If so, kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us if available for our further action.

Please respond and let us know within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we will proceed to close file
at our end.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2019 3:55 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(lll) & SKZ 9337C
ON 28/05/2019]

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/mdm,
We refer to our below email.

Kindly get back to us.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 8:55 AM

To: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(lIl) & SKZ 9337C
ON 28/05/2019]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,



We refer to the above matter.
We propose 50/50 on this matter.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 22 June 2019 2:40 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(lIl) & SKZ 9337C
ON 28/05/2019]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

We are currently pending instruction from Il

We will get back to you asap.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Charn's Customcraft <charns@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 2:45 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(lll) & SKZ 9337C
ON 28/05/2019]

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong
Please advise the below

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charns@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Charn's Customcraft [mailto:charns@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 17 June, 2019 12:55 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(III) & SKZ
9337C ON 28/05/2019]

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong

As requested, please find attached photos taken at the scene.

Our client’s vehicle was in the straight wheel position after the accident.

How about the taxi’s in-car camera? Any video footage to justify the taxi’s statement?

Thanks & Regards,

Sharon Lee

Charn's Customcraft

Tel: 6272 5429 Fax: 6273 6676
Email: charns@singnet.com.sg
GST Reg. No: M90367863L
Company Reg No: 25151300M

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, 15 June, 2019 3:34 PM

To: Charn's Customcraft (charns@singnet.com.sg)

Subject: Your ref: SKZ 9337C *Our ref: CC4/11119009999/Epb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(III) & SKZ
9337C ON 28/05/2019]

Your ref: SKZ 9337C Without Prejudice
Our ref: CC4/1119009999/Epb3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD 7281T(lll) & SKZ 9337C ON 28/05/2019



We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Our insured driver reported that both parties changed lane.
Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

Kindly let us have evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) in order for us to look into the matter.

Appreciate and early reply.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



