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REMOVE, JACK OUT STRAIGHTEN, PANEL
BEATING.ALIGN

QU REF NO.; 17062019-1/SLH315H

iR ESTIMATED COST

PUTTY AND RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS
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CHECK WIRING AND LIGHTING
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 3350D
EVehic!- nelElsT ™  — TESEERE s e
Vehicle No.: SLH315H
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 07 Jun 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: LEXUS IS250 AUTOSTD FL
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2009
Engine No.: 4GR0611853
Chassis No.: JTHBK262X05113477
Maximum Power Output: 153.0 kW (205 bhp)
Open Market Value; $38,495.00
Original Registration Date: 13 Jan 2010
First Registration Date: 13 Jan 2010
Transfer Count: 3
Actual ARF Paid: $38.495.00
Wlffitendo | PARRRebate DEtaISI.
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 12 Jan 2020
PARF Rebate Amount: $19.247.00
Bt o0 COF PERSTE D a AT
COE Expiry Date: 30 Apr 2029
COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10
PQP Paid: $35,411.00
COE Rebate Amount: $35.047.00
Total Rebate Amount: $54,294.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Jun 2019
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

———————————————————————————————————————————— e ————

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc
Subject:

Tracking:

Without Prejudice
(save as lo cosis)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer o the above matter.

Khanchna [LKK Auto)

Thursday, 24 October 2019 11:43 AM

833Motorsports Admin
Admin A

RE: FW: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE

SGM3R AND SLH315H ON 31/05/2019

Recipient
BIiMotorsports Admin
Admin A
shupeiitikkauto.com
MeiowaniBikkauto com

oliviglau@lkkauto com

We propose setilement as follows: -

Delivery

Dallvered: 24/10/2019 1143 AM
Dellvered: 24/10/2019 11:43 AM
Delivered: 24/10/2079 1743 AM

|, Cost of Repair $ 2.200.00
2. Loss of Rental (6 days x $120.00) $ 72000
3. LTA Search Fee ] 7.45

TOTAL | 5$2.927.45

Please confirm acceplance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between partles on this matier is purely on o without prejudice hasis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicahly without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liahility, whmisoever, should be deemed | inferred from

this negotiation of terms/setilement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is pot bound, therealter, by the negotiation terma/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360] cmail: Khanchnaiallkkauro.comiFax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 11 October 2019 8:56 AM

To: 833Motorsports Admin <admin(@833motorsports.com=

1



Khanchna (LKK Autn!

From: 833Motorsports Admin <admin@B33motorsports.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2019 11:07 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: FW: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE
SGM3R AND SLH315H ON 31/05/2019

Attachments: SLH315H DV pdf

DV 15 signed. Thanks

From: Khanchna [LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.comz

Sent: Monday, November 04, 2019 12:57 PM

To: 833Motorsports Admin <admin@833motorsports.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FW: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SGM3R AND SLH315H ON
31/05/2019

Without Prejudice
(save as lo cosis)

Dear Sir/Madam

Mo need, we will do the necessary(i.e. sign and chop) once we have received the RV from your side with your
chop and signature.

Thank you,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com [ Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: 833Motorsports Admin <admipn@833motorsports.com>

Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 12:21 PM

To: Khanchna [LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ilkkauto com>

Subject: RE: FW: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SGM3R AND SLH315H ON
31/05/2019

Release voucher which require signature from the appointed surveyor which under LKK at your own company . Do you
still need ?



From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, November 04, 2019 12:15 PM

To: 833Motarsports Admin <admin@833motorsports.com>

Cc; Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FW: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SGM3R AND SLH315H ON

31/05/2019

Without Prejudice
{save as to costs)

Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the acceplance.

We attach herewith a copy of the DV & LOA form for your further action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on & without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settiement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: B33Motorsports Admin <admin@B3Imotorsports com>

Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 11:59 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FW: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SGM3R AND S5LH315H ON
31/05/2019

Accepted .

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, November 04, 2019 11:58 AM

To: B33Muotorsports Admin <admin@833motorsports.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject; RE: FW: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SGM3R AND 5LH315H ON
31/05/2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please refer to the attachment.
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PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION HEQUEST - SLHI15H vs SGMIR (01) on D.C.A: 30052019

. Fromx e Yin

e T ‘ngrrmet e s o AR & g R mom

CE ™ Fany AndeEY, Crem Lawviciig. sciin, BN i s him, Mot Marmss Agian Bparnirting Char, Yoke S0 Lim, Shang Yarg MShoasings Lastwesrmelioe Stramaniam Onomsan Tor
Sara BMDIIT 24330 =

Adaltyrons O gasiiise Mo Gt

Hi,

PMease refier o the encloned request from 833 Mutorsports Pre Lid
Kindly cory out Pullcy covesage venfisstion firs before conducting the pre-repair inspection within 4% hosirs

I o v amy quetics concerms, plense ot as know
Kingdly aexiat o sssig Ning Gww Nuing as Sogle Salat Evpert an bogueniod

Thanki & Regardy,

Hae Wi Rl (Vivhene)
MG L
Claien Adfpunim i Sempnpoes FMOL Claimig Dpieiliong - doks
I Pl ST | w30 g

From: elcred@3Imotorsports.com [mailte: eldred B3 Imatorsparts com]

Sents Tussday, June 04, 2019 4:28 PM

Tou Hor, Vel

Cox eldred (B3 Imotorspons. com

Subject: KE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SGMIR AND SLHI1SH ON 3040572019
ma [ ine Thanka

Eing doo Quang wp.; Fissss give me & date asd =ine
L

Fram: Hor, Finul
Sant: Tue. & bum JULY 01 A5 4% S000

To: ridred(PEI dmazoreparts tom

€ Fong, Andy-2Y, Chin, Lee-¥oug, Saae, Ballt, ABu Criaim, Scor Wannss, Adlan, Syazssgng, Chan, Woste ML, Lim, Shamf Yarg. Mithooeingh, Ashweenjeetiaur, Subramaniam, Divvashnl. Tang,
Vahaio

Jubjutt: PRE-SERAS RERECTION - ACODENT INVOLVING DUN INSURBES VEMICLE SGARIN AND SLHISSH 0% 30/052019

Withoot Projudice

Vour Riferonce SLIHASH
Chr Referenes SR
Pear SirMadnm,

We refor to yous Wollee af Aczident ol even dule

We tatend o conduct i pro-repair wirvey of the damps t vour dliest'syour custamer's vehizle pnntly with your clent'your motor workshop. We propose o use one of e motor
susveynrs Aamed i H artachsd bt o condiser tse poimy pre-repas survey s o single juin expert.

Nume ol Surveyor Company Namr
Al In Homse Sorveyor Al Ania PanDie Inssenee P Lud
Lawrence Ng Clus Kee Priowisy Services

[ Tefirey Ong Leng Kid Prosity Sarviics
Jisiny Lo Priveity Sersjees

| EC Lo Autamichllz Inapection Services Piz L0
Pang Kk Koun {Frankg) Formieamn Adyustens Pre Lid
Mg You Haa Formteam MAdjusters Pre Lid
Soon HanXie [Tary) Fezrmteamn Adpaters P Lid

[ Chiow 1o Xioag Forprivm Adjusizrs Piz Lid
Chia Soo Teek [Henjmin) Formivem Adpusters Pie Luf
Kalvin Ang LRK Auto Conssiltanis Pie Lid
Ning Gne Qiang LI Ao Consliama T Lid
Mz Chas LEK Amp Consuttan Pie Lid
Mubrmed Tuufikh LEK Auto Consaitanss P Lid
Adrian Ling LK At Coiiiznn Pz LW
Muobmmened Rad LEK Aute Connulizmis e L
Koennoth Kooy LK Ao Connliant Plz Lig

Pleasi liet wa keiow wlthiin tan §2) workbng deps shether vau agree e sppoimtment of sy of these mator surveyom s & single joint expery, You may select one or mare of the
listesd motor warveyars, We will beur the conl of the piresrepair survey corricd ool by the single joint expert.

Tranks & Regaras,

0 Wiy Bl Wi |

A

Sl djusion i Sngaions FNOL Chms Operainme - dess
Tinees rnSham D | s g

IMPORTANT NOTICE:!
The infnmation in this email (and sny aitachmenis) is confidential. 1 you are not the intended reciplent, you miust sl use or disseminate the infarmation. If you
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160 SIN MING DRIVE , #02-09, SIN MING AUTOCITY « IINGAPORE 575722
BUS REG NO. : 200921645R ,EMAIL: ELDRED@833MOTORSPORTS.COM
FAX : 69123280

TO:

AIG Aisa Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIM DEPARTMENT
FAX: 64153727

YOUR REF: SGM3R

OUR REF:  SLH315H

NOTICE OF ACCIDENT

Cear Sir/ Mdm,
We are instructed by our client to notify you of a road traffic actidentai  30-May-19

at about 1509 hours invalving our client’s vehicle registration number
SLH315H and vehicle registration number SGM3AR

As a result of the accident, cur client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client/we
proceed Lo repair the damage vehicle, please let us know within 2 warking days of your
receipt of this notice and conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle at our workshep,

Please do contact us at the following -
Narme: Eldred Goh

Contact: B332-2833

Yaurs Faithfully, For Surveyor
Please initial here after completion of
pre-repair inspeclion. Thank you.

3 : Appointed Surveyor
Eldred Goh——"- (Name & Signature)
Director

E33 Motorsports Pre Ltd

Date & Time of inspection
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§) U AVE L, #01-28 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (0635) 62563561 FAX : (065) L5635

Our Rel: CCA/AIG19009988/Gkh3
20 June, 2019
Lim Lay Gee

448 Brighthill Drive #02-143
Singapore 570448

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGM 3R AND SLH 315H ON 30/05/2019 ALONG/ AT
S s AVE

We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid has been appointed to act on the behalf of your
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd (AIG) to settle a THIRD PARTY claim
against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date and location.

Kindly proceed to lodge your GIA report within five (05) working days of receipt of this
letter, giving the version of the accident amongst other things related to the accident. The
GIA report can be lodged at any of AIG reporting centres. You may refer 1o your
Certificate of Insurance for the list of the reporting centres.

If you have any information to add or any amendments to make, please contact the
undersigned within five days from the date of this letter.

Please note that the standing of your insurance policy such as NCD, premium & etc
would be affected.

Yours faithfully,

LY

Khanchna
Claims

Tel : 6841 2360
Fax: 6741 4108

Email : Khanchna®@ Ikkauto.com

.o, Claims Manager
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)
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S1 LT AVE 1, #00-25 PAY A LI ENDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408833 TEL ¢ (065) A2583561 FAX - (0851 254015

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19009988/Gkb3

10 JULY 2019 By Registered Mail
First Reminder

Lim Lay Gee
448 Brighthill Drive
#02-143

Singapore S70448
Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGM 3R AND SLH 315H ON 30/05/2019 ALONG/ AT
SIN MING AVE

We refer to the above subject matter. Your insurer AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Lid (AIG)
has received a third party claim(s) against your motor insurance policy, and has appointed LKK
Auto Consultants Pte Lid 1o act on their behalf to handle this matter.

We highlight that this accident has not been reported to AIG.
Please note that you had been notified by our via mail by post from our office on 20/06/2019

Kindly proceed to lodge your accident report immedintely, giving the version of the accident
amongst other things related to the accident. The accident report can be lodged at any of AlG
reporting centres. For the listing of AIG reporting centres, you may refer to your Certificate of
Insurance or visit AIG Singapore’s website.

To enable us to look into the matter immediately, please let us hear from you within fourteen
(14) days from date of this letter (by 26/07/2019).

Please be reminded that in accordance with the terms and conditions under your policy, failure
of compliance, our principal M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd reserves the right to
repudiate liability.

If you need further assistance or clarifications, please contact the undersigned.

Yours faithfully.

Khanchna

Case Handler
Tel : 6841 2360
Fax: 6741 4108

Email : Khanchna@Ikkauto.com

c.c Claims Manager
AlG Asia Pacific nsurance Pre. Lid
(Motar Claims Depr)
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Singspore Post Limited

1@ Eunos Road 8

Singapore Post Centre
Singapore 08600

G5T Reg. Ho. : WI-DLBSES]-3
Customer Service Motline: 1eas

Date/Time 11/7/1819 @9:d6
Ne. Description

Amount(51)

i dccept Reglstersd &rticle Item

LN
1. Aef:ROIES1LE1I7SE Ctry : 54
Transaction No.:B824191928022
4. Ref:RCEEZS11E255G Ctry : 56
Transaction No. 8024191520823
3. Mef:RCIEIS118345G ctry : 54
Tranzaction Neo.:BE2419197 804
4, Ref:RCIE2511B48050G Ctry : %6
Tramvaction No.:B@24191928825
1 Sale of Postage Label 2.54
[Domestic)
Quantity: 1
Unit price: 1.54
Tetal G57T: 8.17
i G) RC2826118175G
Irsurance: .
Postage pald: .54
Transaction Mo.: BO24191920026
} Sale of Postage Label .5
{Comestic)
Qulﬁri.t:{: 1
Unit price: 1.
Total G5T: .17
pef , : { F)  RCIE2S118255G
Insurance: 0. oo
Postage pald: 2.54
Transsction No. : BE41919ID0E
4 Sale of Postage Label .54
(Domestic)
Quantity: 1
Wnit price: i.54
Total @&T: a.17
Ref, ) RE2ZEDS11BMLG
Insurance: LA
Postage pald: i.54
Transsction Mo.: Bal41919I 0026
S5 Sale of Postage Label .54
(Domestlic)
Quantity: 1
unit price: 2.54
Total G8T: 8,17
Ref ,: @ RC2E131164856
Insurance: 0,
Postage paid: 1.54
Transaction No. BE2A191500006
Total Ga7T 0.68
Total Amount 10,18
Cach 10,18
Enjoy up to 3% cashback on eligible online and

retall spend =ith the Spree Credlt Card,
Mo minimes spend required. TECs apply.

Sign op now ot singpost.com/ spreecard

Thank {nu for glulng ui the opportunity to serve
you. Pleass visit www.singpost.com for detsiled
Terms and Conditions.
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 16 August 2019 4:55 PM

Teo: NO3CRABSE@HOTMAILCOM

Cc Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGM 3R AND SLH 315H ALONG/AT CARPARK LOT AT BLK 448
BRIGHTHILL DRIVE ON 30/05,/2019

Attachments: GIA Addendum form SGM3R pdf

Qur Ref: CC4/AIG19009988/Gkb3
Your Ref: SGM3R

LIM LAY GEE
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGM 3R [AIG] AND SLH 315H ALONG/AT CARPARK LOT AT BLK 448 BRIGHTHILL DRIVE ON
3l /05/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AlG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SLH 315H against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. We will therefore
proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Kindly also re-confirm the date of Accident as to whether it occurred on 30/05/2019 or 31/05/2019 and fill/sign the
GIA Addendum form (as attached) only if it Is on 31/05/2019.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360 | emall: Khanchna@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Pritiane

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case | Nouied £u Submated | Ad) Assigred | Ad) Apt [Aifj Submitted | Ins Auth'ed Slatus ]
|07 20 2019 Biun 301 ss2.20000 |5$2,200.00 e fr By
Fot Rag gy petit wstimates | | View noe | Cancel Caen |

Claim Datails

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]

| Insured TUm Lay Gee, ID: 51239570A, Tel +6596370231
e i, |TANG WUN SOW, 1D S11033500
e g SLH315H |oate of Loss: fl\l;gsm:?}l.':;:ri From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r}]
Claim Type: |TP / 76034754325G FORCYICOWe 12100441911 (Comprehensive)
E::::;q SGMIR I?ll?u::ﬂ MADO1885
Eiress

Hegairer 833 Motorsports Pre Lid () 160 SIN MING DR #02-09,SIN MING AUTOCITY, 575722 Sin Ming - Tel:

pondling | ATG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel; 65-6419-3000 .. [Handied by Lah, Chee-Heng] Chee-Heng Lanaig com

Etga Insurance Pto Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 63380477
| Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 5256-1561 . [Handied by XING GUO QIANG] .. [Final Rpt due 17/06/2019] |
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case mai |

+ AIG_SG (05/08/2019); Re: Request For OT GIA Report
« AlG_SG (0B/07/2019) Re: No Ol GIA Report

« AIG_SG (19/08/1019): Rei No O] GIA Report
L

AIG_SG (19/06/7019): AIGENCRYPT [EXTERNAL] Re: No OT GIA Report
AIG_SG (07/06/2019): Request To Upload TP GIA Raport
AIG_SG (07/06/2019): No OI GIA Report

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View Al | Search Tasks | Create New Task | _Compiete |

Due Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Completed On Created On Dane?
No ragults.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 14/11/2019
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Claim Documents

*SLH315H (76034754325G)

Page 1 of 3

[SGM3R]
T
TANG WUN SOW
May 31 2019 5:00PM
[Lim Lay Gee]
833 Motorsports Pte Lid
|Letters/Correspondences [perpoge 1~ &4
[Mo_|[Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbrnail | Print
|1 [ Third Party Express Settlement - Payment Braakdown @ &
Assessmant Reports [iperpage V] &
| Ne | Firwlieed On AIG Asis Pacific Insurance Pts. Ltd. (SG) | Thurmbaail | Print
1 [osoeno e |Aecdemsatament IS
Photes/Images o e
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumisall Print
1 | 10/10/19 09013 Ganeral View 0 ladrs | &
7 | 10/30y19 09:13 Ganeral View B | tcadies | &
3 |10/10/19 09:13 | General View 0| s | &
& |10/10/19 09111 | General View 0| tooars | B
190811 | General View 0| teadws | &
B |10/10/1909:13 | General View 0| eaws | BB
7 |10/ 0813 | General View 0| waaws | M
B |10/10/19 09:13 Ganeral View 0| wawc | B
§ | 10/10/19 05:13 | Genersl View 0| wetws | A
10 |10/16/1909:13 | Geners! View O | aaws | B
11 [10/10/19 09:13 | General View 0| tawc | A
12 | 10/10/19 09:13 General View 0| waaws | A
13 |10/10/1908:13 | General View O wews | B
14 [10/10/1909:11 | General View 0| e | A
15 |1p/10/19 08113 General View D | loadirc | A
16 |i0/10/19 0913 | Ganersl View 0| teaws | @A
17 |10/10/19 09:13 | General View 0| weaire | M
18 [10/10/19 0513 | General View © | o | A
19 [10/10/1909:13 | General View 0| weawrc | B4
0 |10/10/19 09113 | General View 0| tedbc | A
21 |10/10/1% 09:13 General View 0| twaws | A
21 |10/10/1909:13 | General View O eerwc | 2
71 [10/10/1908:13 | General View © | crc | A
24 | 10/10/19 D9:13 Chassis Number 0| woecirc | B4
|25 |10/10/19 09:13 Odameter Reading 0| tmdwe | A
|26 |10/10/19 09114 | Dismantied Parts 0| eaws | A
127 [ 10/10/1909:14 | Dismantied Parts @ s | @A
28 | 10/10/19 08:14 | Dismantied Parts 0| weaws | M|
29 |10/10/19 DS:14 Dlamantied Parts I_I Loag G | B
0 |1/10/18 00:14 | Dlsmantied Parts 0 adpc | M
3 | 10/10/19 0914 Dismanticd Parts 0| leadwc | A
31 [10/10/19 09114 | Dismantied Parts 0| ewre | @
33 |10/10/19 09:14 | Dismantied Parts 0 tedwe | 4
34 10/10/1908:14 | Dismantled Parts )| teadws | B
35 |10/10/16 09:14 | Dismantied Parts 0| tosdirc | WA
3% [10/10/1908:14 | Dismantied Parts O | Loatws
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 14/11/2019
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Page 2 of 3

g-unmfcumpﬂmlm: Il_zg__ei-__fﬂj_g
Mo | Fnatzed On | LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid (HG) Thumbnall | Print
¥l

137 |10/10/1909:14 | Dismantied Parts 0 edvc |
38 |10/10/19 0%:14 | Dismantied Parts 0| weaws | B

19 |10/10/19 09:14 | Dismantied Parts 0| Leavs B

40 [10/10/19 09:14 | Dismantied Parts 0| waws | W
41 (10101909114 | Dismantied Parts O wars | B
‘a2 |10/10/1309:14 | Dismantied Parts O waewc | &
141 | 10y10719 09:14 Dismantied Parts 0 weaws | B
44 | 10/10/19 06:14 | Dismantied Parts 0| weaws | &
‘a5 | 10/10/10 08:14 | Dlsmantied Parts 0 wur | M
46 |10/10/1909:14 | Dismantied Parts (O | waews | &

&7 |10/10/19 09:14 | Dismantied Parts Q| ldws | H
a8 |10/10/1909:14 | Dismantled Parts Loed 76 | B

45 |10/10/1% 09:14 | Dismantied Parts 0| waws | &

50 | 10/10/15 09:14 | Dismantied Parts 0| waws | A
51 |10/10/1909:14 | Dismantled Parts O wws | B

57 [10/10/1909:14 | Dlsmantied Parts _ﬂ__ Load G | BA

53 |10/10/1909:14 | Dismantied Paris @ | aaws | 4 |
54 |10/10/1909:14 | Dismantied Parts Q| wcws | A

ES | 10/10/19 09:14 Dlamantied Parts I_I toad PG | B
|58 |10/10/19 00:14 Blsmantied Parts 1| adirc | &
|57 |10/10/1909:14 | Dismantied Parts 0O i | P
‘58 | 10/10/190%:14 | Dismantied Parts @ | oaaws | B

59 | 10/10/1909:14 | Dismantied Parts Q| owws |
60 |10/10/19 0914 | Dismantied Parts 0| ooars | B
61 | 10/10/1000:14 | Dismantied Parts g Load G | BA
62 |10/10/1909:14 | Dismantied Parts 0| codws | B2

63 |10/10/19 0%:14 | Dismantied Parts 0| tadwc | M

B4 | 11/10/1309:00 | mecident photo Hme stamp 0| wows | B

Documentation [1porpage  [~] &

No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Conmittants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbmail | Print

1 |10/06/19 1433 | EMAIL FROM AIG DD 04062019 @ | Losaror

2 |10/06/19 14:33 WKSP NOTICE ) | Load FDF

3 |19/06/10 09:36 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF

A | I0/06/1% 10131 Man reporting letter, Load POF

5 |11/10/19 09:18 LETTER TOD OI 0 | LosaroF

6 |14/11/1902:58 | WORKSHOP INVOICE @) | Load Por

7 |14/11/19 0o:58 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM g Load PDF

B [14/11/16 09:58 | Release Voucher Load PDF

g |14/11/19 09:58 RENTAL RECEIPT _s toad POF

10 [14/11/19 09:58 | LYA SEARCH Load POF

11 140117190958 (LoD @ | Load Por

Ne |Finaleed On AIG Asia Pacifle Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnail | Print
1 |mijos/19 1406 |TP LOD g Load POF

I [34/10/1211:1% | OI GIA addendum 1 Load POF

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

i
u
f

There areé no document checklists configured.

il
W
Shaw Remarks To: [] Handling Insurer
P REMathl BN DFWME UNEESD YO Show £ 1D sther parnes
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp... 14/11/2019
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SGM3R (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA LEXUS GS250
SLH315H (TP veh) ALUTO 2.5 (A)
| Date of Accident: |31/05/2019
Global Sum Settiement | | [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate - 3,840.00
Final Repair Cost s 2,200.00
Loss of Use -8 days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) g 72000| © days
LTA / GIA Search Fee -1 7.45
Others -1 0.00
- §
Final Settlemeant Sum -3 2,927 .45

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liahility 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No  BOLA Scenario No.

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liabilily to ba flled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nal apply.
Remarks

Paymant Instruction: Payes’s Breakdown

1) |833 Motorsports Pte Lid 3 2,927 45
2) -
3) 5
4) §|
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 1;,;:;”
LKK Auto Consultants Pie Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
[Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;

Medical Report/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_... 14/11/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregne 1sssor1ssr)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel; 6258-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email; sur@lkkauto com;assignmentsi@kkaulo.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flle No: CC4/AIG18005988/GKB302
Date: 14112019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid,  Policy No: 2100441811
.  SLH315H Insured Vehicle No : SGM3R
Date of Loss: 31052018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 760347543256
I IDENTIFICATI |
Reg No; SLHI1S5H
Make & Model: TOYOTA LEXUS GS250 AUTO, 2.5 (A) Engine No: 4GRO611853
Reg. Date: 13/01/2010 (Man, Year: 2008) Chassis No. JTHBK262X05113477
Colour: White Cdomeler: 243765 km
Engine Capacity: 2500 cc
Market Valua/New Car NIA
Price
Sum Insured (S$): Markel Value/New Car Price
General Condition Steering (Serviceahle); Yes Foolbrake [Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo  Pre-accident Condition:
M FTYR
Front Tyre Size: 245/40 R1B Rear Tyre Size: 245/40 R18
Front Left Side: Yokohama & mm Rear Left Side Yokohama 6 mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama & mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama & mm
The above vines regresent the remmnmg fyme treads depih
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  DIff %
Parts 3,040.00 2,120.30 918,70 30.25
Miscellan=ous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 800.00 630.00 270.00 30.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5§) 3,940.00 2,750.30 1,189.70 30.20
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 2,200.00
Nett Amount (S§) 3,940.00 2,200.00 1,740.00 44,16
+ Car Rental (6.0 x 55120.00/day) (S%) 720.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S5) 7.45
Nett Liability (S§) 2,927.45
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 04/08/2019
Date Inspected. 06/08/2018 Inspected Al 833 Molorsports Pte Lid

Estimated Period of Repair

160 SIN MING DR #02-09,SIN MING
AUTOCITY
Singapore 575722

3.0 days

Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG

Manager: Khanchna Polhuraj

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusecbox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 14/11/2019
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NOTE: This report represents our fingings af the lime and piace of inspection staled herein, Such inspection has bean carmied out fo the best of our
knowihidge and ability but any ofher fabdfy under any ather orcumstances s hemady suorassy svchided

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 14/11/2019
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Gty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
' *FRONT RIGHT HEADLAMP Cracked 900.00F  *900.00FL
2 1 *FRONT BUMPER GARNISH (UPPER) Deformed 35500F  *282.00FL
a1 *FRONT BUMPER Broken 570.00F  *570.00FL
4 1 *FRONT LOWER BUMPER GRILL Broken 160.00F  *93.40FL
5 1 *NUMBER PLATE HOLDER & BRACKET Deformed 14000FS  *50.00FS
6 1 *FRONT BUMPER GRILLE SUPPORT (GRILLE) Broken a2000F  *320.00FL
T 1 ‘FRONT BUMPER GRILLE Deformed 370.00F *“370.00FL
8 1 “FRONT CUSHION Cracked 107.00F  *107.00FL
g 1 *FRONT BUMPER BRACKET Cracked 11800F  *118.00FL

F=Franchise part. S=Spcett. L=LntitemDec
Sub Total (S§)  3,040.00 2,810.40
= List Item Discount on L ltems 0.00/25.00% (S§) D.00 §90.10

Total Parts (S§)  3,040.00  2,120.30

[ Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 14/11/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellanecus items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 REMOVE,JACK OUT ,STRAIGHTEN JPANEL New 500.00 300.00
BEATING ,ALIGN
2  PUTTY AND RESPRAY AFFECTED AREAS REPAIRS Mew 300.00 300.00
3  CHECK WIRING AND LIGHTING MNew 100.00 30.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 900.00 630.00

Report was unsubmitted duning this print-out,

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 14/11/2019



