Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 23 September, 2019 1:12 PM

To: teamautopl@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; TG Lim (LKK Auto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref SJF 1610 H & SLM 7392 L (Yr Ref) Dated 28th May 2019 LKK REF
CC4/A1G19009987/Bhb3

Without Prejudice

Dear sir/Madam,

We refer further to our below email.

Our surveyor recommended that the vehicle is not economical to repair and proposed for a Nett Value of $6,000.00.
Kindly forward to us LOD for our further action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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" Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 9:01 AM

To: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref SJF 1610 H & SLM 7392 L (Yr Ref) Dated 28th May 2019

Dear Peach,

Thank you for your email.
Dear Vic,

Kindly assist.

Thank you



Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 6:46 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Our Ref SJF 1610 H & SLM 7392 L (Yr Ref) Dated 28th May 2019

Dear Shu Pei,

Good day.

May you get Vic to send us an official email to state that vehicle recommend total loss asap?
We are waiting for the email before owner send for de-reg.

Kindly note that COE Rebate amount will drop daily.

Thank you.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,

Peach Ang

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

385 Sin Ming Drive

#01-02 Vicom Inspection Centre
Singapore 575718

On Tue, Jun 18, 2019 at 5:20 PM Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Peach,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vic at 6841 2096.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you



To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June 2019 5:00 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Our Ref SJF 1610 H & SLM 7392 L (Yr Ref) Dated 28th May 2019

Dear LKK Team,

May you assist to send us an official email to state that vehicle SJF 1610 H recommended for total loss?
Vehicle was surveyed by Mr Lim on 6th June 2019.

Thank you.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall
not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his
personal injuries.*

Cheers,

Peach Ang

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd

Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956



385 Sin Ming Drive
#01-02 Vicom Inspection Centre
Singapore 575718



