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File Led

S1UBLAVE 1 #0225 PAY A UIEN 77

Your Ref: D19003663 "

Our Refl; CS/ECI190000

The Motor Claims Depe
First Capital Insurance |

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECT

Please be informed that -
on 06/06/2019 at the
following to repor:-

Workshop Estimate An
Revised Estimale A

“Check” Items Amone
Total

Market Value

LTA Reimburscient

Neitt Value

Description of '
The vehicle sustiine:!
at the ofs front porti
affected due to collisin

Comments/ Prescnt &
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 3 days

Yours faithfully.
Kenneth Kong
Automotive Assosso

A
i,
-

Company Registration Mo, 19960T198R

o niEEA TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX @ (065) 62564315

Date: 07 June 2019

1 NO. __SHC 5965Y .

<110 of the abovementioned vehicle

101 Services Pte Ltd and have the

58.266.87

19,619.51
0887

ofeide



MS @ FirstCapital

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel: {65) 6222 ¢311 Fax (65) 6222 3547

MS First Capital Insurance Limited (ofeg ho 1950001060 GSF Reg Mo M2-000L6T59

Claims & Mator Underwsiting Dept 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 0EBRTT

Tet (65] 6507 3848 Fax [65)6507 3849

www mafirstcapital.oom.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 04-06-2019 Our Ref No. D18003663MFSH
Accident Date 03-06-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHADEETR Third Party Vehicle. SHC5695Y
Survey Location NO. 2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63
Contact Person. CANDY KONG
Contact No. G2876666/ 0 Fax No. 62571330
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
i e LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Flease submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
MIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report,

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST
TRANS-CAB AUTO

SERVICES PTELTD
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA

Cc : Workshop Attention. NIL

TP Solicitor Fax No., NA

Officer Incharge HENRY KAD

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly subrmit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, no signature reguired.

I |:; T B




Shirie! Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 11:56 AM

To: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)’

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1906-019--Accident involving SHC 5965Y & SHA 0867R on
03/06/2019

Attachments: ESTIMATE MARKED.pdf

Hi Shirley

We confirmed COR amount $ 6,350 (b4 GST).

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

+++ please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
ﬁ TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

— a JE Main Line: (65) 6287 6666 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764

Wehsite: www.lranscab.com.sg

This messs

age is confidential, It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity Of other legal rules. If
=d |t by mistake, please lat us know by e-mail reply a 1d delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
s contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-matlls are not screened
ponse deadlines, The integrity and security of this message canndt De guaranteed on the Internel.

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 1 July, 2019 4:04 PM

To: 'Ng Wai Yin' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg=>

Subject: FW: TCS REF: AAD1906-019--Accident involving SHC 5965Y & SHA 0867R on 03/06/2019

RE-SEND
Dear Wai Yin,

Please confirm final fig $ 6,350.00 (lump sum) @ 3 days of repairs before GST.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Shirley Hiew (L1% Auto) <5 JHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 7 June 19 4585 P

To: ‘Henry Kao Cai Jie; CWS Motor Claims!

Cc: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY AT TESTMENT - 01 2003663MF5H/1
Attachments: SHI 57G5Y - i Acvise.p

Dear Henry,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehi'

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@|kkauto.cor
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue !

From: Admin-D (LKKAuta) [mailto:ac!
Sent: Thursday, 6 June 2019 2:59 PV

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorcla’ o ms tal.cc =+ assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@m ' S ur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - [ : £l

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Phone:; 6841-1972 | email: assipnments@|!
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Ave

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cw: Sfiret com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 6 June 2019 2:37 PI

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorcls | .= Henry Kao Cai lie
<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT -



Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessar
Kindly submit your report via CW

Note: All the accident reports are C

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Lim!
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated | ' no!

This email has
WL aVE.Comm

~ur perusal.

1o this mail.

"G antivirus software.,



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

>Backto OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owmner 1D Type:

Cwner 10

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.;

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Yehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis Mo

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQF Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Page 1 of' 1

Company
3B7BK

SHCS9458Y

Yes

03 Jun 2019

RENALULT

LATITUDE 2.0L DC1 AUTO DvAB 4DR
Red

2015
MYRBEIPCO02B29
WF1ABL15AUCZE2210
127.0kW (170 bhpl
£19.998.00

03 Aug 2015

03 Aug 2013

0

$19.998.00

Yes
02 Aug 2023
%14,298.00

02 Aug 2023

& - Car up to 1600cc & F76W (1300hp)
&

$50.2356.00

£26,147.00

$41,145.00

Plesse note that the B-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichewver is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 03 Jun 2019

OK

hitps://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereg Input ?FUNC TION_ID=F030M4...

3/6/2019



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No. : 6287 6666 Fax No.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHC 5965Y

_I-_I..—I_I._In_I._l_l—\.—\..-l_l—l—\._l_h—k—l—l-.l.—l—l_-l-.u—l_.i_l—l—l—l

Wehicle No.:
Chassis No.:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Date of Accident :
Third Party Insurer :
Date of Registration:

PART
BUMPER COVER FRT
BUMPER SPOILER FRT
BUMPER ABSORBER FRT
BUMPER RETAINER FRT RH
BUMPER SUPPORT FRT
BUMPER UNDERTRAY FRT
BUMPER GRILLE LOWER FRT
BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE RH
BUMPER BEAM FRT
HEADLAMP RH
HEADLAMP PANEL FRT RH
FENDER PAMEL FRT RH
WHEELARCH FRT EH
FENDER BRACKET LOWER RH
FENDER INSULATOR RH
TOW COVER FRT
FRONT BRACE PANEL
RADIATOR GRILLE

RADIATOR GRILLE BADGE 'RENAULT'

RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME
FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL
FRAME FULL SUPPORT BRACKET
BONNET

BONMET INSULATOR
BONNET STRUT LH

BONNET STRUT RH

BONNET HINGE LH

BONMET HINGE RH

BONNET LOCK

BONMET CABLE

AAD1906-019
/Z/W/Wéﬂaf:{,/
2 Loy B (352

SHC 5965Y
VF1ABL15AUC282210
RENAULT
LATITUDE
3619
FIRST CAPITAL
3/8/2015
LIST
Je, 125942
I 18175
o, 39468
Il 15141
/12388
S 47283
‘L 266.80
SO 207.21
2T 91408
I 118443
A 152.15)

S, 1579
1, 13084
S 2861
A 17722
US 1,707.78
Ju. 22536
T 135375
61590
A 8979
/T 194163
Jis 40573
Ju. 8861
Ju  gger
M 34831
2 34831

/T 305.48
R, 11919

mmmmwmmmm%m%m%mmwmmmmawmwmﬁﬂéﬂ%m

X

4, 78383 —
€py 27884 —

X



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No. : 6287 6666  Fax No.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHC 5965Y

1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
.
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
1
2
1
1
1

BOMNNET CABLE COVER

BONNET SEAL OUTER

BONMET SEAL INMER

DOOR PANEL FRT RH

DOOR HINGE UPPER RH

DOOR HINGE LOWER RH

DOOR CHECK FRT RH

DOOR LOCK FRT RH

DOOR CATCH FRT RH

DOOR HANDLE OUTER FRT RH
DOOR HANDLE COVER FRT RH
DOOR HANDLE MODULE FRT RH
DOOR REGULATOR FRT RH

DOOR REGULATOR MOTOR FRT RH
DOOR REGULATOR GUIDE FRT RH
DOOR MOULDING FRONT RH
DOOR FINISHER INNER FRONT RH
DOOR FINISHER FRONT RH

DOOR CASING FRONT RH

DOOR GRAB HANDLE FRONT RH
DOOR BLIND FRONT RH

DOOR WHEATHESTRIP FRONT RH
DOOR SEAL FRONT RH

DOOR GLASS RUNNER SEAL FRONT RH
DOOR WAIST SEAL QUTER FRONT RH
DOOR WAIST SEAL INNER FRONT RH
DOOR MIRROR ASSY RH

DOOR MIRROR GLASS RH

DOOR MIRROR BACK COVER RH
LOWER ARM RH L70Y

KMNUCKLE ARM RH L70Y

ABSORBER FRT RH L70Y
DRIVESHAFT RH

STABILIZER BAR FRT

STABILIZER LINK FRT

ROCKER PANEL INNER GARNISH RH
ROCKER PANEL INNER RH

ROCKER PANEL OUTER RH

mmm‘hﬁmmmwahﬂﬁw%mmwmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmmwmmm

AAD1906-019

S 16103 ¢
fe,  gp36 v
FL 15728 X
A, 284466 —
Zys 26128 —
217 30055 —
B 19477 T
JT 90875
A 131.23
fi. 47776
(. 1322
S 13360
7N 505.19
S, 79646
Ju. 12097
S 17682

. 32344 X
S 42310
P 1,509.06
S~ 21096
S 74180
f. 41066
So 16202
S~ 22931
R 33469
. 11564
S 1,483.40
Sy 14820
I~ 21846, v
Dr) 68576 <

% 84698 —
% 36054 —
M 174745 ¥

Tl 60465 <

A, P2 X

fu 46651 ¢

T 102479 £

rt 118499 X




Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1906-019
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111

Tel Mo. : 6287 6666 Fax Ne.: 6257 1330

CO./GST Reqg. No. 2010196266

SHC 5965Y
1 ROCKER PANEL CENTER RH $ T 990.25 ¥
1 WIPER RESERVOIR MOTOR $ S 27006 X
1 WIPER RESERVOIR $ lo. 34825 ¢
1 WIPER RESERVOIR NECK $ Sy 13611 ¢
1 DOOR HARNESS WIRE RH S I 2567000 £
1 STEERING PINION RACK L70Y $ yC 441311
TOTAL % 43,815.55
10% $ 4,381.55
$ 39,433.99
Special Nett
1 FRONT DOOR STICKER ‘Trans-cab’ $ 7 8000 (ara—
1 FRONT DOOR STICKER 'Classic $ e 8000 " FA—
1 BUMPER CLIP FRT $ ALl 66.00 ¥
1 BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT RH 3 Al 1200 X
1 BUMPER SUPPORT CLIP FRT RH $ AA 1050 X
1 BUMPER GRILLE LOWER CLIP $ A 6900 X
1SET  FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL CLIP $ AA_ 70.00 X
2 FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL NUT $ 4 2000 £
2 FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL STUD $ VA 3000 4
1 WHEELARCH CLIP FRT RH $ Az 3050 —
1 FRONT RIGHT TYRE $ P 30000 b~
1 FRONT RIGHT TYRE RIM $ 47 38000 —
1SET  Front licence plate with holder $ Ly 80.00
1SET  RADIATOR GRILLE SCREW $ Sl 1600
1SET RADIATOR GRILLE FEAME CLIP % “Ta_ 5200
1 WINDSCREEN SEALANT $ A4 25380
1 FRONT WINDSCREEN MOULDING $ 4. 120.00
1 FRONT WINDSCREEN INNER SPONGE SEAL g A~ 100.00
6  BONNET INSULATOR CLIP L70Y $ Aa 730
2 BONNET STRUT L70Y $ A 8861
2 BONNET CABLE CLIP L7O0Y $ Ve 631
2 BONNET CABLE COVER SCREW L70Y $ vre o 10.85
TOTAL § 1,882.88
TOTAL PARTS $ 41,316.87

LABOUR



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 563111
Tel No. : 6287 6666 Fax MNo.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 2010196266

SHC 5965Y

Panel beating, knocking and straightening the
necessary portion, remove and renewal of parts, adjust
and realign the same

Putty and spray painting of the affected portion.
To rust-proofing of the affected areas.

To transfer of front windscreen fittings and conduct
water seepage test.

To transfer of front fender fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test.

To check steering geometry and computer wheel
alignment

To dismantle and refit front end suspension,
undercarriage parts, final checking and testing.

To transfer of front bumper fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test.

To remove and refit interior fittings, trimings, garnish,
fittings and other, to enable repair,

To transfer of front door fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test.

To transfer of tire, rim and on wheel balancing.

To transfer of bonnet fittings, attachment and perform
water seepage test.

To Check Electrical Lighting Concerned.

Labour charge to mount and dismount vehicle on jig
bench, to facilitate repair.

AAD1906-019

6,000.00 S/

6,000.00 "//‘*’K
170.00 g2y

YA 17000 X

A 38000 X
220.00 ,,4-(
38000 Z 2

a_ 38000 X

e 38000 ¥

380.00 0/_,7

170,00 Zey

v 38000 X

170.00 Zoy

~a/ 38000 X



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1906-019

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No.: 6287 6666  Fax No.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHC 5965Y

To apply paint protection system (PPS) maintain and
enhancement $ v~ 380.00 /\’

Towing Fees $ 15000 5/

To check ABS and brake efficiency, final checking and
testing. $ v 380.00 X

To remove and refit air bag system and reset vehicle

warning indicators. $ na 48000 X
TOTAL $ 16,950.00
Over All Total § 58,266.87
LUMP SUM (REPAIR DAY) 28-DAYS

Jﬁ/%{



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: G256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 12-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI12009974/Ksd3n2
soroansontond poreassry ©= @ [N
Code: FCIZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHA BETR Veh. Inspected SHC 5865Y
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D12003663MFSH Excess (3) 0.00
Assign From  HENRY KAO Assign Date 06/06/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model RENAULT LATITUDE (A) c.c 19495
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. VF1ABL15AUC282210 Colour METALLIC WHITE / RED
Odometer 584384 Steering JAMMED
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NiL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI 3Imm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI 3 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 GITI 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 215/60 R16 GITI 8 mm
4. Description of Damages ;
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE /S FRONT PORTION AND UNDERCARRIAGE.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  03/06/2019 Inspection Date D&/06/2019
Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
MOD.2 ANG MO KIO 5T 63
SINGAPORE 569111
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)JTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE MOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5h. Estimate Days of Repair :

3 Working Days

!ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:




TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHC 5365Y

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-3607126-R

Page Mo.1of 5

.. | Estimate By |Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts - Condition % WE: rkshup?;;i s %E! iy
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER COVER FRT SERVICEABLE 1,259.42 -
1|BUMPER SPOILER FRT SERVICEABLE 181.75 -
1|BUMPER ABSORBER FRT SERVICEABLE 394.68 -
1|BUMPER RETAINER FRT RH SERVICEABLE 151.41 .
1|BUMPER SUPPORT FRT SERVICEABLE 123.88 -
1|BUMPER UNDERTRAY FRT SERVICEABLE 472,83 -
1{BUMPER GRILLE LOWER FRT SERVICEABLE 266.80 -
1|BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE RH SERVICEABLE 207.21 -
1|BUMPER BEAM FRT TO REPAIR SEE 914.08 -
LABOUR
1|HEADLAMP RH SERVICEABLE 1,184.43 -
1|HEADLAMP PANEL FRT RH TO REPAIR SEE 152.15 -
LABOUR
1|FENDER PANEL FRT RH BENT 783.83 783.83
1|WHEELARCH FRT RH CRACKED 278 84 278.84
1|FENDER BRACKET LOWER RH SERVICEABLE 15.79 -
1|FENDER INSULATOR RH SERVICEABLE 130.84 -
1|TOW COVER FRT SERVICEABLE 28.61 -
1|FRONT BRACE PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 177.22 -
LABOUR
1|RADIATOR GRILLE SERVICEABLE 1,707.78 -
1|RADIATOR GRILLE BADGE "RENAULT" SERVICEABLE 225.36 -
1|RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME SERVICEABLE 1,353.75 -
1|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 615.90 -
LABOUR
1|FRAME FULL SUPPORT BRACKET TO REPAIR SEE 89.79 -
LABOUR
1|BONNET TO REPAIR SEE 1,941.63 -
LABOUR
1|BONNET INSULATOR SERVICEABLE 405.73 -
1|BONNET STRUT LH SERVICEABLE 88.61 -
1|BONNET STRUT RH SERVICEABLE 88.61 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18009974/Ksd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.2 of 5
Qty Description of Parts cundiﬂnn___  we rk!ﬁﬁﬁ?:i}ﬁ A{:%x,
1|BONNET HINGE LH TO REPAIR SEE 348.31 -
LABOUR
1|BONNET HINGE RH TO REPAIR SEE 34831 -
LABOUR
1|BONNET LOCK TO REPAIR SEE 305.48 -
LABOUR
1|BONNET CABLE SERVICEABLE 119.19 -
1|BONNET CABLE COVER SERVICEABLE 161.03 -
1|BONNET SEAL OUTER SERVICEABLE 92.36 -
1|BONNET SEAL INNER SERVICEABLE 157.28 -
1|DOOR PANEL FRT RH BENT 2,844.66 2,844 66
1|DOOR HINGE UPPER RH DISTORTED 261.28 261.28
1|DOOR HINGE LOWER RH DISTORTED 300.55 300.55
1|DOOR CHECK FRT RH SERVICEABLE 194.77 -
1|DOOR LOCK FRT RH TO REPAIR SEE 908.75 -
LABOUR
1|DOOR CATCH FRT RH TO REPAIR SEE 131.23 -
LABOUR
1|DOOR HANDLE OUTER FRT RH SERVICEABLE 477.76 -
1|DOOR HANDLE COVER FRT RH SERVICEABLE 13.22 -
1|DOOR HANDLE MODULE FRT RH SERVICEABLE 133.60 .
1|DOOR REGULATOR FRT RH TO REPAIR SEE 505.19 -
LABOUR
1|DOOR REGULATOR MOTOR FRT RH SERVICEABLE 796.46 -
1|DOOR REGULATOR GUIDE FRT RH SERVICEABLE 120.97 -
1|DOOR MOULDING FRONT RH SERVICEABLE 176.82 -
1|DOOR FINISHER INNER FRONT RH SERVICEABLE 323.44 -
1|DOOR FINISHER FRONT RH SERVICEABLE 423.10 -
1|DOOR CASING FRONT RH SERVICEABLE 1,509.06 -
1|DOOR GRAB HANDLE FRONT RH SERVICEABLE 210.96 -
1|DOOR BLIND FRONT RH SERVICEABLE 741.80 -
1|DOOR WEATHERSTRIP FRONT RH SERVICEABLE 410.66 -
1|DOOR SEAL FRONT RH SERVICEABLE 162.02 -
1|DOOR GLASS RUNNER SEAL FRONT RH SERVICEABLE 22931 -
1|DOOR WAIST SEAL OUTER FRONT RH SERVICEABLE 334.69 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19009974/Ksd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315
Reg, Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-96071%6-R

Page No.3of &

o T E“IMB = ... i e
Qty Description of Parts Condition |\ Chop 1?}'} ; il
1|DOOR WAIST SEAL INNER FRONT RH SERVICEABLE 115.64 -
1|DOOR MIRROR ASSY RH SERVICEABLE 1,483.40 -
1|DOOR MIRROR GLASS RH SERVICEABLE 148.20 -
1|D0OOR MIRROR BACK COVER RH SERVICEABLE 218.46 -
1|LOWER ARM RH LT0Y DISTORTED BB5.76 BR5.TE
1|KNUCKLE ARM RH L70Y BENT B46.98 846.98
1|ABSOREBER FRT RH L70Y BENT 360.54 360.54
1|DRIVESHAFT RH TO REPAIR SEE 1,747.45 -
LABOUR
1|STABILIZER BAR FRT SERVICEABLE 604.65 -
2|STABILIZER LINK FRT SERVICEABLE 117.22 -
1|ROCKER PANEL INNER GARNISH RH SERVICEABLE 466.51 -
1|ROCKER PAMEL INNER RH TO REPAIR SEE 1,024.79 -
LABOUR
1|ROCKER PAMEL OUTER RH TO REPAIR SEE 1,184.99 -
LABOUR
1|ROCKER PANEL CENTER RH TO REPAIR SEE 990.25 -
LABOUR
1|WIPER RESERVOIR MOTOR SERVICEABLE 270.06 -
1|WIPER RESERVOIR SERVICEABLE 348.25 -
1|WIPER RESERVOIR NECK SERVICEABLE 136.11 -
1|DOOR HARKNESS WIRE RH SERVICEABLE 2,670.00 -
1|STEERING PINION RACK LTOY TO REPAIR SEE 44131 -
LABOUR
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -4 381.56 -636.24
39,434.00 5,726.20
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER "TRANS-CAB™ (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 60.00
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER "CLASSIC" (SN} MECESSARY 80.00 15.00
1|BUMPER CLIP FRT (SN) MOT NECESSARY 66.00 -
1|BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 12.00 -
1|BUMPER SUPPORT CLIP FRT RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 10.50 -
1|BUMPER GRILLE LOWER CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 69.00 -
1|3ET FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL CLIP (SN} MOT NECESSARY 70.00 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18009974/Ksd3n2




1 V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

‘-J = ;‘- - 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607128-R Page Mo.4 of §
g 3 s e aametlin ]
Des arts Condition | Estimate By jOurAdjust
g f i\'mhﬂp'_ |
2|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL MUT (SN} NOT NECESSARY 20.00 -
2|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL STUD (SN} MOT MECESSARY 30.00 -
1|WHEELARCH CLIP FRT RH (SN} MECESSARY 30.50 30.50
1|FRONT RIGHT TYRE (30%)(SN) PUNCTURE 300.00 90.00
1|FRONT RIGHT TYRE RIM (SM) BENT 380.00 380.00
1|SET FRONT LICENCE PLATE WITH HOLDER (SN) SERVICEABLE B0.00 -
1|SET RADIATOR GRILLE SCREW (SN) SERVICEABLE 16.00 -
1|SET RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME CLIP (SM) MOT MECESSARY 52.00 -
1|WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 253.80 -
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN MOULDING (SN) HWOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN INNER SPONGE SEAL (SN) MOT MECESSARY 100.00 -
G|BONNET INSULATOR CLIP LTOY (SN) NOT NECESSARY 7.30 -
2|BOMNET STRUT L70Y [SN) NOT NECESSARY 88.61 -
2|BONMNET CABLE CLIP LTOY (SN) NOT NECESSARY 6.31 -
2|BONNET CABLE COVER SCREW L70Y (SN) MOT NECESSARY 10.85 -
1,882.87 575.50
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTEMING THE 6,000.00 500.00
MECESSARY PORTION,REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS,ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF BUMPER BEAM FRT,HEADLAMP PANEL
FRT RH,FRONT BERACE PANEL, FRAME FULL SUPPORT
PAMEL,FRAME FULL SUPPORT
BRACKET BONNET,BONNET HINGE LH BONNET HINGE
RH,BONNET LOCK,DOCR LOCK FRT RH,DOOR CATCH
FRT RH,DOOR REGULATOR FRT RH,DRIVESHAFT
RH,ROCKER PANEL INMER RH,ROCKER PANEL QUTER
RH,ROCKER PANEL CENTER RH AND STEERING PINION
RACK L7OY.
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 6,000.00 660.00
PORTION.
TO RUST-PROCFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS. 170.00 60.00
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT WINDSCREEN FITTINGS AND |HOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
CONMDUCT WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT FENDER NOT NECESSARY 380.00 =
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
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TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER 220.00 60.00
WHEEL ALIGMNMENT.
TO DISMANTLE AND REFIT FRONT END 380.00 220.00
SUSPENSION UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS, FINAL
CHECKING AND TESTING.
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT BUMPER NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR NOT NECESSARY 380.00 ;
FITTINGS, TRIMINGS,GARNISH,
FITTINGS AND OTHER, TO ENABLE REPAIR.
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT DOOR 380.00 60.00
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO TRANSFER OF TIRE,RIM AND ON WHEEL 170.00 20.00
BALANCING
TO TRANSFER OF BONNET FITTINGS, ATTACHMENT AND |NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERNED. 170.00 20.00
LABOUR CHARGE TO MOUNT AND DISMOUNT VEHICLE |NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
ON JIG BEMCH,TO FACILITATE REPAIR.
TO APPLY PAINT PROTECTION SYSTEM (PPS) MAINTAIN [NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
AND ENHANCEMENT.
TOWING FEES. 150.00 50.00
TO CHECK ABS AND BERAKE EFFICIENCY FINAL NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
CHECKING AND TESTING.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT AIR BAG SYSTEM AND RESET  |NOT NECESSARY 480.00 -
VEHICLE WARNING INDICATORS,
16.950.00 1,650.00
GRAND TOTAL 58,266.87 7,951.7T0
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAle %‘ﬁ% o
_(TOITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
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