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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Jack Ng <jackng@honda com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2019 1:08 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Kindly advise the status of SGM 9961R for survey arrangement

Hi Shian chan,

kindly close this case at your side, our client will claim QD first.

Thank you and have a great days ahead
Chears |1

tlest Regards,
Jack, Ng
Hp: 8288 6309

Email : Jackng@honda.com. sg

HODY REPAIR AND PAINT CENTRE

255 Alexandra Rpad Singapore 159937

DID : +65 6514 5481 FAX : +65 6362 5015
Kah Mator Co. Sdn. Bhd.

{& MEMBER OF ORIENTAL HOLDING BERHAD)
\Website:

o ety Facebook page
ﬁﬁ Please consider the environment before printing this email

CONFIBENTIAL NOTE: The Infisrmation contsined in the e-mnil is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named aboye md
Py cotitain information that i privileped, confidential and exempt fromn disclosure under spphcable Yovw, I the reader uf this message s not the
intended recipient, vou are hersby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this eommunication i strictly prohibited. 15 you
Hiwe recctved this messaze in ermor, please iImmedintels notity the sender and delete the mail. Thank you fir vour collabdrution,

From: Shiau Chan [LKKAUto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2019 12:07 PM

To: Jack Ng <jackng@honda.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Kindly advise the status of SGM 9961R for survey arrangement

dear Jack,

Any updates as below email?

Fest Regards,

Shinu Chan (Ms) | Case Handlor

[ KK Auto Consuliants Pte Ltd

Ahone: 6256-3561 | email; slewsc@lkkauto. com | fax: 6256-4315



Summer Lee (LKK Auto!

From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November, 2019 3:40 PM

To: do-not-reply@merimen.com

Ce: assignments@lkkauto.com

Subject: TP VEHICLE SGM 9961R (YOUR REF: SNM19D202400)

This mail is associated with :
*SGMI961R (SNM19D202400)
[EP318R]
™
TAN CHIAM FONG
May 24 2019 7:00PM

Kah Motor Co Sdn Bhd

Dear Sir/Mdm,

According to the repairer M/s Think One Autocare Pte Ltd, the third party owner had convert to claim OD.

There Is no Inspection done, therefore we will close this case at our end without billing.
Thanks & Regards,

Shiau Chan [Ms)

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Tel: 6256 31561

This is an auto-generated email. Do not reply to this emall,

Sent by : SHIAU CHAN (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)



