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Your reft To Be Advised

Our rel:

The Motor Claims. Departiment

s il PAk ks

CCHEQI 900987 T 1 b3

M LHQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dicar SirfMadam.,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.

We refer to the above matter.,

1"k

st

Company an stration Mo 1996071988

oL clind) 623035610 F AN - b= 6l 56l s

Date: 04.06.2010

SHAIWIC

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 03.06.2019

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check” ltems Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement YValue
Mett Value

Deseription of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Rear portion

Commenis/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs:

Yours Taithiully,

KALVIN ANG
Licensed Appraiser

days

D 8% 1.320.00
D 55 070.00
1 53 -
b -
1 5% -
D55 -
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COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

Melt

il )
REPAIR ESTIMATE* l ( \
VEHICLE NO : SHA 3001C /2019 10:13 .
MAKE : lk L
MODEL __: HYUNDAI i40 L L(
Oty ]_ Parts Description/ Labour ]_ Tvpe Unit Prh:e Amount
Rear Bumper ! ] 5 553.00
Rear Bumper Clip 10 pes ey = | % 22.00
SUB TOTAL 5 S575.00
LESS 20% 5 115.00
DISCOUNTED TOTAL 5 460.00
Rear Bumper Rubber Mat wet 1'% 50.00
b 50.00
Labhour Charge
Panel Beating Zeols 40000
Spray Painting Charge Pol | § 300.00
Wiring Charge W i 30.00
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor 7 ot% 80.00
TOTAL LABOUR b 810.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL 5  1.320.00
§p- 444 5911
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Repairer of !

Acknowledged by Reparer

gInmre:

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will

be prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Survevor appointed by the insurance company.




Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

e e ——————— = ———
From: Tan Wei Yin <weiyintan@eqginsurance.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 5 August 2015 1:27 FM
To: Shu Pei (LKKAuUto)
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC5852U (O : EQI - DMI19HO02176) AMD

SHA3001C (TP : LKK REF - CC3/EQIT19009879,/T1gb3) on 01.06.2013

Dear Shu Pei,
Oi yet to report.

Suggest you proceed to finalise and let us have your WP report.

Please inform TP w/'s to send us their LOD directly while we continue to get insured to report the accident.

Thank you.

Regards,

Tan Wei Yin

TR

EQ Insurance Campany Limited

did tel fan 3

diCanfidestiol information may be contained in this messoge. If vou aré nel the intended recipient

From: Shu Pei {LKKAuto) [mailte:shupei@Ikkauto.com)]

Sent: Monday, August 5, 2019 9:44 AM

To: Tan Wei Yin <weiyin.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC5852U (01 : EQ - TBA) AND SHA3001C (TP
CC3/EQI19009879/T1gb3) on 01.06.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/ Madam,

We refer to the above matter.,

: LKK REF -




Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupeii@lkkauwto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuta)

sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 9:36 AM

To: Tan Wei Yin <weiyin.tan@eqginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC5852U {01 : EQJ - TBA) AND SHA3001C (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI19009879/T1gb3) on 01.06.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir/ Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank You

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; shupei@ kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Awvenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 4 June 2019 5:30 PM

To: eqiprs@eginsurance.com.sg; Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>; ‘Janet Tan'

<janet tan{@eqinsurance.com.sp>

Cec: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PC5852U (Ol : EQI - TBA} AND SHA3001C (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/EQI19009879/T1gb3) on 01.06.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SHA 3001C at M/s ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd - Loyang on a WP basis and

TP repairer proposed for a direct settlement.
Fs



Enclosed for your perusal is:
J TP's GIA report
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Cecilia and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 4274,

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: B366-0055 | email: shupsifikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

8lk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)



Cecilia ChunE (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2019 11:50 AM

To: Jim Wong See Pah

Subject: YOUR REF: T 0619/5HA3001C /JW(St) (OUR REF: CC3/EQI19009879/T1gh3) ***

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PC 58520 & SHA 3001C ON 01/06/2019 ***

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Jim,

We refer to the above matter.

Our principal would take over to conduct the claim.

Thus, we shall close the case at our end.

Kindly send your LOD and other documents to our principal.

Thanks

“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our
part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be disclased in any other related matter(s) in respect of the
accident. Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment
on the settlerment sum.”

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
F L e

SERER W Save the Earthe Print only when necessary:



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Regq. Ne. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref : CC3/EQI19009879/T1gb3s2
D TonER i AT
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date : 18-08-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 089110
Code: EQI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PC 5852U Veh. Inspected SHA 3001C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO02176 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 03/06/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HYUNDAI |40 c.c 1685
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. KMHLE41UMHUDS9945 Colour BLUE
Odometer 23313 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
a Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/60 R16 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Rear Tyre  |205/60 R16 HANKOOK 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  01/06/2019 Inspection Date 03/06/2018
Survey held at COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508969
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 19360T198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHA 3001C
S : i By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition Estimate
i P Workshop (8)| _ (5)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER DEFORMED 553.00 583.00
10|REAR BUMPER CLIPS MECESSARY 22.00 22.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -115.00 =115.00
460.00 460.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR BUMPER RUBBER MAT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
50.00 50.00
LABOUR
PANEL BEATING, 400.00 200.00
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE 300.00 200.00
WIRING CHARGE 30.00 30.00
REMOVE / REFIX REVERSE SENSOR. B0.00 30.00
810.00 460.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,320.00 970.00
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 970.00]
Report Ref No. CC3/EQI19009879/T 1gb3s2
i, . Ml
. g
[
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor
Automotive Assessor
DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES: - This Feport is made solaly for the use and benefit of tha Cliant named on the front page of this Report.
i rit B A ny third part reply on the B 13 n_part, Ay third Ly Bcting of replying on this




