Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 April, 2020 4:54 PM

To: Chan, Kian-Meng

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: AIG ref: 8248244565SG / GZ1200M & GBB9702P on 01/06/2019 - LKK REF
CC6/AIG19009872/Aha3

Dear Kian Meng,

We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we are still pending for TP LOD.
We will get back for an update once LOD is received.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Chan, Kian-Meng [mailto:Kianmeng.Chanl@aig.com]

Sent: Monday, 9 December, 2019 1:52 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: AIG ref: 82482445655G / GZ1200M & GBB9702P on 01/06/2019

Dear Vic,

As per tele-conversation earlier, understand that we are pending for LOD from workshop; kindly withhold
settlement for the time being.
Bl claim is contesting liability with WOS issued. Thank and have a nice day.

Best regards,

Chan Kian Meng

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1678
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