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F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD

Block 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4, #05-26 Synergy @ KB Singapore 417800
HP: 96583171 TEL: (65) 67022915 FAX:6T022916

WEN HONG ENGINEERING SERVICES . 30" MAY 2019
Bk 25 Kaki Bukit Rd 4 TP A
# 05-26 SYNERGY @KB ket
Singapore 417800
A&H 300010234

Accident date: 28 MAY 2019
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: Sku13351 Toyota Alphard 2.5 15
sin Qi Items - Wprice Amount
1 1 bonnet ;
2 1__ Front emble logo Néw
3 1 Front Support Panel Ninh/ $858.00 5
& "% Front bumper M:‘}“
5 1 Front bumper numw $131.20
& 1 Fronthead lamp -LH ¢ ' s2,518.717
7 1 Front fender ; $1,252 10X
8 1 Front Bumper Fog Lamp-LH  Ceeeleed - $388.50
& 1 Front Bumper Fog Lamp cover -LH M $158.00 X
10 1 Front Bumper seonsor sel N4 s $600.00 X
i1 1 FromGrille ¢ 5412007
12 1 frontgrille clips ades sgoal 20
13 1 front bumper lower grille | gamish prfalde $225.00 X
141 watertank -LH T ok M ' $352.00 X
15 1 Front tyre -LH : x
16 1 Sportrimfront LH o ade $600.00 Y

Subtotal :- $12,190.71

SLod Hi
35040
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Khanchna !LKII‘. Autnz

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 3:20 PM
To: chan pick yuen
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: SKU1335L & SLX5379G DOA 28.05.2019
Tracking: Recipient Delivery
chan pick yuen
Admin &
Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delvered: 27/8/2019 3:20 PM
shupei@kkauto.com Delivered:; 27/8/2019 320 PM
olwialau@lkkauto.com Celivered: 27/8/2015 3:20 PM
Our Ref: CC4/AIG17009842/Akb3

Without Prejudice
(save as lo cosis)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.
We propose selflernent at a global sum of $4,300.00{all-In).

Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably withoul parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whaisoever, should be deemed [ inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by elther party that will materially afTect/inMuence on the issues of
liahility/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terma/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe(@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 26 August 2019 10:17 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@ilkkauto.com=>
Subject: Fw: SKU1335L & SLX5379G DOA 28.05.2019

Dear Khanchna .



Khaﬂhna (LKK Autnt

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 1 August 2019 12:05 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: Fwd: SKU1335L & S1LX5379G DOA 28.05.2019

Attachments: SKU1335L_28052019.pdf; file-211 jpeg; RENTAL BILL jpg; SD.pdf
Dear Khanchna ,

Please |et us have your offer soan . Thanks

Get Qutlook for i05

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 1, 2019 9:46:24 AM

To: 'chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com’ <chris_chanbebe @hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SKU1335L & 5LX5379G DOA 28.05,2019

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/AIG19009862/Akb3 Khanchna

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupsl@ kkauto com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe @hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 11:14 PM

To: Mel Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SKU1335L & SLX5379G DOA 28.05.2019



Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is our client's GIA report , rental bill, LOA , Ita fee & invoice .
Please advise DIC & claim number.
As request following :

1. RC $ 3900 ( AS AGREED )
2. Loss of rental $720 (S 120 - (our client's car is 2500cc ) x 6 days -4days recommend + 1 day waiting

PRS + 1 day weekend
3. LTAfee $7.45

@ 100% ( CUT LANE CASE WITH SCENE PHOTO )
Total § 4627.45 /-.
Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen
F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD

HP: 92712214

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chan mail.com>
Sent: Saturday, June 1, 2019 7:52 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) <Melkwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject; Fw: FW: GIA REPORT FOR SKU1335L
Dear Mei Kwan ,

Enclosed is our client's GIA report & estimate .
Please pass to Mr Adrian . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

E] | Virus-free. www.avg.com



S5 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (005) 62563561 FAX : (065) 61564315

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19009862/Akb3

11 JUNE 2019

CHOO L1 MINN RINA (ZHU LIMIN RINA)
507 ELIAS ROAD

PASIR RIS BEACH PARK

SINGAPORE 519919

Dear Sir'Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLX5379G & SKUI335L ALONG STEVENS ROAD ON
I8/05/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party
claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SKU 3351 against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
favour. We will therefore proceed 10 negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that vour No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30%
(20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, il your
policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will
be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

©

KHANCHNA
Case Handler
DID: 6841-2360
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: khanchna@lkkauto.com

c.c AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4
# 05-26 SYNERGY @KB

Singapore 417800
Dear Sir,
Accident on 22!5/“:1@ 3t 5

scibing Vi Tioa,_ SHNIBES

| /We.the registered owner /driver of vehicle registration no: _Lkyis3et
have involved in the above accident.
I/We hereby authorize M/S F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD 10 commence repairs of the said vehick

soliciuors —
u-u-mummmmwﬁ-w““-n
m“-“wﬁmumdeﬁﬂ-lMd
client basis.

mm-:mﬂtywﬁhm-duMu_ﬂﬂhM

mmmmn*m&MMh—ﬂd“mh
relapion with the above claim in my/our sbsence.

Your kind co-operation in this matter will be much appreciated.
Thank you

Yours truly.




elrare
.uumﬂ_ L e
ot TSt ooty zr s, RELEASE VOUCHER

WﬂﬂWwﬁWﬁhﬂywﬁmﬂmwﬂMumﬁnﬂm
wmmwmm&nmwm&wnemm
W{mﬂmﬂwﬁhmmﬁem:ﬁmﬂh
Whﬂlfﬂnﬁiﬂ:m.mmuwdlqumlmﬂwm
which occurred on 28/05/2019(date) along STEVENS ROAD involving vehicle nos SLXS379G.

This is pursuant to the &mn:ﬁmwmhﬂdmmmﬁmu'ﬁhwm“.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am suthorized by the owner WEN HONG ENGINEERING
mm&hdmdim“}nh&idnmmmhm:Wnummhh
MMNMMMIMWW&WMWWTMIMM
w’idﬂlﬁ.Wﬂmhuthdukmdmumﬂyghmhyﬂhcmhdpnydﬁmﬂl".

W/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pt Ltd for all damages,
m:nﬁfwupuuMmmll«hﬁmmmﬁcmmwmwmm“
lﬁﬂﬂum:ﬂmhﬁulmmwmhmhmyhﬂww
mﬁdmhmﬁmmmwumﬂfmpmmmmm
SKU1335L (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

Well confirm that the sgreement reached above is in full and final scttlement of any claim of “the
Mﬂmdﬂ"m'humnddmﬁm%m&mhdleﬂm
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the spplication of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this __|©___ (day) of _S2ptember (month) 2019 _ (year)

=

/

1,.’ A,
[L~ Lﬂ .
Lwe

Signed by appginted surveyor Signed by “the workshop” (with chop)
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F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD

Block 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4, #05-26 Synergy (@ KB Singapore 417800
HP: 96583371 TEL: (65) 67022915 FAX:67022916

INVOICE

WEN HONG ENGINEERING SERVICES’ Date: 31% JULY 18
25 KAKI BUKIT RODAD 4

#05-26 SYNERGY @KB

Singapore 417800

Accident date: 28" MAY 2018
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SKU1335L TOYOTA ALPHARD 2.5'156

— Descriptions [ AMOUNT |
*.ump Sum repair cost as recommended by B $3,900.00

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Isurveyor : Mr Adrian Ling

otal _ $3,900.00 |

S/DLRS: THREE THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED ONLY

Page 383



_ fé HOCK CHUAN HENG CAR RENTAL & TRADING PTE LTD.

No. 4 Putain Acad. Petsn Court Singapore 208086 Tet: 6298 1936, 6294 0246, 6294 9170 Fax: 6290 3864

we N HE I - =
RER'S PARTICULARS
Mfferent From of S -
tion (D) ISR Ul el R e,

cinafler catied “the Hirer herey confirm having agreed 1o hire this day from HOCK CHUAN HENG CAR RENTAL & TRADING PTE L1D
einafter called “the Owner” the uadermentioned Vehicle ot the rental fees as shown below and | furiher agroe that | skall be held respoesible far--

THIRD PARTY ONLY MOTOR VEHICLE COVERAGE
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COMPHREHENSIVE MOTOR VEHICLE COVERAGE
h&muﬂhhmﬁmmdmhwwmwhhnﬂmh-qwm“qhmuhum

m“hmuﬂﬂmﬂnw )
Mrmmﬂymdlpﬂhmﬁn?ywlwummmﬂ-lﬂ“lﬂ“ﬂrﬁnﬂhﬂﬂt
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By i M‘Iﬂ-l

+ Back to OneMotoring
141 '._l|-||:Jrlx1m'rm:I'-.
Lang Transpon Authotity
10 Bin Ming Ditve
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. - M4-D005528-2
Print Date/Time 30 May 2018 / 14:30:06

- Receipt Date/Time 30 May 2018/ 14 30.06
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Feceipl Mo ITNET-D0000-1§0530-001875 .
Prevous Recep No
§/N ltem Description) Amaunt GST Amount

Business Transaction Reference Before Amount Afer GST
Ne. GST (S§) (S%) |S%)

fesult of Insurance Enguiry - SLX53796G

Ag ot 28 May 2018/08:50.00

Insurance Co. AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 insurance Enguiry - SLASITEG

Enguiry Fee 700 048 T 48
20100530142905905700
Sub-Total 700 048 748
Total Betore Rounding 700 048 748
Rounding Difference 004
Total Amounl Payable 748
Paid By

Direct Debit: aNETS Debit

[ 20180530142922573 (Intermet Banking) LE -
Total 745
Casn Change " Q.00
Tandarsd Amourt T 4B
Excess Refundable Amaunt .00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensurs that all payments 1o the Authority are good and promptly settied by the payment service
pmwd-r!Hmﬂﬂlmﬁmmnﬂuw.mmuunmduﬂnhwndwﬂmdhh
may apply.

Print Receipt OK Save as PDF

g vl Do &!-In-wlmmmtrﬂmhymm'!mﬁﬂﬁ{_m_ID-I-'}]HIIIIITT 5007201



Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiane

CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case | Motified Egt Submitted | Adj Assignad A Bt Adj Submitted | Lns Auth'ed Status
|28 May 2019 WM 0LT se300000  $93,900.00 panding for Survey
Eai Bag Ee sy et | Edit Estmates | | View Rot Carcet G |

Main Claim Details

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by adjuster] i

Insured: CHOOD LT MINN RINA(ZHU LIMIN RINA), 10: SE4070648 |

B i, | WEN HONG ENGINEERING SERVICES, Co. Reg. No.: SI060089K
Vehicle Rleg. “[28/05/2019 08:00 - :58
Mo.: is“" 1335L Date of LOSS! | 1 4g ponths and 28 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)]
Cinim Type: | TP / 935379190256 Policy/Cover | (comprehensive)
g B S, folicy No.  leom16a7677-02

¥ . [Clalmant):
[Tnsured):

Excess:

S F-1 Autoclinic Pte Ltd - Block 25 Kakl Buklt (HQ) BLOCK 25 KAK] BUKIT ROAD 4, #05-26 SYNERGY @ KB, 417800 Kaki Bukit -
£ Tel;

ll'ul wﬁ”l"ﬂ AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie. Ltd, (Express) - Tel; 65-8415-3000 ... [Handied by Lok, Chee-Heang] Chas-Heng Loh@ag com

ﬁ:::r"“ NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Teli
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 14/06/2019]
| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View Al | _ Compase Case Mai ||

il‘h-riﬂmmlll'urhhme.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view Al | Search Tusks | Creste Hew Task | Compiete |

Dua Date  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?
No results.
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Claim Documents

*SKU1335L (93537919025G)
[SLX5379G]
TP
WEN HONG ENGINEERING SERVICES
May 28 2019 B:00AM
[CHOO LI MINN RINA{ZHU LIMIN RINA]]
F-1 Autoclinic Pte Ltd - Block 25 Kakl Bukit

mﬂml umhwl :nmpnlhﬂmrl l..uud'hdnl I.hbHMnI \"IH
No_ | Finalized On_ LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
L |6/06/19 10:37 | Video - Accident 0 | Load s
Latters/Correspondences |1 per page ~]| &
No | Finalteed On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |(oram) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown @[ &
Photos/Images Spoppe (V]
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
U |21/07/19 10:05 | General View Q| werc | B
7 |31/07/1910:05 | Genersl View 0| wers | A
3 [39/0719 10:05 | General View Q| wews | I |
4 | 31/07/19 10:05 General View g Load G | B
5 |31/07/12 10:05 | Genersl View 0| waews | A
& |3/071%10:05 | General View Q| vedrws | A
7 |3y07/19 10:05 | Genersl View @ aurc | A
8 |31/071510:05 | Genersl View 0O wwars | M
8 |3UD7N5 1005 | Genersl View Q| ows | B
10 | 31/07/19 10:05 General View ) adwc | A
1 |31/07/19 10:05 | General View @ | ssws | B
13 |3/07/19 10:05 | General View 0 | tedws | A
13 |31/0719 10:05 | General View Q| oxrs |
14 |3407/18 10:05 | Genersl View Q| caars | &
15 |31/02/15 10:05 General View B | badivs | A
15 |3/07/1910:05 | Ganeral View Q| aivs | B
17 | 31/07/19 10:05 General View B | Load eo g;
18 |31/07/19 10:05 | General View @ | wadws | B4
19 [31/07/19 10:05 | General View 0| s | B
0 | 1/07/18 10005 | General View @ | Load s M
21 3107719 10:05 | General View Q| aaws | A
22 |307/49 10:05 | Genersl View @O | i | B
23 |31/07/19 10:05 | Geners] View 0| wars | B
24 |31/07/19 10:08 General View 0| waawrs | &
25 |31/07/10 10:05 | General View 0| wadrc | A
2 |31/07/19 10:05 General View 0| wdies | A
27 |31/07/19 10:06 | Reinspection Photo Q| wears | HA
28 |31/07/1% 10:06 | Reinspection Photo 0| warvs | B
29 |3L/07/19 10:08 Reinspection Photo D | waws | A
10 |31/07/19 10:06 | Reinspection Photo 0| wadivc | A
31 |31/07/19 10:06 | Reinspection Photo 0| vvs | B
1 (30719 10:06 | Reinspection Photo 0| weawc | B
33 |307/19 10:06 Reinspection Photo O | waewe ;]
34 |31/07/19 10:06 | Relnspection Photo 0| waews | A
15 [31/07/18 10:06 | Relnspection Photo Q| ewc | B
36 |31/07/19 10:06 | Relnspection Photo 0| toades | A
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Video [1perpege  [v] ©A

%o | Fanalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
37 [31/07/19 10:06  |Reinspection Photo D adirc | @A

B | 30719 10:06 Reinspection Photo 0| tmews | A

|39 |31/07/19 10:06 | Reinspection Photo 0| tmaws | A

40 |31/07/19 10106 | Reinspection Photo 0| wewc | &

to | Relabel/Reorder | LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
1 |ea/06/12 1490 | TP ESTIMATE Load POF

2 |D4/06/19 14:30 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF

¥ |11/08/19 13:40 Letter to O Load PDF

4 |25/09/19 11123 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load POF

5 |250%/18 11:23 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM Load POF

& |35/09/19 11:23 Release Voucher Load POF

|7 |25/09/19 11:23 RENTAL RECEIPT Losd PDF

B | 25/00/19 11:23 LTA SEARCH Load PDF

9 |25/09/1911:23 |LOD © | Losdror

Mo | Finailzed On AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. {SG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |OB/OES19 10014 01 GIA REPORT Load POF

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST aeset | save | pree |
Thare are na document checkiists configured;

Remarks - LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd [HQ)

Shew Remarks To: L] Handling Insurer
B A maeas A0 pruld el pod ihos @D ether parlies
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SLX5379G (Insd veh) Model: TOYOTA ALPHARD 2.4 (A)
SKU1335L (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: | 28/05/2019

Giobal Sum Settiement| - [ [X] Yes [ [ ] No
Repair Estimate $ 14,190.71
Final Repair Cosl 5 4,300.00
Loss of Use 8 days at $0.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 L: days
LTA / GIA Search Fee . $
Others 3
-
Final Settlament Sum (Global Sum) 5 4.300.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ | YES [X ] NO (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No

B) For GIA Registered Workshop.

BOLA Liability (%) Assesead Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply,
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payea's Breakdown

1) |F-1 Autoclinic Pte Ltd . 5 4,300.00
2) -
3) o
25 Sep
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2019
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form,
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Repart/ Bill (if any)

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_d... 25/9/2019



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg o 1sssor1eem)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 66844-B805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com:assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Page | of 4

Our File No: CCE/AIG19009862/AKB302

Date: 25/08/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Palicy No:
Claimant i
Vehicle No : SKU1335L Insured Vehicle No : SLX5379G
Date of Loss: 2B/05/2019 Mature of Claim TP Claim No: 83537918025G
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SKU1335L
Make & Model! TOYOTA ALPHARD, 2.4 (&) Engine No; 2ARH543010
Reg. Dale 30062015 (Man, Year: 2015) Chassis No: AGH300010234
Colour Black Odometer: B3064 km
Engine Capacity 2493 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (5%): Market Valus/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake {Serviceable). Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 235/50R18 Rear Tyre Size: 235/50 R18
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 6 mm Rear Left Side; Bridgestone & mm
Fronl Right Side: Bndgestone 6 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
The above vaives represan! the mmawning fyre ready depih
(COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %|
Paris 12.180.71 3,800.31 B,290.40 B8.01
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.000.00 1.030.00 §70.00 48.50
Paintwaork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 14,190.71 4,930.31 9,260.40 65.26
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 3,900.00
Nett Amount (55) 14,190.71 3,900.00 10,290.71 72.52
+ Car Rental (6.0 x $580.00/day) (S$) 480.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S5) 7.45
Nett Liability (5%} 4 387.45
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 4,300.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: a0f0s2018
Date Inspected: 30/05/2018 Inspected AL F-1 Autoclinic Pte Lid - Block 25 Kaki
Bukit (HQ)
BLOCK 25 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4, #05-
26 SYNERGY @ KB
Singapore 417800
Estimated Peried of Repair: 4.0 days

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 25/9/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: Khanchna Pothuraj

NOTE: This repovt represents our findings af the time and place of ingpection siated herein. Such inapection has been carmed out to the bast af our
knowledge and ability but any offr Kabitty under any otter circumsfances i hersby sxpresaly erciuded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 25/9/2019
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part Mo. Particulars Condition Repalrer's Amount
1 1 *BONNET Repair 2,250.00F ~FL
2 1 *FRONT EMBLE LOGO Necessary 75.00F *75,00 FL
3 1 *FRONT SUPPORT PANEL Nol Necessary B58.00F *-FL
4 1 *FRONT BUMFER Deformad 1,810.20F *1,655.00FL
5 1 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE BRACKET Mecessary 131.20F *131.20FL
B 1 *FRONT HEAD LAMP -LH Cracked 2518 71F *251B.71FL
7T 1 *FRONT FENDER Repair 1,252.10F ~FL
8 1 *FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP -LH Cracked 38850F *38B.50FL
g 1 *FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVER -LH Mot Necessary 158.00F " FL
0 1 *SET FRONT BUMPER SENSOR Mot Mecessary B600.00F “FL
1 1 *FRONT GRILLE Cracked 412.00F *412.00 FL
12 1 *FRONT GRILLE CLIPS Mecessary B80.00F *20.00 FL
132 1 *FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE /GARNISH Not Necessary 225.00F ~FL
14 1 "WATER TANK -LH Nol Necessary 352 00F *-FL
15 1 *FRONT TYRE -LH Not Necessary 500.00F *-FL
16 1 *SPORT RIM -FRONT LH Not Necessary B00.00F *~FL
F=Franchise part. L=ListtemDisc
Sub Total (S$) 12,190.71 5,200.41
- List Item Discount on L ltems 0.00/25.00% (S%) 0.00 1,300.10
Total Parts (S$) 12,190.71 3,900.31
| Report was unsubmitted during this print-out _]

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusecbox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 25/9/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are ne now miscellanoous itemnms selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour Items

1 WHEEL ALIGNMENT COMPUTER New 120.00 0.00

2 TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM New 80.00 30.00

32 PANEL BEATING New 1,000.00 400.00

4  SPRAY PAINTING New 800.00 600.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 2,000.00 1,030.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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