Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Tracking:

Our Ref: CC6/A1G19009862/Akb3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Thank you for the acceptance.

Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Wednesday, 28 August 2019 9:22 AM

chan pick yuen

Admin A

RE: SKU1335L & SLX5379G DOA 28.05.2019
AIG DV GLOBAL.pdf

Recipient Delivery

chan pick yuen

Admin A
olivialau@lkkauto.com Failed: 28/8/2019 9:22 AM
shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 28/8/2019 9:22 AM

We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 27 August 2019 5:57 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SKU1335L & SLX5379G DOA 28.05.2019

Dear Khanchna,

accept .DV please

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen



From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 27, 2019 3:20 PM

To: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SKU1335L & SLX5379G DOA 28.05.2019

Our Ref: CC6/A1G19009862/Akb3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement at a global sum of $4,300.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris _chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 26 August 2019 10:17 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: SKU1335L & SLX5379G DOA 28.05.2019

Dear Khanchna,



That rental agreement is rental invoice also .

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: chan pick yuen

Sent: Thursday, August 1, 2019 12:05 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Fwd: SKU1335L & SLX5379G DOA 28.05.2019

Dear Khanchna,

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Get Outlook for i0OS

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 1, 2019 9:46:24 AM

To: 'chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com' <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SKU1335L & SLX5379G DOA 28.05.2019

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/A1G19009862/Akb3 Khanchna




To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris _chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 31 July 2019 11:14 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SKU1335L & SLX5379G DOA 28.05.2019

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is our client's GIA report , rental bill , LOA, Ita fee & invoice .
Please advise OIC & claim number .

As request following :

1. RC $ 3900 ( AS AGREED))
2. Loss of rental $720 ('S 120 - (our client's car is 2500cc ) x 6 days -4days recommend + 1 day waiting
PRS + 1 day weekend
3. LTAfee $7.45
@ 100% ( CUT LANE CASE WITH SCENE PHOTO )

Total $ 4627.45 /-.

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen
F-1 AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD



HP: 92712214

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Saturday, June 1, 2019 7:52 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: FW: GIA REPORT FOR SKU1335L

Dear Mei Kwan,

Enclosed is our client's GIA report & estimate .
Please pass to Mr Adrian . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

Virus-free. www.avg.com




