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Ada ma ®m Pweld Company Registration No_ 199607 198R

S1UBEAVE |, #0225 PAYA LB INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 4089230 TEL : 1065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your ref: TBA Date: 06/06/2019
QOur ref: CC4/QBE19009809/Uwa3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

Dear SirfMadam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. GBF 7984
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 04/06/2019

at the premises of M/s Automobile Integragted Management Pte Ltd and have the following to report:-
Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 6,581.25 (esL)
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 2,650.00 (est.)
“Check” ltems Amount 1 5% - [est)
Total (Including Check ltems) - 5% 2,650.00 (est.)
Market Value : S% - (est)
LTA Reimbursement Value : 8% - (esL)
Nett Value + 83 - (est)

Description of Damage: -
The vehicle sustained damages at the
O/S Rear Portion

Comments/Present Status;
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 days

Yours faithfully.

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Aut Integrated Manag=ment Pre Lod
[Business Reg no. 201605257G)

Office: 18 5n Ming Lane 807147

Michiew City Singapore 373972

Wistkghop! 23 ki Bukit Ave & #0401 [sauth
| wingl Singapore 215933

ESTlMﬁTE I Fmiid: Butomim clsim Bgmail.com
Our Ref: AC2019014/TP/GBF7984) - 24.05.2019 [

:GBF7 DYNA
ITEMS QTY PARTICULAR AMOUNT 55
1 1 TAILGATE s 210000 X
2 1 SIDEGATERH 01 2o >0 S/ 256000~
3 1 TAIL GATE HANDLE RH ;% 195.00
4 1 TAIL GATE LOCK RH 210.00
5 1 REARFENDER RH A/ 21000 —
§ 527500
LESS 25% 5 1,318.75
Y 3,956.25
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS AMOUNT 58
6 1 TAILGATE COMPANY NAME STICKER ieq 28000 2LV
7 1 5IDE GATE COMPANY NAME STICKER et 32000 320D
8 1 TOWMRSTCRER 7y Loa fu of ki AUt 2500 /&
5 625,00
LABOUR & MISCELLANEOUS:
9 To remove damaged body parts with all necessary components/attach- 1,000.00 Z/ﬂ >
ments apply hot-works where necessary repair,reshape body dented
panels in accordance with factory specifications replace new parts refit
and align into position refit all necessary components/attachments
10 To spray paint replaced/repaired body parts Inclusive of preparatory 800.00 { o0
works and painting materials
11 To remove, refix rear cargo box aluminium panels 20000 &

{W% W S 2,000.00
A~
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Company
Owner ID: 4403N
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GBF7984)
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 06 Jun 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: DYNA 150 5MT
Primary Colour: White
Manufacturing Year: 2016

Engine No.: 1KD2679197
Chassis No.: JTFAT35Y70K207430
Maximum Power Qutput:

Open Market Value: $26,436.00
Original Registration Date: 13 Mar 2017
First Registration Date: 13 Mar 2017
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $1,322.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 12 Mar 2027
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $49,810.00
COE Rebate Amount: $38.683.00
Total Rebate Amount: $38,683.00

Page | of |

The information contained herein is correct as at 04 Jun 2019

OK

https://vrl lta.gov.sg/ha/vel/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput "FUNCTION _[D=F030... 04-Jun-19



Used toyota dyna Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMan Page 1 of 2
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8 vehicles toyota dyna Aovanced Sesch  $§ Sttt s
Hikn Moded Pruce Cepraciation =eg Tarp Eng Cap Milgags eh Type Shatue
Search Salection  toyota dyna Ay A w017 AT Byt Ly Awmilatile
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Fusl Typa: Diess
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Fomeo: 51-Mep D0Y  Tegu JOI7 Tovom Dyea, S0P ovom oy Tovomn Oy, mepoes oy Tiyota, Dyne, Syni, Uil Toyas
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

#

r
From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 3:02 PM
To: ‘assignments’
Subject: NOA- GBF7984) Claim REF- VC 012631
1ﬂ‘u':|-am@ 3”511‘\
wehicles - Not In

Our ref: VC012631
Pesor® iy nL

Dear all
Kindly assist to survey the third party vehicle.

regards

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims [ Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+B5 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225

Websile Linkedin Twittter

S QBE

From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2015 11:53 AM

To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>

Subject: Re: NOA- GBF7984) Claim REF- VC 012631
Hi lenny,

Please appoint surveyor from LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid. Kindly advise the date and time for us to make
arrangement with customer.

Thank you.

Regards,
Jacyne

On Thu, May 30, 2019 at 11:45 AM Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com> wrote:
Our ref : V012631
Dear Jacyne
We refer to the nbove captioned matter

We intent to conduct a full survey of the damage to vour client’s vehicle. We propose to use one of the
motor surveyors named in the attached list:



COMPANY

Appraisal Associates Pte Ltd
Automobile Inspection Services

KM Auto Assessors Pte
Lid

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Priority Services

Infiniti Appraisal Service

Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Ltd

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these
mMOoLor sSUrveyors.

regards

Jenny Toh

Senior Assistant

Claims / Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+B5 6224 8633 | +65 6477 1225

¥vebls Linkedln Tweillesr

AQBE

From: AlM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 10:01 AM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>
Subject: NOA- GBF7984) Claim REF- VC 012631

Hi lenny,

Please find attached to advise further.

Thank you.



Regards,

Jacyne

AlM

tzl: 5119837

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this emall is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply
email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.

AlM
tel: 51158371

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If vou
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly
inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.



Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 19 June, 2019 7:55 PM
To: Jenny Toh
Cc Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); C5 A Team
Subject: RE: NOA- GBF7984) Claim REF- VC 012631 *** LKK REF: CC4/QBE19009809/Uwa3
Attachments: Preliminary Advice pdf; TP ESTIMATE - MARKED.pdf; TP GIA REPORT pdf
WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVEAS TO COSTS
QBE ref: TBA

LKK REF: CC4/QBE19009809/Uwa3
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed revert of vehicle: GBF 7984
We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
* TP estimated cost of repair
* Preliminary advice

Thank youi.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwani@ kkauto com | fax: 57414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenuoe 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@ghe.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 June, 2019 9:46 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan @ lkkauto.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team
<cs-nfd lkkauio.com>

Subject: RE: NOA- GBF7984) Claim REF- VC 012631 *** LKK REF: CC4/QBEI D00LB0v/wal

Hi Mei Kwan

Please find attached as per requested.

rEEaI{ls
Jenny Toh

Senior Assisiani

Claims / Asia

1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225

Website Linkedin Twittar




SQBE

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @ lkkauto.com:>

Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 10:09 AM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>; assignments <assignments @ lkkauto.com>
Ce: Admin A <admin-a @ lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: NOA- GBF7984] Claim REF- VC 012631

Dear Sir/fMdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle 1s not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1g72 | email! gssignments@ kauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | ${408933)

From: Jenny Toh [mailto:jenny.toh @gbe.com|
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 3:02 PM

To: 'assignments' <assignments @ lkkauto.com>
Subject: NOA- GBF7984) Claim REF- VC 012631

Qur rel: VC012631
Dear all

Kindly assist to survey the third party vehicle.

Segards
Jenny Toh
Senior Assistant
Claims / Asia
1 Raffles Quay, #29-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225

Websile Linkad|n williar

S QBE




+85 6224 6633 | +65 6477 1225
Waebsile Linkedin Tiwifte

@ QBE

From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim @ gmail com>
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 10:01 AM

To: Jenny Toh <jenny.toh@gbe.com>
Subject: NOA- GBF7984] Claim REF- VC 012631

Hi Jenny,
Please find attached to advise further.

Thank you.

Regards,

Jacyne

AIM

ek 91 19RATY

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be pnivileged. If you
are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of
this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly
inform us by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.

AIM



T 2.
Ada BA B Pla Lig s — .

51 UBLAVE 1, #00-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : i065) 62563561 FAX : (65 62564315

Our Ref: CC4/QBE19009809/Uwa3
28 June 2019

Green City —Scape Pte Ltd
101 Kitchener Road

#03-34 Jalan Besar Plaza
Singapore 208511

Dear Sir/Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING TP 7184B & GBF 7984J ON 24/05/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for QBE Insurance (Singapore) Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or
your authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

IT you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 08/07/2019, after we
shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis
and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by yowyour driver against the
other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

‘{uurs faithfully,

N

Vivian Lau

Case Handler

DID: 6841 8625

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com

cc.  OBE Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Jenny Toh <jenny tohi@gbe coms

Sent: Wednesday, 26 February 2020 2.07 PM

Te: Admin-D (LKKAuULo), assignments, Asher Sng (LKKAuULD)
Cc Admin A claims-singapore

Subject: RE NOA- GBF7984) Claim REF- [VCD12631]

Hi Asher

Can let me know the survey report ready, cos we need to send it to our lawyer.
Thank you.

_rigards
Jenny Toh
Semior Assistard
Claims / Asia
! Ratfles Cuay, #29-10 Soulh Tower, Singapore 048583
-65 6224 6633 | +65 64TT 1225

S QBE

From: lenny Tah

Sent: Tuesday, 25 February 2020 11:55 AM

To: Nivitha [LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.coms; "assignments’ <assignments@lkkauto.com>; "Ashar Sng (LKK Auto)’
<AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'Admin A’ <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; claims-singapore <claims-singapore@qbe.com>

Subject: RE: NOA- GBF7984) Claim REF- [VC012631]

Hi Asher

Kindly |et us have the report ASAP.

From: Nwvitha (LKK Auto) <admin-g@lkkauto com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 February 2020 11:39 AM

To: lenny Toh <jenny toh@gbe com>; 'assignments’ cassignments@|kkauto com>; "Asher Sng (LKK Auto)'
<Acharsnpi@l »

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; claims-singapore <claims-singapore@gbe com>
Subject: RE: NOA- GBF7984) Claim REF- [VC012631)

Dear Jenny,

Thank you for the email

Dear Asher,



Kindly assist

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/QBE19009809/Ueal

Bist Rigards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lul

Phoni= 6845-1072 | email: !&lﬂﬂlﬂlﬂ.ﬂ.ﬁﬂ&l&ﬂﬂl | fax: Bsf-4415

Bk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{308033)

From: lenny Toh [mailto:jenny.toh@gbe com)
Sent: Tuesday, 25 February 2020 11:37 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); assignments

Cc: Admin A; claims-singapore

Subject: RE: NOA- GBF7984] Claim REF- [VCD12631]

Hiall

Is the vehicle survey by LKK? And check whether the survey report ready?

From: lenny Toh

Sent: Friday, 14 February 2020 11:42 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-di@|kkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@|kkauto coms; claims-singapore <claims-si i me
Subject: NOA- GBF7984) Claim REF- [VC012631]

Hi all
Is the survey report ready?

regards

Jenny Toh
Senior Assistant
Claims / Asia

| Aatfles Quay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 8633 | 85 6477 1225

A QBE



From: Admin-D [LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 10:09 AM

Ta: Jenny Toh <jenny toh@ghe com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.coms>
Ce: Admin A <admin-ai@lkkauto com>

Subject: RE: NDA- GBF7984) Claim REF- VC 012631

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not in the workshop, repairer will arrange

Ranet Regards,

G Nivitha| Admin
Lk Anto Consultants Pie Lid

Phooe: 6841-1072 | email! assignmepts@ [Kkiuto com | [x 6256-4115
Bk 51, Pava Ubd Industeial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | Slgo8ax1)

From: lenny Toh [mailto:jenny.tohi@gbe.com]
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 3.02 PM

To: ‘assignments’ <assignments@lkkauto com>
Subject: NOA- GEF7984) Claim REF- VC 012631
Our ref: VC012631

Dear all

Kindly assist to survey the third party vehicle.

regards

Janny Toh

Sanior Assistant

Claims /| Asia

| Raifies Quay, #25-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
+65 6224 6633 | 65 BATT 1225

H ] Vi Tl

»QBE

From: AlM PTE LTD <automim.claim ail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 11:53 AM



To: lenny Toh <jenny.toh Lom
Subject: Re: NOA- GBF7984) Claim REF- VT 012631

Hi Jenny,

Please appoint surveyor from LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid. Kindly advise the date and time for us to make
arrangement with customer.

Thank you.
Regards,
Jacyne

On Thu, May 30, 2019 at 11:45 AM lenny Toh <jenny.toh@abe com> wrote:

Our ref : VCO12631
Deitr Jacyne
We reler to the above capuoned mane

We intent 1o conduct 4 full survey of the damage 1o your client’s vehicle. We propose 1o use one of the motor
siurveyors named in the attached list

COMPANY

Appraisal Associates Pre Lid
Automobile Inspection Services
KM Auto Assessors Pre

Lud

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
Priority Services

Infiniti Appraisal Service
Quantum Risk Management (S) Pte Lud

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
SUTVEYOrs

regards

Jenny Toh
Senjor Assistant
Claims / Asia



1 Raffles Quay, #28-10 South Tower, Singapore 048583
«B5 6224 BR33 | +BH B4TT 1225
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From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 10:01 AM

To: lenny Toh <jenny. com>

Subject: NOA- GBF7984) Clalm REF- VC 012631

Hi Jenny,
Please find attached to adwise further
Thank you.

Regards,

lacyne

AlM

el H1198371

IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the
intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the informatian and any disclosure or copying of this emall Is
unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please promptly inform us by reply email
or telephone. You should also delete this emall and destroy any hard copies produced.
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IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are
not the mtended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this
email is unauthonised and strictly prohibited. If vou have received this email in ertor, please promptly inforn us
by reply email or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies produced.
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IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this email is confidential and may also be
privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure
or copying of this email is unauthorised and strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please
promptly inform us by reply emml or telephone. You should also delete this email and destroy any hard copies
produced.

- IMPORTANT NOTICE : The information in this emall is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are
not the intended recipient, any use or dissemination of the information and any disclosure or copying of this email is
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or telephane. You should also delete this emall and destroy any hard copies produced.



’ ” V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-y 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park._ Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199807158R GST Reg No. 19-9607188-R
Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle
QBE INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTELTD Refl | CCA4/QBE10008808/Uealq2
OAERSCAPORE e owe: a0 | [ HEMR
Code: QBE
13 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM -
Insured Veh. ¥F T1B4B Veh. Inspected GBF 79844
Policy No. B-VOD18472-MVA Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. VC012631 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JENNY Assign Date 30/05/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA DYNA (M) c.c 2962
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. JTFAT35YT0K207430 Colour WHITE
Odometear - Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/70R15 CST TIRES 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/70 R15 CST TIRES & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |155R12 (D) MAXXIS 6/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |155R12 (D) MAXXIS 6/6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE 0O/5 REAR PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. p General Information
Accident Date  24/05/2019 Inspection Date 04/06/2018
Survey held at 23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 #04-01
Repairer AUTOMOBILE INTEGRATED MANAGEMENT PL
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8258 3581 FAX B25B 4315
Reg No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-960T198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBF 7984J

Page No. 1of 2

1|TAIL GATE TO REPAIR SEE 2,100,00 -
LABOUR
1|SIDE GATE RH DENTED/ BENT 2,560.00 2,101.00
1| TAIL GATE HANDLE RH TO REPAIR SEE 185.00 -
LABOUR
1|TAIL GATE LOCK RH TO REPAIR SEE 210,00
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER RH BENT 210,00 210,00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,318.75 S577.75
3,9856.25 173325
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|TAIL GATE COMPANY NAME STICKER (SN} MECESSARY 280.00 250.00
1|SIDE GATE COMPANY NAME STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 320.00 300.00
1|7O0KM/MH STICKER (SN) NECESSARY 25.00| 10,00
625.00 580.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE DAMAGED BODY PARTS WITH ALL 1,000.00 400.00
NECESSARY COMPONENTS /ATTACHMENTS APPLY
HOT-WORKS WHERE NECESSARY REPAIR .RESHAPE
BODY DENTED PANELS IN ACCORDANCE WITH
FACTORY SPECIFICATIONS REPLACE NEW PARTS
REFIT AND ALIGN INTO POSITION REFIT ALL
NECESSARY COMPONENTS /ATTACHMENTS .INCLUSIVE
O THE REPAIR OF TAIL GATE HANDLE RH,TAIL GATE
AND TAIL GATE LOCKRH.
TO SPRAY PAINT REPLACED/ REPAIRED BODY PARTS 800.00 600.00
INCLUSIVE OF PREPARATORY WORKS AND PAINTING
MATERIALS
TO REMOVE,REFIX REAR CARGO BOX ALUMINIUM 200.00 50.00
PANELS
2,000.00 1,050.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,581.25 3,343.25

Report Ref No. CC4/QBE19008809/Uea3q2




Report Ref No. CC4/QBE19009808/Uea3q2

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensad Appralser
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