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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 2 January 2020 4:09 PM
To: Carmen Lim
Cc: Coleen Kwok; jenny chong; Admin A
Subject: RE: <REJECTION> Your Ref: SLP5544M *Our Ref: CC4/ASM19009798/Kpa3 

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLT 6273S(AXA) & SLP 5544M ON 31/05/2019]
Attachments: PIR FROM SLT6273S.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
Please be informed that our insured had appealed the case to traffic police. Traffic police had reviewed the case and 
they will be taking action against your client. No action will be taking against our insured driver. 
 
In view of this, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to maintain rejection. 
 
Thank you. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Happy New Year 2020” 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 
From: Carmen Lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 11 November 2019 11:53 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Coleen Kwok <coleen21@esteemperf.com.sg>; jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: <REJECTION> Your Ref: SLP5544M *Our Ref: CC4/ASM19009798/Kpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLT 
6273S(AXA) & SLP 5544M ON 31/05/2019] 
 
Dear HsiaoTong, 
 
Attached herewith police investigation result for your attention. 
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Kindly advise your amend liability. 
 
Thank you  
 
 
 

 

   

Freundliche Grüße / Best Regards 

 

Carmen Lim 

Accident Claim Executive | Operation Division 

Esteem Performance Pte Ltd 

 

M: 8799 0066 
P: 6484 1221 
E: carmen@esteemperf.com.sg 

 

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259 
(Head Office) 
385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre 
(Showroom) 

 

www.esteemperformance.com   

      

 
 
 
On Fri, Nov 8, 2019 at 11:18 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Your Ref: SLP5544M                                              Without Prejudice 

Our Ref: CC4/ASM19009798/Kpa3 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLT 6273S(AXA) & SLP 5544M ON 31/05/2019 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Attached is a copy of our insured accident report and accident location for your easy reference. Based on all the 
available information on hand, we are of the view that our insured has the right of way. In addition, your client 
insurer has indicated 100% settlement with our insured. 
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In view of the above, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to 
look into your client’s matter. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

 

  

  


