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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2019 9:10 AM
To: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: GY5195Z marked estimate

TrackingTracking: Recipient Delivery

Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd

Admin A

olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 24/9/2019 9:11 AM

Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 24/9/2019 9:11 AM

shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 24/9/2019 9:11 AM

Without Prejudice 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19009715/T1kb3 

Dear Ms. Josephine, 

We refer to the above matter. 

We re-confirm settlement as follows: 

  
 

1. Cost of Repair (W/GST) $ 1,284.00 
2. Loss of Rental (W/GST) (7 days x $120) $   898.80 
3. LTA Search Fee $      2.00 
Total $ 2,184.80 

 We will amend the DV and proceed to do the necessary accordingly. 

Sorry for any inconvenience caused. 

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 

 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 16 September 2019 3:20 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: GY5195Z marked estimate 
 
Dear Khanchna, 
 
We attached copy of the duly signed Discharge Voucher for your perusal. 
Kindly let us have the settlement as soon as possible. 
 
Best Regards, 
Josephine Teo 
 
 
SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 
T : +65 67600819 
F : +65 67690221 
 
 

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 
On Mon, Sep 16, 2019 at 2:34 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We refer to the above matter. 

Thank you for the acceptance. 

 We attach herewith a copy of the DV for your further action. 

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 4:25 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: GY5195Z marked estimate 

  

Dear Khanchna, 

  

We accept your settlement of $2,126.00  

Kindly provide the Discharge Vourcher. 

Thank you. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Josephine Teo 

  

  

SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 

T : +65 67600819 

F : +65 67690221 

  

  

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  
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On Fri, Sep 13, 2019 at 4:05 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19009715/T1kb3 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We refer to the above matter. 

We propose settlement as follows: 

  
 

1. Cost of Repair (W/GST) $ 1,284.00 
2. Loss of Rental (W/GST) (7 days x $120) $    840.00 
3. LTA Search Fee $      2.00 
Total $ 2,126.00 

 Please confirm acceptance. 

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, 13 September 2019 3:15 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: GY5195Z marked estimate 

  

Dear Khanchna, 
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We accepted Taufikh COR L/S $1,200 (exclude GST) and 4 Days of repairs. 

  

Below is the breakdown for the Loss Of Rental. 

30/05/2019 - Pre Repair Servey 

31/05/2019 - Taufikh did the survey at 3.40pm and agree a 4 days repair 

01/06/2019 - 04/06/2019 - 4 working days to repair 

But in between there is a Sunday and a Public Holiday 

  

Attached is the amended Invoice and Rental Agreement for your reference. 

  

Sorry for the inconvenience cause. 

  

Best Regards, 

Josepine Teo 

  

  

SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 

T : +65 67600819 

F : +65 67690221 

  

  

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Thu, Sep 12, 2019 at 5:57 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
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Our Ref: CC4/AIG19009715/T1kb3 [GY5195Z] 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

Please let us have the rental agreement as well as breakdown for loss of rental as our surveyor only 
recommended COR for 4 days. 

  

Thank you. 

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from 
this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement." 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Khanchna| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd 

Sent: Wednesday 10 July, 10:43 

Subject: Re: GY5195Z marked estimate 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 

Dear Taufikh,  

Good day, 
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Attached copy of the Letter of Demand and neceesary documents for our claimant GY5195Z and your 
insured SMJ2415S for accident at/along PIE towards Changi Airport near Shuang Lin Temple on 
28/05/2019. 

Kindly let us have your settlement as soon as possible. 

Best Regards,  

Josephine Teo 

SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 

T : +65 67600819 

F : +65 67690221 

Virus-free. 

  

www.avg.com  

  

  

On Fri, Jul 5, 2019 at 5:15 PM Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Taufikh,  

We accept your COR L/S $1,200 (exclude GST) and 4 Days. 

We will send the final bill accordingly. Thank you. 

Best Regards,  

Josephine Teo 

SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 

T : +65 67600819 

F : +65 67690221 

Virus-free. 

  

www.avg.com  
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On Fri, Jul 5, 2019 at 4:45 PM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Josephine, 

COR L/S$1200, 4 DAYS. 

Regards 

Taufikh  

Lkk Auto 

Get Outlook for Android 

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd 

Sent: Thursday 4 July, 14:40 

Subject: Re: GY5195Z marked estimate 

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 

Dear Taufikh,  

We attached copy of our calculation and after paint photo for vehicle 
GY5195Z. 

Kindly finalize with us.  Thank you. 

Best Regards,  

Josephine Teo 

SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 

T : +65 67600819 

F : +65 67690221 

Virus-free. 

  

www.avg.com  
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On Tue, Jul 2, 2019 at 10:54 AM Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com> 
wrote: 

  

Get Outlook for Android 

  

  

Virus-free. 

  

www.avg.com  

  

  

  

  

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  


