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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 12 July, 2019 2:22 PM

To: GO Sashe

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1510-044--Accident involving SKV2483E  & SHD0067S on 

04.10.15 *** LKK REF: CS/TP15017257/Kvbn2  // AXA REF : C0365928

Hi Sashe, 

 

Both TP and OI unable to provide video/ scene photo for this case. 

 

Kindly let us have your further insruction. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, 31 May, 2019 2:24 PM 

To: GO Sashe <sashe.goms@axa.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1510-044--Accident involving SKV2483E & SHD0067S on 04.10.15 *** LKK REF: 

CS/TP15017257/Kvbn2 // AXA REF : C0365928 

 

Dear Sashe, 

 

TP do not have video/ scene photo for this case. 

 

We will request from OI. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: GO Sashe <sashe.goms@axa.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 31 May, 2019 1:52 PM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1510-044--Accident involving SKV2483E & SHD0067S on 04.10.15 *** LKK REF: 

CS/TP15017257/Kvbn2 // AXA REF : C0365928 

 

Dear Mei Kwan 

 

Please request evidence from TP workshop for us to review this matter. 

 

Thank you. 
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Regards 

 

 
 

Sashe Go 

Motor Claims 

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 

 

8 Shenton way AXA Tower #24-01 

Singapore 068811 

Tel +65 6880 4888 

www.axa.com.sg 

 

Please consider the environment before printing this message 

____________________________________________ 

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. 

Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify 

the sender immediately. 

 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, May 29, 2019 11:50 AM 

To: CHAN Kian Chuan <kianchuan.chan@axa.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1510-044--Accident involving SKV2483E & SHD0067S on 04.10.15 *** LKK REF: 

CS/TP15017257/Kvbn2 // AXA REF : C0365928 

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

 

Dear KC, 

 

We refer to the above matter and our tele-conversation yesterday. 

 

We have inspected TP vehicle SHD 67S at M/s Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd on a WP basis and submitted 

our report to them. 

 

On 24/05/2019, we received an email from TP repairer. They requested to withdraw the independent report 

and proposed for a direct settlement.  

 

Please let us have your instructions. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

-----Disclaimer----- 

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are 
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not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have 

received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this 

message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other 

entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.  


