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Nivitha (LKIE Auto)

— =
From: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 6:59 PM
To: SUR
Cc: assignments
Subject: FW: Accident Involving SJY5702A & GY7684R On 28/05/19
Attachments: SJY5702A GIA Report.PDF; Estimate Before Survey.pdf; GY7684R (OI).PDF
Hi LKK team

Please make arrangement with repairer for the TP survey. Kindly let us have your surveyors’ comments whether the
damages are consistent.

Thanks and Regards

GREATAMERICAN o | |
INSURANCE COMPANY Claims Division | 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190
QF\RAb = - Moody's Standard & Poor's
s A1 (Good) A+ (Strong)
5 S Epeme S Published December 2018 Affirmed February 23, 2018
iy ,@? A+ (Superior)

Affirmed August 17, 2018

For mare infarmation on our financial ratings, visit GAIG.com/FinancialStrength.

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com> On Behalf Of General Claims
Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2019 1:40 PM

To: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: FW: Accident Involving SJY5702A & GY7684R On 28/05/19

Hi Sharon

Please assist. Thank you.

From: Shawn Chua <shawnchua@tanchong.com>

Sent: 30 May 2019 12:50 PM

To: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>

Cc: Kelvin Heng <kelvinheng@tanchong.com>

Subject: [External] Accident Involving SIY5702A & GY7684R On 28/05/19

Dear Sir/Madam,

Our customer holds your insured driver, GY7684R liable for the accident on 28/05/19 and would like to
claim against your insured driver. We hereby inquire whether you would like to have a direct settlement
with our claimant, SJY5702A.



If you minded to reach an amicable direct settlement with our customer, please let us have your
substantive reply strictly by 04/06/19. Otherwise our customer will proceed in a manner that he deems fit.

Kindly let me know when | can arrange for an accident survey.

Attached herewith the GIA Report and estimate of repair cost for SJY5702A.

Shawn Chua

Service Executive

TC AutoClinic Pte Ltd
25 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 159097
DID: +65 67038515
HP: +65 96450023
Fax: +65 64795019

J

TANCHONG

INTERNATIONAL

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments



S_h_iau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shawn Chua <shawnchua@tanchong.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 July 2019 8:20 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALISE OF TP VEHICLE SJY 5702A (DOA: 28/05/2019)

Good morning.
Great American has not got back to me with regards to SJY5702A liability.

Shawn Chua

Service Executive

TC AutoClinic Pte Ltd
25 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 159097
DID: +65 67038515
HP: +65 96450023
Fax: +65 64795019

TANCHONG

INTERNATIONAL

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, July 29, 2019 3:27 PM

To: Shawn Chua <shawnchua@tanchong.com>

Subject: FINALISE OF TP VEHICLE SJY 5702A (DOA: 28/05/2019)

Dear Shawn,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

= s
From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 3:26 PM
To: Ng, Sharon; SUR
Cc: assignments
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SJY5702A & GY7684R On 28/05/19 || Our ref:
CLMOMVC000003669
Attachments: CSGAI19009662Eqd3.pdf
Dear Sharon,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SIY 5702A.
Damages consistent.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 11:03 AM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SJY5702A & GY7684R On 28/05/19 || Our ref: CLMOMVC000003669

Dear Steve

Based on your assessment, please commcnt whether the damages sustained to SIY5720A was indeed caused by
GY7684R (0l). Ol was unsure if the damages was caused by his driver. TP only discovered damages on the following
day.

Thanks and Regards

Sharon Ng, Assistant Manager | Claims, FoC +65 6804 7845 | F +55 6235 3354 | sharon.ng@sg.gaig.com
GREATAMERICAN.
INSURANCE COMPANY Claims Division 1 Temasek &ve 11 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190
M @ Moody's Standard & Poor’s
i ¥ ‘E'_BES'“ A1 (Good) A+ (Strong)
3 N Published December 2018 Alfirmed February 23, 2018
Uy, A+ (Superior)

Affirmed August 17, 2018

For more information an our financial ratinas, visit CAIG.com/FinancialStrenat
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51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: GY 7684R Date: 07 June 2019

Our Ref: CS/GAI119009662/Eqd3

The Motor Claims Department
Great American Insurance Company

Attn: Sharon
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.__SJY 5702A

We thank you for the instruction on _30/05/2019.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 06/06/2019 at the premises of M/s TC AUTOCLINIC and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S 3.976.04
Revised Estimate Amount - SS 1.838.00
“Check” Items Amount :S$ 255.12
Market Value 1S9 -
Salvage Value : S$ -
Nett Value +S8 -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages consistent.

Recommend days of repair: 3 days.
We have NOT authorise repair.

Yours faithfully

Steve
Automotive Assessor



Shiau Chan (LKI(_Auto)

From: Ng, Sharon <Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 11:03 AM

To: SUR

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SJY5702A & GY7684R On 28/05/19 || Our ref:
CLMOMVC000003669

Dear Steve

Based on your assessment, please comment whether the damages sustained to SIY5720A was indeed caused by
GY7684R (0l). Ol was unsure if the damages was caused by his driver. TP only discovered damages on the following
day.

Thanks and Regards

Sharon Ng, Assistant Manager | Claims, P&C | P. +65 6801 7845 | + +65 6235 3354 | sharon.ng@sg.gaig.com
GREATAMERICAN,
INSURANGE COMPANY Claims Division | 3 Temasek Avenue =16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190

pranchl Sbwagth by,

Moody's Standard & Poor’s

& hﬁl " | A1 (Good) A+ (Strong)
5_ ; B 182 Published December 2018 Alfirmed February 23, 2018

A+ (Superior)
Affirmed August 17 2018

For mare information on our financial ratinas, visit GALG.com/FinancialSer=ngth

From: Ng, Sharon

Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2019 6:59 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Accident Involving SJY5702A & GY7684R On 28/05/19

Hi LKK team

Please make arrangement with repairer for the TP survey. Kindly let us have your surveyors’ comments whether the
damages are consistent.

Thanks and Regards

Sharon Ng, Assistant Manager | Claims, P&C | P. +65 6804 7845 | F. +65 6235 3354 | sharon.n .gaig.com



6/6/2010 ) DADEINAE Rahata Enniiin

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |1D Type: Company
Owner |D: 2205K
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SJY5702A
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Dereglistration Date: 06 Jun 2019
Vehicle Make: NISSAN

Vehicle Model:

SYLPHY 1.5L 4AT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR

Primary Colour: Silver
Manufacturing Year: 2010

Engine No.; HR153%90637B
Chassis No.: JN1BAAG11Z0111224
Maximum Power Output: 80.0 kW (107 bhp)
Open Market Value; $17,230.00
Original Registration Date: 15 Sep 2010

First Registration Date: 15Sep 2010
Transfer Count: 0]

Actual ARF Paid: $17,230.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 14 Sep 2020

PARF Rebate Amount: $9,476.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 14 Sep 2020

COE Category, A - Car (1600cc & below)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $33,089.00

COE Rebate Amount: $4,209.00

Total Rebate Amount: $13,685.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 06 Jun 2019

OK

hnps:u'n.lw.aur.a\:ruu F R S U S ATUEISU Y ULILUSIVI SLS SY UL DY T Wt



MTLK18070078 / TC AutoClinic Ple Lid - Leng Kee
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 20/06/2019 16:40
SUBMITTED BY: Chua Chu Rong

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1 Please report correcll[ the detalls of Ihe accident 1o speed up the claims process
2 This Form mus! be completed by the Policyholder andlor the Authorised Driver

3. Infarmation provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiale policy liability

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies
5 Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6 This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Cenltre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties
7. By the lodgement of this report to the Insurers, you hereby consent 1o the archiving of this report at the centre and lo coples of the report being made available

aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accident
Country/State of Loss

29/05/2019 16:40

28/05/20189 19:45

JLN AHMAD IBRAHIM TURNING RIGHT TO JLN BOON LAY
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Paolicy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

SJY5702A

NISSEI ASB PTE LTD
198302205K
NOEMAIL

OFFICE-67784633

NISSAN
SYLPHY-1.5 4AT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR (A)

NO

THIRD PARTY
PRIVATE CAR

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

2100228380-08

15/08/2018 - 14/09/2019

KOH KWEE FONG
$1642303C

09/09/1964

INDOOR

03/05/1991

28 YEARS AND 0 MONTHS
FEMALE

(LOCAL) +65-97816328

KAREN@NISSEIASB.COM.SG

Page 1 of 24



Address BLK 661D #11-448 JURONG WEST ST 64
Postcode S644661

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company YES

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident €

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by

ambulance? NG
Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance. NO
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the paolice? NO
If Yes,Please state which Paolice Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

Refer to attached sketch plan

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO

Vehicle Registration Number GY7684R

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour NISSAN

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Name of Driver MAHENDRAN
NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number 91338412

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

Nature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 2 of 24



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

SKETCH PLAN

i |

—t -

LT
EEREEREEERER
DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

1SS U, U (R == |

| W SR —_— |

ikfro.( 'Lb r.-\J;m,l\c‘_l

Important:
You have been advised by the workshop that in the event that you wish ta
claim against your own policy (OD CLAIM), There is a FOURTEEN (14)
DAYS CLAUSE WHEREBY MUST BE MADE within the stipulated time frame
from the day of the occurrence.

- Reporting Only

- Claim OD

- Claim TP

- Claim OD/ TP at other workshop

DECLARATION
I/WE declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect.

Policyholder’s signature

Date & Time

,\,’sN!C By

)}ﬁ ~’,z

Nnc{an No.

.__./

Driver's Signature (on 5ii“‘f ’E w Kt t-’-m\]'!r.-pcurting Centre Personnel’s Signature
Date & Time (if driver not the pblicyholder}

Page 3of 24



Sketch Plan Pg. 2

29" May 2019
To whom it may concern

Accident at Jurong Bird Park traffic junction at about 7.45pm, 28" May 2018 (Tuesday) for car no
GY7684R vs SJ¥Y5702A

On 28" May 2019 at about 7.45pm, | was waiting at Jurong Bird Park traffic light junction for green
light to turn right to Jalan Boon Lay.

While | am about to drive off when the green light turn green, | heard a sound at the back of the car
and felt the car jerked

| carried on with my turning as | did not want to obstruct traffic. | stopped at the first bus stoo after
turning right. A pickup with plate no GY7684R stopped behind me.

The pickup driver informed me that a small lorry behind him knocked into his pick up and caused his
pick up to bump into my car. He could not catch the lorry driver as it drove off very fast.

As the light at the bus stop was not so good, | could not see any damage to my car. So 1 only took a
picture of pick up and exchanged handphone no with the pickup driver. The pickup also has no
damage in the front

This morning | c?ecked th? back part of the car and found the back bumper has a crack line on top.
Covl i To\ger 9.4-" “"

(i—_’}’ s s11¥ Jouz i
j;_l'_ ~'|—.' AT LE 2

Thanks

Yours faithfully,
7

o

Karen Koh ( fee =v $01%Fva ) 2
97816328

Page 4 of 24



Sketch Plan Pg. 3

SKETCH PLAN

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims procass,
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Infarmation provided must be as truthful and accurate as passible. Any wilful misrepresentztion or withholding of material
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance
companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6, The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Assoaciation of Singapaore (GIA) for archiving and that copies of this report will for 2 fee be made availzble upon application by
Interested parties.

7. Bythe ledgment of this repart to the Insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report 2t the centre and to coples of
the report being made available afaresaid.

8. Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (POPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

(8] My nsurer, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore (*GIA"] may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal Information set out in this [form] and any other personal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Persanal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident (all insurer{s) whe have insured
vehicle(s) Involved in this accident shall be collectively referred 1o as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/lew firms, the
Menetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority {such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of :

{I) processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settiement of the claims and any riecessary
Investigations relating to the claims;

(1i) investigating the accident and/or my claims;
{iii) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

(iv) administering my claims (including the mailing of carrespondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

(v) complying with applicable law in administering, processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims.(collectively the
"Purposes”)
{b) all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, may/are permitted
1o collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

(e) my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third party service providers or
agents(including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the 2bove Purposes,

(d) my Personal Information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
Investigation and management In present and all future claims.

{e) the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

(i) to all insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating. contralling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

(ii) for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

-'_“‘-\..\_H\-
: AN/
P
=) =4
4( )" )
) Mg Q\
Palicyholder’s Signature Oriver's Signature [.}ﬂ Sd‘u«l{ J‘{' Koh k»"k Reporting Centre Personnel’s Signature
Date & Time: (If driver is not the policyhoider) g,fﬂ Name:
Date E Time: NRIC/FIN No,
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TC AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
25 LENG KEE ROAD
SINGAPORE 158097

ESTIMATE : ACCIDENT/BODY REPAIRS
WORKSHOP : LENG KEE

CONTACT NO : 67038511

REFERENCE : 067/1C/TCAC/CCR/2018
DATE i 29-MAY-2018

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY
3 TEMASEK AVENUE

#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER
$(039190)

TEL : 68046059

FAX : 62353354

ATTN: MOTOR CLAIM MANAGER

OWNER'S NAME  : NISSEI ASB PTE LTD

ADDRESS : 85 SCIENCE PARK DRIVE
#01-03 CAVENDISH, THE
5(118259)

TELEPHONE NO + 67784633/96206862

TYPE OF CLAIM  : DIRECT SETTLEMENT / THIRD PARTY CLAIM

POLICY NO + 2100228380-08
VEHICLE NO ¢ SJY5702A

MODEL CODE : BDUARCAGIIEHA-----
MODEL/YEAR ¢ SYLPHY 1.5 4A/T SEDAN (II)
ENGINE NO : HR153906378

CHASSIS NO : JN1BAAG11Z0111224
MILEAGE : 246752 KM

DATE IN : 29/05/2019
LIABILITY - 0.00

EXCESS CLAUSE : 0.00
ESTIMATE BY : SHAWN CHUA CHU RONG

ACCIDENT DATE : 28/05/2019



JC AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
25 LENG KEE ROAD

SINGAPORE 159097

ESTIMATED LABOUR CHARGES FOR ACCIDENT VEHICLE REGN NO SJY5702A

2 RSI

3 SEALI

4 22/001

5 11/002
6 2Z/003

7 71/004

ESTIMATED SURVEYOR'S

NATURE OF JoB CHARGES RECOMMENDATION
PERFOAM RUST PROOFING & TREATMENT FOR AFFECTED 120.00 /

PANEL

REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR, NECESSARY ADJUSTMENT & 55.00 /

FUNCTION TEST

APPLY SEALANT TO ALL AFFECTED PANEL JOINTS & 100.00 X
RESEAL NECESSARY AREA
REPLACE REAR BUMPER & MOULDING,REAR UPPER PANEL,. 1560.00 S
STRIKER ETC. REPAIR PANELS /9|5

7 /

RESPRAY REAR BUMPER,REAR UPPER PANEL ETC gg’} - -5 750.00 qu
QC, RETUNE & CONSULT CHECK

COMPLIMENTARY WASH & VACUUM

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 2585.00



JC AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
25 LENG KEE ROAD
SINGAPORE 159097

MATERIAL LIST FOR ACCIDENT VEKICLE REGN NO SJY5702A

1 Reverse sensor (M
2 ENERGY ABSORBER
3 RiGHT suwper sty - [R
4 LEFT BUMPER STAY {;r\
5 RIGHT BUMPER BRACKET X pw

6 LEFT BUMPER BRACKET X An

7 REAR BUMPER CHROME MOULDING
grear sweer /()]

g STRIKER 7 o~

x R

10 REAR UPPER PANEL

SUB TOTAL

LESS DISCOUNT (NETT-20.00%, LIST-30.00%, S/NETT-.00%)

GRAND TOTAL

OVERALL TOTAL

LEGEND: REMARKS( 0K ) = APPROVED,

DAMAGED PARTS & PRICES

» To display damaged part(s) during resurvey
* Parts prices are subject lo confirnation
* Third party survey is on a "Wittiout Prejudice” basis
* No illegal modification(s) is aliwed
* Supplementary item(s) mus he resurveyed
Is subject to final approval from Insurance Cﬁ'ﬁl‘ly

Acknowiedged by Repairer
Signalure:
Date:

PARTS NUMBER NETT LIST  S/NETT REMARKS
"""""""""""" oo e
85090-EW00D 37.00
85212-AX010 43.30
85213-AX010 43.30
B5226-EW000 3.60
85227-EW000 36.60
(4 85072-EW000 162.80
85022-£W025 660.60
8462 1-ED40A 56.90
79110-EW400 436.70
180 000 180,00
302.76 0.00 0.00
Do o0 180,00
Cusee
REMARKS( X ) = NOT APPROVED
LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey before/after spray painting



JC AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
25 LENG KEE ROAD
SINGAPORE 159097

SUMMARY OF ESTIMATE FOR VEHICLE REGN NO SJY5702A

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 2585.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES 1391.04
GRAND TOTAL 3976.04 =

* A1l charges doZ not include GST,

) \\
4 o
SURVEYOR'S PARTICULARS

0.7 m
g wil el 61, 27Y

; ------------------ . f-;eCL“) LH,, NP
s::'.ErEYEU DATE 7 j lﬂ/f

AUTHORIZED DATE : /1 //’

EXCESS CLAUSE : 0.00

LIABILITY ; 0.00 117 hel ¢
REMARKS : B ﬂa :7

PLS NOTE : This estimate is based on visual inspection of the
affected vehicle. Should we require further labour
charges & spare parts in the process of repairs, we
shall inform you accordingly.



'Y Vd 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

L; ; ‘. : 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 18-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref :  CS/GAI19009662/Eqd3e2
WM
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 06-08-2019
SINGAPORE 039190
Code: GAI
12 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GY 7684R Veh. Inspected SJY 5702A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMVCO000003669 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SHARON NG Assign Date 30/05/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN SYLPHY c.c 1498
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. JN1BAAG1120111224 Colour SILVER
Odometer 246983 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre [195/65R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[195/65R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 195/65 R15 YOKOHAMA 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/05/2019 [Inspection Date 06/06/2019
Survey held at TC AUTOCLINIC PTELTD
25 LENG KEE RD
SINGAPORE 159097
5a. i Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJY 5702A
- : : Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty : Description of Parts Condition Workshop (s?u .‘.sj).
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|ENERGY ABSORBER (N) * CHECK 37.00 -
1|RIGHT BUMPER STAY (N) BROKEN 43.30 43.30
1|LEFT BUMPER STAY (N) BROKEN 43.30 43.30
1|RIGHT BUMPER BRACKET (N) NOT NECESSARY 36.60 -
1|LEFT BUMPER BRACKET (N) NOT NECESSARY 36.60 .
1|REAR BUMPER CHROME MOULDING (N) NECESSARY 162.80 162.80
1|REAR BUMPER (N) DENTED 660.60 660.60
1|STRIKER (N) * CHECK 56.90 -
1|REAR UPPER PANEL (N) TO REPAIR SEE 436.70
LABOUR
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -302.76 -182.00
1,211.04 728.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) * CHECK 180.00 B
180.00 J
LABOUR
PERFORM RUST PROOFING & TREATMENT FOR 120.00 120.00
AFFECTED PANEL.
REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR, NECESSARY 55.00 55.00
ADJUSTMENT & FUNCTION TEST.
APPLY SEALANT TO ALL AFFECTED PANEL JOINTS & NOT NECESSARY 100.00 B
RESEAL NECESSARY AREA.
REPLACE REAR BUMPER & MOULDING, REAR UPPER 1,560.00 585.00
PANEL, STRIKER ETC. REPAIR PANELS. INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF REAR UPPER PANEL.
RESPRAY REAR BUMPER, REAR UPPER PANEL ETC. 750.00 350.00
2,585.00 1,110.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,976.04 1,838.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 1,838.00

(REPAIR COST NOT CONCLUDE)
(EXCLUDE CHECK ITEMS S$255.12 NETT)

Report Ref No. CS/GAI19009662/Eqd3e2
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CHEN TSUE YEE ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




