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MSs@FirstCapital

£ Raffles Quay 421-00 Singapore D48580
Tel (B5)6222 2311 Fax (65)6222 3547

M5 First Capltal Insurance Limited to#eg e 195000106 CST Rew Mo H2-DO0LETE-9

Claims & Hoter Usderwriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-00 ity House Singapore DEBATT

Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Fax (65) 6507 3849
wenw.msfirstcapital.comsg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

30-05-2019 Our Ref No.
26-05-2019 Claim Type.
SHCO809Z Third Party Vehicle.

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #02-24 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
SHAMELLE LIM

B2866060/ 91878064 Fax No.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No.

MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

D19003566MFSH

Third Party

SLD3083C

62867060

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

RICO 80 AUTO Attention
SERVICES PTE LTD :
MNA TP Solicitor Fax No.

HENRY KAD

IMPORTANT NOTE

MNIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

MIL

MNA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated latter, no signature required.

A& Member of EEERRNEE INSORANCE GROUP




QIZTI2018 Mail - Shirley Hiew [LKK Auta) - Outlock

Re: Finalisation for SJB 3803 B

Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Fri 27/9/2019 11:10 AM

To: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; enquiry@rico60.com <enguiry@rico60.com>
Hi John,

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Rico 60 <claims@ricob0.com>

Sent: Friday, 27 September 2019 10:58 AM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com=>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=; enquiry@ricob0.com
<enquiry@rico60.com>

Subject: RE: Finalisation for 5JB 3803 B

Dear all,

Offer accepted.

Dear Shanelle,

Please prepare the LOD and COR to submit.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
lohn Ong

_,.--""'-‘-__—-"

RICOGO services

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Mobile: +65 8811 2101 | Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@ricob0.com

From: Shirley Hiew [LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 27 September 2019 10:55 AM

To: Rico £0; SUR
Subject: Re: Finalisation for SJB 3803 B

Hi Jahn,

hitps:/foutlook.office3ds, com/mallisearchid/ AACQKADUxOWNIYmYzLTFhM2QtND ISNy05ZWFILTZIMzADO TIyM2ZMS NwWAQAKOIOZVTYRNImIpt?Z... 143



92712019 Mail - Shirley Hisw (LKK Auto) - Outlook

Please confirm final fig $ 5,100.00 (lump sum) @ 4 days of repairs.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2019 3:26 PM
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: FW: Finalisation for 5JB 3803 B

Thank you.

Best Regards,
John Ong

—_—

RICOGO &Eavices

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit

#02-24, Singapore 415875

Mobile: +65 8811 2101 | Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@rico60.com

From: Rico 60

Sent: Wednesday, 26 June 2019 10:07 AM
To: 'sur@lkkauto.com’

Subject: Finalisation for 5JB 3803 B

Dear Adrian,

| refer to attached for finalisation.

Please confirm,

Thank you.

Best Regards,
John Ong

RICO&G0O 5

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.
Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

https:/ioutlook. office36 5_com/mailfsearchid/AACikADUXOWNIY mYzLTFhM2OINDISNy052WFILTZIMZADO TIyM2ZMS MwAQAKOIOZVTYRNImIptSe2... 2/3



ShErlez Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 3 June 2019 10:44 AM

To: ‘Henry Kao Cai Jie’; 'CWS Motor Claims’

Cc assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003566MFSH/1
RE-SEND

Dear Henry,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLD 3083C on 31/05/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6256-3561 | email; Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) [mailto:ShirleyHiew @Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 4:48 PM

To: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'CWS Motor Claims’
<cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003566MFSH/1

Dear Henry,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLD 3083K on 31/05/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 3:52 PM




Shirle: Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 4:48 PM

To: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie'; 'CW5 Motor Claims’

Cc: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003566MFSH/1

Dear Henry,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLD 3083K on 31/05/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 3:52 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.comz>; assignments
<assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Henry Kao Cai Jie' <HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003566MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment,

Please be informed that repairer agreed to survey on 31/5/2019.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims [m_aiIto:cwsmnmrcEaims@msﬁrstcapita!,mm.5g]

Sent: Thursday, 30 May, 2019 3:43 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Henry Kao Cai Jie

<HenryKao@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003566M FSH/1

1



Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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15% Off Stock
Videos

Post an Advertisement
Sall & yoursalf! Advertee i€ 3t just
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Auta Toom Ent
1 4 " |
19 vehicles MEACEDES-BENZ C-CLASS C180 3
Price Any price Dapra  Any depoe Rag Date 2016 to 2116 Eng Cap Any bl Veh Type All bypes
Fuel | Any fuel * | Mileage Any OMV Ay Goar Ay Gear T Past Gwners Ay
Category Al categories Scheme All schemes Deaber | Any Dealer ¥  Location Any Status Avarable ¥
a
Make B Model Price Dhepreciation Rag Date Emg Cap Mileage ‘eh Typa Satus
Marcedes-Bene C-Class C180 5122666 515,080 fyr IT-Ape-2016 1,595 cc 35,000 krny Lueury Avablabls
Avantgarde
Prov §.99%, High Coa And Omy, CAC Uait, Agent Service, Wel Maintained, New Road Ta, Accident Free, High Trade In, Cheapest In Town
Excefant Conglion, We Wekome Vicom/Stacvaluation! View To Bali...
Privilege Motors P L
. g% 2016 Mercads B ¥ ¥ =5 1AL
P L ‘-'I— T —I.-'--':f:'. : 160, €
Mercedes-Banz C-Class CLBO 5125800 £15,390 fyr 27 -May-2016 1,595 o 27 500 ki Lupcury Awailable
Avantgarde
Nice 2 Digit Number Ta Ga With, Very Low Mikage Dane, Serviced At Cycle And Carrisge, In Howse Loan #vailable, Car Well Taken Cara By Previous
Onwner, Cortified With Assurance And Quality By 5TA Evalu...
Dackson Automobile
Dosrad: 27-Mary-2019 BO, ¥ des-ens L1 ek ¥
Mercedes-Benz C-Class CL80 $123,800 514,990 fyr 10-Jun-2116 1.585 oc 41,111 km Luxwry Available
Avantgarde
Grased Aoy ST
Ug Te T00% Loan, Comes With AMG GT Grilla, Full Agent Serdced Since Day 1. Just Serviced With C&C With Receipt Proven. Under Agent Warranty
Till Juna 2019, Well Mairtained By Prevsous Owner! Low Mie, .
SKL Automobile Pre Lid
Postes: 2-May-a0ts- [P 1B Mercades-bent O B 1B e '
Mercedas-Benz C-Class C180 $124,800 $15,060 fyr 07 -Jun-2016 1,585 cc - Lusury Availablo
Avantgarde
Extended 12 Months Warranty By Liberty Insurance FOC,' 1 Careful Dwner. Rare Pear White On Black, (Latest Facelift R17 LED Model]. Highest ARF
£37592. Minimumm Parf $18946. Vehicke [n Showrgom Al Cond,.. | s st 3
Pristed: 26May-at s-beng c180, Mencades-Benz C15], mercedes-benz ¢150
Total INEQ MC3 Vehicle Servicing
The TOTAL QUIARTZ INEC range comgrises synthetc technology lubncants with Tormulas eptimized to recuce SAPS content
Find aut mare!
Mercedes-Benz C-Class C180 %128, 800 515,830 jyr 20-May-20168 1,595 cc 42,000 km Ly Available
Avantgarde
! Owwnar Only, Full Agent Serviced. Call Or Misit Us Now For Further Details.
.My Tag ! el ooyt ol efrades-k |
L b} s bk
Mercedes-Benz C-Class C1BO 14,530 fyr 21-Jan-201E& 1,595 8¢ 45,00 ke Lugmury Availables

Avantgarde



e Bmith Rosd Tax,§ Cwnert CRC Uit Full Agent Serviced! R17 LED Avantgarde Model! Dust Free Interiar Grooming Done Every 'Wesk! Comes With
Gold Warranty! Excallent Condition! Hurry, 8indly Contact Us...

Mercedes-Benz C-Class C180 $115,000 £14,530 fyr 18-}an-2016 1,585 cc 59,4495 km Luiury Available
Avantgarde

Eidded Mice Regstranon Plate, R17 LED Model, 1 Owner With Regular Maentaim [n CAC, Excellent Conditon, Low Depreciaton Luxury Sedan,

Evaluation Welcoms, Price Negobiable, Trade In Waloome, | PR g0
Mercedes-Beng C-Class C180 121,800 £14,730 fyr 21-lun-2016 1,595 e 43,333 km LuKuny Avallabie
Avantgarde

M & Mouth Rd/tax, low Mieage, 18" sparts Rims, new Tyre, Latest Facelift R17 LED Model. Leather Intenor Lipholstery Like M. il /T Services
fec.Bank N [ Hse Loan Availadle,5T4 Evaluation Gradng A,

roies-Bene CL80, merpades-beny 13

Mercedes-Benz C-Class C180 $120,666 515,430 fyr t4-lan-2016 1,395 oC &0,000 km Lusury Available
Avantgarde

Promo 1.99%. High Coe And Omw, CRC Unit, Agent Servce, Well Maintained, Mew Road Tas. Acodent Free, High Trade In, Cheapest In Town.
Excellent Conditien. We Welcome Vicom Stagvaluation! View To Bali..

Privikege Mators Pte Lid
Tags: M g ek Beny CLED T
180, Lisad M B

Posted: 23-May-209

Mercedes-Benz C-Class C1B0 5133000 515,380 fyr 08-5ep-2016 1,595 cc 22,879 km Lusury Avallable
AMG Line

AMG Kits, Low Mileage, CAC Service Record, Accident Free, Keyless Entry/Start, Serviced And Maintaired And Stll Under Warranky By CELC, Easy In
House Enanong Available, Prstine Condition, Price Inc...

HMotar-Way Cragt Pra Lid

Boted: 0-Ha-anig o0 2015 Marcadps-Banz 2 arcndes-nane c180, Mergedes-Benz 180, mercedes-nanz C1EL

Merradoc-Ban;

Sall your Car for 53,000 More

With over 15§ cars soid via Auction and a 500+ Dealer Network, cars on sgCarMart Quote typically receive up to 53,000 aboave market walue, Quots
Guarantaes the Highest Seling Price In Singapore - if we fail, you get $100 cash from us. Get your Car Listed Today,

Firel oul mone!

Mercedes-Banz C-Class C180 5123.800 £15, 780 fyr 2G-Jan-20154 1,595 cx - Lusury Available
Avantgardie

1 Owiner Onty. Full Agant Serviced. Call Or Visit Lis Now For Further Details,

Burabes i - NEds: 2005 Mer 016 meneoes-perg cLED, Mervedes-Bang TR0, mamedes-bens: c180
bt T MevoadasBeng Sercpdes-Bens
Mercedes-Banz C-Clagss C180 5122 800 14,820 fyr 15-Jun-2016 1,555 e 55,000 km Lumury Available
Avantgarde

Lo Mileage OF 55,000km. Cycle And Carmiage Unit. Acciklent-Free. Tip Top Condition, 100% Loan Available, Vehicke In Showroom Conditian,
Grooming Dene By Professional Groomer, With Black Leather Seafls....

Snuang Hup Credil
180, 201

roedes-beng L8, Marcedes Berg C1ED, meroades- ket ¢ LR

Posted| 17-May-2012 e Mercices Bent
Mercedes-Banz C-Class C180 5121, 800 415470 fyr 01-Feb-2016 1,555 o< 57,588 km Lumisry Avaitabbe
Avantgarde

£2 000 CAC Servica Credits, CRC Unit! Additional 1 Year Mercedesi-Bene Pre-Owned Venicle Warranty Till Feb. 20200 33 Paints Vehicle Inspection,
Maintaired At C&C, Buy With A Peace Of Mind. Enjoy Exclusi...

Republic Auto

Porgtesd - 13-

Mercedes-Benz C-Class C1B0 5126 B0 £15,300 fyr 15-Jul-2016 1,595 o 53,842 km Luxury Available
Avantgarde

£2.000 CAC Service Credits, CBC Uni! Agent Wamranty Till 14 Jul 20149, Additional 1 Year Mercedes-Benz Pre-Owned Vehicle Warranty! 13 Paints
vehide Inspection, Maintained At CBC, Enjoy Exclusive Low-...

fepublic Aufo
Brceas  fb-Ma- 10 Tags: 2015 Merc £ mariedes-pang c1HD des-Bers C16], maredes-banz C1H0
i i serredes-Beng, C BT
Mercedes-Bene C-Class CLEQ $123,000 514,840 fyr 16=Jun-2016 1,595 o S, 500 krn Luury Availabla
Avantgarde

1 Chwiner With Full Service Histary By Cycle And Carrigge, Sheiter Parked. Exclusiee Interest Rates 2.48%. Please Call For Viewing And Endguiry.

Wearmnes Autormative Pte Lid

tad: O3-Mag-2010




Mercedes-Beng C-Class CLE0 5121, 800 515,500 fyr 27-Jan- 2016 1,555 oC 37,300 km Luzury Available
Avantgarde

57,000 CAL Sarvice Credits. CAC Unit, CompEmentary 1-Year Mercedes-Benz Pre-Owned Warranty, Fully Servica dnd Maintain By C&C, 33 Foints
Chack At CAC, Low Mileage, 4 x Brand New Tyres, CallfSM5 Far V..,

Republic Auto

Aostad PU-AgrAi] wrlad-Benz C13F, me 13
Mercedes-Benz C-Class C1B0 5116,B00 415,080 fyr 22-1an-20168 1,595 ce 57,004 km Luauiry Available
Avantgarde
{Appeoaimately 106 Upgrades Dene To Car), 1 Ownes, Add On 0563 Sport Body Kit Including Rear Diffuser {Cosmete Madule), Stock Exhaust And
Engine, [Byrinated Frent Star Emblemn, CALC Unit, Frant Bumper B...  PARN 1D
360 VR Cars
Pt Ao MG 5 Merge 7 C1k feroedas-Bens ifes-frens C1AT
Mercedes-Benz C-Class C180 $126 800 16,310 fyr 1B-Jan-2016 1,545 cx 43,000 km Ly Availatie
Avantgards
Hust Did Servicing And Grooming &t CBC, Fully Maintained At CBC, Mo Dealers Plaase, lust Changed New C5C Tyres [51.3k), CEEED
BTy Gy Togus 206 Ma -Bong 180, 2014 mecedes-bang £180, Mertedes-fianz TIRD, mamedes banz c140
IR, SN Megrerdes-Ben 180, Usad Mercedes-Benz
Mercedes-Benz C-Class C180 5125 800 £15,010 fyr 26-Da-2016 1,595 42,000 km Luury Available
Avantgarde
Hari Reve Special! Enjoy Discount Up To $30001 100% Finance Avatable! Mamtzmed By CBL With Warrarty! Excilfient Condition, 100% Aocdent Fres!
Lowest Deprecation Unit In The Market! Buy With & Peac... S Foaumm a0

Hua Yang Credit Pte Lo

CLB0, Merrades-Bens 1AL

= g s
el RSB I019
Posted: Q5Aprd0IY e eripc B

Make & Mooel Price Deprecation Reg Date Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Status
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> Back to OneMotoring

Ivisst .

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type: Singapore NRIC
Chmer 1D 89798

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SLD3083C
Vehicle to be Exported: Mo

Intended Deregistration Date: 28 May 2017
Vehicle Make: MERCEDES BENZ
Wehicle Model: CLA1BO AMG SPORT AUTO
Primary Colour: Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2015

Engine Mo, 27091030771244
Chassis Mo.: WDD1173422M277505
Maximum Power Output: 200 kW (120 bhp
Open Market Value: $29.379.00
Original Registration Date: 13 Jun 2014

First Registration Date: 13 Jun 2014
Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $28.131.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 12 Jun 2026

PARF Rebate Amount: $21.098.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 12 Jun 2024

COE Category: E - Dpen Category
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: £42,000.00

COE Rebate Amount: $33,720.00

Total Rebate Amount: $54.818.00

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 28 May 2019

OK



ARILLF RFIF CRERLAF JFE

MILEAGE:
TYRE:

CHASS1S NUM:

FILLE 5 uk Ladkh o BFERL Uy

RN LPRREREL BT aR T g

“SLD 3083 C

: MERCEDES C180

Premier (@i hal.: Bukit Singapore 415875, Email: cln:mw ricobil.com
Tel: 6286 6060 , FAX: 6286 TO60
VECHICLE NUM:
MAKE & MODEL: |

—

s ] s Sha'ele
ST e 8
g HEADLAMP {RII} Cacle € A266)00 ¥ | 1 | $5326-00
,[HEADLAMP BRACKET (RH) pe -~ £ 1| 44%.0 _|
5|FRONT LOGO (MERCEDES) . & AR
. ,JTRONTBUMPER "¢ A | 141554, 00
[FRONT BUMPER RETAINER (L+R) Ry p—~d oo, T ‘| 2 | $33¢e0
o [FRONT BUMPER CENTER GRILLE CHROME A X | 1| 423900
,|FRONT GRILLE LOGO (MERCEDES) Atq w % 1 | %'g1.00
o FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE  ye( A 1%\ .00 |
o|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE (L+R) ¢4 'Hr{ Mo e 2 | 3% 0
10/FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP At m + 1 | 4@6-vo |
1 FRONT BUMPER UNDERCOVER /" g 1 4164090
15|FRONT SENSORSET | pr &at d~my e 260 4 |gnoko.vo|
14| FRONT BUMPER NOZZLE CAP At s ol 1 [§8%-00 |
15 FRONT BUMPER TOWING CAP (L+R) i " 2 | AvotL-00
16 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BAR My o P 1| SUp® w0
,,[FRONT BUMPERBEAM 3 X |1 [ §3w0
1g|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE ¥ " 1| w1y 09
1o FRONT BUMPER BRACKET (L+R) -t #~ » 2 |4 " 0-09|
50| FRONT FENDER (RH) Pkd §1,030-0] 1 | \wed |
,1|[FRONT FENDER COWLING (RH) Pel—aA L13k00 | 1 | 426H-wO
| 22 FRONT SUPPORT PANEL ALt e~ 4| 1| fhkos20
[ 53| FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH jirq £ x| 1 |Fo8.00
,4|FRONT ABSORBER (RH) ) 4 | 1 |§ase.00
- [FRONT LOWER ARM ( + | 1 | 409600
-5 FORWARDER ARM s 09U 4 1 ML
,7|[FRONT THRUST ARM ‘ == i NI .
Jg|FRONT KNUCKLE C2236(0) * 11 [1.24%:00
;9| FRONT KNUCKLE BEARING 4 1| %3200
30{FRONT BEARING HUE AL l‘ ¥ 1 [t&HA.00 |
31|FRONT STEERING RACK & PINION ASSY ?M 4 1 |43 ,288-00
35 FRONT CROSSMEMBER 1 | 421300
- $2.304%. 00 E i
-w {93360 SUBTOTAL -
LESS 10% _
i PARTS TOTAL E -
R R T SPECIACNETE: R ~ |ory| PrICE
1 FRONT BUMPER CLIP  ALc- 10 | § 0T 3R
5|[FRONT FENDER COWLING CLIP e 10 s 1006630
3|FRONT TIRE AR pm IS 1,20000 |4




g FRUNIT LIKE KIM - A Ao ISET § 1,000.00 ' &
=\N=§60, |

=N - | C—

[ — (Al | |
| | |

| SPECIAL NETT TOTAL § 13,400.00
,/TO RNR ACCIDENT DAMAGE PARTS, CUT/WELD, KNOCK&REALIGN 1S 2400807 S
»|TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA L1 s 240800 SN
,/TO RUST PROOF ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA _ 1 s 25000 %
+ TO RNR UPHOSTERY,GARNISH AND ATTACHMENT PARTS ' 1 | s 400.00 €
5/ TO RNR FRONT SENSOR & CHECK FUNCTION. 1|5 e ZC
5/TO RNR UNDERCARRAIGE SYSTEM TV |1 |s 40000 | A
;|TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT O 1 |s 25000 | £
5/ TO CHECK WIRING LAYOUT AND HEADLAMP FOCUS 1 |s 120867 372
g TO RNR TYRE AND WHEEL BALANCING 1 | s 12000 | 4
10/TODO DIAGNOSIS AND RESET , REFROGRAM OR CODING FAULT CODE. 1 5 250.00 (4
11/TO DO WATER LEAK TEST . 1 |s 10000 |+
Y S 1) €0
TareL =¥6, 303 O TOTAL $  6,890.00
- 90/ = 45,199 GRAND TOTAL COST $ 20,290.00 |
I 4 bh2 bo |
L '|
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408233
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Req. Mo: 199607198R GS5T Reg. No, 18-2607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCI19009615/Asd3n2

36 ROBINSON ROAD R

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 s TIRER wmmnl”"‘ml”"
Code: FCI2

1.

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SHC B0SZ Veh. Inspected SLD 3083C
Policy No. Coverage (S) 0.00
Claim No. D19003566MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From HEMNRY KAD Assign Date 30/05/2015
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ CLA180 c.c 1595
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No. WDD1173422M277505 Colour SILVER
Odometer 48429 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/40 R18 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/40 R18 DUNLOP & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/40 R18 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/40 R18 DUNLOP & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHIGLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/05/2019 Inspection Date 31/05/2019
Survey held at RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTELTD
8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4
#02-24 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875
5a. Remarks
A)DAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607138R GST Reg. No. 19-8607183-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLD 3083C

Page No.1af 2

E By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wm:tn; {gj} ! {5‘1
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|HEADLAMP (RH) CRACKED 5,326.00 2,663.00
1|HEADLAMP BRACKET (RH) NOT NECESSARY 93.00 -
1|FRONT LOGO (MERCEDES) NOT NECESSARY 117.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 1,554.00 1.554.00
2|FRONT BUMPER RETAINER (L+R) /S DAMAGED 226.00 113.00
1|FRONT BUMPER CENTER GRILLE CHROME NOT NECESSARY 329.00 -
1|FRONT GRILLE LOGO (MERCEDES) NOT NECESSARY 189.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 179.00 -
2|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE (L+R) NOT NECESSARY 794.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP NOT NECESSARY 396.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER UNDERCOVER NOT NECESSARY 164.00 -
4|SET FRONT SENSCR DAMAGED (1 PC 1,040.00 260.00
OMLY)

1|FRONT BUMPER NOZZLE CAP NOT NECESSARY 89.00 -
2|FRONT BUMPER TOWING CAP (L+R) NOT MECESSARY 106.00 -
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BAR NOT NECESSARY 468.00 F
1|FRONT BUMPER BEAM NOT NECESSARY 217.00 =
1|FRONT BUMPER SPONGE NOT NECESSARY 137.00 -
2|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET (L+R) NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
1|FRONT FENDER (RH) DENTED 2,060.00 1.030.00
1|FRONT FENDER COWLING {RH) DEFORMED 368.00 184.00
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL NOT NECESSARY 465.00 -
1|FRONT SUPPORT PANEL TOP GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 318.00 -
1|FRONT ABSORBER (RH) NOT NECESSARY 938.00 -
1|FRONT LOWER ARM NOT NECESSARY 686.00 -
1|FORWARDER ARM (NFA) NOT NECESSARY . -
1|FRONT THRUST ARM (NPA) NOT NECESSARY - -
1|FRONT KNUCKLE NOT NECESSARY 1,296.00 -
1|FRONT KNUCKLE BEARING MNOT MECESSARY 792.00 -
1|FRONT BEARING HUB NOT NECESSARY 689.00 -
1|FRONT STEERING RACK & PINION ASSY NOT NECESSARY 7.935.00 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18009615/Asd3n2
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 199607138R GST Reg. No. 19-0607188-R Page No.:2of 2
: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop lg'.':l {J,
1|FRONT CROSSMEMEBER NOT NECESSARY 2,163.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -2,930.40 -580.40
26,373.60 5.223.60
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIP (SN} MECESSARY 100.00 30.00
10|FRONT FENDER COWLING CLIP (SN) MECESSARY 100.00 30.00
1|FRONT TIRE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 1,200.00 -
1|SET FRONT TIRE RIM (SN) NOT MECESSARY 12,000.00 -
13,400.00 60.00
LABOUR
TO RNR ACCIDENT DAMAGE PARTS, CUT/WELD, KNOCK 2,400.00 500.00
& REALIGM.
TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA. 2,400.00 500.00
TO RUST PROCF ACCIDENT AFFECTED AREA. NOT NECESSARY 250.00 =
TO RNR UPHOSTERY ,GARNISH AND ATTACHMENT NOT NECESSARY 400,00 -
PARTS.
TO RNR FRONT SENSOR & CHECK FUNCTION, 200.00 50.00
TO RNR UNDERCARRIAGE SYSTEM. MOT NECESSARY 400.00 -
TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT. WOT MECESSARY 250,00 -
TO CHECK WIRING LAYOUT AND HEADLAMP FOCUS. 120.00 30.00
TO RNR TYRE AND WHEEL BALANCING. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TO DO DIAGNCOSIS AND RESET,REPROGRAM OR NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
CODING FAULT CODE.
TO DO WATER LEAK TEST. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
5,620.00 1,080.00
GRAND TOTAL 46,663.60 6,363.60
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 5,100.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19009615/Asd3n2
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Licensed Appraiser
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DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report i made solely for the use and benefit of the Clisnt named on the front page of this Report.




