~

TC AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
25 LENG KEE ROAD
SINGAPORE 158097

FINALIZED : ACCIDENT/BODY REPAIRS
WORKSHOP ¢ LENG KEE

CONTACT NO : 67038511

REFERENCE : 064/1C/TCAC/CCR/2019
DATE ¢ 28-MAY-2019

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

5 TEMASEK BOULEVARD
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE
5{038985)

TEL : 68299199

FAX : 68299247/9248

ATTN : CLAIM MANAGER

OWNER'S NAME  : M/S SERVICE STATIONARY & TRADING PTE LTO
ADDRESS : 18 BOON LAY WAY

#04-142 TRADEHUB 21

5(609966)
TELEPHONE NO  : 97979200 - MR RONNIE

TYPE OF CLAIM  : DIRECT SETTLEMENT / THIRD PARTY CLAIM

POLICY NO : 1700012219-01
VEHICLE NO + GBG8S1J

MODEL CODE : YTKARURM20TWL-CAAC
MODEL/YEAR : NISSAN NV200 1.5L DIESEL VAN (II)
ENGINE NO ¢+ K9KC400D056981
CHASSIS NO : VSKYBAM20Z0144964
MILEAGE : 28480 KM

DATE IN : 28/05/2019
LIABILITY : 0.00

EXCESS CLAUSE 0.00
ESTIMATE BY + SHAWN CHUA CHU RONG

ACCIDENT DATE : 28/05/2019



TC AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
25 LENG KEE ROAD

SINGAPORE 159097

LABOUR CHARGES FOR ACCIDENT VEHICLE REGN NO GBG8S1J

ESTIMATED SURVEYOR'S

CHARGES

RECOMMENDATION

2 RSI

3 SEALI

4 WHI

5 72/001

6 2Z/002

7 1Z/003
8 2Z/004

9 72/005

PERFORM RUST PROOFING & TREATMENT FOR AFFECTED
PANEL

REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR, NECESSARY ADJUSTMENT &
FUNCTION TEST

APPLY SEALANT TO ALL AFFECTED PANEL JOINTS &
RESEAL NECESSARY AREA

CHECK & INSPECT WIRE HARNESS FOR DAMAGE & OPEN/
SHORT CIRCUIT, REPAIR WHEN NECESSARY

REPLACE REAR BUMPER,RIGHT TAIL LAMP { fl“Jf
REPAIR RIGHT SLIDING DOOR,REAR RIGHT FENDER 290
~

TRANSFER RIGHT SLIDING DOOR COMPONENTS TO
FACILITATE REPAIR
7 e
RESPRAY RIGHT SLIDING DOOR,REAR RIGHT PANEE
a( o

QC, RETUNE & CONSULT CHECK

COMPLIMENTARY WASH & VACLUM

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

240.00

55.00

200.00

240.00

1950.00

120.00

750.00

100.00 /

.00

1170.00 ,/'

.00

500.00



TC AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
25 LENG KEE ROAD
SINGAPORE 159097

MATERIAL LIST FOR ACCIDENT VEHICLE REGN NO GBG891J

2 sLiDInG poor RAIL guroe X AL

7 (K
<o

5 REAR RIGHT FENDER

3 RIGHT BUMPER BRACKET

4 REAR BUMPER

6 GROM-PTN PIPE Ve ("T

e (a‘(

7 RIGKT TAIL LAMP

SUB TOTAL

PARTS NUMBER

DAMAGED PARTS & PRICES

H2100-BJ1AC

77760-BJ01A

85228-BJ00A

H5022-3LGEH

78100-3LS0A

80874-WLO0A

26550-BJ20A

LESS DISCOUNT (NETT-20.00%, LIST~30.00%, S/NETT-.00%)

GRAND TOTAL

OVERALL TOTAL

LEGEND: REMARKS( OK ) = APPROVED, REMARKS( X ) = NOT APPROVED

LKK & . :n.sultants hence notify
the Re; of the following:
e Tores . .. 3fer spray painting
o Todisp - |-t parti's) dunng resurvey
o Parls pr o eet g confirmation
o Third par’ 4 "without Prejudice” basis
o Noillegal : - s allowed
» Supplemer st e resurveyed and
is subjectto . ai trom insurance Company
Acknowledged by n=pairer
Signature:
Date:

Steve CLKK)

NETT LIST S/NETT REMARKS
1165.20 X
154,40 X
2.0 / oK
632.70 /7 0K
1554.30 X

2.50 / oK
254.90 / 0K
912.80 0.00 0.00
182.56 0.00 0.00
730.24/ 0.00 0.00
730.24

o gl 7)1, 29997
§ 471
74
Rj bl §



TC AUTOCLINIC PTE LTD
25 LENG KEE ROAD
SINGAPORE 153097

SUMMARY OF OVERALL CHARGES FOR YEHICLE REGN NO GBG891J

NETT ITEM 912.80
LESS 20.00%) -182.56
NETT AMOUNT 730,24
LIST I1TEM 0.00
LESS 30.00%) 0.00
LIST AMOUNT 0.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEM 0.00
LESS .00%) 0.00
SPECIAL NETT AMOUNT 0.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 2065.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES 730.24
TOTAL CHARGES 2795.24
ADD 7 % GST 195.67

GRAND TOTAL 2990.91



Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Shawn Chua <shawnchua@tanchong.com>
Sent: Friday, November 15, 2019 8:27 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: GBG891J Finalized Claim

Good afternoon sir & apologies.
We will confirmed the finalized claim $2795.24 (P/P before GST) with 5 days of repair.

Shawn Chua
Service Executive

TC AutoClinic Pte Ltd
25 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 159097
DID: +65 67038515
HP: +65 96450023
Fax: +65 64795019

v

TANCHONG

P ERNAT IO N A

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.coms
Sent: Thursday, November 14,2019 5:58 PM

To: Shawn Chua <shawnchua@tanchong.com>

Subject: GBG891J Finalized Claim

Dear Shaun,

Kindly follow up the finalize.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 Email: SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)



