Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 10 January 2020 4:11 PM
To: Rico 60
Subject: RE: RE: RE: LOD for SKP 8943 L (DOA : 03/05/2019)
Attachments: SMH 7042L.mp4; Ol SKETCH PLAN.pdf
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.
We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement and video for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client try to filter to the
left and rear ended our insured vehicle.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Indus‘rrlol Pork Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

HAFF? AT TRAR!

0006)

TEAR O THE RAT

From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Friday, 20 December 2019 6:25 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: RE: RE: LOD for SKP 8943 L (DOA : 03/05/2019)

Dear all,



We do not have anymore photos or video on our side.
Thank you.
Best Regards,

Elfphaine Tan

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: enquiry@rico60.com

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2019 5:51 PM

To: Rico 60

Subject: RE: RE: LOD for SKP 8943 L (DOA : 03/05/2019)

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Elfphaine,
We are still pending for your evidence.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)




From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 17 December 2019 5:29 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: RE: LOD for SKP 8943 L (DOA : 03/05/2019)

Dear Asher,

Any updates on the investigation?
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elfphaine Tan

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: enquiry@rico60.com

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 October 2019 11:46 AM

To: Rico 60

Subject: RE: LOD for SKP 8943 L (DOA : 03/05/2019)

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 8943L & SMH 7042L ON 03/05/2019
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's
accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you heard

further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order for us to
look into the matter.

We shall revert upon hearing from you.



Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 October 2019 2:58 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LOD for SKP 8943 L (DOA : 03/05/2019)

Dear Asher,

Any updates on the said case?
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elfphaine Tan

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: enquiry@rico60.com

From: Rico 60

Sent: Tuesday, 15 October 2019 2:21 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD for SKP 8943 L (DOA : 03/05/2019)

Dear Asher,

Any updates on the said case?
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elfphaine Tan



RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: enquiry@rico60.com

From: Rico 60

Sent: Tuesday, 16 July 2019 10:29 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD for SKP 8943 L (DOA : 03/05/2019)

Dear Asher,

*** Please ignore previous sent LOD.
Attached file as per your pursuant.
Kindly release DV/cheque.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yvonne Teoh

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@rico60.com

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 9:11 AM

To: Rico 60

Subject: RE: LOD for SKP 8943 L (DOA : 03/05/2019)

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sirs,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 8943L & SMH 7042L ON 03/05/2019

We refer to the above matter.



Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's
accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you heard
further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order for us to
look into the matter.

We shall revert upon hearing from you.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Rico 60 <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Monday, 3 June 2019 4:43 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: LOD for SKP 8943 L (DOA : 03/05/2019)

Dear Asher,

Attached file as per your pursuant.
Kindly release DV/cheque.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yvonne Teoh

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@rico60.com







