INS CASE OWNER

| cc 41 Mbaqgeg UMb , JalO/

\ ML

ot

pOl: EEEI‘“

W4

Srveyor Dmte / Tine
i pegistered in Merimen \/I\ l.\j
Pre-assign / COU / FTE
Insured Viehicle No SGC‘ [“T X Claish No. -
Name of Insured U’I““' VAN Pla) M Palicy No.
lnsured Tel No. HP Make / Model
Excess See 11 :S§ n.amn‘;hq Place of Accidem - _
1s driver the awner? { ‘@J’ w0 Ntz of Accidom ;
IINO, Driver Name / Age O1 GIA REPORT: @IN{} .TFGL&‘REFGRT:N@ I W0
Brives Tel Noc: Vi @-" N Insured Lishility e Final * Yes /No
INSRS: INSRS: INSRS:
M.t W wep: ) WEP WEP:
Tel Td; Tel:
w:uny Linbility - Liability : Linhiliry ;
RMKS: BMXS: RMEKS: RMKS:
Datef Time .
ot Ab A A e A IR T ST I 2 T LR AT AGE DATE / PIC
Ly T ol I MU WU, Y A
Non-Reporting I (Final)
Notificatian Iz (if non-pisia)
[Cadi Gl oy peren, V1G4
;}_‘Ml Hﬁ{- | After all b o O 7
llocumemtiatian Chock Livi: Handler  Typist
[Matifization it (if noeepickug) | |
After eall Ity 1o OL el | |
Authorisation To Act v |-
% elease Voucker 1-" |
[Fimat B epaie Bill =
Car Retmal Tnvolce: = g .
[ Tawing Invoice | L1
LTAJ GEA —
Wedice] Bill:
PI:
ManduteRetect temmastion:
LOD
Peyment Breakdown Form;
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ASSIGNMENT

From: Date: vehNo  SMBIZ308  viRegn 9 maas 1913
Estimated Cost: Type: M.Car | M.Cycle @ I'Van | Lorry | Tasti / Prima Mover |
OD/TPIWS /TP RES/OD RES/ EVA/INV MV Truck/ Traller or
Ta Inspect Vishicle No: Make: Wan ALL _4:; DS I1%
at Workshop mis Colour B AIC:  Insured | Std | NI I NA
of Sp Reading é 59 S27 TiRadlo: Insured | Std | NI/ NA
Insured: Eng/No: -
Poiicy No. CiNo: WMARL1L ZZ %D ToolNES
Claims No. Gen. Cond: | Fair | Poor | Burnt
Sum Insured: Excess: Steering: [31 Jammed | Leaked | Burnt or

(Client's Record) Brake: @I Jammed / Leaked / Bumt or
Maka of Veh: Modi: NIl | §Rig? | STD ARIm or

|tz B 25 ogn S

{Palicy Condition) R: 1 .

Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | OS | | BS/DUN/EXNOVA I GY [ FS I LIZA | MIC | OHTSU | PIR | SUMI {
repair at the time of Inspection. TOYO | YOKO or Elrenza
Bal or Market Value: Eront Rear
IDAC Accident Rport: Consistent? : Yes o No RiBal g - Res.  7[7  mm
GIA /PR Seen:  Consistent? : Yes o No LBal 2l mm LBal ]{] mm
Est. Repairs days Res: Yes cr No ooa 23 )19 ool 2¢[shg
Lum Sumy;: o 3val: Yes or No Survey held at S.“,,}
CA | REV | REP. | 24 HRS mmmm;wnmiwm:mmmnma
Vehigle: IN | OUT

O Perin Cantacied: The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affected dus to collsian,

Dats | Tima Action / Instruction

FIP - g m RO w3 Y9 o
Data/Tirm, Fie Paes 107 : Prell. Report Days Of Repair:
1 : Final Report Resurvey No. of Trip: Survey Fee
Dato/Tima. Fia Ratum 197 oo
2 B Add Fee: :SitaInsp (9 }1 _sems_ s [
nterview (S )| Pmetes ]
Report Format : E Tech Invs s )| Others i
Lump Sum ! 1L.B.1: (§ , | weskena s )
TOTAL [ ——
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. Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June 2019 3:43 AM

To: Audrey Woo (Auto Svecs/Claims & IA/Claims & |1A/Buses); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); AIG SGP, CCU Referral; Aigsgp_claimssurvey@aig.com;
CS A Team

Subject: RE: LOD to AIG - SMRT ref BUS/05/19/1062 - Accident involving SMB1330B and
SGC1667X on 23 May 2019 along Hillview Road *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19009516/)ea3

Attachments: img-618180556-0001.pdf; SAS2606415.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag 5tatus: Flagged

From: Audrey Woo (Auto Sves/Claims & [A/Claims & [A/Buses) <audrevi@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June, 2019 9:24 AM

To: Admin A <admin-ailkkauto.com=>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlauelkkauto.com>; AIG SGP, CCU
Referral <AIGSGPCCUReferral@aig.com>; Aigsgp_claimssurvey/@aig.com

Subject: LOD to AIG - SMRT ref BUS/05/19/1062 - Accident involving SMB1330B and SGC1667X on 23
May 2019 along Hillview Road

Importance: High

SMRT Ref : BUS/05/19/1062
Your Ref : SGC1667X

Dear Sir/Mdm.

We claim on behalf of SMRT BUSES LTD, owner of the vehicle registration number SMB1330B. Your
client's negligent driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,

Cost of Repair $976.00
Loss of Use (5275 x 2 Days) S 550.00
LTA Search Fee 5 7.00
Total $ 1533.00

We enclose the following documents,
« Repair Invoice
« GIlA Report
e LTA Search
¢ Survey Report and Bus Photos to be furnished by AIG’s appointed surveyor, LKK.

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. Payment
by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT BUSES LTD.



WE

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Manday, 17 June 2019 3:27 AM

To: CAESAR.CHEUNG@GMAILCOM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGC 1667X AND SMB 13308 ON 23/05/2019

Our Rel: CCIH/AIGI9009516/Jead

17 MAY 2019

CAESAR CHEUNG SHI SHUNG

Dear Sit/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING S5GC 1667X AND SMB 1330B ON 23/05/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid 1o resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver
may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have them
in writing within the next 10 days, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the
without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against
the other party's insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng @ lkkauto.com

e.c.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
{Motor Claims Dept)



SWMRT  Refl BMS/OB/H/WGZ /Ao

AUTHORIZATION TO ACT
AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third P Claim

I, SMRT BUSES LTD (the third party claimant™) of 60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK
E4 SINGAPORE 757705 (address), owner of SMB 1330B (vehicle no.) hereby authorize SMRT
AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) 10 act for me with respect to my claim
for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no SMB 13308 that was
damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 23/05/2019 (date) along HILLVIEW AVE
{location) involving vehicle no/s SGC 1667X (“the accident™).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in 2 manner that they deem fit

and the workshop is further authorized 10 receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT BUSES LTD.

I further acknowledge that any setlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/ownet/insurers of the other

vehiclefs is concemed,

Dated this l (dav) of ﬂ[' ; {(month) Eﬂﬂ (vear)
m gl\ﬁg‘\_ahﬁ

Signed by jhe third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop"
(with chep if applicable) (with chop)




SmeT Ref! BuS/o:i/{"?/wé?— ()

EASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

MOTIVE SERVI PTE LTD (“the workshop") hereby confirm that we/l
have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
S$488.00 (Repair Cost), S$250,00 (Loss of Hse/Rental), $$7.00 (Disbursement) for vehicle no. SMB
13308 _that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 23/05/2019 (date) along

HILLVIEW AVE (location) involving vehicle no/s SGC 1667X.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 28 fof (19 (date) at "'the workshop™,

We/l confirm that we/l arefam authorized by the owner SMRT BUSES LTD (“the third purty
claimant™) of vehicle no. SMB _1330B_make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have [ull authority to settle the matter on his/her behall in a munner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage 1o SMB

13308 (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l conlirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this ’ (day) of ﬂ%# (month) zuﬂ (year)

=
KK )
() o b, alpifpe

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed hiy*m: iwm&xhnp“ (with chop)




L a .
stT SHMRT Automotive Ssacvices Pta Ltd

251 North Bridge Road Singapose 179102

AUTOMaTIVE Tel: 65 63311000 Wax: 65 631340247
Tax Invoice
Customer Code: 3000066 GST Reg Mo. : MR-B500001-7
CAaN : 1990042802
SMRT BUSES LTD Invoice No. : IV190800240
Date : 13.06.2018%
Block 0Onit Vehicle Ho. : SMB1330B
STREET B2 Your Ref No. : BUS/05/1%/1062
& ANG MO KIOD Our Ref No, : 24101750
SIHNGAPORE 569140 Terms : 30 Days
Description oty Unit Add / (Discount) Amcunt
Cost & Amount
Labour
TO REPAIR AH PORTION 1.00 § 530.00 0.00 -] 0.00 3 530.00
Othars
FROVICE LABOUR AMD MATERIAL TO 1.00 5 445.00 0.00 3 D.00 5 446.00
FUTTY AND RESPFRAY ABOVE HEFAIR
ITEME
ZRAND TOTAL -] 976.00
Remark :
Make/Model : MAN A22

Recidant Date : 23.05.2019

K.3. Faymant by chague should be crossed and
mds payable to 'SMET Autcmotive Services Pta Led®.

o recaipt will be issued unless Ceguaated, /
£;“ij‘

Autha:isad‘hignagﬁzéﬁ
for SMAT Rutomotive Services Pte Ltd

Fags 1/1 E. & 0.E



" Enquire Transaction History
¥ Tracwactinn History Details

Leg Date/Time 24 May 2019 / 15:3&:4%9
Asset Type: Vehicle Transaction Amouni: $749
Assat 1D: SGC1467TX
Transaction Typa: 18.32 Insurance Enquiry (GIRO Payment]  Channak Exlernal Agency
; ESASBAHO - BALQISH BINTE ABDUL Busiinvess Transactlon
User |0: HALIL ‘ Nou: 2017052415364 716 1844
Saarch Dato / Time: 23 May 2019 11:33.00
Insurance Company: AlG ASIA PACTFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

Infermation displpyed is correct as al the log date and time.

Enquire Related Logs Back to List
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Exgresi

'CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case | Notifed [Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned | Adj Rpt Ad) Submitted | Ins Autted [Status
| 22 Moy 2018 . Sy ALY $$976.00 $$976.00 pncion ror Sy
i : eport
. Edit fleg I | Ee = J mmm] Wi Rpt | | Canes Case 1

Hain Reference

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS - [Created by adjuster]
| Tnurea: CAESAR CHEUNG SHI SHUNG, [D: FS42536F

- :
|Claimany: | SMAT BUSES LTD, Co Feg. No. 1981022630

Vehicie Reg _|23/05/2019 11:00 - :59
P o ocee o Date 0f LosS- | (33 Months and 28 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man ¥r)] |

Claim Type: | TP / 794359135456 OYICOVET | 1100598668 (Comprehensive)
{Venicle Reg i

| Pulicy Na,
MNo. SGCIGETX D-19081203MFBF
{Insured); (Climant): |

e |Eetess |
| Reparer: SMAT Automotive Services Pie Lid (Woodlands) &0 Woodlands Industrial Park E4, 757705 Woodlands - Tei: 68662638

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel! 65-6419-3000 .., [Handied by Loh, Chee-Heng | Ches-Heng, Loh@Ealg.com
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62222311

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

view Al | compose Case mail |
| Thare are no mail for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™

view All | Search Tasks | Create New Task | Complete ||
Due Dale Priority Type Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By
| Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=dsp__.. 14/8/2019



Menmen e-Claims

Upioad Docaments | Upicsd Photos | Compose New Lemer | ww| upiosa Augio_|

Claim Documents

*SMB13308B (79435913545G)

[SGC1667X]
T
SMRT BUSES LTD

May 23 2019 11:00AM
[CAESAR CHEUNG SHI SHUNG]
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Page 1 of 2

Letters/Correspondences [1peroege M1 &4
No | Finaltzed On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ Thumbinall Pring|
1 {oran) Third Party Express Settiement - Payment Breakdown 0O e '
Photos/Tmages I 3 per 1= |
o | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - | Thumbnall| Print
I 110819 09:59 General View © | weaws | B |
1 |11/06/19 09:59  Ganeral View 0 | ieadirs | B
3 llm:ﬁ‘ﬂ:ﬂ_imﬂw_ 0 | weaws | |
4 11/08/1909:59 | General View 0  wawc | &
5 11/06/1909:50 | General View 0  (lsdws |
6 |11/06/19 09:59 .“".';'!",..",'."_"!"' 0 | L=dirc @_
7 |MDE/1906:55 | General View B | cdws | 4
B 11/06/19 09150 | General View 0D lwdws | 4
9 11/06/1609:55 | Phote After Spray O | wurs | 2|
10 1DE/1909:55 | Photo After Spray © | taaws | B
11 LUD8/19 09:59 | Photo After Spray | @ | et | &
‘Documentation - {1 per page I:I| ]
[N Aclabel/Aeorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Print
| 29/05/1% 20:50 TP ESTIMATE - MARKED © | Losaror

2 29/051920:50 TP GIA REPORT Load PDF |

3 17/08/1509:28 | LETTER TO O1 3 Load POF

4 14/08/19 10.00 _ WORKSHOP INVOICE 0 | Loadene

5 14/08/1% 10:00 | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM QO | loadpor |
|6 |14/08/19 10:00 | Release Voucher ) | Load POF

7 |14/08/19 10:00 | LTA SEARCH © | ioss POF

o |Finakzed On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnail Print
1 30/05/19 10:38 | O1 GIA report O | oanrnF |

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

[There are no document checklists configured.

Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
Robe Harsdrhs By DOVEle JIEse pou Ehow L @ other pariess

https://singapore.menimen.comV/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc...

14/8/2019
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hitps:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doc... 14/8/2019



Preview Page 1 of |

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|'.-'¢hh:ln No: SGC166TX (Insd veh) Model: N NL320F {A22) 10.5 D (M)
SMB1330B (TP veh)

|Date of Accident: | 23/05/2019

Global Sum Setilement | [ | 1 Yes I [X] No

Repair Eslimale '§ 1,323.00

Final Repair Cost ‘5 488.00

Loss of Use '8 250,00 2.00 days at $250,00 per day
Rental {if any) -1 0.00 days

LTA | GIA Search Fee - 7.00

Others: - 0.00

3
Final Setllemant Sum :§ 745.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? | | YES [X | NO (Kindly indicate
below)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agread Liability 50 (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registerad Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liabllity to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |SMRT Buses Lid $ 745.00
2) .1
3) -1
14 Aug
JOANMNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultanis Pte Ltd Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Inveice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Repaort; Medical
Report! Bill {if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 14/8/2019



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg we 1sss07108m)
51 Ubl Ave 1 801-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel. 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: surn@lkkauto.com;assignmenis@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CC3/AIG180085168/JEA3Q2
Date: 14/08/2018
HEFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte, Lid.  Policy Ne: 0100598668
Claimant Vehlcle sme1aaon Insured Vehicle No: SGC1867X
Date of Loss: 23052018 MNature of Claim: TP Claim No: 7843581354506
RIPTI I FICA F
Reg No: SMB13308
Make & Modal. MAN NL320F (A22), 10.5 D (M) Engine No 503336801903358
Reg. Date: 25/03/2013 (Man. Year 2012) Chassis No: WMAAZ2ZZXDTO01765
Colour Multi-colour Odometer: 659527 km
Engine Capacity 10518 cc
Markeq Value/Mew Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S§). Market Valuae/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering {Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Candition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size 275fT0OR225 Rear Tyre Size: 2750 R22.5 (D)
Front Left Side; Firenza 7 mm Rear Left Side: Firenza 7/7 mm
Front Right Side: Firenza 7 mm Rear Right Side: Firenza 7/7 mm
The sbove valles represent the rmaiiing hyre eads depth
COST OF CLAIMS . Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %,
Parts 0.00 0.00 0.00
Miscellanecus ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.323.00 g78.00 347.00 26.23
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Natt Amount [S§) 1,323.00 a76.00 347.00 26.23
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x $$250.00/day) (S$) 500.00
(58) 1.476.00
Liable Amount (50.00%) (S§) 738.00
+ DociSearch Fee (S5) 7.00
Nett Liability (5§) T45.00
INSPECTION
Date ol Assignment; 2B/05/2019
Date Inspected: 28/05/2019 Inspacted At SMRT Automotive Services Pte Lid
{(Woedlands)
60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4
Singapora 757705
Estimated Period of Repair: 1.0 days
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/8/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: ONG HWEE JIE Manager: Asher Sng Rong i

NOTE: This raport represents our findings at the ime ang place of inEpechion saied harsn, Swch inEpection has bewn carmad ouf o the besf of aur
knewledge and abillty but any other Kty under any other circumstances is hersby axpressly axciuded

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/8/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 0f 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Thote aro no now parts solocied.
[ Report was unsubmilted during this print-out. |

hitps:/singapore.merimen,com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/8/2019



Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are ne new miscellsnsous itema salecied.
Recommended Labour
No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REPAIR RH PORTION New 785.00 530.00
2 PROVIDE LABOUR AND MATERIAL TO PUTTY AND RESPRAY  Mew 528.00 448.00
ABOVE REPAIR ITEMS
Gross Labour Cost (S5) 1,323.00 976.00
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out |
< END OF ESTIMATES >
https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 14/8/2019



