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51 UBTAVE 1, #0125 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: D19003259MFSH Date: 30/5/2019
Our Ref: CS/FCI19009498/K1id3

The Motor Claims Department
First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO____SHD 5747E

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
29/05/2019 at the premises of M/s Trans-cab have the following to report: -

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8% 28.524.36
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 4.786.90
“Check” Items Amount : 5% 1.281.30
Market Value 1 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value : S§
Nett Value : 8%

Description of Damage: rear

[he vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.

Yours faithfully
Kenneth
Automotive Assessor



MS @FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited (oReg ho 1950001080 GST Beg ho. MZ-0001676-49
B Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D48580
Tel: (B5) 6222 2311 Fax (B5) 6222 3547
(aims & HMoter Underwriting bept: 36 Robinzon Road #16-01 Gty House Singapore 06BATTY

Tel (B5) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 3849
‘wiwiii, mafirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
27-05-2019 Our Ref No. D19003481MFSH
23-05-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHE400Y Third Party Vehicle. SHDS747E

NO. 2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63
KEK ZHEWEI

62876666/ 0 Fax No. 62571330

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

TRANS-CAE AUTO
SERVICES PTE LTD

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

MAY CHUA,

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repart via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,




Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 2:26 PM

To: Admin-D (LEKAuto); 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments
Cc: 'May Chua Hui Chin'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003481MFSH/1
Attachments: PREL! ADVISED SHD 5747E. pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHD 5747E

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{208933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 29 May 2019 12:38 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: "May Chua Hui Chin' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.comz=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003481MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 29 May 2019 12:24 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LEKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua Hui Chin
<maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg=>

Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003481MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Denise Ta: (LKKAuto)

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 19 August 2019 10:55 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SHD5747E TP FIRST CAPITAL DOA: 23/5/2019 -- AAD1905-215
Hi Denise

Amount confirmed $ 4,786.90 (before GST).

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*+# please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111

Main Line: (45) 6287 &646 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7764
/'""'Cﬂg g

Website: www . franscab.com.sg

his message s confidential, It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If
you have re by mist 1kr— please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message
disclose its contants to anyone. Please send IIE- oy fax any message -Z.-;Intmf‘ll:‘ll.‘l -’It"a_. 12s as incoming e-mails are nol screened

r response deadlines, The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet,

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 15 August, 2019 8:45 AM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SHDS747E TP FIRST CAPITAL DOA: 23/5/2019 -- AAD1905-215

Dear Wai Yin,

I've double check with Kenneth, he says is parts discount 25% not 10%.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: £256-3561 | email: sur@|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 14 August 2019 1:53 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyvin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SHD5747E TP FIRST CAPITAL DOA: 23/5/2019 -- AAD1S05-215

Dear Wai Yin,



Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Mg Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 1:45 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SHD5747E TP FIRST CAPITAL DOA: 23/5/2019 -- AAD1905-215
Hi Denise

Our COR amount $5,307.20 (b4 GST).
will send you photo after | get it from our workshop.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*%£¥ plagse be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63, Singapore 569111
/...—..C“ Main Line: [65) 6287 66646 Fax Line: (45) 4287 7764

Website: www franscab.com.sg
This message is confidential, It may also be privileged or © stherwise protectad by work product fmmunity or other legal rules. IF
'r-..-LI have received it by mistake, pleass let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message

disclose its contents to anyone, Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened

'uu response L'_-:*.'-..':.--_'zs_ The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay @lkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 17 June, 2019 2:33 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: SHD5747E TP FIRST CAPITAL DOA: 23/5/2019

Dear Wai Yin,

Is repair done? can finalize?

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com

[x]




Denise Tax (LKKAuto)

From: Mg Wai Yin =waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 14 August 2019 1:16 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SHDS747E TP FIRST CAPITAL DOA: 23/5/2019 -- AAD1905-215
Attachments: SHD5747E 23.05.2019 - FCILpdf

Hi Denise

Please see the below working calculation,

SHDS74ATE - DOA 23.05.1%
PART 458.60
318.80
14.70
552.60
112.70
1,547.27
232.00
232.00

RRE TR TR T I T R P P R P

W

3,468.67
346.87
3.121.80

[
S
A R

S.MNETT 250.00
22.00
40.00

100,00
30.00
47.00
52.90
53.50
30.00

30.00

AT IR TR R TR T R T T T T O

we

655.40

800.00
500.00
50.00
60.00
120.00

LABOUR

LT T T A T T

515000
5 5.307.20
Thank You

Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owmier 1D Type:

Owner 1D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No,:

Vehicle to be Exported;
Intended Dereglstration Date
Wehicle Makes:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis No,

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Criginal Registration Date:
First Reglstration Date:
Transfer Count!

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

FARF Eligibility Expiry Date;
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years)

POP Paid:

CCE Rebate Amount;

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

BADCITME Dakzba Emmiiine

Company

JBTEK

SHDS747E

¥ies

24 May 2019

TOYOTA

PRIUS 5DR HATCHBACK (AUTO)
Red

2018

2IRIBYRT 1S
JTDKB3FUTOI079230
F00 kW (120 bhp)
$26.605.00

17 Jan 201%

17 Jan 2019

o

$14,247.00

Yes
16 Jan 2027
510,685.00

14 Jan 2027

A - Carupto 1600cc & #7kW (130bhp)
B

$20,838.00

$16,670.00

$27,355.00

Please note that the B-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed, The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earljer,

The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 24 May 20192

OK

PIERIS 00 w0, them gt gL 1 L1 b 1 LI 1 AT AL LA S G AL £ ) W | P LA D )
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Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No. : 6287 6666  Fax No. : 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 2010196266

SHD 5747E

[ e« B R T o B O

e e A A i wiy WL |
- oW w2 O

LRSI U U U U T T T R
m ~ U R WM O W o

T TR T T I T s " (it . N ' . (S ' (. [ S (e (S [ Y R [ e

Vehicle No.:
Chassis No.:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Date of Accident ;
Third Party Insurer :
Date of Registration :
PART

REAR BUMPER

REAR BUMPER RE-INFORCEMENT

REAR BUMPER TOWING COVER

REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER (BLACK)
REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH

REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH

REAR TAILGATE

REAR TAILGATE OUTER GAEMISH

COVER, REAR COMBINATION LAMP, RH
COVER, REAR COMBINATION LAMP, RH
GARNISH, BACK DOOR SIDE, LH

GARNISH, BACK DOOR SIDE, RH

BOARD ASSY, BACK DOOR TRIM

PANEL ASSY, BACK DOOR TRIM, UPPER
REAR TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP

REAR END PAMNEL

TAILLAMP LOWER RH

TAILLAMP UPPER EH

REAR BUMPER SIDE RH

REAR BUMPER SIDE LH

TAILLAMP LOWER LH

TAILLAMP UPPER LH

PAN, REAR FLOOR

EXTENSION, REAR FLOOR SIDE PANEL, RH
EXTENSION, REAR FLOOR PAN TO QUARTER PANEL, LH
EXTENSION, REAR FLOOR SIDE PANEL, LH
EXTENSION, REAR FLOCR PAN TO QUARTER PANEL, RH
PANEL, QUARTER WHEEL HOUSE, OUTER LH

AAD1905-215

/%fu% 6’%{7 ‘?;.,;7‘

SHD 5747E
JTDKB3FU703079230
TOYOTA
PRIUS
23.5.2019
FCIL
17/1/2019
LIST

/e

L 45860 —
31880 —
P17 1470 —
552.60

S, 11270 X
2/ 11270 —

% 154727 —
/1 g9p5.10 A
S\ 5470

/'~ 5470

S 9360

‘4 9360

“ 25440

fo 5120

365.20

/T §02.10 7

Y. 54840 ¥

557.90 A

MYy 23200
Wh oy 23200 —

SNL 54840 7
S¥& 55790 7
M 57210 X

A 7700 ¥

T 19290 ¥

T 77.00 £

2T 19290 £

7T 29050 K

s 8 259 B9 9% % B9 65 5 B9 B9 bR B0 B 5 05 bR bR W% B W9 B BT 95 BB R BB o5
j‘:ﬂ-



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

Mo, 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111

Tel No. : 6287 6666 Fax No.: 8257 1330

CO./G5T Reg. Mo. 2010196266
SHD 5747E

29
30

1 REAR FENDER LH
1 REAR FENDER RH

Specical Nett

1 1SET PARKING AID
2 1SET REAR BUMPER CLIP

3

- O W 0~ o b

A et

2

_— md =t =3 —% & ik

REAR WINDSCREEN SELANT

WINDSCREEN MOULDING

REAR WINDSCREEN INNER SPONGE SEAL
REAR TAILGATE TOYOTA LOGO

REAR TAILGATE WORDING "PRIUS’

REAR TAILGATE WORDING "HYBRID"

REAR TAILGATE STICKER 'TRANS-CAB'
REAR TAILGATE STICKER '6555-3333
REAR BUMPER PROTECTOR

LABOUR

To Rust-Proofing Of The Affected Areas.

To reinstall rear bumper parking sensor.

25%

TOTAL

TOTAL PARTS

Putty And Spray Painting Of The Affected Portion.

Panel Beating, Knocking And Straightening The Necessary
Portion, Remaove And Renewal Of Parts, Adjust And
Realign The Same

AAD1905-215
§ /7 81750 ¥
$ /1 g1750 X
$ 11,305.97
$ 2,826.49
$ 8,479.48
$ Het 30000 25cp—
$ Aev 2200 —
$ T, 8000 Posa_—
$ 7% 10000 2—
$ “le, 100.00 FesSr—
$ M 4700 —
$ Aee 5290 —
$ M. 5350 —
$ e, 8000 Fesm—
$ Aey 8000 Tosin—
$ “V~ 100,00 X
$ 1,415.40
g 9,894.88
$ 4,200.00 fg;ﬁ.(
$ 4,20000 Sesy
$ Aas 17000 X
4 170.00 .ﬁ:?/



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No. : 6287 6666 Fax No.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHD 5747E

To transfer of Tailgate fittings, attachments and perform
water seepage test.

To transfer of Rear Bumper fittings, attachments and
perform water seepage test.

To repair and realign rear exhaust pipe.

To drop rear exhaust box, renew the same, to repair and
realign centre exhaust pipe.

To transfer of rear end panel fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test.

To transfer of rear windscreen fittings and conduct water
seepage test.

To check steering geometry and computer wheel
alignment

To transfer of Rear fender fittings, attachments and
perform water seepage test.

TOTAL

Over All Total

(PART-BY-PART) Repair Days

AAD1905-215

17000 &=/

AV 17000 X

A, 17000 X

An. 17000 X

AL 17000 X
17000 /Zef

A 2op00 X

a0 17000 X

10,150.00

28;524:36

3004 B8
_20-DAYS

Con,



’ VV LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

‘;_‘—‘.1.._'_; 51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 198607 198R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref : CS/FCIE009498/Kid3n2
iﬁaﬁsgfﬁ? EETL?SAE[;‘;INGAPDRE 068877 o e ”II'IIMH”II“"“I
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SH 6400Y Veh. Inspected SHD 5747E
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19003481MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MAY CHLUA Assign Date 20/05/2019
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAPRIUS (A) c.c 1798
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. JTDKB3FUT03079230 Colour METALLIC WHITE / RED
Odometer 26841 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 YOKOHAMA, 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [195/85 R15 YOKOHAMA, 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/65 R15 YOKOHAMA 8 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/05/2019 Inspection Date 29/05/2019
Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTELTD
NO.2 ANG MO KIO ST 63
SINGAPORE 569111
Ba. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

1EST1M#&TED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 5T47E
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR BUMPER BUCKLED 458.80 458.80
1|REAR BUMPER RE-INFORCEMENT BENT 318.80 318.80
1|REAR BUMPER TOWING COVER MISSING 14.70 14.70
1|REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER (BLACK) BENT 552.60 552 60
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH SERVICEABLE 112.70 -
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER RH DISTORTED 112.70 M2.70
1|REAR TAILGATE BENT 1,547.27 1,547.27
1|REAR TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH TO REPAIR SEE 805.10 -
LABOUR
1|COVER,REAR COMBIMATION LAMP RH SERVICEABLE 54.70 -
1|COVER,REAR COMBINATION LAMP,RH SERVICEABLE 54.70 -
1|GARNISH,BACK DOOR SIDE.LH SERVICEABLE 83.80 -
1|GARNISH BACK DOOR SIDE.RH SERVICEABLE 93.60 -
1|BOARD ASSY BACK DOOR TRIM SERVICEABLE 254.40 2
1|PANEL ASSY BACK DOOR TRIM,UPPER SERVICEABLE 51.20 -
1|REAR TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP SERVICEABLE 365.20 =
1|REAR END PAMNEL TO REPAIR SEE 602.10 -
LABOUR
1| TAILLAMP LOWER RH SERVICEABLE 548.40 -
1|TAILLAMP UPPER RH SERVICEABLE 557.80 =
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE RH MTG CRACKED 232.00 232.00
1|REAR BUMPER SIDE LH MTG CRACKED 232.00 232.00
1| TAILLAMP LOWER LH SERVICEABLE 548.40 =
1| TAILLAMP UPPER LH SERVICEAEBLE 5587.90 -
1|PAN,REAR FLOOR TO REPAIR SEE 57210 -
LABOUR
1|EXTENSION,REAR FLOOR SIDE PANEL,RH TO REPAIR SEE 77.00 -
LABOUR
1|EXTENSION,REAR FLOOR PAN TO QUARTER PANEL.LH |TO REPAIR SEE 192.90 -
LABOUR
1|EXTENSION REAR FLOOR SIDE PANEL.LH TO REPAIR SEE 7r.00 -
LABOUR

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18009498/Ktd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: B256 3581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo.:2 of 3
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition :
Qty o Workshop (8)|  (5)
1|EXTENSION, REAR FLOOR PAN TO QUARTER PANEL,RH |TO REPAIR SEE 182.80 -
LABOUR
1|PANEL.QUARTER WHEEL HOUSE,OUTER LH TO REPAIR SEE 290.50 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER LH TO REPAIR SEE 817.50 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FENDER RH TO REPAIR SEE 817.50 -
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -2,826.48 -B67.17
B.479.48 2.601.50
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET PARKING AID (SN) DENTED 700.00 250,00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIF (SN) MECESSARY 22.00 22.00
Z2|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) MECESSARY 80.00 40,00
1|WINDSCREEMN MOULDING (SM) MECESSARY 100.00 100,00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN INMNER SPOMNGE SEAL (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 30.00
1|REAR TAILGATE TOYOTA LOGO (SN) MECESSARY 47.00 47.00
1|REAR TAILGATE WORDING "PRIUS" (SN} MECESSARY 52.90 52.90
1|REAR TAILGATE WORDING "HYBRID® (SN) MECESSARY 53.50 53.50
1|REAR TAILGATE STICKER "TRAMNS-CAB" (SM) MECESSARY B80.00 30.00
1|REAR TAILGATE STICKER "6555-3333" (SN) MECESSARY B80.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER PROTECTOR (SN) NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
1.415.40 655.40
LABOUR
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 4,200.00 800.00
PORTION.
PAMNEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE 4,200.00 500.00
NECESSARY PORTIOM REMOVE AMD REMEWAL OF
PARTS ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.INCLUSIVE OF
THE REPAIR OF REAR TAILGATE OUTER GARNISH,REAR
END PANEL.PAMN.REAR FLOOR, EXTENSION.REAR
FLOOR SIDE PANEL RH,EXTENSION REAR FLOOR PAN
TO QUARTER PAMNEL,LH,EXTENSION REAR FLOOR SIDE
PANEL.LH.EXTENSION.,REAR FLOOR PAN TO QUARTER
PANEL RH,PANEL QUARTER WHEEL HOUSE,QUTER
LH,REAR FENDER LH AND REAR FENDER RH.
TC RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS. MOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
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Gty Description of Parts Condition ; :
Workshop ($)) ($)
TO REINSTALL REAR EUMPER PARKING SENSOR. 170.00 50.00
TO TRANSFER OF TAILGATE FITTINGS ATTACHMENTS 170.00 60.00
AND PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO TRANSFER OF REAR BUMPER NOT NECESSARY 170.00
FITTINGS ATTACHMENTS AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO REPAIR AND REALIGN REAR EXHAUST PIPE. MNOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
TO DROP REAR EXHAUST BOX RENEW THE SAME, TO NOT NECESSARY 170.00
REPAIR AMD REALIGN CENTRE EXHALUST FIPE.
TO TRANSFER OF REAR END PANEL NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO TRANSFER OF REAR WINDSCREEN FITTINGS AND 170.00 120.00
COMDUCT WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER NOT NECESSARY 220.00 -
WHEEL ALIGNMENT,
TO TRAMSFER OF REAR FENDER NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENTS AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
10,150.00 1.530.00
GRAND TOTAL 20,044.88 4, 786.90
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 4,786.90
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KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser
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