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Nivitha !LKK Autn!

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 12:21 PM

To: assignments

Ca Kevin Leong Wai Kit

Subject: Re: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKP&401Y & SFE2221T ON 03/04/2019

***LKK REF:.CC3/AIG19006168/)b3

Dear Sirs

Please arrange survey on 21 May 2019.

Owner leaving car in for survey + repaipby 10am.

Thank you.

Regards,

Caroline

Clo Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 158941

DID, 6312 0174 Fax: 6478 4601

From: PBSP
Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 11:01:13 AM

To: Kevin Leong Wal Kit

Subject: Fw: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKP6401Y & SFE2221T ON 03/04/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC3/AIG19006168/]b3

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <loylrene @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 May 2019 11:00 AM

To: PBSP: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Cc: MIB ©; CSA Team

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT - SKPG401Y & SFE2221T ON 03/04/2019 ***LKK
REF:CC3/AIG19006168/|b3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Caroling,

We refer to the subject.
Please be informed that solely basing on the accident statements submitted by parties involved, the
liability is clear.

Kindly note on the following:

1) The final repair cost is subject to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the
accident and approval of our principal insurer;



YLl

g R = P Lot

21 UNL AVE 1, #01-22 PAYA UNEINDUSTRIAL PARK. EIEM'H_IF. 40EYEY TEL ; (31 _usam_ m&ml (3L LIE]
Your Ref: D19003448MFSH Date: 30 May 2019

Our Ref: CS/FC119009

The Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SKA 8204R .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 28/05/2019 at the premises of M/s FALCON-AIR AUTO. and have the following to
report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 88§ 707680 .
Revised Estimate Amount 'S8 6.098.24
“Check” Items Amount ' S§ 388.56 .
Market Value : 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value 188§ -

Nett Value ' 8% -

Description of Damage:
e vehi ined damages

A rea
at !!]E redr portion.

Yours faithfully

Steve
Automotive Assessor






MS@FirstCapital

B Raffies Quay #2100 Singapore DABSBO
Tel (65) 6222 2311 VPax (65 6Z22 1547

M5 First Copital Insurance Limited Coeg e 1955001000 S50 Mg he M2 OO00GT5

Claiews B Pt Unstwrwniling Dept: 5B Robimon Road #15-01 City House Sngapore 05EETT
Tul, [65) 6507 3648 Fax: (65) 6507 3845
LU e TR T
MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 27-05-2018 Our Ref No. D15003448MFSH
Accldent Date 24-05-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SH9788J Third Party Vehicle. SKAB204R
Survey Location NO.B PANDAN LOOP (BELK 1 / BLK K)
Contact Person. ANDY
Contact No. 67795665/ 0 Fax No. 67791110
Survey Type DIRECT SETTLEMENT:
Anpointed LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 68416315

Contact Number,

MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

FALCON-AIR AUTO

SERVICES PTE LTD Attention,
NA TP Solicitor Fax No.
EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

NIL

NA

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a8 computer generated letter, no signature required

o | reenancs i







Shiau Chan !I..I{I(Autn!

From: Shiau Chan (LKEKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 11:01 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'; assignments

Cc 'Eileen Lee’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003448MFSH/
Attachments: CSFCI19009489Eqd3 pdf

Dear Eileen,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SKA 8204R.

Best Regards,

Shinu Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6256-1561 | email; sipwse@ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims [malito:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.

Sent: Tuesday, 28 May, 2019 5:27 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital. com.sg>; Eileen Lee <EileenLee @msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI; SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19003448MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail, Please do not reply to this mail.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

The infarmation contained herein Is correct as at 25 May 2019

;Back to OneMotoring

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owirimy |0 Type

Crwner |0

Vehicle Details

Viehucle Mo

Vishicle to be Exportad;
Internded Deregiitration Date:
Vehicle Make

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manulacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis Moo

Ftaximum Power Output
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date
Tramfer Count

Actual ARF Pagd;

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Engibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amaint
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Explry Date

COE Category:

COE Period|Years);

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebale Amount

Simgapore NRIC
514E7

SHKAR204R

Yes

25 May 2019

HONDA,

CITY 15L I-'VTEC AUTD
Grey

2009

L15AT1B11080
MAHGMAS0FP0204%8
880 kW (116 bhp)
$16,603.00

05 Aar 2011

05 Apr2011

o

§$16.603.00

Yies
04 Apr 2021
£9,131.00

04 Apr 2021
A-Car (1600cc & below)
10

$43813.00

$8.151.00

$17.282.00






Fage i 4
_—— FALCON-AIR AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

€O. REG. NO.: 1995-01140-D
G5T REG. NO.: 19-9501140-D
Ed

FALCON.AIR
THET NAING Estimate | ES003469
3 JURONG EAST ST 32 #08-04
B084TA Date - 24/05/2018
u:nu'mi HONDA CITY-2009
Afiarsion : Motor Cleim Depariment Chassis/Eng# - MRHGM26509P020498/ 1547181108
Contact . 98735595 Accident Date - 24052019
Cisim No. -
Reference - TP NTUC VS MSFCI
Policy Mo
SN Quaniity Parficular Unit Price  Amount 55
LIST ITEMS "
.1 scotup -~ 1 i 44000/
2 9 BOOTUDLOCK - 178,00~
3 1 BooTUDLOGD -~ AlLC ; 2400 <
Py BOOTLID EMBLEM CITY .~ 4'}.( 2400 7/
g 3 BOOTLID EMBLEM WTEC — Al :um;
& 1 BOOTLID WEATHER ~ (i 8400
7. 2 TAILLAMP LHRH -~ fr 28600 57200 7
R O REARENDPANEL .~ [ 32500
et i REAR END PANEL TOP GAR ~ (ke 80.00 ~
10, 1 SPARE TYRE BOARD ~ 10800 7
"1 LH TAILLAMP PANEL .~ [ 120.00
12 1 SPARE TYRE PANEL _- m 40680 ~
13 1 SPARE TYRE PANEL s W 180,00 /
14 1 REAR BUMPER -~ 454,00 -
15 A REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LHRH ~ [T 17.00 -
16 4 REAR BUMPER SIDECLIPS ~ AE( 10.00 4000 ~
17. 1 LH REAR FENDER .- gﬂ 624 50
18 2 REAR FENDER s (kv 11800 23600 /
19 1 REAREXHAUST ( o, » A 45770 «
20 1 EXHAUST HEAT SHIELD . =« AN 2800
2. & | EXHAUST RUBBER HOLDER ~ KV 1650~ AT
2 1 REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MouLOING -~ AEC 1500 ~
List TotaiS$ - 4 608 50
20.00% Oiscount 5§ Ww . S 821 70
LXK Auto Conguliants henc: 1y o
the Regarer of the followns 3.686.80
o To resurvey beformiuler spey pe
- |
* Third pafty survey Hona™Wilhe . icn” baala ‘?f
* No fagm madfcason) 8 sk 40§49
» Suppiementery hesis) mmibe - 00 png
5 subyect 0 el appvonl o . Company - o
Acan cummaes by Rapars 7271.54
| S
| O

FALCON-AIR AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
it sibmEany of FaconsAr Holdings Pre L)

Head Ofice: | 74 Sin Ming Dirve #0106/ 771 3, K051 7 Sin Ming Autocaes Srigaipore 575721 T8l s452-0680/6A58880 Fax 44547862
Branches: Tanpines S 93 BR 9008 #0200 SISZRS40| Tet ATES-7937 Fan ATHEF997 « No B Percion Loop (Bik | 7 Bk K §) | 282260 Te ATTRE2AE Fax ATTR1110
Websites: vy Daeorss gonm A E-mall i@t onas oo sy
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. Fage 212
’ . = : FALCON-AIR AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
CO. REG. NO,: 1995-01140-D
G5T REG. NO.: 19-9501140-D

FALCON.AIR

THET NAING Estimate ES003469

3 JURONG EAST ST 32 #08-04

609478 Date : 24052018

Vehicle Num - SKAB204R
MakeModel - HONDA.CITY-2009
Alierion:: Molor Gism Depertment " Chassis/Eng¥ - MRHGM28500P020408/L 15A7181108
Contact 98735595 Accident Date - 240052018
Claim No.
Reference - TP NTUC VS MSFCI
Palicy No.

SN Cuantity Particular UnitFrice  Amount 5%
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

T | REVERSEseNsorR ~ B K 20000 7,

2 1 SEALANT - )¢ 4000 /
Special Neft Total S$ 24000 /
LABOUR v
TO REMOVE/REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR & CHECK WIRING 80.00 -’; 1
TO TRANSFER BOOTLID PARTSMECHANISMS 00 ~5¥ "
TO RUST PROOF ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS 15000 70 -
SPRAY PAINTING FRONT & REAR ACCIDENT DAMAGED AREAS 1,300.00 ~ 1900
TO REMOVE/REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS 12000, 60 -
TO REMOVE/REFIX CUSHION SEAT CARPET GARNISH WIRING 150.00_ g0 ¥

TO CUT OUT/REWELD REAR END PANEL A SPARE TYRE PANEL
LH TAILLAMP PANEL, REPAIR REAR FLOOR BOARD REAR

CHASSIS RHREAR FENDER INCLUDES KNOCKING 120000 K9q -
& REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
TO REMOVE/REPLACE EXHAUST, HEAT SHIELD & HOLDERS 100.00 %ﬂ:’ _
Labour Total SS 3.150.00
r M
;7? 14 d
E &0E ! “ otal SS 7|:msau

Shwe CLKx) Vv faple ¢Sl 17 o
g006i & 4

(- 3. ’;' " (e ki @ Kkt com L[S
g?n IY
/s - 4569 ¢

|8 SuEECny of FacortAr Holongs P L)
Hend OMice: 176 Sin Mg Driee #01-06/0771 1 #0517 Sir Ming Autocaee Sngapone 575721 T &452-0880V6ASB-0880 Fau iA54-THAZ
Branches: Tampines 5653 Bik 9006 #01-200 5/528840] Tet ATER-TF?T Fas 4TEE-TI9T » No 8 Pandan Loop Bk | 7 Bik K51 28224) T 679956465 Fac 62790110
Whebaltes: o bicomms com oF E-mail: eruilBtscones com o

T BERWEES P
for FALCON AIR AUTE SERVSL LTD
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Page1/2

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Estimate - ES003469
36 ROBINSON ROAD #16-01 CITY HOUSE
SINGAPORE D6887T Date - 24/06/2019
Vehicle Num. - snémgﬁugliw -
PRI MakeModel ; HON g
Altantion : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# - MRHGM26509P020498/L15AT18110
Contacl : 62222311 Fax No. . 65073848 Accident Data : 24/06/2016
Claim No. :
Reference : TP NTUC VS MSFCI
Palicy No. :
SN  Quantity Particular Unil Price. Amount 5§
LIST ITEMS :
1 1 BOQTLID 440,00
2 1 BOOTLID LOCK 178.00
3 1 BOOTLID LOGO 24,00
4 1 BOQTLID EMBLEM CITY 24.00
5 1 BOOTLID EMBLEM IVTEC 24,00
g 1 BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP 04.00
7. 2 TAILLAMP LH/RH 286,00 572.00
g 1 REAR END PANEL 325,00
a1 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH 80,00
0. 1 SPARE TYRE BOARD 108.00
"1 LH TAILLAMP PANEL 120.00
12. 1 SPARE TYRE PANEL 406.80
13. 1 SPARE TYRE PANEL BRACKET 180.00
14 1 REAR BUMPER 464.00
15 1 REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH/RH 17.00
16 4 REAR BUMPER SIDE CLIPS 10.00 40.00
17. 1 LH REAR FENDER 624 50
18 2 REAR FENDER TRIMBOARD 118.00 236,00
18
20.
21, ¢) EXHAUST RUBBER HOLDER 50
22. REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING 115.00
List TotalS$ : 4,080.80
20.00% Discount 58 : 817.96
3.271.84

CONTINUE /...






MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD
36 ROBINSON ROAD #16-01 CITY HOUSE
SINGARORE 06GE8877

Attention : Motor Claim Department
Cantact : 62222311 Fax No. ; 65073648

Estimate | ES0034569
Date ; 241052018

Wehicle Num, : SKAB204R
Make/Modal : HONDA CITY-2008

Chassis/Eng#

Accident Dale : 24052019

Page2/2

: MRHGM26508P020408/L15AT18110

Claim No_:
Referance : TP NTUC V5 MSFCI
Palicy Na. :
SN Quartity Particular Unit Price  Amount 5%
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS :
1. 1 REVERSE SENSOR 200.00
2 1 SEALANT 40.00
Special Nell Total 5§ 24000
LABOUR -
TO REMOVE/REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR & CHECK WIRING 2000
TO TRANSFER BOOTLID PARTSMECHANISMS 30.00
TO RUST PROOF ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS 30.00
SPRAY PAINTING FRONT & REAR ACCIDENT DAMAGED AREAS 1.,000.00
TO REMOVE/REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS 50.00
TO REMOVEMREFIX CUSHION SEAT.CARPET GARNISH WIRING 80.00
TO CUT OUT/ REWELD REAR END PANEL , SPARE TYRE PANEL
LH TAILLAMP PANEL, REPAIR REAR FLOOR BOARD REAR
CHASSIS RHREAR FENDER INCLUDES KNOCKING 950.00
& REFPLACEMENT OF PARTS
TO REALIGN EXHAUST 40.00
Labour Total 5% 220000
E &0E Total S5 : 5711.64
Lrg less-o0% — _LI42720
for FALCON AIR AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD 4;5{:‘2 : 9:'

Ys 455000

|| DAYS






LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl indusinal Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: B255 3561 FAX: B258 4315

Reg Mo: 166807168R GST Reg. Mo, 19-0807188-R

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSUHANCE LTi'J Ref CSIFCI‘-EDUBIIBEFEqu
oomeontor® noneossr o weows [N
Code: FCI2
Insured Veh. 5H 9788J ’«flh. lnlpucbd SKA B204R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1900344BMFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 2810572018
Make & Model HONDACITY c.c 1487
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 201
Chassis No. MRHGM26508P020458 Colour GREY
Odometer 161811 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
T [
Siza
R/H Front Tyre [175/65R15 DUNLOP 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |175/85 R15 DUNLOP 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |175/85R15 DUNLOP & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |175/65R15 DUNLOP & mm
45 L e
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAIM.GES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
SIS e ) Sl R |
Accident Date  24/05/2019
Survey held at FALCON-AIR AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD
BLK 8 PANDAN LOOP
5a. A |1 A
mmm&s mHsISTEHrm ACCIDENT REPORT
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
c}m AEGORDANCE TO YOUR tHSTRU:ﬂDHs WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKA B204R
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BOOTLID

BOQTLID LOCK

BOOTLID LOGD

BOOTLID EMBLEM CITY

BOOTLID EMBLEM IWTEC

BOOTLID WEATHERSTRIP

TAILLAMP LH/RH @5285 00

REAR END PANEL

REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH
SPARE TYRE BOARD

LH TAILLAMP PANEL

SPARE TYRE PANEL

SPARE TYHRE PANEL BRACKET
REAR BUMPER

REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH/RH
REAR BUMPER SIDE CLIPS @$10.00
LH REAR FENDER

REAR FENDER TRIMBOARD @$118.00
REAR EXHALST

EXHAUST HEAT SHIELD

EXHAUST RUBBER HOLDER @%16.50

REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING
LESS 20% DISCOUNT

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

REVERSE SENSOR (SN)
SEALANT (SN)

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408033

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: B258 4315

DENTED
BENT
NECESSARY
NECESSARY
NECESSARY
CRUMPLED
BROKEN
DENTED
CRUMPLED
BROKEN
DENTED
DENTED
DENTED
DENTED
BROKEN
NECESSARY
DENTED
CRUMPLED

NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
CRUMPLED (1 PC

ONLY)
NECESSARY

BROKEN
NECESSARY

Report Ref No. CS/FC119009488/Eqd3n2

440.00 44000
1789.00 179.00
2400 2400
2400 24,00
34.00 34 00
84.00 B4.00
572.00 572.00
32500 32500
80.00 80.00
108.00 108 00
120,00 120.00
40B.80 408.80
180.00 180.00
46400 AB4 00
17.00 17.00
40,00 40.00
624,50 624 50
236.00 236.00
457.70 .
28.00 .
4850 16.50
115.00 115.00
-821.70 817 68
3,686.80 3.271.84
200.00 200.00
40.00 40.00
240,00 24000
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TO REMOVE/REPLACE REVERSE SENSOR & CHECK 80.00 20.00
WIRING.

TO TRANSFER BOOTLID PARTS/MECHANISMS. 50.00 30.00
TO RUST PROOF ON ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS. 150.00 30.00
SPRAY PAINTING FRONT & REAR ACCIDENT DAMAGED 1,300.00 1.000.00
TO REMOVE/REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS, 120.00 50,00
TO REMOVE/REFIX CUSHION 150.00 B80.00
SEAT CARPET GARNISH WIRING

TO CUT OFF/REWELD REAR END PANEL SPARE TYRE 1,200.00 950,00

PANEL LH TAILLAMP PANEL REPAIR REAR FLOOR
BOARD REAR CHASSIS RH REAR FENDER INCLUDES
KNDCKING & REPLACEMENT OF PARTS.

TO REMOVE/REPLACE EXHALST HEAT SHIELD & 100.00 40.00
HOLDERS.

3,150.00 2,200.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,076.80 5,711.84

Rapur'l RH{ No. CSJ'FBHBEU’HBEJ’EQHW
MARKET VALUE: §24,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $17,282.00=NETT VALUE: §6,718.00
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CHEN TSUE YEE ADRIAN LING WAI PING
Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser

DASCLAIMER OF LIABEITY TO THISD PARTIES:: This Mopart is mads sslely for the Wes and Denel of the Clsst named on the from pege of this Repart







