Khanchna (LKK Auto)

#

Subject: FW: GBE9495X & SGQ833R DOA 16.05.2019 *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG19009469/AKB3

Attachments: SD.pdf

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 11 June, 2020 1:20 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Diana (LKK Auto) <diana@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: GBE9495X & SGQ833R DOA 16.05.2019

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Enclosed is the invoice , GIA ,LOA .
Please advise OIC.

As request following :

1. RC S 2900- AS AGREED )

2. loss of USE $360 ($60 X 6 DAYS ) 4 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS +1DAY weekend - TOTAL 6
DAYS

@ 100% ( direct from behind )

Total S 3260/-.

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks



_ Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

HO BENG TRADING

Hp:92712214

From: chan pick yuen <chris chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, May 28, 2019 11:20 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: GBE9495X & SGQO833R DOA 16.05.2019

Dear Mei Kwan ,
Your refer : SGQ833R ( AlG )

Enclosed is our client's GIA report & estimate .
Please advise OIC, claim number & liability .
Please pass estimate to Mr Adrian . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
HO BENG TRADING
HP: 92712214

Virus-free. www.avg.com



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 9:06 AM

To: THECURRANSHOME@GMAIL.COM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGQ833R [AIG] & GBES495X ALONG TUAS WEST ROAD

HEADING INTO JUNCTION WITH JALAN AH ON 16/05/2019

Our Ref: CC6/AIG19009469/Akb3
Your Ref: SGQ833R

Dear Mr. Curran Philip James,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGQ833R [AIG] & GBE9495X ALONG TUAS WEST ROAD HEADING INTO JUNCTION WITH JALAN
AH ON 16/05/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from GBE9495X against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. Should you however wish to further
discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this e-
mail.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be
deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@|kkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)




LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

HO BENG TRADING
BLOCK 3020A UBI

1 #0133
SINGAPORE 408714

Diear Sir, - ’ | A
it K . Llx] 1 @ [RAhvo
Involving Vehicle Nos GBE9495X and SGQ833R

Amn#m Tuas wWest Road plonoy o PVE

d fn 2 i
| /We the registered owner /driver of vehicle registration not__ w‘ jg‘:{ "ﬂ; _ff"j? X’ ,>( s
have involved in the above accident. )
/We hereby authorize M/S HO BENG TRADING 10 Comumence repairs of the said vehicle
forthwith. _

1/We agree to assign the whole proceeds of my/our con "orehensive/third party claim to you and our

solicitors ‘ wwmmyfwwﬁmmaﬁwm

matter. And if applicable,my/our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irrevocable authority to pay
sount as deemed compensated direct to you afiet deduction of thielt coets ona Soficitor and

client basis.

m.mmwmmmmww forms and all necessary papers in
memmiﬁmyfomw‘

Your kind co-operation in this matter will be much appreciated.

Yours truly.

megf‘wi«‘w”ww
X =

e EFord THID

Name: Rl il
e -

Date: _28/05/2019




RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“Wel HO BENG TRADING{ the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/T have reached an agreement
with the appointed survevor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS
PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount clammed for 552.900.00 (Repar Cost),
5%300.00 (Loss of Use/Rental), 55-—-(Disbursement) for vehicle no. GBES495X that was damaged
pursuant to the accident which u-cmrrﬂl on 16/05/2019 (date) along TUAS WEST ROAD(location)
mvolving vehicle no/s SGQS833

Thus 15 pursuant to the mspection conducted on 28/05/2019 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner TNL CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD (“the
thurd party claumant™) of vehicle no. GBE9495X make the claim as set out in the above pamgraph
and we/T have full authonty to seftle the matter on his/her behalf 1n a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l
enclose herein the letter of anthonty given by “the thurd party claimant™,

We/l further confirm that we/l will mdemmfy AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party ¢laimant™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to
GBE9495X (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident,

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claum of “the
thurd party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without

prepudice and without adoussion of liabality basis.
This agreement 13 subject 1o the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this 14 (dayyof __ JULY  (month)20_20

Signed h}r appnmted sUrveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)

WITHCOUT PREJUDICE 1y
(2} lvsurrence Submoated Claim snddar
L) Ay Perscad Injury Claims

[Nose: This Motice supersed s a W N OnUC B reeE
found inthis Mir hargaMeasc hay)



HO B

Block 3020A Ubi Road 1 # 01-33 Singapore 408714

INVOICE

TNL CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD Date: 11" JUNE 20
Blk 3020A #01-33

Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408714

Accident date :16™ MAY 2019 -
Final Bill For Vehicle No: GBE9485X NISSAN NV200 1.6A

KK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Lump Sum repair cost as recommended by
urveyor : Mr Adrian

S/DLRS: TWO THOUSAND NINE HUNDRED ONLY



