Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 13 June 2019 11:09 AM

To: ‘jenny chong'

Cc: ‘carmen lim'; 'serence ctc'

Subject: RE: Liability Check - Accident involving SLZ7301G & SH8965X(INDIA) on 25.05.2019
Attachments: Video - Accident (OID) (1).MP4

Your Ref: SLZ 7301G Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/11119009467/gb3
Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 8965X & SLZ 7301G ON 25/05/2019

We refer to the above matter.

Attached is a copy of our insured car video footage and accident statement for your easy reference. We
have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that our driver is not liable for the accident. Your client have
reversed his vehicle and hit onto Our Insured’s Driver vehicle.

In view of the above, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look into your client’s
matter.

Thank you.

Note: This video footage is solely for investigation and shall not be reproduced. You undertake to preserve its
confidentiality and will not disclose, provide or make available the video footage in whole orin part, fo any
third party.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=SR2 WU Spve the Larth Print only when necessary

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 11:55 AM
To: jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>



Cc: carmen lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>; serence ctc <serence@esteemperf.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Liability Check - Accident involving SLZ7301G & SH8965X(INDIA) on 25.05.2019

Your Ref: SLZ 7301G Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/11119009467/gb3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SH 8965X & SLZ 7301G ON 25/05/2019

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's
accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you heard
further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order for us to
look into the matter.

We shall revert upon hearing from you.

Thank You.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

=SR2 WU Spve the Larth Print only when necessary

From: jenny chong [mailto:jenny@esteemperf.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 7 June 2019 11:39 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: carmen lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>; serence ctc <serence@esteemperf.com.sg>

Subject: Liability Check - Accident involving SLZ7301G & SH8965X(INDIA) on 25.05.2019

Dear Cecilia , Hsiao Tong

We refer to the above matter.



Kindly let us know case liability asap.

Thank you.

Freundliche GriiBe / Best Regards

Jenny Chong
Senior Operation Executive | Operation Division
Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

P: 6484 1221
F: 6484 7829
E: jenny@esteemperf.com.sg

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259
(Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre
(Showroom)

www.esteemperformance.com

GOR




