Janet Tan

From: Janet Tan

Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2016 11:38 AM

To: ‘Gay Thuan Ewe Joseph Michael'

Subject: RE: Our ref: DM16HO01482/JT, Your ref: 211/2016/ap-acc on 12/7/16 involving

XD2064Y and SHD9388G

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir,

We have effected payment. Please await our settlement cheque which will be sent direct to your office.

Best Regards

Janet Tan

Claims Executive

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road,

#17-00 Tower Block,

MND Complex

Singapore 069110

6223 9433 (Tel)

6496 9032 (DID)

6223 4190 (Fax)

Website: www.eginsurance.com.sg

Disclaimer : Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in
this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the
sender immediately and delete all copies of it.

From: Gay Thuan Ewe Joseph Michael [mailto:joegayco@gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, November 23, 2016 11:19 AM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@egqinsurance.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Our ref: DM16H001482/IT, Your ref: 211/2016/ap-acc on 12/7/16 involving XD2064Y and SHD9388G
Dear Janet

We refer to our email sent to you on 10-11-16 at 11:15 am.
To-date we have not received payment of $2,684-21 in our favour.
Kindly let us have the said payment without further delay.
Regards

Joseph Gay & Co
Ref: 211/2016/el

On Thu, Nov 10, 2016 at 11:17 AM, Gay Thuan Ewe Joseph Michael <joegayco@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Janet



We attach hereto copy of the duly signed Warrant to Act which was omitted in our previous email.
Regards

Joseph Gay & Co
Ref: 211/2016/el

On Thu, Nov 10, 2016 at 11:15 AM, Gay Thuan Ewe Joseph Michael <joegayco@gmail.com> wrote:

Dear Janet

For quick amicable settlement, your offer as outlined in your email sent to us on 08-11-16 at 4:07 pm is
accepted on condition that payment must be made in our favour.

We attach hereto copy of the duly signed Warrant to Act for your attention.
Kindly let us have payment of $2,684-21 in our favour as soon as possible.
Regards

Joseph Gay & Co
Ref: 211/2016/el

On Tue, Nov 8, 2016 at 4:07 PM, Janet Tan <janet.tan(@eginsurance.com.sg> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir,
Please refer to the above claim.

We are prepared to offer as follow:

General damages $3,500.00
Medical expense $504.30
Transport expense $120.00
Loss of income $700.00
@20% $964.86
Medical report $80.00
LTA/GIA $34.35
Cost $1,605.00
Total $2,684.21

Please confirm acceptance.

Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed
as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in
respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to
this offer or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters.
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Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and
execution of Discharge Voucher (for settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant. Further
all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment on the settlement sum.

P.S. In the meantime please hold hand for all legal action.

Best Regards

Janet Tan

Claims Executive

EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road,

#17-00 Tower Block,

MND Complex

Singapore 069110

6223 9433 (Tel)

6496 9032 (DID)

6223 4190 (Fax)

Website: www.eginsurance.com.sg

Disclaimer : Privileged/Confidential information may be
contained in this message. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately and delete all
copies of it.



