Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Sharon <sharon@ow.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2019 5:11 PM

To: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

Cc: angela.tan@ow.sg; Lily Loi OW; puitheng.chong@ow.sg; hockkong.ong@ow.sg; Vic
(LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: TP Claims / Arrange survey - Accident involving SLK1596R & SLF2149T on
24/05/2019

Without Prejudice

Dear Jimmy,

Our client accept your offer at $3,730.46. Please send DV.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sharon Ten (Ms.)
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
DID: (+65) 6481 1522 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011

OPT/MALERHKZ ...

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 159143 Tel: (+65) 6472 1313 Fax: (+65) 6472 2112
Branch: 9A Serangoon North Ave 5 Singapore 5654500 Tel: (+65) 6484 9919 Fax: (+65) 6481 1011
Branch: 56561 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 Tel: (+65) 6452 6868 Fax: (+65) 6452 9223

www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content
immediately after which.

On 11-Jul-19 3:54 PM, Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto) wrote:

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Please ignore my previous email, already received LOD at my end.

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 3,057.46
2. Loss of Rental w/GST (6 Days x $100) $ 642.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $ 31.00
TOTAL $ 3.730.46

Please confirm acceptance.



“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not
be construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver.
The terms of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of
this accident nor should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,
Jimmy Chen| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jimmychen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 11 July 2019 1:33 PM

To: Sharon <sharon@ow.sg>

Cc: angela.tan@ow.sg; Lily Loi OW <Lily.L.oi @ow.sg>; puitheng.chong@ow.sg;
hockkong.ong@ow.sg; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@]Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TP Claims / Arrange survey - Accident involving SLK1596R & SLF2149T on
24/05/2019

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly forward the LOD and all supporting documents to us to proceed with the settlement.

Thank you.

“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not
be construed as an admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver.
The terms of our without prejudice engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of
this accident nor should it be binding in any other related claims.”

Best Regards,
Jimmy Chen| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jimmychen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sharon <sharon @ow.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 May 2019 9:40 AM

To: SG AXA Insurance SM AXA SGP - Motor Survey <motor.survey @axa.com.sg>
Cc: angela.tan@ow.sg; Lily Loi OW <Lily.Loi @ow.sg>; puitheng.chong@ow.sg;
hockkong.ong@ow.sg

Subject: TP Claims / Arrange survey - Accident involving SLK1596R & SLF2149T on
24/05/2019




Your Ref: SLF2149T

Our Ref: SLK1596R

Dear Executive,

Please arrange for survey as soon as possible.
Location: 9A Serangoon North Avenue 5
**Please avoid I1PM - 2PM

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sharon Ten (Ms.)
Claims Executive, Motor Claims Department
DID: (+65) 6481 1522 | Fax: (+65) 6481 1011

ORPT/IMAERHKZ .o

Head office: 6 Kung Chong Road Singapore 168143 Tel: (+65) 54721313 Fas: (+65) 6472 2112
Branch: 84 Serangoon Morth Ave 5 Singapore 554500 Tel: (+65) 8484 8919  Fax: («85) 6481 101
Branch: 551 Upp Thomson Road Singapore 574415 Tel: (+65) 6452 GABE Fax: (+65) 6452 9223

www.ow.sg | www.facebook.com/OptimaWerkz

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or
use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the
email and its content immediately after which.



