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FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD “:M
e s oy 21483

SINGAPORE 417883 .b,L, ,

VEHICLE NO:SMG 82840
ary PARTICULAR E
1 PCS BOOTLID A1 §1.24500
1PCS REAR BUMPER /472§ DJoe. 128830 —
1PCS REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT & 1 L6 PP STTS00 —
2PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS $68.00 A1 F136.00 W
1SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS Lo 35000 —
1PCS REAR END PANEL /L $AB260 %
1SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR OZ) Fie  $280.00p¢
$4,196.90
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TO CHECK WIRING $50.00 20
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REVER SENSOR $80.00 L
70 DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT,CUSHION UPHOLSTREY $12000 4 0
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING A4 A $60.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS $680.00 ) ¢
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING S800.00 YU
TOTAL $5086.90 |V
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Mei Kwan s!.KKAutn]

From: Lim Shu Min <shumin lim@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June, 2019 3:24 PM

To: Irene Tay; Chee So Chow; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D202427 - Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLWA418R (OI
CTI - TBA) AND SMGB8284D (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI19009358/Uea3) on 26/05/2019

Attachments: TP GIA REPORT.PDF

Categories: HMK

Dear Irene,

Please conduct PRS SMG8284D soonest possible,

File with Officer-In-Charge - Irene Tay — 63896192,

Thank you

Lim Shu Min
Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896156 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www sg cnlaipingcom | FB: www.lacebook com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X F ¥ Taiping SG

Disciaimer: This a-mai and any files transeited with it s infended oniy far the named recipients and may contain configential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, Lse or dissemination of His message. either in whole or partial, & prohibited. If you are not the intended recipienl, ploase
nolify the sender immedigialy. Please delele the e-mail and any copies of T theveaffer

From: Mel Kwan [LKKAuto) [malito:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]|

Sent: Wednesday, 19 June, 2019 7:30 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLW418R (01 : CT1 - TBA) AND SMG82840 (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/CTI19009358/Uea3) on 26/05/2019

‘WITHOUT PREIUDICE"
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle SMG 8284D at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit on a WP basis and TP
repairer proposed for a direct settlement.



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 3:27 PM
To: Jason Fastech Auto (jason@fastechauto.com.sg); 'Nancy Lam'
Subject: Accident Involving SMG 82840 & SLW 41BR on 26/05/2019
WITHOUT PREJUDICE"

SAVEAS TO COSTS

Your Ref: SMG 8284D
Our Ref: CCB/CTI19009358/Ueal

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident Involving SMG 8284D & SLW 418R on 26/05/2019
We refer to the above matter,

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under BOLA
(subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settiement for the above mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail Is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your
client's vehicle.

The final repair cost Is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the
days of LOU/ LOR will base on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor,

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 6051

In order to expedite the claim process, please forward all relevant documents to us (LKK) to proceed on negotiate
settlement.

Thank You.

Bert Regoras
Asher Sng | Cose Honder
LKK Aulo Consullanty Ple Lid

phone: ¢841-6051 | emoil: geshenng@ikkouto com | fax &741-4108
Blk 51. Paya Ubl Indusirial Pork, Ukl Avenue | #02.25 | 51408933)



CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

MAZDA AUTO PROTECTOR PRIVATE VEHICLE

Name of Policyholder  : Lo Chee Yen (Luo Zhiyuan) Vahicle No SMG82840
Period of Insurance + 31 Dec 2018 To 30 Dec 2020 Policy No. 190001
Engine No. + PE212400989 Endorsement No

Chassis No.  JMBGL10T2K0311159 Issued Date 23 Jan 2018

ABOUT THE COVER

Maka/Modal MAZDA 6 2.0 SKYACTIV

Engine Capacity/Tonnage : 1,888.00 CC Sum Insured @ Markal Value First Year of Registration  :© 201
Diriver Resiriction MA Off Peak Car : No Insuring with COEPARI Yes

Person or Classes of Persons Entitled to Drive®

Loe Condition All Age Condition
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owreer Dy 03158
Vehicle Detalls
Vehicle No.: sMGHEZR4D
Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended Deregistration Date: 28 May 2019
Wehicle Make MAZDA
Wehicle Model: MAZDAS SEDAN 20 AT STANDARD 2WD
Primary Colour: Grey
Manutacturing Year: 2018
Engine N PE21249989
Chassis No. IMAGLIOT2KO31115%
M aximum Power Output: 121.0 kW (162 bhp)
Open Market Value: £18,617.00
Original Reglstration Date: 31 Dec 2018
First Registration Date: 31 Dec 2018
Transter Count: 1]
Actual ARF Paid- $18.617.00
Intended PARF Rebate Detalls
PARF Eligibility; Yes
FARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 30 Dec 2028
PARF Rebate Amount: £13956200
Intended COE Rebate Detalls
COE Expiry Date: 30 Dwec 2028
COE Category: E - Open - all except motorcycle
COE PeriodYears): 10
QP Paid; $32,900.00
COE Rebate Amount: $25.041.00
Total Rebate Amount: $39,002.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 May 2019

OK
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FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67465405 / 67465376  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date: 0B.082019

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Lid
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleal” Tower

Singapore 079909

Attn: Motor Claim Department

Dear SirMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES :  SMG 8284D / SLW 418R ON 26.05.2019

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no: ~ SMG 8284D , which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicleno:  SLW 418R The vehicle owner has requested and
authorized us to assist him in presenting his'her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1} Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) 5 2,320.10

2) Loss of Use (3 days X 55100) 5 300.00

3) GIA Search Fee $ 2.00
S 2,622.10

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice b) GIA Search Resull

¢) Letter of Authorisation, etc.., d) GIA Report

¢) /C & Driving Licence 1} Insurance Certificate

¢) Vehicle Registration Log Card

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlerment of our customer's claims
a5 soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully,

Jason Tang (jasonia) hauto.com.sg)
For Fastech Auto Pre Lid



Asher Sna sLKKAulu!

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 6 August 2019 3:24 PM

To: AZUHARUE3I@HOTMAILCOM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLW 418R AND SMG B2B4D ON 26/05/2019

Our Ref: CC6/CTII9009358/Ueal

06 AUG 2019

MUHAMMAD AZHAR BIN MAT' ODI

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLW 418R AND SMG 8284D ON 26/05/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pie Lid to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler

DI1D: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng @lkkauto.com

[ China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)
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RE :  ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLENO. VG R840 / iy $ig R

ALONG 1B (ushom
oN_ 1 05.2019

I/'We, \D_ChFE \in

of (NRIC No./ROC No.) 3 3303158

of Bk 54 Wosdlands Jiive 16 % 05-)  Sinmpore 13899

owner of vehicle no. MG $18ND in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO

PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle _ i §13Y ) at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settle receive whatever
mmgﬂﬂwmhbyﬁclmmcmmﬁmmhdmmmmm
mﬂw,mmmqhmwofmmmwuhmdm
etc. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

I/We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the abovementioned claim cost

Signature of Owner :
Name of Owner : ‘LC i\'\ﬂ. \{W
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MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

Pelicy Mo : DMPCEN3IDO0BOT1901 Claim Ho @ SNM19D202427
Claimant : LO CHEE YEN (LOU ZHIYUAN)
Amount : S582,822.10
DOLLARS TWO THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED TWENTY TWO AND CENTS TEN
ONLY .

I/We agrea to accept the above mentioned amount to be pald to mefus In full &
final settlement of all claims, costs £ disbursementa for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SMG B2B4D
Insured Vehicle No. : SLW 41BR

Date of Loss 26/05/2019
Place of Accident r JB CUSTOM

IN COMSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD,, I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE! PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Name
Driver Name

1 MUHAMMAD AZHAR BIN MAT® ODI
! MUHAMMAD AZHAR BIN MAT' ©ODI

from all elaima, present or futuze in respect of all loss,
sustained by mea/us arising out of the sald accident.

injury or damage

1 acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part aof CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LID.

{1} General Damages 5%
(2} Cost of Hepalr/Eseess 5% 2,320.10
{3) Loss of Use/Rental/Earning 55 300.00
{4) GIA/Police Reports/
Investigation Results/Search Fees 5% 2.00
(5] Medical Reports/Expensas 58
(6) Survey Fesa/Towing Fee/Disbursemsnt 13
17) cest ineluding Disbursement 55
TOTAL &+ o & o 4 9 = = » % @ & = & » BF 2,622.10

Claimant Wame : LO CHEE ¥EM (LOU EHIYUAN}

4

HRIC Ho : SB2T0315B

Signature : 51&“ Date \,U\,ﬂ q v .




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883
Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

Tax Invoice - 21115

3 Anson Road Date :0R.08.2019
#16-00 Springleaf Tower Vehicle No  :SMG 8284D
Singapore 079909 Make/Model MAZDA 6
ChussisEngd
Aun : Motor Claim Department Accident Dute - 26,05.2019
Claim Mo -
Refercnce 0519 -21115
Policy Mo
Amount
To proceed on parts by parts repair S8 216832
inclusive of knocking ,spray painting
labour charges and etc.
E. & O.E. Total : 5% 216832
GST @ 7% : 8% 151.78
Amount Due @ SS 2320.10

for FASTECH AUTO PTE ETD
All Invoices are subjected to G



28052018 Invoice

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Rel No GR-19-083940
Date of Request: 28/0572019 Your Ref No:

Kim Chwea Auto Ple Lid

1 Hakl Bukil Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kakl Bukit
Singapore 417883

Dear SirffMadam,

Online Purchase

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore D4AB580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm

Enquiry Dale 28/05/2019

uiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

Vehicle No. SLW41BR
Accidenl Data 26052019
Engquiry Result
TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SLW418R China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Lid, 25/01/2019-24/01/2020 6389 6111
Thank You.

Tha images provided 1o you are taken from the original reports forwarded 1o the centre by the members of the General Insurance Associalion of
Singapore and we take no responsibiiity for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of

of in connection with tha reports or their Images,

s is a computer generated document and requires no signature

hitos:isinganor mermen comiclalimefindex cfmMusahor=MTRsas&fusaacion=dsn oaninvin&mehd=21585808CFID=5340524BACFTOKEN=245.

172



28/05/2018 Invoica

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapare 048580
Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

GENERAL
INSURANCE

ASSOCIATION Operaling Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No GR-19-083940
Date of Request: 28/05/2019 Your Refl No; Online Purchase
Kim Chwea Auto Pie Lid

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukil

Singapore 417883
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 28/05/2019
quiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
Vehicle Na, SLW41BR
Accident Date 26/05/2019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer genarated document and requires no signature.,

For GIARMC Officlal use:
Data:
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

-

hittps:/isinaapore. mermen, com/claimalindex.cim Husebox=MTRsasAluseaction=dso oeninvin&refid=21585804CF ID=5348524BACFTOKEN=24a... 212
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

81 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapare 408933

TEL: 6256 1561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607188R GST Rag. No. 18-8607188-R

Afiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (5) PTELTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00

Ref : CCB/CTI18009358/Uealg2

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 SRS R ” ||||‘|"I"l|“"l"l
Code: CTI
13 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SLW418R Veh. Inspected SMG 8284D
Policy No. DMPCSN300807 1901 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM190202427 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 28/05/2019
- Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MAZDAG (M) c.c 1008
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 24
Chassis No. JMBGL1072KD311158 Colour GREY
Odometer 11350 Steering IN CRDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/55R17 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |228/55 R17 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/55R17 BRIDGESTONE g mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/55 R17 BRIDGESTONE 8 mm
4. ‘Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/0572018 Inspection Date 2B/D5r2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#O1-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa. . Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
Sb. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL B25F 1561 FAX G256 4315

Reg No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMG B284D
Descripti Parts ‘Condition ; Y :
o ! jeonel Workshop (S))] (8
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BCOTLID NOT NECESSARY 1,245.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED / 1,288.30 1,172.80
DEFORMED
1|REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DENTED 715.00 51260
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS @$68.00 NOT NECESSARY 136.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 482 60 -
LABOUR
1|SET REAR REVERSE SENSOR SERVICEABLE 280.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -347.08
4.1586.80 1,388.32
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING. 50.00 20.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REVERSE SENSOR . 80.00 50.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT ,CUSHION UPHOLSTERY 120.00 60.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING. NOT NECESSARY 80.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING 680,00 250.00
PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR END
PANEL
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING 800,00 400.00
1,780.00 TBO.0O
GRAND TOTAL 5,986.90 2,168.32
| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | . [ I ?zﬂm;;zl
Report Ref No. CC&/CTI19009358/Uea3g2
CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report Ia mades soialy Tor the use and benafil of tha Client named on the fromt pags of this Aeparn.
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