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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 8:30 AM

To: Pauline Soh; SUR

Cc: Jocelyn Ng

Subject: RE: MV for SKS3798G - DOA: 17/05/2019

Dear Pauline,

The market value of SKS 3798G is $54K-$57K (Estimated) as at April 2019.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Pauline Soh <pauline_soh@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Friday, 24 May 2019 4:36 PM

To: Motor Survey <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; admin <admin@autoprobe.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>;
mi@aispl.com.sg; mail@vpappraisal.com; Admin @ VAUG <admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg>

Cc: Jocelyn Ng <jocelyn_ng@sg.msig-asia.com>

Subject: RE: MV for SKS3798G - DOA: 17/05/2019

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Attached COE/PARF Rebate and Vehicle Transfer Fee for your info.
Please help to advise on the Market Value of the above mentioned vehicle.

Thank you

Pauline Soh
Senior Admin Officer, Claims Services
D: +65 6594 2537 | F: +65 6225 7402 | pauline soh@sg.msig-asia.com

MSIG

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Bu lding, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

i
& e o &

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg

AMember of BUREAE INSURANCE GROUP
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Criginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:
The information contained herein is correct as at 24 May 2019

PARF/COE Rebate Enqguiry
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Singapore NRIC
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SKS3798G

No

24 May 2019

TOYOTA

COROLLA ALTIS CLASSIC 1.6 CVT
Silver

2014

1ZRX472867
MRO53REH104522096
90.0 kW (120 bhp)
$17,398.00

10 Apr 2015

10 Apr 2015

0

$12,398.00

Yes

09 Apr 2025
$9,298.00 é N O\O\
09 Apr 2025

A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)

10

$64,700.00

$38,025.00

$47,323.00
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