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Jia Le (LKK Auto) S —————

From: Danny Loh <lohheng0308@yahoo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 June 2019 1:28 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 68518 AND SF) 8875R ON 29/12/2018

Hi Carlor,
We accept your offer as final settlement for the case,

Thanks
Danny

Sen Mail on Android

On Mon, 3 Jun 2019 at 13:44, Jia Le (LKK Auto)
<JiaLe(@lkkauto.caom=> wrote:

w 0 EJUD

Dear Sirs/Mdm.
We releer to the above matter

We propose settlement at a global sum of $4.300,00(all-in),

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotintion between parties on this matter is purely on & without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lisbility, whatseever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation af terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence vn the
issues of lability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotistion terms/setilement.”

Best Regands,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auio Consultanis Pie Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jigle@@|kkawo.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408931)



11‘|'1|:1rl|1:-[}m:m:,r Loh [mailto:lohheng0308@yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 9:14 PM
To: Jin Le (LKK Auto)

Ce: Admin A
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 68518 AND SF] BE75R ON 29/1272018

Hi Jia Le,

Please refer to attached video evidence regarding accident involving GZ6851B and SFIS875R on 29/12/2018.
Kindly let me know if you require anything else.

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Loh Heng

Danny

On Monday, 27 May 2019, 2:47:06 pm GMT+8, Jia Le (LKK Auto) <Jiale@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: 5F] 8875R Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CS/EGIT2000234/Kdad-]

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

CIb VOL L

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's accident
repont for your perusal.



Shirlﬂ Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LXK Auto) <ShirleyHlew@Ikkauto.com>
Sont: Tuesday, 8 January 2019 529 PM

To: Steve Lim’

Ce: Sitl Rahman'; assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: 3rd party claim attachment (Our insured: GZ68518)
Attachments: SF) BETSR - Prell Advise pdf

[Jear Steve,
Enclosed preliminary revised ol vehicle SFJ 8875R.

Kindly provide us claim no,

T hank you

Lot Regarua,

Shiviey Hew | Case Handiar

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane. 6156-1561 | emall Sur@ikkaute com | fax: 6256-4115
VNS0, Page Ui Indudtoal Park, LD Avenoe 1. #33-25 | 5808933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 3:47 PM

To: Steve Lim' cgteve lim@ergo com sg>: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Ce: "Siti Rahman' <3iti Rahman@ergo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 3rd party claim attachment (Qur insured: GZ68518)

Owar Sleve,
Thank you tor the assignment.

Please be infarmed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer arrange survey on 07.01.2019.

Mt Rogirds,

Cntherine Chong | Admin

KK Auto Consultants PFle Lid

Pl B7g0-84'4 | email; pssignments@likaniocom | fax: Gst-4005
k51, Paya Uta Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue o, so2-325 | S{4n8ga3)

From: Steve Lim [mallto:steve lim @ergo.com.sg)
Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 3:23 PM

Te: SUR (sur@lkkauto com) <sur@ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) (admin-d@ikkauto com) <gdmin-
diBkkauto.com>



Catherine Chr:ma SLI(I( A.utn!

Fram: Steve Lim <stevelim@ergocomsg>

Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 3:23 PM

To: SUR (sur@ikkauto.com); Admin-D (LEXKAuta) (admin-d@ikkauto.cam)
Cc Sitl Rahman

Subject: FW: 3rd party claim attachment (Our insured; GZ68518)
Attachments: €C101032019.pdf; Ol report pdf

Lraar Lk,

Miease assist to conduct TP survey

LEGO inswrnnce Ple Lid
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From: Danny Loh [mailto:lohhengl308@yahoo.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 4 January, 2019 3:19 PM

To: Steve Lim

Subject: Re: 3rd party claim attachment

Hi Steve,

thanks for the reply. We prefer LKK
10 survey al our workshop,

Thank you
Dianny

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android

On Fri, 4 Jan 2019 at 9:55, Steve Lim
<steve Iim@ergo.com.sg> wrote:

Hy Dhanny.
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From: ERGO Inturance Fre. Lad.

Sent; Thursday, 3 January, 2019 4:05 PM
Tz Seve Lim

Ce: Charlie Neo

Subject: FW: 3rd party claim attachment

[ by Slerve,
Mlense psaist. Thanks.

Woarinesl Hiceurds

I ileen

From: Danny Loh [mailio:lohheng0308
Sent: Thursday, 3 January, 2019 10:09 AM
Toy ERGO Insurance PMe. Lid.

Subjeet: 3rd party claim attachment

we nre submitting a 3nd party cloim snachment for your perusal.

Kind regands,
Luoh Heng

Danny
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NOTIFICATION Of ACCIDENT & PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION

To - _ER@’(.":J /H;’mnmf Ftet 1A
Claims Department 24y -3 LLT24 7
Re
Vehicle No _éz. 6887 B Z

From: Mis Loh Heng

Sub - 3" Party Claim

This is to inform you that vehicle no, 62 6?5?5 which is insureg under your
company was involved in an accident on Zc? "/_'@“ / 8

The vehicle is at the warkshop LOH HENG Ta::m;;gzgz and is avallable for your
iNspection before work is Carmied out,

Yours faithfully,
LOH HENG

Danny Loh(Person 1o contact)
HP 80111432

BLOCK 178 #03.0g Sin MinG AUTOCARE,
8IN Mming DRIVE, imﬂl!ﬁl! §TST2
PHOME: Ga832zar Gds3o0re;r
FAX: LLEETET T

;:_ e L 1 . =



DT Receipt
» Hack tp OneMotoring

' Land .'r..r-.a!um%‘:u:h--rﬂ_v

Lasrud Transport Autharty
10 Sien Ming Driver

Singmpors STETON
GST Ragistration Mo, - WM4-0N06520-3

Print Dale/Time 31 Dac 2018/ 160159
Rucelpl Datle/Mime 31 Dec 20187 15:01:30

Tax Invoice/Receipt
focopt Mo, TTNET-DODOC-1H1231-001578
Pravious Rocmpl No,
SN lHam Description/ Amount

Business Transaction Ralerenco Bofore
Mo GST (8%)

Resull of Insurance Enguiry - GZE8518

As il 20 Dec 201814 223:00

Insurance Co' ERGD INSURANCE PTE. LTD
! Umurares Enquiry - GIEES1R

Enguity Foe 7.00
FDTRYIIVNIANBLE TR SAD
Sub-Tolal 7.00
Total Bators Rounding 7.00
Rounding Diftersnce
Total Amound Payabile
Pt By
2478 Cradil Cant'
Vina/haniarCan
Tuskal
Camh Changes
Tt Aenoua
Excews Fnlundabie Amouni

THAKK ¥OU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

GST Amount
Amoumt  Aftor GST
(5% [53)
o.49 740
0.49 Tan
0.4% ran
0,04

145

T4

I

oog

145

0,00

Please ensure that all paymonts ta tha Authority are good and promplly sattled by the paymeint service
provider | financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and recelpt is considered void and lete les

may apaly.



W:*: are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying ﬁ.II'IhCI: with our OI we will revert with
our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer 1o any party for legal assistance until you heard further from us,

Meanwhile, we would Tike to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order for us to look into
the matter.

We shall revert upon hearing from you.

Thank Y ou.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of lability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lad

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jinle@@ikkauto com | fioe: 67414108

Blk 51, Puya Lihi Industrial Park, bl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



LOH HENG

Aplomotive Repair & Senvices
sccident & Insurance Claims

22 February 2019
ERGO Insurance Pte Litd

Attn.  Motor Claim Department
Rel.GZBRE1B

Dear Sirfmadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFJ8875R AND GZ6851B ON 23 Dec 2018
We understand that you are the insurer of GZ8851B vehicle.

We are instructed by the owner of mator vehicle SFJBB75R write,negotiate and settle
ihe claim on their behalf for the above mentioned accident.We therefore propose to claim
from you as follows

1 Lump sum recommended by surveyor $ 400000

2 Loss of use G days x $80 $ 480.00

3 LTA search 5 7.00
§ 4487.00

Plaase advise If shove claim is agreeable via direct settiement with us.

Yours faithfully,

LOH HENG

BLOCK 176 #03-08 SIN MING AUTOCARE,
SIN MING DRIVE, SINGAPORE S7572%
PHOMNE: 64532217 | 84530787
FAX: 64556304
EMAIL : lonheng0l0s@yanoo.com.8g



—_ N e

ssaRa® Peud -
!':I L1 AVE 1. #01-25 PAYA um 1Nll'ljﬁTlllM.I‘-’-RR.SIN[:AHIHH NTTL AR TEL 1065 62561561 FAX « (G5) hE5HHIE
Our Ref: CSfEGllﬂﬁ[}ﬂﬂdfﬂdﬂ-l

30 May 2019

KOK KEONG LANDSCAPE PTE LTD
10 LOR SEMANGKA,
SINGAPORE 698936

Attn: The Management
Dear SifMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GZ 6851B & SFJ 8875R ALONG/AT UPPER THOMSON RD
ON 29/12/2018

We refier 1o the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed
by your molor insurer, ERGO Insurance Pe Lid to deal with the third party claim against your

policy.
We have received a claim from §FJ 8875R against your motor insurance policy.

RBased on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
favour, We will therefore proceed 10 negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

lease note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due o
this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CHANJIA LE
Case Handler
DID: 6749 5792
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ']inlﬁﬂlkknum,;gm

ce. ERGO Insurance Ple Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

08 Jun. 2019
The Claim Manager

ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd
Singapare

Accident involving GZ6851B and SFJ8B75R on 29 Dec 2018

| TEOQ EE GUAN STEVEN, hereby authorize my repairers M/S LOH HENG of 176
Sin Ming Drive #03-08 Sin Ming Auto Care, Singapore 575721 whom | have appointed
as my agent in respect of my claim.\

| further authorize to negotiate and release all proceeds of settlement monies to my
repairers MIS LOH HENG in settlement of my claim

Signature / Date”




Invoice

D HENG

Aullidnolive Repar Services
Ar=idantdnsurance Clams

ERGO Insurance Co. Date. 22-Feb-18
invoice No, 34425
Terms

[Made: |VW Jelta =

fuhicle No. : SFJBBTSR = e
| ("o, [Description o H s e MR | B Unit Price |To
——— To repair the above accident vehicle as per lump
sum recammended by surveyor. § 4,000.00

BLOCK 176 #0308 SIN MING AUTOCARE,
5IN MING DRIVE, SINGAPORE 575721
PHONE: 84532237/ 64530707
FAX: 54558384
lohheng030a(@yahao com.6q



"8 Recoipt

| 4k ta OneMotoring

| gt | ramsnor \uihorins

L Transpon Authanity
‘ 117 Sy Ming Drivo
Gingupors ST5T01
55T Regstrabon Ho. : MAONDB5IS-2

Print Dale/Time ! 41 Dec 2018 { 15:01:39
Raceipt Dale/Time : 31 Dec 2018 1 15:07:39

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Rucaipt Mo, | ITRET-00000-111231-0015789
Provious Roceipt Mo,
SIN ltem Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reforence Bofore  Amount  Aftar GST
Nao, GST (85) (55) {5%)

Russulll 6 Insurance Enguiry - GZ66518

As Bl 29 Dec 2018/14:22:00

|nsurance Co: ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD.

] Insurancn Enguiry - GZEES1E
Engiiry Fis T.00 048 149
F0IR1ZIN45BL4TEINES

Sub-Tatal 7.00 04D r.a%
Total Getare Rounding 7.00 o.au 1.48
Rounding Diffarence oo
Totsl Amoun Payable 745
Paid By

e Rl e 245
Tatal TAG
Cash Cnange .08
Terdarsd Amount 4t
Excess Aalundabis Amouni (Rt

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAYT

Please enaure that oll paymants to tha Authority are good and promptly seitled by the paymant service
arovider [ financlal nstitution. Otherwise. the transaction and recelpt Is considered vold and late lee
may apply.



- ; : -I. Pre Lrd Company Registration No. 199607 198R

L)L AVE b #0225 PAVA LIBLINDUSTHIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08933 TEL : (651 A2563541 FAX 1 (0051 62564315

To : Mis ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Date: 27/06/2018

THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

. GZ 68518 {(Insd Veh) |Your Ref No.: CDOMCG1B001276
Vehicle No T e :
SFJ BBTSR (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CS/EGI19000234/Kda3q2-1

Date of Accident 29/12/2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost - 4,000.00
Loss of Use % 360.00 6 days
Rental (If any) ' § ~ days = =
Others: ' $ 7.00

4 367.00
Final Settlement Sum |: § 4.300.00 |GLOBAL SUM

Remarks _

Payment Instruction: P 's Break n

1) |LOH HENG B '8 4. 300.00
'8 B

JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid




¥y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 LUbl Ave 1 #071-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

#_J—ILI
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg Mo: 198607188R GST Reg No. 18-8607188-R

Affiliated 1o Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automoblle

ERGO INSURANCE PTELTD Ref : CS/EGI19000234/Ksbn2
o ST ToveR [IITMWTEN
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 01-03-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GZ 6851B Veh. Inspected SFJ BATSR
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. GZB8518 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  STEVELIM Assign Date 04/01/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLKSWAGEN JETTATSI(A) |e.c 1380
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2014
Chassis No. WVWZZZ18ZEMD11628 Colour METALLIC GREY
Odometer B7365 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Slze Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 PIRELLI & mm
L/H Rear Tyre [205/55 R16 PIRELLI 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 28/12/2018 Inspection Date 07/01/2019
Survey held at LOHHENG
BLK 176 #03-08
SIN MING DRIVE
SINGAPORE 575721
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SFJ BBT5R
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop (§)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER BUCKLED / CUT 780.00 780.00
1|FRONT LEFT MUDGUARD BENT 497.00 497.00
1|RETAINER BUMPER DISTORTED 117.00 117.00
1|FRONT RIGHT SHOCK ABSORBER BENT 570.00 48820
1|FRONT WHEEL COWLING SERVICEABLE 188.00 -
1|ROAD RIM DENTED &78.00 705.00
1|FRONT LEFT HEADLAMP cuTt 783.00 684.00
1|FRONT KNUCKLE BENT 749.00 42511
1|FRONT BEARING NECESSARY 327.00 327.00
LESS 5% DISCOUNT -248.00 -201.67
4674.00 383164
LABOUR
TO REPAIR DAMAGED ON FRONT LEFT ACCIDENT AREA 500.00 450.00
KNOCKING PANEL BEATING AND READJUSTMENT
REMOVE FRONT SUSPENSION AND REPLACE NEW 200.00 160.00
PARTS
READJUST FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 60.00 60.00
RESPRAYING FRONT ACCIDENT AREA 750.00 B00.00
1.510.00 1.270.00
GRAND TOTAL 6,184.00 5,101.64
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,000.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18000234/Ksbn2
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KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraisar

DISTLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repon is misde solely fad the use snd benefil of fhe Clant nemed on the font pegs of this Aeport




