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GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

% Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, #05-25 Premier @ haki Bukit Singapore 415875

LUMENS AUTO PTELTD > ﬂt’ (-:1 24" MAY 2019
B KAK|I BUKIT AVENUE 4 T
# 05-25 PREMIER @ KAKI BIKIT
Singapore 415875 1/'- (e
Accident date: 23™ MAY 2019
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: SMG2620G Toyota PRIUS
sin aty Items Uiprice Amount _,
] 1 Front Windscreen Chatitrtd 51,2
3 1 Eront windscreen moulding Mf & ’53
5 1 Front windscreen rubber N ra- 36.50 "€ of
6 1 Front windscreen ERP sticker 000~ 4 ""“)
7 1 Front Wiper Panel $485.00 X
8 1  Front wiper garnish [ut* 354
9 1 Front wiper garnish rubber #¥ feu 13175 %
10 1 front wiper $98.00
11 &  Front wiper gamish clips MNaw $12.90 S740 1.0
i ———fromtdashboerd. =N Sl O
12 1 Frontdashboard  (ak 5964.00 =
14 1 Frontdashboard panel > Pis $469.00 X
16 1 Front Bonnet ' $1,150.00 + .
2ENS Subtotal :- $5,742.45
> SN, W0

Labour charges 2! 231
Gum $50.00
To remove & re-fix front windscreen $1 ?6 139
to Remove & install front dashboard -0 SM y L
Panel beating M o0
Spray painting “W" 200

LEN Auto Consull hence nobly

Ir‘EF-_L yireat ol 1} lrMing: subtotal:- $1,280.00

o Toi to0e Total:- $7,022.45
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Vic (LKKAuto)

#

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 14 August, 2019 9:35 AM

To: sinyo220909@outlook.com

Cc Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMG2620G & GBF23605 DOA 23.05.2012 / CC6/AIG19009190/AHA3

Without Prejudice
Dear Chris,
We refer further to our below email and we confirmed in receipt of your client’s video footage.

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available information and
evidence at hand, our principal Is in the view that our Insured is not liable of this accident.

Based on BOLA scenario 27(a), liability is favour of our Insured.

SCENARIO DESCRIPTION = D,

FRONT TO REAR COLLISION

27. Driver of tha vehicle X will be
-_.D 100% liable for losses incurred | 100% | 0%
by the vehicle Y

(Hit by identifiable | 100% | 0%

Renason: Vehicle X travelling
behind Vehicle Y must keep a
safe distance.

As such, we have our principal’s instruction and that we are unable to look into your client’s claim.
We will now close the matter in our end.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

LXK =TT Save the Earthe Print only when necessary”

This e-mail cantain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
Unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in eror, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delste the e-mall and all attachments, including any coples thereod, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereofl. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 8 July, 2019 9:24 AM

To: sinyo220909@outlook.com

Cc: Admin A: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMG2620G & GBF2360S DOA 23.05.2019 / CC6/AIG19009190/AHA3

Without Prejudice
Dear Chris,
We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that our Insured Driver reported that he was not aware of this accident as all of his stuff behind
the lorry were locked and covered. Kindly refer to the attached statement for your reference.

Kindly furnish us any evidence to support your client’s claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

LKK =, the Earch: Print only when necessery-

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Lise or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may ba a violation af law. If you believa that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mall or any aflached items. Pleasa delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: sinyo220909 @outlook.com [mailto:sinyo220909@outlook.com]
Sent: Sunday, 7 July, 2019 4:21 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)



Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: SMG26206G & GBF23605 DOA 23.05.2018 / ECE}AIGIEUﬂElEDfAGM

Dear Cecilia,

Enclosed is our invoice , LOA & LTA fee
As request following :

1l RC $ 2407.50 ( $2250 + 7% GST )

2. Loss of use$750( $150 - 1800cc under rental company x 5 days - 3 days recommend + 2 days
weekend 23.05.2019 ( Friday accident ) 24th & 25 th May ( weekend no survey )

3. ltafee $7.45

@ 100% ( with video camera )

TOTAL S 3164.95

Please let us have your offer & reply soon . Thanks
Best Regards

Chris Chan

GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
HP: 92712214



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ Tan@aig.com=>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 August, 2019 11:30 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce Admin A; Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 05432228285G_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBF 23605(01) AND

SMG 2620G(TP) ON 23/05/2019 LKK REF CC6/AIG19009090/Aha3

Hi Vic

Referring to your email below.
Please reject TP claim based on BOLA scenario listed below.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.alg.sg

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, July 09, 2019 2:01 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Jimmy Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Your Ref: 05432228285G_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBF 2360S(0I) AND SMG
2620G(TP) ON 23/05/2019 LKK REF CC6/AIG19009090/Aha3

I'his message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Your Ref: 05432228285G

Dear Bennie,

We refer to the subject matter.

Insured Driver reported that he was not aware of the accident.

As such, TP had provided to us a copy of their video footage that shows the entire incident (please see attached
video).

As observed, an object flew from Insured vehicle and hit onto the front portion of the TP vehicle.

Under below BOLA scenario 27(a), liability is in favour of our Insured.



SCENARIO DESCRIPTION - D

| X Y
|| FRONT TO REAR COLLISION
| 22, | Driver of the vehicle X will be
-_D 100% liable for losses incurred | 100% | 0%
by the vehicle Y
*21 (@) New | yvehicie X — Moving straight
(Hit by identifiable | 100% | 0%

—
— - oﬂ"h D__. Unhid-?-wrggraigl'lt

Reason: Vehicle X travelling
behind Vehicle Y must keep a
sale distance.

Kindly advise if we deny TP claim and/or for your further instruction please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

'S 72
SLERER SE Syve the Earth Print only when necessary’

This @-mail conlain confidential and privileged matenal. and are for the sole use of the intended reciplent. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohiblled, and may be a vialation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mall In error, please do nol
read this e-mall or any attached ltems. Please delale the e-mall and all altachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American Interational
Group. Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Vic (LKKAuto)

__—__—__

From: sinyo220909@outlook.com

Sent: Sunday, 7 July, 2019 4:21 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Ce: Cecilia Cheng (LKK Auto)

Subject: SMG2620G & GBF2360S DOA 23.05.2019 / CC6/AIG19009190/AGA3
Attachments: SD.pdf

Dear Cecilia,

Enclosed is our invoice , LOA & LTA fee
As request following :

1. RC $ 2407.50 ( 52250 + 7% GST )

2. Loss of use$750( $150 - 1800cc under rental company x 5 days - 3 days recommend + 2 days
weekend 23.05.2019 ( Friday accident ) 24th & 25 th May | weekend no survey )

3. Itafee$7.45

@ 100% | with video camera )

TOTAL S 3164.95

Please let us have your offer & reply soon . Thanks
Best Regards

Chris Chan

GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
HP: 92712214



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

1S padp Pz LA
rwe, =AMNIST fo . of -

n . f ~a
. owner of S Mokl J hereby

authorize Green Forest Automobile Pre Lid, (“The Workshop™) to act for me/us wim F-;p:d w m;m-ur

claim lor the repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use for my our u*hr:l-:

that wis damaged pursuant 1o the  accident  occurred  on )‘E
P T invalving vehicle fnum

F y . | r -
vils L ' Ry

[
-

I/We further authorize the Warkshop to settle my/our sbove mentioned claim in a manner that they deem
fit and The Workshop i5 further suthorized to receive payment further 10 settlement of my/our claim with
payment cheque being made in favor of Green Forest Automobile e L.

The seftlement The Workshop may reach on my/four behalf is on without prejudice and without
admission of liability hasis insofar as the driverfowner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Pursiiant to Persondl Data Protection Act 2012, 1/We hereby agree that The Workshop may disclose or
share my personal dats 1 any authorized service providers whom The Workshop would pecessanly need
to cooperate, interact of work in one way or another in serving me or mecting my regiiests.

If 'we are not able to recover full amount for the repair cost from the third Party’s Insurance Compan)
in & (six) months” time from invoice date, Green Forest Automobile Pie Lid shall ball to you'your
Company for the balance/full amount of the repair cost. The Workshop will close this case without prios
notice iT we are unable 10 recover within 2 years.

IM'We understand the above explanation by Green Forest
Automobile Pte Lid

Dated this day of {month) | year)

i _;7,1'11 f
r

!l'
Clabimant’s Signatire .
(Company’s stamp for company vehicle) Cireen Forest Automobile Pre Lid

206G
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GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD

% haki Bukit Avenuc 4, #05-23 Premier @ kaki Bukit Singapore 415875

INVOICE

LUMENS AUTO PTE LTD Date: 07" JULY 18
# Kak| Bukit Avenue 4 ' GST Reg.No: 201723238H

#05.25 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Accident date;23™ MAY 2018
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SMG2620G TOYOTA PRIUS

Descriptions AMOUN

lLump Sum repair cost as recommended by $2,250.00
AutoProbe Consultants
Survoyor : Mr TAY

S/ DLRS : TWO THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED SEVEN AND CENTS FIFTY ONLY

Page 408
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» Back to OneMotoring

X

Larel Temnsgont Authosiby

10 Sen Mg Drlve -
Sngapote 574701

G5T Ragsiation Mo MA-D006526-2 i
P Ciaa /T ame 23 May 20181181711

Recept Dale/Time 23 May 2018/ 16 1711

Tax involce/Receipt
Frcep No ITNE T-00000- | 90423000408
Preyuous Receqt No
SN ltem Description/ Amaunt GST Amaunl
Business Transachion Reference gefore  Amount  After GST
No. GST (58) 8%) (S%)

Result of Insurance Enquiry - GBF23805
As al 2 May 20151220000
imkirsnce Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE FTE LTO

! msirance Enguiry - GEFZIG05
Enauny Fes 00 049 748
FRORIMRIATTI I

Siub-Tolal ! o0 L T 48
Total Batom Rounding roo 0ae i 4f
Aounding Difference 004
Toial Amount Payatie Ak
Faa By

2019057316154 756C ﬁ:mﬁsm 4
Total T 45
Cash Crange 0 o0
Tendeied Amount T AR
Eeress Felundable Amount 0.0

THANK YU AND HAVE A NICE D&Y

Uicass srrsime that all paymants o the Authority are good and prompily settled by the payment service
srawidns ¢ financal (nstitution. Otherwise, the transaction and recopl s considerod void and Late fee
may apply

Print Receipt . OK Save as PDF

ol WL v s st complerelayment SFUNCTION 1=k 13010011 S2R20404



