
1

Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 14 August, 2019 9:35 AM

To: sinyo220909@outlook.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMG2620G & GBF2360S DOA 23.05.2019 / CC6/AIG19009190/AHA3 

Without Prejudice  

 

Dear Chris, 

 

We refer further to our below email and we confirmed in receipt of your client’s video footage. 

 

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available information and 

evidence at hand, our principal is in the view that our Insured is not liable of this accident.  

 

Based on BOLA scenario 27(a), liability is favour of our Insured. 

 

 
 

As such,  we have our principal’s instruction and that we are unable to look into your client’s claim. 

 

We will now close the matter in our end. 

 

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 8 July, 2019 9:24 AM 

To: sinyo220909@outlook.com 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: SMG2620G & GBF2360S DOA 23.05.2019 / CC6/AIG19009190/AHA3  

 
Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Chris, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Please be informed that our Insured Driver reported that he was not aware of this accident as all of his stuff behind 

the lorry were locked and covered. Kindly refer to the attached statement for your reference. 

 

Kindly furnish us any evidence to support your client’s claim. 

 

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: sinyo220909@outlook.com [mailto:sinyo220909@outlook.com]  

Sent: Sunday, 7 July, 2019 4:21 PM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
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Cc: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) 

Subject: SMG2620G & GBF2360S DOA 23.05.2019 / CC6/AIG19009190/AGA3  

 
Dear Cecilia ,  

 

Enclosed is our invoice , LOA & LTA fee  

As request following :  

 

1. RC               $ 2407.50 ( $2250 + 7% GST )  

2. Loss of use$750( $150 - 1800cc under rental company x 5 days - 3 days recommend + 2 days 

weekend 23.05.2019 ( Friday accident ) 24th & 25 th May ( weekend no survey )  

3. lta fee $7.45 

  

@ 100% ( with video camera )  

 

TOTAL $ 3164.95  

 

Please let us have your offer & reply soon . Thanks  

 

Best Regards 

Chris Chan  

GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD  

HP: 92712214 


