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JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD

BECHERAAREH
SINCE 1986

¥ ken ‘Ln &
ATTN: MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT
OWNER: WINSTEAD TRADING PTE LTD
TP INSURER: AIG Asia Pacilic Insurance Pte Ltd
POLICY NO: 5076661530-03
REFERENCE: TP CLAIM
DOA: 23/05/2019

REPAIR ESTIMATE
Est. No. - E19050007
Date : 25/05/2019

Vehicle Num. : YPT36E
Make/Model : ISUZU.NPRBSUHSAK

Chassis/Eng#  JAANPRBSHFT100838
Yr.of Manu  : 2016

No Description

Qty uP Amt

Section: LIST ITEMS
1 Talllamp ML P
2 Spare Tyre Bracket ef =~

Section: SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
3 Rear Crash Bar M 0
4 Rear No Plate  Bedr
5 Rear No Plate Bracket Beud

Section: LABOUR
[ To Repair & Replace All Necessary Parts

To Spraypaint

e |

2.00 248.80 49760 4
1.00 620.00 620.00 -+

Amt 55 1.117.60
Discount {15.00%) 55 167.64
Subtotal 5§ 949.96

1.00 680.00 680.00 ~~

1.00 80.00 etrno- 79
7 60 1.00 120.00 12088~ € >
Amt 5% BBO.0O

Discount (0.00%) 55 0.00
Subtotal 5% B80.00

36D 1.00 580.00 580:80- oo
1.00 420,00 42000 300.

Amt 5% 1.000.00
Discount {0.00%) 5% 0.00
Subtotal 5% 1.000.00

A L5 Aol 1265
L/! )%%9' l-/s k.
om.T,

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte. Ltd.

LIST ITEMS Subtotal 5% 549.96

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS Subtotal 5% 880.00
LABOUR Subtotal 53 1.000.00

Total 5% 2,829.96

HLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #OV-408, SINGAPORE 408701 TEL: 8743 1913 FAX: 6743 5234 CO/OET REG NO: I0130008TW
BLK 3014 USI ROAD | §01-224, SINGAPORE 408702 EMAIL: sdmin@|hk . com.sg WEBBITE! www. hicom.sg

biFsHE,

PAGE L OF |



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

o e e  ————e—— — e——————_——

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Tracking:

Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Thursday, 5 September 2019 9.07 AM

shimin poh

Admin A

RE: Re: Re: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE
SCY3600G AND YP736E ON 23/05/2019 - AIG Ref: 37537761105G-003

Recipient Delivery

shimin poh

Admin A

Fong, Andy-5Y

Tan, Bennie-WZ

Melbwani@lkkauto com Deliverad: 5/9/2019 %07 AM
olivialau@®lkkauto com Deliverad: 5/9/2019 9.07 AM
shupei@ikkauto.com Delivered: 5/9/2019 307 AM

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19009187/Aka3

Your Ref: YP736E
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir’Madam,

We propose settlement as follows:

Cost of Repairs (w/GST) $ 1,070.00
Loss of Use (2 days x $100 ) $ 200,00
LTA Search Fee $ 2.00
TOTAL $1,272.00

Please confirm settlement.

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| emall: Khanchna(@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: shimin poh -

[mailto:shimin@jhk.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, September 04, 2019 2:43 PM
To: suri@lkkauto.com; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Khanchna (LKK Auto)
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JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTELTD

HECHAERAARAR
SINCE 1986

OurRef :YP 73BE
Your Ref : SCY 3600G

29 July 2019

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
Motor Claims Department

78 Shenton Way #08-16
Singapore 078120

Accident involving YP736E/SCY3600G(AIG Insured) on 23/05/2019

We act for WINDSTEAD TRADING PTE LTD, the owner of vehicle no. YP736E, which was
involved in the above accident

Our client suffered loss and damage as a result of your Insured's negligence in the driving of
motor vehicle no. SCY36006G.

We quantify our client claim’s as follows:

= Costof Repair inclusive of GST : $1,070.00

* TP Insurer Enquiry Inclusive of GST :§2.00

* Loss of Use @$150/day X 2 days : $300.00
Total Claim Amount $1,372.00

Pre-repair inspection of our client's vehicle was carried out by Surveyor Adrian and we
have finalized $1,000.00 before GST on 29/07/2018

Please let us know whether you are accepting liability and will be doing settlement within 7 days
upon recelving this letter, If there are no discrepancies, please assist to forward the DV to us

within 7 days.

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd
T:6743 1913 F: 6743 5234

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-406, SINGAPORE 408701 TEL: 6743 1913 FAX: 6743 6234 CO/GST REG NO: 201300082W
BLK 3014 UBI ROAD 1 §01-324. SINGAPORE 408702 EMAIL: admin@ihk.com.sa WEBSITE: www.ihk.com.sa
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S1UBLAVE 1, 200-25 PAYA U INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 8013 TEL : (0651 62563561 FAX 1 (I45) 62564315

Our Ref: CC4/AIG 19009187/ Aka3

3 JUNE 2019

TAN WOON TIANG
BLK 37 AMBER ROAD
#12-18

SINGAPORE 439946

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCY3600G & YP736E ALONG/AT NORTH BRIDGE ROAD ON
13/05/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with
them.

We have received a claim from YP736E against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
favour. We will therefore proceed 1o negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior 10 our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20%
for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy
has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

KHANCHNA
Case Handler
DID: 6841 2360
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: khanchna@lkkauto.com

ec AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motar Claims Dept)
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SATISFACTION AND DISCHARGE VOUCHER
EBSEEES

To: Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd andlor To:Motor Claims Department
Blk 3007 Ubi Road 1

#01-406 Singapore 408701

Claim ref no:
Policy No:
Data

liwe, hereby certify that the repairs to mylour vehicle bearing registration number Z

j;?;h% which was involved in an accident an Coasplie
2351 alo Mﬁm‘ﬂz_&@_@mmn

ng
completed by Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd to my/our ive agree that payment to
mmmmuhmmmﬂmwmmml

nlaimsahimMmayhavammspoctaluurm&nﬁmudmﬁdamdnﬁdpnﬂwnumber
insured by [OUAE

Dated this day of __ 29 month of &ij year zmﬂ_

Signed by owner/ driver Signed by Witness X7 2%
MName. al

(with chop if appiicabie) et
MName: Nric.
NRIC/Coy Reg No:




RELEASE VOUCHER
ia Pacific - Express laim

“Weil, JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK

AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
S51,070.00 (Repair Cost), §5260.00(Loss of Use/Remtal), $52.00(Disbursement) for vehicle no.
YP736E that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 23/05/2019(date) along
NORTH BRIDGE ROAIXlocation) involving vehicle no/s SCY3600G. This is pursuant to the
inspection conducted on 27/05/2019 (date) at “the workshop".

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner WINSTEAD TRADING PTE LTD(the
third party claimant") of vehicle no. YPTI6E make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and
we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”,

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss andfor expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage 10 YP736E(vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis,

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Datedthis > (day)of__SePY  (month)20_19 _(year)

(LK) )
. l‘"\:_ ?/ Lm P
Signed by appointed surveyor
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JOO HAK KEE AUTO PTELTD
HEIEHFERAFTRATH
SINCE 1986
Tax Invoice
WINSTEAD TRADING PTE LTD Inv No, : INV19070098
/0 BLK 3007. UBI ROAD 1. Date £29 Jul 2018
#01-406, SINGAPORE 408701 Ref : W)1907098
Terms : COD
Veh, No.  :YP736E
Make : ISUZU
Model : NPRBSUHSAK
# Description Qty UOM u/p aAmt
1 Total Lump Sum Repair 1.00 1,000,00  1,000.00
Cost Third Party Claim - YP736E / SGY3600G Accident Date
23/05/2019
{ agree to the price as listed above and aifirm thart the E &0E Subtotal : 5% 1,000.00
goods are received in good condition. GST 7.0% : 5% 70.00
5% 1,070.00
Auto Pte. Ltd.
[Customer's Signature) »d Signature]

Please make cheque payable to YOO HAK KEE AUTO PTE LTD' or Cash/Nets/ Credit Cards payrment at our workshop,

BLK 3007 UBI ROAD 1 #01-406, SINGAPORE 408701 TEL: 6743 1913 FAX: 6743 B234 CO/GST AEGQ NO: 201300082W
BLK 3014 UBI ROAD 1 #01-324, SINGAPORE 408702 EMAIL: admin®]hk.cem.sg WEBSITE: www.|hk.com.sg
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GENERAL

INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone; +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to S5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
TAX INVOICE
Qur Ref No: GR-19-081476
Date of Request: 23/05/2019 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Joo Hak Kee Aulo Pte Lid
Blk 3007 Ubl Road 1
#01-408
Singapore 408701
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 23/062018
Enquiry By Poh Shi Min
TP Vehicle No. SCY3600G
Accident Dats 23/05/2019
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Dua (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This Is a computer generaled document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official usa;
Data:
[%] GIRO [ ] Cash [ | Cheque
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GENERAL
INSURANC
ASSOCIATION

Involce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phona:; +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Bam to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Ne: GR-19-081476

Date of Request: 23/05/2019 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase

Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd

Bik 3007 Ubl Road 1

#01-408

Singapore 408701

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 23/05/2019

Enquiry By Poh Shi Min

TP Vehicle Ne. SCY3800G

Acciden! Data 23/05/2019

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SCY3800G AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid, 30/03/2018-29/03/2020 65-8419-3000
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded io the cenire by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no responsibliity for thelr accuracy or cantents and shall be under no liability whatscever for any loss or damage arising out of

or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated documen! and reguires no signature,




Merimen e-Claims

Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastiana

| CLATM SUBFOLDER TRACKING _
| Case  [Mopfied Ext Submitted Adj Assighed | Bt Adj Bubsmitted | Ins Auth'ed Status
24 May 2018 Pending for Survey
H“ “: r:.zﬂmi [ n;::.u Itl..noﬂ.or Raport
e | B Acy gt | e L Cancel Caun |

Main Refarence

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS | [Created by adjuster]
Tnsured: TAN WOON TIANG, [0 S1436727F
g;“ o WINSTEAD TRADING PTE LTD, Co. Reg Mo.: 201020835H
Vehicle Reg, _ {23/05/2019 12:00 - 159
Mo YP736E Date of Loss: |14 sonths and 18 Days From LTA Rag Date (Man ¥r)]
Claim Type: | TP / 375377611056 RolCy/Caver | 2100506161 (Camprehentive)
Vehicle Reg.
Na. SCY36006G Pohcy Wo. | enaees1530.00
{Insured): (Clakmant):
Exrmes:
Repairer: Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd (HQ) Bik 3007 Ubl Road 1, #01-406, 408701 Ubi - Tel: 7431913
Handiing ATG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd, {Express) - Tel: £5-5419-3000 _ [Handied by Tan, Bennle-W2 - £419 1715] Bennie-
Insurer. WE. TanBalg.com
m" NTUC Income Insurance Ca-oparative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:
Actjuster; LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 5256-3561 .. [Handled by ADRIAN LING] ... [Final Rpt due 04/06/2015]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View 8 |  Composs Cass Mail |
There am no mall for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS-

Die Date Priority Type
No resuits.

iew Al | Search Tasks |  Create wew Task | compiete |
Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?

Task Group Subject  Handler

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 18/9/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*YP736E (37537761105G)
[SCY3600G]
™
WINSTEAD TRADING PTE LTD
May 23 2019 12:00PM
[TAN WOON TIANG]
Joo Hak Kee Auto Pte Ltd

Upioad Documants | Upioad Phats | Compose ew Lenier | Upioed viase | upiad ause |

Page 1 of 2

view [ m T

Letters/Correspondences Tperpage Lv]| B8
No_|Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |(Dram Third Party Express Settlement - Paymant Breakdown O

Photos /Images 3 per page ~] &
Ne | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
1 |29/07/1910:26 | General View 0| iwe | &
2 |29/07/19 10:26 | General View D! leacirc | A
3 |2wo7/19 10:36 | General View 0| sedwr: | A
4 |I907/19 10:26 | General View 0 | Lo | B
5  |29/07/19 10:26 | General View @ | esaws | M
6 |29/07/19 10:26 | Genaral View @ | edirc | &
T |23/07/19 10:26 | Genersl View 0| leodirc | A
8 |I9/00719 10:26 | General View 0| lsawc | A
§ |29/07/19 10:26 | Genersl View 0| earws | B
10 |29/07/19 10:26 | General View O | teadws |
11 |29/07/19 10:26 | Genersl View @O | toadrrs | A
12 |2%/07/18 10:26 | General View 0| lediec | M
13 |79/07/19 10:26 | Ganersl View O irc | B
14 |ZW07/19 10:26 | Genersl View 0| waawc | A
15 |29/07/19 10:26 | Geners) View 0| waws || &
16 |20/07/19 10:36 | Genersl View 0| tdws | |
17 |29/07/19 10:26 | General View @ | wews | A |
168 | 2907 19 10:26 Reinspection Photo 0| wades | A
19 |29/07/1% 10:26 | Reinspection Photo @ | waaws | B
20 |29/07/19 10:26 | Relnspection Photo 0| waaws | B
21 |29/07/1910:36 | Reinspection Photo O | wadws | A
Documentation 1 per page E i)
Mo | Relsbel/Meorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid (HG) Thumbnall | Print
1 |24/05/1916:28 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO AIG DD 24.05.2018 O | e ror

2 |34/05/19 16:28 EMAIL FROM AIG DD 24.05.2019 g Load POF

31 |24/05/19 16:28 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF
{#  |00/06/19 10:44 Latter to O1 s Load POF

5 |16/09/19 0910 | WORKSHOP INVOICE Load FOF

& | 18/05/1% D9:10 AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM g Load POF

7 | 1B8/00/19 09:10 Release Voucher Load POF

8 |18/09/1909:10 | GIA SEARCH a Load POF

9 | 18/06/15 09:10 LoD Load POF

No | Finafized Cin ATG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbinail Print
1 |27/05/19 11:48 | O GIA REPORT 0 | Load por

2 l29/07/1812:13 [TPLOD ) | Load pOr

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

peset | Save | P |

There are no document checklists configured.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc& fuseaction=dsp_...

18/9/2019
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Our Checkiist Remarks - LKK Aute Consultants Pte Lid (H]

Show Remarks Tor [ Handling Ineurer
Momm | Remarey e provate uniess you ginow 8 19 elles parfies

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_... 18/9/2019
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| vehicle No: SCY3600G (Insd veh) Model: ISUZU NPRBSUHSA 3.0 D
YPT36E (TP veh) (M)
| Date of Accident: | 23/05/2019
Global Sum Settiement | || [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimatle - 3,028.06
Final Repair Cost % ] 1,070.00
Loss of Use i1 260.00 2.00 days at $130.00 par day
Rental (if any) '$ 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee $ 2.00
Others: - 0.00
$
Final Saettlemant Sum 5 1.332.00

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicate
below)

A) For Nen GIA Reglstered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)
BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (*): (%)
* Assessed Liabiiity to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Joo Hak Kee Auta Pte Ltd - §| 1,332.00
2) 5|
3) E
1B Sep
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN e
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report;
Medical Report! Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_d... 18/9/2019
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ico reqg Mo 1seaor1eer

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6258-3561 Fax: 6B844-8805 Email; sur@lkkauio.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG18008187T/AKA3O2

Date: 18/08/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 2100506181
Claimant .
Vehicle No YPT36E Insured Vehicle No : SCY3600G
Date of Loss: 23/05/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 3756377611056
TI FICATION OF I
Reg No: YPT3EE
Make & Model: ISUZU NPRBSUHSA, 3.0 D (M) Engine No: 4)J12F2232
Reg. Date: 05/01/2016 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: JAANPRBSHFT100838
Calour Blue Cdometer. 648970 km
Engine Capacity 2099 cc
Market Value/Mew Car N/A
Price:
Sum Insured (S%); Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceablea). Yes Foolbrake (Setviceable): Yas
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size 7.00 R16C Rear Tyre Size: 7.00 R16C
Front Left Side: Condor 6 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone & mm
Front Right Side: Condor 8 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 6 mm
Tha above valuns represant the mmaining fyre resds deptfh
}-COET OF CLAIMS Repairer’s Adjuster’s Difference  Diff %l
Parts 1,829.96 760.00 1,069.96 58.47
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,000.00 500,00 500.00 50.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55%) 2,829.96 1,260.00 1.569.96 55.48
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 1,000.00
(S%) 282995 1,000.00 1,829.96 B4 68
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 198.10 70.00 128.10 64.66
Nett Amount (55) 3,028.06 1,070.00 1,958.06 B4.66
+ Loss of Use (2.0 x $5130.00/day) (S§) 260.00
+ Doc/Search Fes (S§) 200
Nett Liability (S§) 1,332.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 24/052018
Date Inspected: 27052019 Inspected Al Joo Hak Kee Auto Ple Lid (HQ)
Bik 3007 Ubi Road 1, #01-406
Singapore 408701
Estimated Perlod of Repair: 2D days

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 18/9/2019
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Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: Khanchna Polhuraj

NOTE: This report represeniz our findings &f the Fme and place of ingpeciion stated harein. Such inspection fas been camed oul fo the besr of our
kmowiedge and abilly but any other Natelify under any ather circumnsiances (s hersby sxpressly srciuded

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 18/9/2019
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REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 2 *TAILLAMP Not Necessary 487 60FL *-FL
2 1 *SPARE TYRE BRACKET Not Necessary B20.00 FL *-FL
3 1 “REAR CRASH BAR Bent BBO.OOFS "6B0.00FS
4 1 *REAR NO PLATE Bent BO.OOFS *30.00Fs
5 1 *REAR NO PLATE BRACKET Benl 120.00FS *50.00FS

F=Franchise part S=SpcMett. L=Listiemisc

Sub Total {S§) 1,987.60 Te0.00

- List Item Discount on L Items 15.00/15.00% (S$) 167 64 0.00

Total Parts (S$) 1,829.96 760.00

Repont was unsubmitied during this print-out ]

https://singapore.merimen,.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 18/9/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellanecus ltems selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 TO REPAIR & REPLACE ALL NECESSARY PARTS New 580.00 200.00

2 TO SPRAY PAINT New 420.00 300.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 1,000.00 500.00

Repor was unsubmitied during this pnint-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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