Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 22 August 2019 11:48 AM

To: jovi@caerusholding.com

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: LKK Auto Claims

Tracking: Recipient Delivery

jovi@caerusholding.com

Admin A

Meikwan@lkkauto.com Delivered: 22/8/2019 11:48 AM
olivialau@lkkauto.com Delivered: 22/8/2019 11:48 AM
shupei@lkkauto.com Delivered: 22/8/2019 11:48 AM

Our Ref: CC3/A1G19009172/Kkb3

Your Ref: SKL 1528U

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHB 9905A & SKL 1528U ON 21/05/2019
The above matter and e-mail as trailed refers.

Kindly be informed that the third party has already engaged a lawyer to claim against your insurance company (AlG)
for his bodily injury resulting from the accident and this claim is handled by the insurance company.

As such, we advise against a private settlement for the property damage claim and to let the said Insurance company to
handle the matter at best.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jovi@caerusholding.com <jovi@caerusholding.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 7 August 2019 6:23 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LKK Auto Claims

Dear Khanchna
Please find the report as requested. Kindly advise on the next course of action particularly on the private settlement.
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Thank you.

Warm Regards,

Jovi

Personal Assistant

45 Cantonment Road, Singapore 089748

Office: +65 6221 8858
Fax: +65 6224 8858

www.caerusholding.com

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 3:57 PM

To: jovi@caerusholding.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LKK Auto Claims

Our Ref: CC3/AIG19009172/Kkb3

Your Ref: SKL 1528U

Dear Sir/Madam,
The above matter and e-mail as trailed refers.

Please forward us a copy of the GIA (Singapore accident statement) or let us know when and at where the GIA was
submitted at for our further action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jovi@caerusholding.com <jovi@caerusholding.com>
Sent: Monday, 5 August 2019 3:29 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LKK Auto Claims

Dear Asher
Pertaining to the incident report which had already been submitted. May we know the final amount for the settlement
and to handle this matter as per private settlement?



Thank you Asher and awaiting your advise.

Warm Regards,

Jovi

Personal Assistant
CAERLSCAERL SCAERLS

45 Cantonment Road, Singapore 089748
Office: +65 6221 8858

Fax: +65 6224 8858
www.caerusholding.com

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 6:23 PM

To: jovi@caerusholding.com

Subject: RE: LKK Auto Claims

Hi Jovi,

We refer to the email below.

You need to file the accident report as your insurance have appointed at as the loss adjuster.

We shall inform you on the final amount before settlement and you may decide to let the insurance handler the matter

or private settle.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: jovi@caerusholding.com <jovi@caerusholding.com>
Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 5:48 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: LKK Auto Claims

Dear Asher Sng
| am writing on behalf of the driver for SKL1528U with regards to the above claim.

May we propose for private settlement for this accident claim as it involves a minor damage of the vehicle?

Thank you and awaiting your kind advice.



Warm Regards,

Jovi
Personal Assistant



