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Your rel: To Be Advised
Our rel: CCA/EQLID091 70/ Adb3 Date: 29.05.2019

The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Dear SirMadam.,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SLES9IK
We reler to the above matter,

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 28.05.2019

at the premises of M/s _Premium Automobiles Pre Ltd and have the following to report:-
Workshop Estimate Amount : S8 £.904 00

Revised Estmate Amoumn : 5% 7.082.00

"Cheek” Nems Amount + 8% 6 (0

Market Value : 5% -

LTA Kemnbursement Value : 5% -

Newt Vilue : 5% -

Deseription of Damage: r——

Ihe vehicle sustained damages at the e r ‘=‘E-TF"_"3|‘J‘! _—
/S Portion ere— ey

Comments/Present Siatus:
Damages Consistent
Estimited normal period for repairs: 5 days

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING
Licensed Appraiser



-

| "Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408659
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax:6B841 1183

Telefax
Accident Vehicle S
Estimated
S/n Nature of Jobs Charges
To remove and transfer front wire harness for
1 headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor, S/N S 360.00 o~

headlight washer assy.

To dismantle and renew front bumper and rhs front 2 W
2 fender. Re-organise front crash management $ 1,800.00 T U
components. Reinstall all parts removed. /

r

3 Torespray front bumper and rhs front fender. $ 1,80000 (€0

4 To remove and renew rhs front rim and SN S 280.00
alignment.

5 To carry out diagnostic check. S/IN S 192.00 g
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES - S 4,432.00



"Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel: 6366 2323 Fax: 6841 1183

Telefax
S/N Parts Description W
1 FRONT BUMPER 9{th §  1,946.00
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS / s 258.00
3 FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE - RH .\ s 5 56.00
4  FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - RH ? 5 34.00 |
5 FRONT FENDER - RH “/rstatd 5 700.00 =
6 FRONT FENDER CLOSING ELEMENT -RH 5 45.00 -
7  FRONT FENDER BRACE-RH /. A S 107.00 =
8 FRONT FENDER BRACKET -RH * S 32.00 v
9  FRONT FENDER RIVET-RH 7~ s 36.00"
10 FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER - RH - s 22000
11 FRONT WHEEL SPOILER - RH %h’r*f . 5 66.00 -
12 FRONT WHEEL SPOILER TRIM - RH * S 33.00
13 FRONTTYRERIM-RH (& s 62900 =
14  SUNDRIES ¥ S 400.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES © $ 4,562.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES $ 4,432.00
GRAND TOTAL $ 8,994.00
Al eharges are not inclusive of G5T
Legend Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X = Not approved

Spare parts are Special Mett.



" Premium Automobiles

56 Ubl Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183

Telefax

Name

Surveyed Date
Authorised Date
Excess Cost
Liability
Remarks

Please Note

Yours faithfully,

Adn e
lﬂuf].ﬁ

Pl t}v\f{&ﬂ"ﬁf.J 2 05 "’7-'*

This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.

For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment

Premium Automaobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo

Body Repair Manager

Allan Wu
Claims Consultant



Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Janet Tan <janet tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 4:23 PM

To: Jia Le [LKK Auto)

Cc Admin A; Tan Wei Yin

Subject: DM19HO01479/WY: [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 5082K & SLB 8491K ON
16/05/2019]

Attachments: scene photo (Ol).pdf

Dear Jia Le

Please proceed to reject claim.
Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

ec]nsuronce

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
w.eglnsurance.com

ﬁnwamm- &

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailtoJiaLe @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, June 17, 2019 3:51 PM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN S082K & SLB 8491K ON 16/05/2019]

Dear Janel,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 5082K(CI) & SLB 8471K(TP) ON 146/05/2019

We refer to the above matter.
There is no any video footage or evidence from third party.
Based on the scene photo clearly shows that third party is switching lane to right where our insured was travelling.

Insured lorry was travelling straight along it's lane, it was third party vehicle changing lane from left to right thus
causing the collision. Therefore, we intend to reject third party’s claim.

Please let us have your instruction,



Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6740 5702 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, moz2-25 | S(408933)
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‘Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Janet Tan <janettan@eqinsurance.comsg>
Sent: Friday, 24 May 2019 11:48 AM
To: assignments
Ce: Admin A
Subject: FW: DM19HO01479/JT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 8491 K AND YOUR INSURED YN
5082 K DATED ON 16/05/2019
Attachments:; SLB B491 K - 22052019 GIA.PDF; SAS2605551.PDF
Dear all,
Please arrange to attend to the PRS on without prejudice basis.
Regards,
Janet Tan
Senlor Executive | Claims
[T
l Ll b Gt Bl
EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 656223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190
WWW EQinsurance.com.sg
\.‘ A Mavmtes of Criysiate "ﬁ —

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify ti

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto.com.sg)

Sent: Friday, May 24, 2019 11:39 AM

To: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>; EQI PRS <EQIPRS@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Ce: claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: RE: DM19H001479/JT: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 8491 K AND YOUR INSURED YN 5082 K DATED ON
16/05/2019

Denr All,

Wo would like to choose LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for the survey,

Thank vou. \]LLF- O.ﬁ

Best Regards,
Kelvin Khoo 'l\ﬂw_f'.r_
Claims Advisor

Freminm Automobiles Pre Lid g v isszzrim

50 Boad | Rosd Smgmpone A08EHW

P <65 GARK 2125 o, +65 ATHN OK3IN L -a5aNd] 183
e, cluimsipremivmuutocomsg  w, www dudlcom.sg



Auidi Showroom, Audi Centre
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From: Janet Tan [mailto:janet.tan@eginsurance com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 24 May, 2019 10:04 AM

To; Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Subject: DM19H001479/1T: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 8491 K AND YOUR INSURED YN 5082 K DATED ON
16/05/2019

Without Prejudice
Save As To Costs

Dear Sir/Madam,

For preé repalr survey request, please emall to egiprs@eqginsurance.com.sg

Liability not cleared.
We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client's vehicle.

Below is a list of motar surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any
objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have
agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. Alternatively, please specify one or more of
our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2) Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Tel: 6255 0808 Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 68499155 Fax: 6284 1539

Contact Person: Sophia

3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd 4) Priority Services
L.B.5. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Tel: 62934822
Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866 Fax: 62963283
Fax: 6281 8748 Contact Person: Sharon

Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd b) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
i




Tel: 674B6076 Tel: 6256-3561
Fax: 67480361 Fax: 6741-4108
Contact Person: Elson/Elgene

7) Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying
Tel: 81825263 Services
Fax: 67461148 Tel: 96623655
Contact Person: Kelvin Fax: 67655662

Contact Person: Mr Chee

9) IP Knights Pte Ltd 10) Appraisals Associates Pte Ltd
Tel: 63450068 Tel : 67472822
Fax: 63445328 Fax: 67470070

11) Infiniti Appraisal Service
Tel : 96684818/90098001
Fax: 643587432

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 mator surveyors whom
you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before you
return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

ec':insuror_jce

£

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 [ fax 65 6223 4190
Www.eginsurance com.sg

QA & i 2 7. —

Privileged/Confidentiol information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: Claims [mailto:claims@premiumauto com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, May 23, 2019 B:54 PM

To: EQ PRS <EQIPRS@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 8491 K AND YOUR INSURED YN 5082 K DATED ON 16/05/2019

Dear All,



- Kindly assist in the liability clearance for the above mentioned case. We propose for 100% direct settlement
in our clients favour.
We herein attached the GIA report for direct settlement for your reference.

We will forward you the estimate once is available.
Rindly arrange the survey on 28/05/2019, Tuesday, 2 PM.
Thank vou.

Hest Regards,
Kelvin Khoo
Clamms Advisor

Prembwm Natomaliiles e 1ol Rag e | T W

i Roww (T : e 4 !
P65 6388 2327 . <68 6THE 9828 I +65hB4] | 1R3
e cluimsa PrEmTUMaUI.ComLS8 W wiwie, id), com ]
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Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Janet Tan <janet tan@eqinsurance com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 17 June 2019 4:23 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A; Tan Wel Yin

Subject: DM19HO01479/WY: [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 5082K 8: SLB B451K ON
16/05/2019]

Attachments: scene photo (O1).pdf

Dear Jia Le

Please proceed to reject claim.
Regards,

Janet Tan
Senior Executive | Claims

ecinsuronce

Urre G Tinel

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6496 9032 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 032 | fax 65 6223 4190

wWww. eqinsurance.com.sg.

‘I.Awdcnym #"—'—

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: Jia Le {LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLle @lkkauto.com)

Sent: Monday, June 17, 2019 3:51 PM

To: lanet Tan <janet.tan@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 5082K & SLB 8491K ON 16/05/2019]

Dear Janet,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN S0BZK({Ol) & SLB 8491K(TF) ON 146/05/201%

We refer to the above matter.
There is no any video footage or evidence from third party.
Based on the scene photo clearly shows that third party is switching lane to right where our insured was travelling.

Insured lorry was travelling straight along it’s lane, it was third party vehicle changing lane from left to right thus
causing the collision. Therefore, we intend to reject third party’s claim.

Please let us have your instruction,



Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6740 5702 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenuoe 1, #02-25 | 5{4089a33)



Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@ lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Ler, Bernard-1Q [malilto:Bernard-)Q.Ler@aig.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 20 June, 2018 10:40 AM

To: Vivian Lau [LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: B9144824795G-003

Dear Vivian,

We are doing file review for this case again. Appreciate your update on this case.
Please provide the date of the last correspondence with TP as well.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)

Tel +(65) 6419 1946 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Bernard-JQ.Ler@aig com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Ler, Bernard-JQ

Sent: 24 May 2018 10:38 AM
To: "Vivian Lau (LKKAuUto)'
Subject: RE: 89144824795G-003

Dear Vivian,
May | check are we still pending on PO and DO? If so, kindly pravide the date of the last correspondence with TP.
Thanks.

Best Regards,

Bernard Ler

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid



e, claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audl Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Sinapure 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

Your closest companion
on the road.

The new AUdITAR:

Email MHsclaimer

This email. ibchuding any aitschment i conflidentinl and may alao be privileged

I woms harve received 1 in error, plemse notify o mmediately by reply emall end then delete this messige from your system
Meise do not copy (L or wae it for gty purpose, or disclose s contents or amy sitachment to any other person, Thanic you

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <liaLle@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 4:50 PM

To: 'Claims’ <clai iumauto.com.sg>

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@I|kkauto.com:

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 5082K & SLB 8491K ON 16/05/2019

Your Retf: SLB B491K Withou! Prejudice
Cur Ref; CC4/EQINF009170/db3

Dear Sirs/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 5082K L SLB B491K ON 14/05/201%
We refer to the above matter,

Flease be informed that lability is unclear for this matter.

Aftached is a copy of our insured accident statement and scene photo for your easy reference. It shows
that your driver is switching lane from left fo right where our insured was travelling straight its lane.

meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video leolage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in
arder for us to look into the matter,

We shall revert upon hearing from you.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5702 | email: Jinle@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No 18-968071388-R

Affillated to Federation Intermationale Das Exparts En Automobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

5 MAXWELL ROAD

Rel CC4/EQI8008170/Adb3g2

#17-00 TOWER BLOCK _ Dale: 08-07-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 068110
Code: EQI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YN 5082K Veh. Inspected SLE B491K
Policy No. DMPCHQ18-002144 Coverage (§) 0.00 .
Claim No. DM18HO01478/MY Excess (5) 0.00
Assign From  JANET Assign Date 24/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model AUDI A4 SEDAN c.c 1395
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2016
Chassis No, WALZZZF42GA038570 Colour RED
Odometer 76333 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/50 R17 GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/50 R17 GOODYEAR 8 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R17 GOODYEAR 8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/50 R17 GOODYEAR 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S BODY
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS, "
5. General Information
Accident Date  22/052018 Inspection Date 28/05/2019
Survey held at PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD
55 UBI ROAD 1,
SINGAPORE 408689
5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR 5 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapare 408933
TEL 6258 1561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 199807188R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page Mo 1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLB 8491K
i
. Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | 1 kg g" )
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER (SN) DEFORMED 1,946.00 1,946.00
1|FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 258.00
1|FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE -RH [SN) NOT NECESSARY 58.00
1|FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION -RH (SN} * CHECK 34.00 -
1|FRONT FENDER -RH(SN) DISTORTED T00.00 T700.00
1|FRONT FENDER CLOSING ELEMENT -RH (SN) * CHECK 45,00
1|FRONT FENDER BRACE -RH (SN) BENT 107.00 107.00
1|FRONT FENDER BRACKET -RH (SN) BENT 32.00 32.00
1|FRONT FENDER RIVET -RH (SN} NECESSARY 36,00 36.00
1|FRONT WHEEL HOUSING LINER -RH (SN) * CHECK 220.00
1|FRONT WHEEL SPOILER -RH (SN} NOT NECESSARY 66.00
1|FRONT WHEEL SPOIILER TRIM -RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 33.00
1|[FRONT TYRE RIM -RH (SN) cuT 629,00 629.00
1|SUNDRIES (SN) * CHECK 400,00
4,562.00 3,450.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND TRANSFER FRONT WIRE HARNESS 360.00 360.00
FOR HEADLIGHTS ,HORNS ,OUTSIDE TEMPERATURE
SENSOR HEADLIGHT WASHER ASSY
TO DISMANTLE AND RENEW FRONT BUMPER AND RHS 1,800.00 1.400.00
FRONT FENDER RE-ORGANISE FRONT CRASH
MANAGEMENT COMPONENTS REINSTALL ALL PARTS
REMOVED
TO RESPRAY FRONT BUMPER AND RHS FRONT 1.800.00 1,400.00
FENDER
TO REMOVE AND RENEW RHS FRONT RIM AND 280.00 280.00
ALIGNMENT
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK, 192.00 182.00
4.432.00 3.632.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,994.00 7,082.00

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI19009170/Adb3g2
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RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS 7,082.00
(REPAIR COST NOT CONCLUDE) o
(EXCLUDE CHECK ITEMS $$699.00 NETT)

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI18008170/Adb3q2
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ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATA!
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TD THIRD PARTIES: - This Repari is made saialy for ihe use snd benelll of e Cliend named on the franl page of ihis RBepart
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Joanne Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Joanne Lee [LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 18 July 2019 3:59 PM

To: ‘egiprs@eqinsurance.com.sg’

Ce: chewht@|kkauto.com'

Subject: TP Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN S082K (OI1) and SLB B491K (TP) on
22/05/2019

Attachments: EMAILpdf; LKK REPORT & PHOTO.pdf

Dear SirMadam,

We refer to the above matter.
Please be informed that we have rejected TP claim. (see attached)

We enclose herewith our without prejudice report and relevant documents for your necessary action please

Thank you.

Best Regards,

JIDANNE | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone; 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: repart @|kkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933



