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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic [LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 July, 2019 9:52 AM

To: Audrey Woo {Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & [A/Buses)

Cc: Admin A Vic (LKKAuto); Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Sves/Claims & 1A/Claims &
IA/Buses)

Subject: RE: LOD to AlG - BUS/05/19/7025/AW - Accident involving Double Decker Bus

SGS5810) and SMG2240U on 15 May 2019 along junction of Woodland St 83 and
Ave 4 LKK REF CC3/AIG19009154/Jhad
Attachments: SMG 2240U 150519 MP4

Without Prejudice

Dear Audrey,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SMG 2240U AND 5G 5810J ON 02/03/2019
We refer to the subject matter and to your LOD.

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the avallable information and
evidence at hand, our principal is in the view that our Insured is not liable of this accident.

Our Insured had reported that she was stationary when your client’s vehicle while turning accidentally hit the left
side mirror of her vehicle. Please refer to the attached video footage for your reference.

As such, we have our principal’s instruction and that we are unable to look into your client’s claim.
We will now close the matter in our end.

Thank you.

Best Regarls,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

P ‘
S i Save the Earthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged malerial, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached tems. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you,

From: Audrey Woo (Auto Sves/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) [mailto:audrey@smrt.com.sg)
Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2019 12:12 PM

To: AlG SGP, CCU Referral <AIGSGPCCUReferral@aig.com>; AlG 5GP, Claims-Survey

<AIGSGP ClaimsSurvev@alg.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] LOD to AIG - BUS/05/19/7025/AW - Accident involving Double Decker Bus SG5810J and
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SMG2240U on 15 May 2019 along junction of Woodland 5t 83 and Ave 4
Importance: High

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

SMRT Ref : BUS/05/19/7025/AW
AlG Ref : SMG2240U

Dear SirfMdm,

We claim on behalf of SMAT BUSES LTD, owner of the vehicle registration number SG5810J. Your client's negligent
driving has caused the above accident, As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,

Cost of Repair 5 353.00
Loss of Use (5350 x 0.5 Day)

Double Decker Bus 5 175.00
LTA Search Fee & 7.00
Total $535.00

We enclose the following documents,
* Repair Invoice
= GIA Report
» LTA Search
« Survey Report and Bus Photos to be furnished by AlG’s appointed surveyor LKK.

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. Payment by
cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT BUSES LTD.

oAudvey Woo | DID:6556 3521 | FAX:64819221 | Email : audrey@smrt.com.sg | Claims
Department | 6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 Singapore 569140

G SMRT

AUTOMOTIVE

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
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the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 9 July, 2019 9:14 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: 72654798995G-003 LKK REF CC3/AIG19009154/Jha3 - OL SMG 2240U
Dear Vic

You may proceed to reject TPPD claim as OIV was stationary at the time of accident
Thank you

Best regards

Loh Chee Heng

AIG

Senlor Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple, Ltd

AlG Building. 78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore{078120)
Tel +(65) 6418 1881
Chee-Heng.Loh{@aig com | www.3ig.5g

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit to learn more.

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE

The informaton i this email (and any attachmentsj is configential. [f you are nol the infended recipi|enl. yoo must nol use or dissamnate tha
informanion If you have received this emall in error, please immediately nolify me by "Reply” command and permanently delefs the anginal and ary
copies or printouts thersof. Althouwgh this email and any attaschments are believed fo be fres of any virug or other defect that might affect any
computer system mfo which if i3 receved and opened, it is the respansibiily of the recipeent [0 ensure thal i 5 wings free and no responsDility 15
accepted by AIG for any lass or damage anzing in any way from is use

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 8 July 2019 3:40 PM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@alg.com=>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com=>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: 726547298995G-003 LKK REF CC3/AIG19009154/)ha3 - Ol: SMG 2240U
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments,

Dear Chee Heng,

We refer to your below email.

Based on Insured's video footage, Insured vehicle was ohserved to be stationary when hit by the turning TP bus at the
junction.

In view of the above, we would like to deny TP claim



For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email; vicalpeh@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

r b
IKK = Save the Earth Print only when necessary

This e-mall contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the inlended recipient. Uze or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. Il you believe thal you received this e-mail in eror, please do nol
read this e-mail or any atlached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thareof. and inform the
sendar that you have delsted the e-mail, all attachments and any copias thareol. Thank you.

From: Loh, Chee-Heng [mailto:Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com|
Sent: Monday, 1 July, 2019 3:45 PM

To: CS A Team
Subject: 72654798995G-003
Importance: High

Dear Sirs,

We have received LOD from TP workshop for your handling. OI's video shared in Merimen for your viewing.
Thank you

Best regards.

Loh Chee Heng

AlG

Senor Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Building. 78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6418 1&31_

Chee-Heng Loh@aig.com | www.aig 5g

From: Paramchand, Varsha
Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 1:06 PM
To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>; Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ Tan@aig.com>

Cc: AlG SGP, CCU Referral <AIGSGPCCUReferral@alg.com>

Subject: FW: aigencrypt - LOD to AIG - BUS/05/19/7025/AW - Accident involving Double Decker Bus 5G5810J and
SMG2240U on 15 May 2019 along junction of Woodland 5t 83 and Ave 4 & clm no: 72654798995G

Importance: High

Hi Chee Heng / Bennie

Pls assist.

Tq

Varsha



From: AIG SGP, CCU Referral

Sent: Thursday, June 27, 2019 1:05 PM

To: Audrey Woo [Auto Sves/Ext Biz Sves/Claims & 1A/Buses) <audr m m.sg>

Cc: AIG SGP, CCU Referral <AIGSGPCCUReferral@aig com>

Subject: aigencrypt - LOD to AIG - BUS/05/19/7025/AW - Accident involving Double Decker Bus SG5810) and
SMG2240U on 15 May 2019 along junction of Woodland 5t 83 and Ave 4 & clm no: 72654798995G
Importance: High

Dear Audrey,

Thank you for email enguiry.

We are pleased to inform you that AIG have received your email request & We have forwarded to the relevant
department for assistance.

If you need any further assistance, please call us at 6419 3000 from Mondays to Fridays, 9:00 am to 5.00 pm,
excluding Public Holidays. Our Customer Care Consultants will be pleased to assist you.

Varsha
Claims Care Associate
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120

WwWw.aig.sg

From: Audrey Woo [Auto Svcs/Claims & I1A/Claims & 1A/Buses) [mallto:audrey@smrt.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, June 26, 2019 12:12 PM

To: AIG 5GP, CCU Referral <AIGSGPCCUReferral@aig.com>; AlG 5GP, Claims-Survey
<AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] LOD to AIG - BUS/05/19/7025/AW - Accident involving Double Decker Bus SG5810J and
5MG2240U on 15 May 2019 along junction of Woodland 5t 83 and Ave 4

Importance: High

This message Is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

SMRT Ref : BUS/05/19/7025/AW
AIG Ref : SMG2240U

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We claim on behalf of SMRT BUSES LTD, owner of the vehicle registration number SG5810J. Your client's negligent
driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,

Cost of Repair $353.00
Loss of Use (5350 x 0.5 Day)
Double Decker Bus $ 175.00




LTA Search Fee 57.00

Total $535.00

We enclose the following documents,
+ Repair Invoice
« GIA Report
¢ LTASearch
* Survey Report and Bus Photos to be furnished by AIG's appointed surveyor LKK.

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. Payment by
cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT BUSES LTD.

Audvey Woa | DID : 6556 3521 | FAX:64819221 | Email : audrey@smrt.com.sg | Claims
Department | 6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 Singapore 569140

& smRT

AUTOMOTIVE

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If vou are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof, Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
yvou must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use,
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|
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| Excess: o
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd (Woodlands) 60 Woodlands Industrial Fark £4, 757705 Woodlands - Tel: 68662618
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by ONG HWEE J1E] ... [Final Rpt dus 04/06/2019]
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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2
Claim Documents
*SG5810) (72654798995G)
[SMG2240U]
™
SMRT BUSES LTD
May 15 2019 12:00AM
[GUOK MEI YEN]
SMRT Automaotive Services Pte Ltd
Video [1perpage [V] B4
[No [Finalized On | AIG Asia Pacific Insuranes Pte. Ltd, (SG) Thumbaall | Print
, !
| | ; Video - Accident
__’ ;IJ'I..HIT.'H 15144 Proer 8 - I.q_ Mo SMOTIA0U, O Ol ME] YEN n Load MP4
Photos/Images 3 par v|| M
Mo |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auts Consultants Pie Lid (HQ) ThaniBell | Pring
1 |29/05/1909:37 | General View 0 | eaws | 4
7 |29/05/19 09:37 General View | vadws | A
3 |29/05/19 09137 | General View 0 | eds | A
4 [29/05/1% 0%:37 Genaral View © | waaws M
5 |29/05/1909:37 | Genersl View 0 | s | A
& 129/05/18 09:37 | General View 0| adws | &
(7 | 14/06/15 09:22 | General View 0| leacws | A
B |14/06/1009:22 | Genersl View 0| caaws | A
9 |14/06/19 09:22 | General View D | adec | A
10 |14/06/19 0022  |Geners! View 0| aaws | A
11 [14/06/19 09:22 | Genersl View € | tasws | A
17 |14/06/1909:22 | General View )| tosawrc | A
13 14/06/19 09:22 Photo After Spray D | iosdies | A
14 34/06/1909:22 | Photo After Spray O oarws | &
15 1406/1909:22 | Photo After Spray 0| o | &
Ibmmuﬂm 1 par page 1 B
\No_ | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail| Print
{1 [24/05/18 16:32 | TP GIA REPORT €Y | Load PoF
12 24/05/19 16:32 | TP ESTIMATE €) | Load PoE
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Documents Checklist
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https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 18/7/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2
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https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 18/7/2019



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoreq ne 1essoriser
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CC3/AIG18008154/JHA3Q2

Date: 18/07/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No:
ﬁ::f"""‘ Vehicle gg58104 Insured Vehicle No: SMG2240U
Date of Loss! 15/05/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 726547888856
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SG58104J
Make & Model: MAN ASS, 10.5 D (A) Engine No: 50344481284450
Reg Dale DB/06/2017 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No: WMAABSZZTGT003457
Colour; Grean Odomeler: 106602 km
Engine Capacity: 10518 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/&
Sum Insured (S$): Markel Value/New Car Price
TH F VEHI TTHE T F Y
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable); Yes Foolbrake (Serviceabla): Yeas
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accidenl Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 275/7T0R225 Rear Tyre Size: 27570 R22 5 (D)
Front Left Side Bridgesione T mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 7/7T mm
Front Right Side Bridgestone 7 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone T/7 mm
Thee above vilues represen! the remaining (pre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %|
Parts 24500 22050 2450 10.00
Miscallanecus ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 265.00 132.50 132.50 50.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Nett Amount [55) 510.00 353.00 157.00 30.78
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 23/05/2019
Date Inspected: 23/052010 Inspected At SMRT Automotive Services Pte Lid
(Woodlands)
60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4
Singapore 757705
Estimated Period of Repair: 0.5 days
Adjuster: ONG HWEE JIE Manager: VIC ALPEH
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NOTE: This repart represents our findings ar the ime and place of mapection stated hormin. Such ingpochion has been carmied cuf (o the best of ow
knowdlgdge and abiity but ary ather fabiity under any ather clieymetances (s hersby srpressly sxcluded.
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartMo.  Particulars Candition Repairer's Amount

11 *REAR LAMP BULB (A95 MAN) Cracked 24500F  "245.00FL

F=Fmnchuse part. LeLatiemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 245.00 245.00
= List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/10.00% {S%) 0.00 24.50
Total Parts (S§) 245.00 220.50
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
18/7/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous itema selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE & INSTALL ALL ABOVE ITEMS AND REPAIR New 265.00 132.50

OTHERS DAMAGED AFFECTED AREAS

Gross Labour Cost (S$) 265.00 132.50

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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