Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.coms

Sent: Monday, 23 September, 2019 3:48 PM

To: Vic (LEKAuto); Admin A

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GX6144U (OF

SNM19D202202C02/4(ock) and SIX2742) (TP : LKK REF - CCH/CTI19009132/Bha3)
on 15/05/201%

LKK REF-CC6/CTI19009132/8ha3
CTPIS REF - SNM19D202202C02/4(ock)

Dear Vic
We refer to your emall of even date pertaining to the above matter,
You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 53,107.49,

We await your payment advice to enable Chin Kiat to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Execulive

Claims Deapartment

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID : (65) 6389 6183

FAX: (65) 6224 7478

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.comichinataipingsal | WeChat: & F¥ji# Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named reciplents and may contain confidential information.
Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partlal, is prohibited. If you are pot the infended
recipient, pleasa notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mall and any coples of it thereaffer.

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 23 September, 2019 3:28 PM

To: Claims Dept of CT| <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com=>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GX6144U (OI: SNM19D202202C02/4({ock) and
SJX27421 (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI119009132/Bha3) on 15/05/2019

CTI REF - TBA
LKK REF - CC6/CT119009132/Bha3

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GX 6144U (O1) AND 51X 2742] [TP) ON 15/05/2019
We refer to the above matter,

It was reported that Insured vehicle reversed out from c¢/p lot when hit TP behind it.



We had spoken to the Insured Driver Mr Tan and was informed of the TP claim. A letter was sent out to the Insured
company to notify TP claim and NCD issues. No feedback received till date.

As such, in view of BOLA 24, liability may not be to our Insured’s favour and we have to settle the claim from the TP
vehicle and the damages sustained to TP vehicle were consistent to the nature of the accident.

Summary to offer to repairer GUAN MOTOR WORKS is as follows:
TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair S 4,124.49 £2,500.00
Loss of Rental (5100 x 6 days) $ 600.00 5  600.00
LTA Search Fee 5 7.49 5 7.49
TOTAL | $ 4,731.98 $3,107.49

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Recommended Days 5 days
Weekends / Downtime 1 day
TOTAL | 6 days

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval and/or further instructions please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenoe 1, woz-25 | S(408933)

FIrys =

= Save the Earth: Print only when necessary’

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged materal, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient, Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited. and may be a violation of law. Il you believe that you recelved this e-mall in efror, pleasa do nol
read this e-mail of any attached tems. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any capies thereal, and inform (he
sander thal you have delated (he e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereol. Thank you

From: Mel Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 May, 2019 2:06 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Vic (LKKAuto); CS A Team; Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GX6144U (Ol : CTI- TBA) and 5JX2742] (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI19009132/Bha3) on 15/05/2019

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE"
SAVE AS TOD COSTS
Dear Sir /Madam,



We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle S)X 2742) at M/s Guan Motor Works - Sin Ming on a WP basis and TP repairer
proposed for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- TP GIA report

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 o055 | emuil: MeiKwan @lkkauto.com | fux: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | §{408033)



Attn: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Sir/ Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO GX 61441 AND SJX 2742)

ALONG BLOCK 7 TECK WHYE AVENUE CAR PARK ON 15/05/2019,

We understand that yvou are the insurer of GX 6144U vehicle.

I/'We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle SJX 2742] have been completed repairs 1o
my/lour satisfaction by M/s GUAN MOTOR WORKS. I/'We therefore propose to claim
from vou as follows:

I.  Costof Repairs 52500 -00
2. Loss ol Bsa/Rental(SS 100 x G days) 55 ©o0.00
3 LTA Search Fee/Ghr Repesia S5% = Aa
4, Others 55 -
TOTAL ss_9,\0%. 49

Please let us have your reply soonest possible,

Thank you.

Yours faithfully

-



I %=
- . _ - Consultanls
Bl BEA = Ple (id

21 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAN (165) 67414108

Our Ref: CC6/CTI19009132/Bhal

24/06/2019

M/S FORTUNER MARINE PTE LTD
69B Tuas South Ave |

Seatown Industnal Centre

Singapore 637501

Dear SirMadam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GX61440U AND SJX2742J ON 15/05/2019

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Lid 1o resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third-Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
Jimmy

Case Handler
DID: 6841 2928

FAX: 6741 4108
Email: jimmychenf@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
(Mator Claims Dept)



AUTHORISATION TO ACT

I'We, AIRVEH AUTO (“the third party claimant”) of BLOCK 181 BISHAN STREET 13
#04-255 SINGAPORE 570181 (address), owner of SJX 2742] (vehicle no.) hereby
authorize GUAN MOTOR WORKS (“the workshop”) to act for me with respect to my
claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no. SJX 2742]
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 15/05/2019 (date) along
TECK WHYE AVENUE (location) mvolving vehicle no/s GX 6144U (“the accident™).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they
deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to sertlement of
my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of GUAN MOTOR WORKS.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers

of the other vehiclefs is concerned.

4
Dated this 'l I [My}uFJS_F{mnnth}lﬂﬂ (year)
N~

Signed by “the third party claimant” Signed by “the workshop”
(with chop if applicable) - (with chop)




NOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VCUCHER

e ——— = - _———————

folicy H: :+ DMCYSN30G0551800 Sleim Mo : SWM19D202202ZC03/4 lock]
clesmart @ AIRVEH ATTO

Rmount : %83,107.49 §
SINGAPDORE DOLLARS THREF THOUSAKD ONE HUHDRED S3SEVER AND

ZENTS FORTY NINE QRLY
1/¥a agras to accept the above menticrned aTount to bLe psic Lo pefus An fyll &
fFinal set=leren= oFf sl claims, costs & Aisbursepsnze 2or irjurics / damagea
sustalred by me/us =hreujh an sccidant invelwing

Claimans Yehizle Ma. : S3% 27427

Insiyras Vahicle No. | GX €1447
Date of Loss : 15.05.2019
Place of ACTident i TECE WEYE AVERNUE

IN¥ CONSIDEZRTION of the paynent cade to mefus of the aforementioned aum oy
CEINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORZ! PTE. LTD.. I/We agrss sbsclutely o
discharge CHINA TATPING INSUBANCE (SINGRFORE' PT2 LTD, and/ec

Iasursd Hane t H/a FORTUMER MRRINE PTE LID
Driver Hame 1 TAN FIAM SCCH

from all claims, pressnt or fuzure in respess of wll Ioss, Injury or damage
sastained by me/us srising out of the sald accider:,

1 ackrowlsdge that this payzent 13 made wishout sdsiss_cr of liablility on the
part of CHINA TACPING ZHSURANCE {SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1} Geaneral Damages 5&
{2) Cost o7 Repalz/Excsaa 5% 2, 500.00
{3] Loss =f Usa/Rental/Eacming 55 EOG. G0
(4] SIA/Folics Raports/
Investigation Fesulte/Searsh Fees 35 T:49
(5 Madical Report:/Expersss 55
(6] Barvey Fees/F.T Faas 1)
(7] Cast incloding Disbursemant 35
PAPRL s s & 5 4 b i dlaaai d e v B8 3,107.48

Ciaimant Mama i Fh“j&“ H«"Tﬂ HEIC Re 1 ﬂ;(‘ﬂw

o

. l
Signature ! Date : 1 JI v
| T
L]

=hiddsduld patts bralalog FROC L4l

1u|{"



RE % R
GUAN MOTOR WORKS

Business Regn, Me: 081 026-00E
176 Sin Ming Drive #02-03 Sin Ming Autocare Singapore 575721 Tel: 6453 6111 HP 9742 6003

AIRVEH ALTO

Wesary

Invoice No: 4997

2-07-2019
Dare

TOYOTA VIOS - SIX 2742 1

Lump sum for total repair cost inclusive ol spare

parts and labour charges.
$ 2.500.00

Dollars Two thousand Five hundred only.

E.&O.L.




AIRVEH AUTO

BLK 181 BISHAN STREET 13 #04-255 5(570181)

Reg No: 53355380W
GREEMENT

C T

e otmte oo HYUNDA [ AVANTE STTI%89F

HIRER'S NAME (AS PERNRICK =\ (e ™) e 2a kesond
NRICIPASSPORT NO.: C8Y2$Bi1éL
DRIVINGLICENSENO.. o g ) c @ 76 1
ADDRESS: Bl 660 Tupara g st ST.LY H#o2-364 (S) 6?366‘5
CONTACT NO.:
B/313152
RENTAL DEPOSIT: NIL
DATE/TIME OF COMMENGE: 1+ MAY 19 0900 h-
EMAIL: NIL
RENTAL PER DAY:
8 loo
BANK/ ACCOUNT NO.:
L
CONTRACT VAILDITY: .
23 Y19 (0,c04M
VEHICLE MILEAGE: | 30k
= g = . REMARKS:

N 1) g ——)

L ™ 1

LoD, "

- F'=_""_—""'¢_1 —1

Or0ENT S=SCRATCHES C=CHIPE R=RUST M=SASSING




AIRVEH AUTO INVOICE

Reg. No. 53355380W invoice No 20189170501
Fal =A% AdAY SOTS lwoice Dale. 1T May 2010

Emad mrveh auto@gmall com

BILL TO:
Guan Motor Works
176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-03 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore S5T5T21
Tel; «65 64538292

6 days car rental from 17 May 2018 1o 23 May 2018 $600.00
(Hyundai Avante SJT 3480E) Per day. 5100

TOTAL $600.00



e W W il W mnam i WP i ) L

Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information { Vehicle No, GX6144U As At 15 May 2019 / 19:45:00

)

Law Firm Search Details

Search Reason: Insurance claim inrelation to trathe accident
Law Flam Case Mo TCEMWITLTAZ0 1S G

Current Cwner Detalls

Owner 1D Type. Company

Qwrigr 10 2008056200

Owrier Name: FORTUNER MARINE PTE LTD,

Regletared Address Type: Frivate Residentdal [Conco Aoror House) / Shopping / Offce Complexe:
::flitrm Rlack/ House 898

Regitared StrestName:  TUAS SOUTHAVENUEZL
Regilsterad Unlt Nou .

Reglotered Bullding Mame: SEATOWHN INDUSTRIAL CENTRE
Reg'stered Posta| Code:  AI7S0:

Current Vehicle Detalls

Vanicle No: CxE1 440
Mgka Description/™odal: TOYOTAS ITEACE SDH

Insurance Company Mame: CHINA TAIRING INSURANCE (SINGAPQREI PTELTD



