8PALN1A. PARF/COF Rahata Fnoiry
> Back to OneMotoring
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars }
~ Owner ID Type: LTS Company J
" Owner ID: 5369K }
Vehicle Details :
| Vehicle No.: SHBS5515T e b S S
Vehicletobe Exported: Pt Ea e [ R s st
Intended Deregistration Date: 23 May 2019 B Pyl e i
Vehicle Make: Lty TOYOTA
| Vehicle Mode: PRIUS HYBRID 1.8 CVT
Primary Colour; Maroon
| ManufacturingYear: 2017 BT
EngineNo: e . __ 2ZRS098063 AR
" Chassis No: 7 _ JTDKB3FU103572935 W |
__ Maximum Power Output: 90.0 kW (120 bhp) |
| OpenMarket Value: Vil S i) $29,007.00 i
__ Original Registration Date: 120ct2017 il
_ FirstRegistration Date: 120ct 2017 k!
| Transfer Count: o ) — : - WEri, e 1L AESR Iy I R R DY e
| Actual ARF Paid: T L e $5,000.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details 5 ] u
 PARF Eligibility: ] Yes
. PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: ¢ 110ct2025 ey s
PARF Rebate Amount: T e S = l
' Intended COE Rebate Detalls *
{ SOTPaNNE e T A _ 110ct2025 i s
| COECategory: T ___A-Carupto 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp) w el R
COE Period(Years): 8 i
__PQP Paid: iy $3405200 .’
| COE Rebate Amount: $27,166.00 T
| Total Rebate Amount: $30,916.00 ]

|__Message

vehicle reaches its statutory s statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 23 May 2019
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Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis) <YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, November 29, 2019 9:40 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: SHB5515T

Hi Steve,

Please refer to the purchase value as per your request..

Thanks & Regards
Poh Suan

From: Sam Kwok Kok Meng (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr)

Sent: Friday, 29 November 2019 9:34 AM

To: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/T. axis)

Cc: Lynn Gan Peh Ling (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr); Timothy Yap Thian Woon (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr)
Subject: RE: SHB5515T

Hi Poh Suan,
The purchase value for SHB5515T will be $86,678.91

Thank you.

Best regards,
Sam Kwok
DID : 68662752

From: Sam Kwok Kok Meng (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr)

Sent: 26 November 2019 09:45

To: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis) <YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Lynn Gan Peh Ling (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <LynnGanPehLingYanPeiling@smrt.com.sg>; Timothy Yap Thian
Woon (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <YapTimothy@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: Re: SHB5515T

Tim,

Pls assist.

Thank you.

Get Outlook for Android

From: Yeo Poh Suan (Auto Svcs/ARC/ARC/Taxis) <YeoPohsuan@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, November 26, 2019 9:26:59 AM

To: Sam Kwok Kok Meng (TPHS/Ops&Maint/Fleet Svr) <samkwok@smrt.com.sg>
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