Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

From: Wong, Justin [Justin.Wong@aig.com]

Sent: Monday, 21 September, 2015 10:52 AM

To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Cc: Joy Irene (LKK Auto); Vic

Subject: #800735005B#023# AIG Ref; Your Ref:CC3/AIG14009556/Kna3 (Accident involving
SGS 6600X and SHD 9875S on 17/05/2014)

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Green category

Dear Bevan,

Since there is no reply from TP claimant and this claim has been stagnant for more than 1 year.
We will close our reserves on our end and you may also close the file on your side.

Please keep us updated should TP does decide to continue with the claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Justin Wong

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1880 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416
Justin.Wong@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and
any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) [mailto:bevanlim@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, September 09, 2015 5:20 PM

To: SSAUTOEXPRESSCLAIMS - Singapore; Samsuri, Zuhaidah

Cc: Joy Irene (LKK Auto); Bevan Lim (LKK Auto); Vic

Subject: Your Ref: 800735005,0ur Ref:CC3/AIG14009556/Kna3 (Accident involving SGS 6600X and SHD 9875S on
17/05/2014)

Your Ref: 800735005
Our Ref:CC3/AlIG14009556/Kna3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident involving SGS 6600X and SHD 9875S on 17/05/2014

We refer to the above subject claim.



We received this assignment for third-party claim and have surveyed TP client vehicle since 19.05.2014.

To date, we still have not receive TP’s Letter of Demand (LOD) with all its supporting claim documents
such as the final repair bill/tax invoice, rental receipt and LTA search document.

Since it is almost one (1) years outstanding and no effort of follow-up and further action being made by TP
repairer, we would like to close file on our end and submit our wp report to your good-office.

In future, if TP would still want to pursue their claim, we will inform you for our further handling.
Please advise if we may proceed.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-6051 | email: bevanlim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.



