Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Cheok, Lee Wai <Cheok.Leewai@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 4:55 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: #800735005B#023# AIG Ref; Your Ref:CC3/AIG14009556/Kna3 (Accident involving SGS

6600X and SHD 9875S on 17/05/2014)

Dear Asher,

We refer to your email.

Kindly proceed to resolve the matter on liability at 50% and update us of developments.
| have re-opened the case in Merimen.

Regards,

Kathlyn Cheok

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +64191880 | Fax +68357416
cheok.leewai@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards. Click
here to find out more

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 4:34 PM

To: Yong, Ivy-AV <lvy-AV.Yong@aig.com>; Cheok, Lee Wai <Cheok.Leewai@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: [REOPEN] 800735005B#023# AIG Ref; Your Ref:CC3/AIG14009556/Kna3 (Accident involving
SGS 6600X and SHD 9875S on 17/05/2014)

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Hi Sir,

We refer to the email dated 30.01.19.



Please kindly if we can process as third party is chasing for settlement.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 30 January 2019 12:33 PM

To: 'Yong, lvy-AV' <lvy-AV.Yong@aig.com>; Cheok, Lee Wai <Cheok.Leewai@aig.com>

Subject: RE: [REOPEN] 800735005B#023# AIG Ref; Your Ref:CC3/AIG14009556/Kna3 (Accident involving SGS 6600X and
SHD 9875S on 17/05/2014)

Hi Kathlyn,
We refer to the email below.
Kindly advise if we can process to offer tp 50% settlement.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Yong, Ivy-AV <lvy-AV.Yong@aig.com>

Sent: Friday, 11 January 2019 9:43 AM

To: Cheok, Lee Wai <Cheok.Leewai@aig.com>

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [REOPEN] 800735005B#023# AIG Ref; Your Ref:CC3/AIG14009556/Kna3 (Accident involving SGS 6600X and
SHD 9875S on 17/05/2014)




Hi Kathlyn,
Justin was the previous case handler.
Kindly take over this case and liaise with Asher from LKK.

Thank you

lvy Yong

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way AIG Building #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +64191637
Ivy-AV.Yong@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

AIG Asia Pacific won General Insurance Company of the Year at the 22nd Asia Insurance Industry Awards. Click
here to find out more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Sent: Friday, January 11, 2019 9:37 AM

To: Gan, Angiegeokling; Yong, Ivy-AV

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: [REOPEN] 800735005B#023+# AIG Ref; Your Ref:CC3/AIG14009556/Kna3 (Accident involving SGS 6600X
and SHD 9875S on 17/05/2014)

Hi Both

Below email from Asher refers.

Matter previously under Justin for our necessary reassignment pls.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan

AlIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd



78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120
Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, January 10, 2019 5:45 PM

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Subject: [REOPEN] 800735005B#023# AIG Ref; Your Ref:CC3/AIG14009556/Kna3 (Accident involving SGS 6600X and
SHD 9875S on 17/05/2014)

Hi Sir,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that TP had submit their LOD for settlement.

As such, kindly assist if we can reopen the matter in our further handling and the case handler for this case.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



