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HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHGP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896
ESTIMATE
RADIAH BINTE OSMAN P Date :19.07.2018
BLK 128 MARSILING RISE \ Vehicle no SIWeas1cC
#09-268 D 2 Make/Model ‘HONDA FIT
5730128 Accident date :08.07.2018
No DESCRIPTION Qty Amount (55)
List Itemns
1 Front bumper . 1 S 503.2-
2 Front bumper side halder @ 53000 F4 5 60
3 Frant bumper reinforcement  pof rde 1 s 2135 ¢
4 Front bumper clips [1set) * y 1 S B0 52
5 Front grille  t&f o4 ' 1 § I5x
6 Front RH head lamp Z AT | S 5521 .
7 Front RH head lamp lip = 1 5 155°
8 Wipertank “ " 1 S 85~
9 Bonnet 1 $ 1100”
10 Bonnet lock 1 g 051 «
g 2908.9
Less 20% Disc -] SB1.78
Total 5 2327.12
Special Nett ltems .
1 Front bumper lower lip Boyp¥ 1 £ 380"
2 Front grille rim 1A S 1 S 880 <N
3 Front number plate s . 1 S 50«
Total s 1280
Labour Cost
1 Remove replace & repair consistent to the accident S -“Bdhr Aa ';-'
2 Respray painting gg ) ¢ _1000 490
3 Tuff kote : S 100~
Total $ 1300
{\ _-—__—h_",_\’ Grand Total 5 5907.12
I
| : il | L2k




Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Jia Le (LKK Auta)

Sent: Monday, 3 June 2019 4:21 PM

To: 'Hua Meng'

Subject: RE: Your Ref: S/W6451C *Our Ref: CS/EGI18012528/Ada3-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SJIPS199A & SJW6451C ON 08/07/2018]

WITH PREJUDIC

Dear Jing Yee,

No DV needed below $20k and we will proceed fo close.
Thank you.,

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jigle@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Hua Meng [mailto:huameng@live.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 3 June 2019 3:50 PM

To: Jia Le [LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SJWB451C *Our Ref: CS/EGI18012528/Ada3-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JP5199A & 5JW6E451C
ON 08/07/2018]

Dear Jia Le
Kindly let us have your DV soonest.
Thanks & Regards

Jing Yee
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, June 3, 2019 1:50 PM

To: Hua Meng

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SIW6451C *Our Ref: C5/EGI18012528/Ada3-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIP5199A & SIwe451C
ON 08/07/2018)

WITH PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter,

We propose settlement at a global sum of $2.000.00{all-in),

Please confim acceplance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@dauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hua Meng [mailto:huameng@live.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 1 June 2019 10:13 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SIW6451C *Our Ref: CS/EGI18012528/Ada3-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JP5199A & SIW6451C
ON D8/07/2018]

Hi lia Le

Please refer to the video, our client is stationary all time while your insured keep reversing his vehicle.
Kindly let us have your offer urgently.
If we cannot reach direct settle, we will pass the matter to solicitor.

Thanks & Regards
Jing Yee
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <Jiale @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2019 11:29 AM

To: Hua Meng

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SIWB451C *Our Ref: C5/EGI18012528/Ada3-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJP5199A & SJWB451C
ON 08/07/2018]

Vithout Prejudi
Dear June,
Attached herewith our insured statement for your reference.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-9108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hua Meng [mallto:huameng@live.co

Sent: Friday, 31 May 2019 11:24 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Your Ref: S/IW6451C *Our Ref: CS/EGI18012528/Ada3-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJP5199A & SIW6451C

ON 08/07/2018]

Hi Jiale



Please let us have your insured report.

Thanks & Regards
June
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <Jiale@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2019 10:59 AM

To: Hua Meng

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Your Ref: SIW6451C *Our Ref: CS/EGI118012528/Ada3-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJP5199A & SIW6E451C ON
08/07/2018]

Your Ref: SIWB451C Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CS/EGI18012528/Ada3-1

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJP 5199A AND SIW 1C ON 08, 201
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear for this matter. Enclosed herewith in this email is a copy of our insured's
accident report for your perusal.

We are in a course of investigating into the circumstances of the accident. After verifying further with our Ol we will
revert with our opinion on the cause of the accident. Kindly do not refer to any party for legal assistance until you
heard further from us.

Meanwhile, we would like to request a copy of video footage/witness statement/scene photos(if any) in order for us
to look into the matter.

We shall revert upon hearing from you.

Thank You.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed f inferred
fram this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially atfect/influence on the issues
of liabllity/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51. Pava Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(a08933)



Cathﬂne Chnna (LKK Auto)

From: Survey Report (ERGOD Insurance Pte. Ltd) <Survey Report@ergo.comsg>
Sent: Tuesday, 10 July, 2018 1:49 PM

To: ‘admin-d@ikkauto.com’

Cc ASSIGNMENTS@LEKAUTO.COM

Subject: Ol ; SJP5199A / TP : SIWB451C/LKK / DOA : 08.07.2018

Attachments; SIPS199A - SAS. pdl: SIWE451C - SAS.pdf; SJWE451C - PRS FORM pdf
Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 20167 in regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”

Plaage ascist to conduct this survey from HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP,

ADDRESS ¢ 1 KAKIBUKIT AVE B BLKC
#01-61 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883

PERSON TO CONTACT ¢ JUNE @ 6746 5519 / 6747 8064

ERGO OFFICER-IN-CHARGE : ST

Note: To survey on without prejudice basis. Please advise the consistency of demages to third party vehicle.
Dbtain estimote from workshop and inform the repairer In writing, that you are require to conduct a re-survey
before vehicle is returned to claimont, They ore to contact your office directly. Pleose do keep us in the loop,

itease fill up the necessary on ERGO PRS Form from workshop and return to us together on your update of the survey
statis via Survey.Repont @ergo.com.sg.

Attached are insured's and third party’s SAS (note: reports not to be released to any Third Party). No estimates was
provided.

Kingly acknowledge receipt of this email,

£5aras
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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAULD)

sSent: Friday, 13 July 2018 4:55 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto), ‘Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pre. Ltd.)
Ce: assignments; SUR

Subject RE: SJPS199A / TP - SIW6451C/LKK / DOA - 08.07.2018

[ear Pas Li,

please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIW 6451C on 10/7/2017
wa are pending estimate from repairer.

[le4t Regards,
Cenise Tay | Case Hardlr
LK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Agre: (156-3581 | emad: denoetayE®kiguto.com | fas 8256-431%
L 5], Maya Uibd industrial Paek LIk Avenue 1, 502-2% | 51408933)

Fram: Admin-D [LKKAutD)

Sent: Tuesday, 10 July 2018 1:57 PM

To: ‘Survey Report [ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.)' <Survey Report@ergo.com.sg>
Ce: assignments <assignments @lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SIPS199A /TP : SIWG451C/LKK / DDA : 0B.07.2018

Daar Pel LL
Thank you for the assignment.

st Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LK Auto Consultanis Ple Lid

Fhome ne41-8a34 | emall: asslgnments@Ikkauto.com | frx: 6256-4315
Wik =1, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ui Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408914)

From: Survey Report (ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.) [mailto:Survey. Report@ergo.com.sg)
Sent: Tuesday, 10 July, 2018 1:49 PM

To: ‘admin-d@lkkauto.com’ <admin-d @|kkauto.com>

Ce: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Subject: Ol : SIPS199A /TP : SIWBE4A51C/LKK / DOA : 08.07.2018

Dear Catherine/Nivitha,

In compliance with “State Courts Practice Directions Amendment No.1 of 2016" In regards to the Pre Repair Survey,
both TP repairer and ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd have agreed on your company LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD to be
the “Single Joint Expert”.

Blease assist to conduct this survey from HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP.



Shu Pei !I.KKAuto‘j

From: Steve Lim <stevelim@ergo.comsg>

Sent: Thursday, 23 May 2019 10:42 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Jeannie Cheng

Ce ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuta); Admin A, Jia Le
(LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: ERGO INSURED:SJP 5199 A OUR REF:SJW 6451 C D.0.A:08.07.2018 - ERGO REF:
DSMPC1801330

Attachments: Ol report. PDF

Hi Ml Kwan,

Attached
Stawa Lim
..... M Lo
ERGO Insurance Pre. Lid
4dl? el : o

. ERGO

EMAIL DISCLAIMER

The information contained in this email communication is confidential. You should only read, disclose, re-iransmil, copy, distibube, aci in reflance an or
commercialize the information if you are authorized fo do so. If you are not the Intended recipient of this emall communicalion, please notify the sender by
replying 1o the email and destroy any elecironic or peper copy of this message

Any views expressed in this emall communication are those of the indhvidual sender, ERGO Insurance Ple. Lid, does nol represent, warrant or guarantes ihat
ihe integrity of Ihis communication has baen maintained or thal the communication is free of arrors, vires or inlerference

ERGO Insurance Pl Lid. asserts copyright in respect to this emall including any attachment. Mo part may be reproduced by any process or for any purpose
withoul prior wrillen permission

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 23 May, 2019 9:36 AM

To: Jeannie Cheng; Steve Lim

Cc: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A; Jia Le (LEK Auto)
Subject: RE: ERGO INSURED:SJP 5199 A OUR REF:SJW 6451 C D.0.A:08.07.2018



SAVEAS TO COSTS
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter,

Please provide us 01 G1A and claim ref for our necessary action.

Thiamk vou,

Hest Regarls,

Med Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6306 o055 | ematl: MeiEwan@[kkouto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Pava Ubl Induostreial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 22 May, 2019 6:09 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ERGO INSURED:SJP 5199 A DUR REF:SJW 6451 C D.0.A:08.07.2018

Dear MeiKwan

Enclosed document for your necessary action.
Kindly let us have the update.

Thanks & Regards

June
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop

Virus-free www avg com
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HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

AUTOBAY @ KAKIBUKIT

1, Kaki Bukit Avenus 6 Bik C #01-34/#01-61, Singapore 417883 o
Tal:ETITWH.ETﬂESH! Fax: 6743 4896 H/P: 9666 9680
Rog. No. 2S4STE/00M
m-:.‘;:nml

Your Ref :
19 .1t -
Our Raf Date:. q Lﬂrr
Attn: Motor Claims Dept
ENT L07. IN W 1 C & SIP5199
PAR 9

With regards to the above, we are writing on behalf of the registered owner of vehicle W 6451C
which was involved in the above mentioned accident.

We are informed that the above accident was caused solely by the negligence of your insured
vehicle SIP 5199 A .As a result of the accident, our clie at's vehicle was damaged and our client
had Instructed us to submit his claims for loss and expenses, particulars of which are follows:

1) Repair cost s 1,800.00
2) Loss of rental-5120 X 03days 5 360.00
3) LTA search s 7.49

Total 5 2,167.49

We hereby enclosed herewith the following documents for your conside ration of the above claim.

a) Final Repair Bill Of SIW 6451 C ¢) LTA SEARCH
b} GIA report & i d) Owner / Driver NRIC & Driving Licensa
J} HH rl‘
e SPRAY PANTING WORKSHO?
L ﬂﬂﬂﬂ“‘l‘ﬂw BUKIT
SHGAPORE 417883

g 34
‘[M;Tﬂﬁ“ﬂ FAX: 6743 4030

Yours faithfully,
HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP



ORISATION TO AGT

I/We, Radiah Binle _ggrman (*the third party claimant”) of
BLE 13§ WAEOLING R\SE 30048 5130128 (address),
owner of 53w €451 C_ (vehicle no.) hereby authorise Mmm
(“the workshop") to act for me with respect to my claim for repair costs and/or

rantal and/or loss of use ("claim") for my vehicle no. <jw €451 € that was damaged pursuant
to the accident which occurred on o807 3018 _(date) slong _Carpark of Junedion 9§

(location) Involving vehicie no/s _SIE 5199 A __ (“the accident”).

| further authorize the workshop to settla my above mentioned claim ina manner that they deem
fit and the workshop is further authorized to recelve payment further to sattlement of my claim
with payment cheque/s being made In favour of the workshop.

|fuﬂhummﬂmlmmmmmmwmmunmwrum:wﬁm

prejudice and without admission of liabllity basis Insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other
vehicle/s Is concerned.

pated this__|__(day) of 0} (month)20_'%_year)

B Y oo B K
HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHT
AUTDBAY @KAKI BUKIT

I\/AI P | KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #01-34 SINGAPORE 41TC
AL, 4 6747 8004, 6746 5518 FAX: 6743 4
Signed by "the thind party claimant™ signed by “the workshop"

(with company stamp if applicable) (with company stamp)



I S .
HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

AUTOBAY @ KAKIBUKIT
1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 BIk C #01-34/4#01-61, Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 Fax: §743 4896 H/P: 9666 9680
‘Ang. No.: 26467R/00M

Your Ral :
30/10/2018
Cur Ref Date:
VEHICLE NO SIWB451C
MAKE / MDDEL ‘HONDA FIT
NAME -RADIAH BINTE OSMAN
ADDRESS -BLK 128 MARSILING RISE
#09-268
5730128
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR VEHICLE NO:SIW 6451 C
TO SUPPLY AND REPLACE PARTS, LABOUR CHARGES FOR S 1,B00.00
REPAIRING, KNOCKING, WELDING AND TO RESPRAY PAINTING
{LUMP SUM REPAIR)

SINGAPORE DOLLARS:ONE THOUSAND AND EIGHT HUNDRED ONLY



‘h‘ DAWN ENTERPRISES
21 E'EI.ETHRWEST

SINGAPORE 796125
5333 2661 FAX: 6484 2836
NO, £3U0S/000
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Land TransponRAurhoriry

] Land Transport Autharity
10 Sin Ming Drive

Singapore 575701 _

GST Registration No, : M4-00065629-2
Print Date/Time : 08 Jul 2018 / 14:57:30
Receip! Date/Timea : 09 Jul 2018 / 14:5730

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Rocaipt No. : [TNET-00000-1B0TOR-001569

Previous Recelpl No. :
/N lHem Dascription/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Referonce Before Amount AferGST
No. GST (53) 5%) (%)

Raesult of Insurance Enquiry - SJP5188A
As at 0B Jul 201816:50:00
Insurance Co; ERGO INSURANCE FTE. LTD,

| Insurance Enquiry - SJPS188A
Enquiry Fae 7.00 049 TAS
201B0709145608480440

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 748
Total Before Rounding 7.00 D40 740
Rounding Difference 004
Total Amount Payable TAB
Pald By
Diroct Debit eNETS Dabit

201BOTOE 45823TEE 0 Banking) TAS
Total 745
Cash Change a.00
Tandersd Amount TAS
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAYT

Ploase ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the paymant service
provider | finencial Institution. Otherwise, the transaction and roceipt is consldored vaid and late fee
may apply.

Print Receipt OK Save as POF
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Ada ma = P Lt Company Registration No. 189607 158R

0L AVE § mu2-25 PAYA UM INDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL - (0463) 62563581 FAX : 065 62581315

To : M/s ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Date: 27/06/2019

THI DIRECT LE T

\ SJP 51984 (Insd Veh) |Your Ref. No. : DSMPC1801330
Vehicle No. — —
SJW B451C (TP Veh) |Our Ref. No.: CS/EGI18012528/Ada3q2-1
Date of Accident B/rr2018
Liability 100%
Final Repair Cost % 1,800.00
Loss of Use g days
Rental (if any) _|'$ S0000) 3dcays
Others: ‘% 7.45 B
]

2,107 .45
Final Setllement Sum |+ § 2,000,00 |GLOBAL SUM
Remarks e
P i i k

1) |HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

2,000.00

JOANNE LEE

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Ingustrial Park. Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg Mo: 189607188R GST Reg. No 18-9607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobiie

ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD Ref : CS/EGI18012528/Atbn2
0wt SUNTES TONER A
#04-01 SUNTEC TOWER FIVE Date: 26-10-2018
SINGAPORE 038985
Code: EGI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SJP 51994 Veh. Inspected SJW B451C
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SJP5198A/SA/p Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From YEE PEI LI Assign Date 10/07/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA FIT c.c 1339
Engine No, HIDDEN Year of Req. 2008
Chassis No. GEB1052338 Colour WHITE
Odometer 148194 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185/55R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/55R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/55R15 BRIDGESTONE B mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/55R15 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date DB/OT/2018 Inspection Date 10/07/2018
Survey held at HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WKSP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-61 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
Sa, Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5h. Estimate Days of Repair

[ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 201-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6258 15681 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No 199607188R GST Reg No. 18-9607198-R Page No. 1 0f 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJW 6451C
' ; Estimate By | Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition | "Sima l{l} ':1}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 50320 503.20
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER @$30.00 NECESSARY 60.00 80.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT NOT NECESSARY 21350
1|SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY £0.00 30.00
1|FRONT GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 75.00
1|FRONT RH HEADLAMP CRACKED 552.10 552 10
1|FRONT RH HEADLAMP LIP NECESSARY 155.00 155.00
1|WIPER TANK DEFORMED 95.00 95.00
1|BONNET TO REPAIR SEE 1,100.00
LABOUR
1|BONNET LOCK NOT NECESSARY 85.10
LESS 20% DISCOUNT 58178 -279.06
232712 1.116.24
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP (SN) TO REPAIR SEE 380.00
LABOUR
1|FRONT GRILLE RIM (SN) cuT 850,00 380,00
1|FRONT BUMPER PLATE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00
1,280.00 380,00
LABOUR
REMOVE, REPLACE & REPAIR CONSISTENT TO THE 1,200.00 400.00
ACCIDENT. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF BONNET AND
FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP
RESPRAY PAINTING 1,000.00 400.00
TUFF KOTE. NOT NECESSARY 100.00
2,300.00 800.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,907.12 2,296.24

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18012528/Atbn2
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RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1,800.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/EGI18012528/Atbn2

% g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M MATAI
Licensed Appraiser

ISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s msds salaly far the use and banefll of the Clend named on the fron) page of this Aegon.




