Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 1:35 PM

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: SLW8645Z ( ? Photos & after repair photos )
Importance: High

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hui Yang Motor <hui_yang_motor@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 30 May 2019 9:58 AM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SLW8645Z ( ? Photos & after repair photos )
Importance: High

Hi Kenneth

We accept lump sum at $2200.00 & 3 repair days.

Thank you & Regards,

Marco Neo

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, May 30, 2019 9:32 AM

To: Hui Yang Motor

Subject: RE: SLW8645Z ( ? Photos & after repair photos )

Attach finalised for SLW 8645Z. Kenneth

From: Hui Yang Motor [mailto:hui yang motor@hotmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 29 May, 2019 12:35 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Subject: SLW8645Z ( ? Photos & after repair photos )
Importance: High




Hi Kenneth

Pls refer to attached & May i1 have the lump sum repair cost & repair days.

Thank you & Regards,

Marco Neo



