Elaine (LKK Auto)

To: Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com; Motor Claims

Cc: 'sur@lkkauto.com'

Subject: RE: RE: FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R || Our ref:
CLMOMVC000003661

Attachments: GIA Rpt.pdf; LKK photo1.pdf; LKK photo2.pdf; LKK photo3.pdf; LKKAdjustment.pdf;

LKKInspection.pdf; LKKInvoice-YN 9152R.pdf

Dear Kelvyna,

Enclose Survey Report of YN 9152R.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Elaine | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@Ikkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) [mailto:siewsc@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2019 11:56 AM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna; SUR; Reports (LKKAuto)

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: RE: FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R || Our ref: CLMOMVC000003661

Dear Kelvyna,

Thank you for the email.

Please be informed that we are in the midst of preparing report.
Dear Elaine,

Kindly expedite.

Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna <kelvyna.ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 November 2019 11:50 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R || Our ref: CLMOMVC000003661

Hi all,

Is the report ready? We have received the third party claim from YN 9152R.

Thanks
Kelvyna

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: 23 May 2019 3:18 PM

To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@l|kkauto.com>

Cc: assighments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] RE: RE: FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R || Our ref: CLMOMVC000003661

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of YN 9152R.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 May 2019 3:37 PM

To: 'Motor Claims' <MotorClaims@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: RE: RE: FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R || Our ref: CLMOMVC000003661

Resend
Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle is not In the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,



G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 22 May 2019 3:15 PM

To: 'Motor Claims' <MotorClaims@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: RE: RE: FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R || Our ref: CLMOMVC000003661

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

G.Nivitha| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ng, Sharon [mailto:Sharon.Ng@sg.gaig.com] On Behalf Of Motor Claims

Sent: Wednesday, 22 May 2019 2:34 PM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: FW: RE: FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R | | Our ref: CLMOMVC000003661

2" TP claim against GBD8436D

Hi LKK (selected SJE)
Please help to obtain video and conduct PRS.
Regards

Sharon
Great American

From: Tropical Success <tsac303@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, May 22, 2019 1:14 PM




To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: [External] RE: RE: FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R || Our ref: CLMOMVC000003661

The video file is too large to send by email. Do you have mobile no | can whatsapp to you?

After seeing the video, Can you let me know asap to offer settlement?

Regards

Calvin

Tropical Success Auto Care
Blk 5032 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk2
#01-303 S(569535)

Tel: 64817773

From: Tropical Success <tsac303@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, May 22, 2019 12:19 PM

To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] RE: FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R || Our ref: CLMOMVC000003661

Please assign to LKK

calvin

From: Tropical Success <tsac303@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, May 22, 2019 10:16 AM

To: Motor Claims <MotorClaims@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R

Please arrange survey ASAP

Regards

Calvin

Tropical Success Auto Care
Blk 5032 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk2
#01-303 S(569535)

Tel: 64817773

From: Tropical Success <tsac303@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2019 7:19 PM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R

Have you arranged the surveyor?

Regards
Calvin



Tropical Success Auto Care
Blk 5032 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk2
#01-303 S(569535)

Tel: 64817773

From: Tropical Success <tsac303@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, May 17, 2019 8:46 PM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: FW: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R

Dear Kelvyna

So sorry | forgot to attach the report here.

Regards

Calvin

Tropical Success Auto Care
Blk 5032 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk2
#01-303 S(569535)

Tel: 64817773

From: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>
Sent: Friday, May 17, 2019 6:45 PM

To: Tropical Success <tsac303@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Calvin

Please advise date of accident and forward your client’s accident report to us. Appears we do not have record of this
accident.

Thanks
Kelvyna
68046059

From: Tropical Success <tsac303@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, May 17, 2019 5:13 PM

To: Ngian, Kelvyna <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] 3rd party : SFA9928M/GBD8436D/YN9152R

Dear motor claim

Please send us your list of surveyors for 3™ party survey vehicle SFA9928M. Your insured: GBD8436D



Regards

Calvin

Tropical Success Auto Care
Blk 5032 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk2
#01-303 S(569535)

Tel: 64817773
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