
Vic ([KKAuto)

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Claims & [A/Claims & IAI-axis) < Leecek@smrt.com.sg >

Sent: Monday, 1July, 20L9 3:12 PM

To: CS A Team; Admin A
Subject LOD Re: Accident on 77 /5/2079 involving SHB 3825 &SGD4099K(AIG's insured)

Our Ref: TAX/05/19 /207 4 /lg
Attachments: TAX 05 19 2074.pd1

Dear All,

We quantify our claim as followsi

Cost of Repair s29s0.00

Loss of Rental 5794.48 I 7.5 days x 5105.93

Loss of lncome S4s0.00 ( 7.s dayx 560.00

LTA Search Fee S7.oo

Total s4201.48

We enclose the following documents:
L) Repair invoice
2) Proof of rental rate
3) Police/GlA reports
4) Accident vehicle laid-up report
5) LTA search

Our hirer has engaged his own lawyer to claim for his injury only.

Please let us have your offer soon. Thanks.

Regords
Tan Lee 6ek (DID: 6866 2647)
CIoims Deportment
SMRT Automotive Sarvices Pte Ltd

4smnrw --;UE;&ilE
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FOK JUN HENG       By Post & By Email 
126 HOLLAND GROVE VIEW 
SINGAPORE 276280 
 
 
 
 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
OUR REF : CC3/AIG19008977/Jha3 
YOUR REF : SGD 4099K 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGD 4099K AND SHB 382S ALONG GHIM MOH ROAD ON 
17.05.2019 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster 
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third 
party claim against your policy.  
 
We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of 
SHB 382S against your motor insurance policy. 
 
Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had 
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as 
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable 
settlement with third party claimant. Unless proven otherwise. 
 
Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD – if any) may be affected as a 
result of the claim against your policy. 
 
We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according 
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your 
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your 
own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.   
 
To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with 
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or 
settlement without AIG’s prior knowledge and consent.  
 
This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any 
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised 
driver may have committed.  
 



In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep 
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).   
 
If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2096 or email us 
at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com.  
 
Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more 
effectively. 
 
 
 
 
Yours sincerely, 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Vic Alpeh 
Case Handler 
DID: 6841 2096 
FAX: 6741 4108 
Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd  
             (Motor Claims Dept) 
 

hgvspore@gmail.com / fabio117@gmail.com   

             (Email) 
 



1

Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 20 August, 2019 5:28 PM

To: hgvspore@gmail.com

Cc: fabio117@gmail.com; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: YOUR REF: SGD 4099K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGD 4099K AND SHB 382S ALONG 

GHIM MOH ROAD ON 17.05.2019

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

20 AUGUST 2019 

                                 

FOK JUN HENG                                                                                                 By Post & By Email  

126 HOLLAND GROVE VIEW 

SINGAPORE 276280 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

OUR REF              : CC3/AIG19008977/Jha3 

YOUR REF            : SGD 4099K 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGD 4099K AND SHB 382S ALONG GHIM MOH ROAD ON 17.05.2019 

 

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor

insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.  

 

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of SHB 382S against your 

motor insurance policy. 

 

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given 

us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to 

negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. Unless proven otherwise. 

 

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD – if any) may be affected as a result of the claim against your 

policy. 

 

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under 

the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) 

arising from this incident, at your own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 

 

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) 

and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AIG’s prior knowledge and 

consent.  

 

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of 

policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.  

 



2

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep you informed of the final 

indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).   

 

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2096 or email us at vicalpeh@lkkauto.com. 

 

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 



I, SMRT TAXIS PIE LTD (the rhird parry claimant") of 60 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL

PARK E4 (5)757705 (address), owner of SHB 3825 (vehicle no.) hereby authorize SM&I
AUTOMOTIYE SERVICES PTE LTD ("the workshop") to act for me with respect ro my claim

for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use ("clairn") for my vehicle no gELl!!2lthat was

damaged pulsuant to the accident which occurred on 17/0512019 (date) along GHIM IVIOII ROAD
(location) involving vehicle no/s SGD 4099K ("the accident").

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit

and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD.

I fufiher acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the ddver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned-

oatea tnis X'6 (day) of

4i;N
,/.:Y. -". \i; [\ lr
\.7'\-\V., /

------37-
Signed by "the thild party claimant"

(with chop if applicable)

Signed by "the workshop"

(with chop)



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

"W"/I, SMRT AUTOMOTM SE ("the workshop") hereby confirm that we/I

have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LEE
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
5S4.000.00 (Global Sum - all in) for vehicle no. SHB 3825 that was damaged pursuant to the

accident which occurred on UlW (date) along GHIM MOH ROAD (location) involving

vehicle no/s @l@[. This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on !@(date) at "the

workshop".

We/I confrrm that we/I arelam authorized by the owner SIMRT TAXIS PTE LTD ("the third party

claimant") of vehicle no. $L3S make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/I have

full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/I enclose herein

the letter of authority given by "the third pady claimant".

We/I further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,

loss and/or expense that they will or have already incured in the event that "the third party claimanf'

after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses

suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to $!
@(vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/I confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of "the

third palty claimant" pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Datedthis -XL(aav) or-,&.s+Ut- lmonth) 2019 (year)

(l

Signed by appointed surveyor workshop" (with chop)

"' This Orscharge Voucher applies only lo lhe claimanl's clairn

or hjs propeny damage and will not alfecl his pelsonal

rnjuries claim and/or unirsured losses clsim in a laler dai..

Flrher, the setllement lerms herein sho0id nol b€ used as

an evidence lo preiudice lo lhe claimanls peBonal iniurirs

claim and/or oiher lninsured losses clairn arisinq of the

s,rbjcct mallar in lhis eclion.
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Customer Code | 3000063

SMRT TAXIS PTE ITD

BIock Unit

60 WOODIANDS INDUSTRIAI, PARK E4
SINGAPORE 75]705

BURI Alrt@otlv. S6leicer Dte ltd
251 Nortn B.idgE RErd alnEqDsc 179102
T.l: 55 533U000 

' 
:.: 55 633,!021?

trax Inwoice
GST Beg No. :
CRN :
Invoice No. .'

Date :
Vehicle No. :
Your Ref No. :
Our Ref No- :
Terms :

MR-8500001-7
.L99004280Z

rv19060 0337
19.06,2019
sHB382S
rP;d. / 05 / L9 / 207 4

24L01548
30 Days

{€.cEIYE}

LC?
a o u,t zo$ LL

Description

Remark :

Make/Model : TOyOTA pRrUS
Aceident Date ! 1?.05.2019

ll.8. Prlll!.tlt tg, ch6qu. .hou1d b. closled .trd
r.da !r!y.bl. to I S!G.l luteoiLv. g.re1ca. ptc IJtd , ,
lgo r.c.lpt rIlI ba i,.r!r€d rml.e.! r-qu€lteat.

Add / (Dlacount) Irloutrt

2, 950.00

GRAND TOTAI $ 2, 950. OO

Authorised Signature
for SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd

LUMP SUM MOUNT FOR REPAIR
AS PER SURVEYOR' S RECOMMENDATION

1.00

Paqe 7/1 E. & 0.E



lA cnrlrlt
-JVJ""I'
SMRT Taxls Pte Ltd

To: Claims Dept

From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd

MEMORANDUM

Our Ref:

Date:

TN<lqslt9/2074

3U512019

I
ACGIDEilT INVOLVING SHB3E2S AIttD scD4o99l( Ottt 17t5t2l01g
9:55 Ail ALONG GHllf, MOH ROAD ToWARDS GOMMONWEALTH
AVENUE WEST.

This is to conrirm that the daily rental rate for SHB 3825 is $105.93
Per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident.

SMRTTAXIS PTE LTD

for Manager
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