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¥ V.4 Auto
E .E_:‘ _,E“:}' Consultants
aome Fie-Lid Company Registration No. 199607198R

S URIAVE 1. #02-25 PAYA UBLINSDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (651 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your ref; 19/19/19/VC05/021773 Date: 07.08.2019
Our ref: CC6/LPC19008915/Ahb3

The Motor Claims Department
M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam.
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. GBG 7341)
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 17.05.2019
at the premises of M/s NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 5,849.60
Revised Estmate Amount 1 5% 2,731.47
"Check” Items Amount : 8% -
Market Value : 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -
Nett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
Front N/S Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4  days

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING
Licensed Appraiser



PARF COE Rebate Enguiry

E

> Back to OneMotoring

nquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Cwner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle MNao..

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date
Vehicle Make:

Viehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year

Engine Mo.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amaount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Company
454008

GRG7341)

Yes

08 May 2019

MISSAN

NV200 1.5 MT ABS AIRBAG
2WD DR ESW/RC

Silver

2017

K9KCA00D057454
WESKYBAMZDZ0148311

$20,11%.00
12 Oct 2017
12 Oct 2017
&

£1,006.00

No

£0.00

110ct 2027

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

£42.801.00

$34.240.00
£34,240.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 May 2019

lofl

OK

hitps; vrlha, gov.sg avrl action enquire RebateByPublicBefore.

B/5/2019, 1:02 pm
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Sketch Plan #4
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348 1 b R AL AT PN 3]
NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE. LTD.

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk C #01-43 Autobay@Kaki Bukit, Singapore 417883
Email: admin@nhtmotorcom  Website: www.nhtmotor.com
Tel: 6747 9241 Fax. 6741 7276
UEN: 201718370K

EZ SWIFT CAR RENTAL & LEASING PTE LTD 16/05/2019
Blk 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-43
Singapore 417883

| !{("
Accident date: 08/05/2019 'x
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: GBG7341) NISSAN NV200 1.5 M 17

CHASSIS: VSKYBAM20Z0148311

S/n Qty Items/ Nett U/price Amount
1 T Front L/H Head Lamp b 5486.40 ~
2 1  Front L/H Head Lamp Bracket Moy Mo~ $248.60 <
3 1  Front Bumper Tor/“ $589.70
4 10 Front Bumper Clip s 56.50 $65:00 2 0
5 1  Front L/H Bumper Side Retainer /A1~ $35.20
6 1  Front L/H Bumper Top Side Cover D¢ *__ o $362.20
7 1 Front L/H Fender oo olfgh $564.80
8 1  Front L/H Fender Cowling PANY, $122.00
9 6 Front L/H Fender Cowling Clip .\ #v&4s $6.50 $39.00 ¢
2068:20 - T
“ Subtotal :- 2, .90
PR
S/n Qty Items /Special Nett U/price Amount
10 1 Front L/HHubCap Ced™ $186-70— 60
11 1 FrontL/HTyre  HMof pdr $350.00 ¥
Subtotal :- $536.70

4



Labour charges

To check wheel alignment
To check wiring

Tuff kote

Panel beating

Spray painting

Ly
tha B
= Mo | 5
» Supp i
j§sub 3 '
Acknowledged by Repaires
Signature:
Dade:

L UTVEY

rveyed and

nce Company

g0 $1,20000 SV

Subtotal :- $2,800.00

$5,849.60

otal . 27304T
L/g « Q¥

OL;_WS .

Total:-




Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

————e ==
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 May 2019 10:42 AM
To: Shu Pei (LEKAUto)
Cc: MT _Claim_SG; Joy lrene (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB3746C (O : LPC - TBA) AND GBGT7341)
(TP : LKX REF - CCE/LPC19008915/Ajb3) on 08.05.2019 [External Confidential]
Attachments: 22052019103658 pdf
Our Ref : 19/19/19/VC05/021773
Dear Shu Pei,

Attached copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Aside to Joy Irene — Please assess liability before proceeding with
Direct Settlement as our insured is claiming against the third party.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all @& lonpac.com.sg

Lanpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 22 May, 2019 9:35 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Joy Irene {LKKAuUto)

Subject; Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBB3746C (01 : LPC - TBA) AND GBG7341] (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/LPC19008915/Ajb3) on 08.05.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Year Sir f Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Ve have inspected TP vehicle GBG 7341] at M/s Chew Motor Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed fora
direct settlement.



Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

linclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GlA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Our case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409.

Thank vou.

Bost Regards

Shu Pei| admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ui industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



y i LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

‘._’; :; ; 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 198607 198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Ref : CCE/LPC19008915/Ahb3n2
#17.04107 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 100565 Dele:  27-08-2019 I, ”‘I‘l”l"”l"”l‘ " |‘|
Code: LPCZ
15 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GEB 37460 Veh. Inspected GBG 73414
Policy No. Z19VC05001466 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. 19189190 COS/021773 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 17/05/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN NVZ0OD c.c 1461
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req. 2017
Chassis No. VSKYBAM20Z0148311 Colour SILVER
Odometer 35885 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |175/70R14C GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Front Tyre |175/70R14C GOODYEAR 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |175/70R14C GOODYEAR & mm
L/H Rear Tyre 175/70 R14C GOODYEAR & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  08/0%/2010 Inspection Date 17/05/2019
Survey held at NEW HOCK TECK MOTOR PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6 #01-43 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAFPORE 417883
Sa. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBG 7341J

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R (ST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page No.:1 of 1

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

aty Description of Parts Condition ::wm}:?:n O ";{';j}“m"
E MENT OF RT.

1|FRONT L/IH HEAD LAMP CcuT 486 40 486 .40
1|FRONT L'H HEAD LAMP BRACKET NMOT NECESSARY 248 .60 -
1|FRONT BUMPER TORMN 589.70 589.70
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIP @3%6.50 MECESSARY 65.00 30.00
1|FRONT L/'H BUMPER SIDE RETAINER MECESSARY 35.20 35.20
1|FRONT L'H BUMPER TOP SIDE COVER DEFORMED 362.20 362.20
1|\FRCNT L/H FENDER DENTED 564 80 EB4 80
1|FRONT L/H FENDER COWLING MNOT NECESSARY 122.00 -
G6|FRONT L/H FEMDER COWLING CLIP @$5.59 NOT NECESSARY 39.00 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT - -206.83
251250 1,661.47

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT L/H HUB CAPR (SN) cuT 186.70 60.00
1|FRONT L/H TYRE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 350.00 -
836.70 B0.00

LABOUR

TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 150.00 80.00
TO CHECK WIRING. 100.00 30.00
TUFF KOTE. MOT MECESSARY 150.00 -
PANEL BEATING. 1,200.00 400.00
SPRAY PAINTING. 1,200.00 300.00
2,800.00 810.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,849.60 2,731.47
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,100.00

Report Ref No, CC&/LPC19008915/Ahb3n2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A MMATAI

Licensed Appraiser




