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Date: 17.05.2019
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INDIA INT'L INS PTE LTD
64 CECIL ST
SINGAPORE 045711

wls]1.
TEL: 6347 6100 wll,alt", .
FAX: 6224 4174/6225 7743

Attn: Motorcycle Claims Dept (Third-party Claim)

Our Client: FBL5028B YAMAHA FZN150

LKK Aut

§ =

0 Consultanty hence notify

+ To display dsranes an

* Pants prices are subwect by confirmation
T

Perd party survey 8 oo & "Witout Prepcics” baas
» Na iisgal modification(s) iy alowed
® EESTTENtEry Aamm 'I.:I musi be [ “

2 Sulpet o fmael approvil rom Insyrance Campany

Acanowledged by Ryparer

Your Insured: SLAB129M Signature:
Accident on: PIE TWDS TUAS 18KM ...
Estimate repair for the abave mentioned motor-cycle:
Original Parts:
NO QTY DESCRIPTION PRICE
1 1PC HEADLIGHT AssY ~ P\ $ 26000 |75
2 1PC METERASSY _ @k, . $ 25000
3 1SET SIGNAL FRONT .~ 0,6 . $ 90.00 -
4 1PC COWLING _ a5 $ 12000 -
5 1PC STAY .~ m'¢ $ 1B0.00
6 1PC HANDLEBAR _- 07. $ 11000
7 1PC LEVERCLUTCH &4 - $ 4500
8 1SET HANDLE GRIP ~ GA $ 5500
9 1PC BAREND 4 $ 8.00 ~
10 1SET MIRROR 4t - $ 6000 -
11 1PC LEVERBRAKE , (7. $ 3200
12 1PC TOP BOX SHAD45 &g . $ 280.00 (Yo (Swv)
13 1PC INNERCOWL , #'$ . 3 80.00 -
Sub-Total $ 1,580.00 iy
less 10% discount $ 158.00
$ 142200 A
Nett Prices Parts:
14 NUMBER PLATE ~ au§ - $ 1500 ~
15 LABOUR $ 30000 2o,
$ 1,737.00
add 7% GST 5 12159
Grand Total $ 1,858.59

Flease contact CK / Ahmad before sending surveyor to our workshop to

assess the damages.
Thank You.

From

CK

Looi's Motor Enterprise Pte Ltd
E-Mail; loois@singnel.com sg




BRI PARFMNF Rehate Famiine

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner ID Type: Foreign Identification Number
Owner ID: 28457
Y1 Y 0 1 .. == S~ == |
Vehicle No.: FBL5028B
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 21 May 2019
Vehicle Make: YAMAHA
Vehicle Model: FZN150
Primary Colour: Black
Manufacturing Year: 2016
Engine No.: G3E3E0040868
Chassis No.: ME1RG1611G2001991
Maximum Power Qutput: -
Open Market Value: $2,359.00
Original Registration Date: 07 Nov 2016
First Registration Date: 07 Nov 2016
Transfer Count: 3
Actual ARF Paid: $354.00
(Elaterded PARE Re Bate DUt e B o,
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
E ntendedCOE REGaTH Dot ST ey S s ) e S P o o W e ]
COE Expiry Date: 06 Nov 2026
COE Category: D - Motorcycle
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Paid: $6,354.00
COE Rebate Amount: $4.740.00
Total Rebate Amount: $4,740.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 May 2019

OK

RRpELITLRE.gov. sgiitanTiacion/anguiraHabatadyH ubkcHalomUuamngIinpul/FLUNC LN _IU=FUd0a0uw | |
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Nivitha 5' LKK Auto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Motor Claim - Ill <motorclaim®@iii.com.sg>

Tuesday, 21 May 2019 9:23 AM

LOOI'S MOTOR, 'sur@Ikkauto.com’; admin-d@lkkauto.com

LOOI'S MOTOR ENTERPRISE PTE LTD; Lalitha Krishnan - Il

RE: FW: ACCIDENT ON 14/05/2019 INVOLVING SLAB129M(III) & FBLS0288

slaB129m_20190517171510.pdf
N-424m3 2 |slin

vihle h
punir® ck

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle FBL5028B and let us have your report urgently.

This claim will be handled by Ms Lalitha.

*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen.

Thank You,

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

@% [nou
Y [nTERNATIONAL
Insurance

Il WA aAarDRI
Jwrring the Fagiom sy (90T
E4 Cecil Street; #05 - 108 Bullding
Singapore 049711

Ted: 6347 6100, Ext— 248

From: LOOI'S MOTOR [mailto:looisworkshop@gmail.com]

Sent: 17 May, 2019 6:06 PM

To: LOOI'S MOTOR ENTERPRISE PTE LTD <loois@singnet.com.sg>
Ce: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iil.com.sg>
Subject: Re: FW: ACCIDENT ON 14/05/2019 INVOLVING SLA8129M(IIl) & FBL5028B

Hi Gabriel Wee,

| would like LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to follow up this case.

Thanks
CK
Best Regards

On Fri, May 17, 2019 at 5:48 PM LOOI'S MOTOR ENTERPRISE PTE LTD <loois@singnet.com.sg>

wrote:
Dear CK,

FYA.



¢ Thank You

R¢gmds

Shawn Lee

From: Motor Claim - III [mailto:metorclaim@iil.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, May 17, 2019 5:23 PM

To: |oois@singnet.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT ON 14/05/2019 INVOLVING SLAB129M(I1T) & FBLS028B

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your letter.
We propose using one of the following motor surveyors:

Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
Autoprobe Consultants

VP Appraisal

Form Team Adjusters Pte Ltd
Infiniti Appraisal Service

JP Knights Adjusters

LBS Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Priority Services

RT Appraisal

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections
to the above list.

Best Regards,

Gabriel Wee



o Inpia
o (=] INTERNATIONAL

INsuranCE
fFiNCGArFrFOoOmnIR
Airving tha rageiun sy § Y

64 Cecil Street; #05 - 10B Building
Smgapore (4971 |

Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed 1o have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers
(located both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry,
including the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing,
handling and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with
applicable laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses,

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification,

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K

Thanks

CK

Best Regards

Looi's Motor Enterprise Pte Ltd
55 kaki bukit pl 416230
Contact: 6743 1072

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including

3



- the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing. handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delaved or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd,

Registration No. 198703792-K



Hsiao Tnna !LKK.Autu}

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Saturday, 24 August 2019 3:30 PM

To: 'LOOI'S MOTOR'

Subject: Your Ref: FBL50288 *Our Ref: CC4/11119008881/Gpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA
B129M(IIl) AND FBL 50288 ON 14/05/2019]

Attachments: Statement of SLAB129M pdf

Your Ref: FBL5028B Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CC4/11113008881/Gpa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA B129M(l1l) AND FBL 50288 ON 14/05/2019
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability Is unclear, Our insured driver reported that your client hit him from behind.
Attached Is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

As per |l instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

*Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liabllity, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phone: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408933)



8242018, Merimen e-Claims

Claim Audit

= AUDIT TRAIL = .
Ma., On Audit Aemarks By
[A]
1 31Mav 2019 cym oul Modified Claimant's Name: ~> KRISHNAMOORTHY IYYAPPAN, Claimant's 10: -> G3332845T. "o
: KWAN
HOW
2 J1MaY 2019 cim veh Model Changed (204385) YAMAHA FZN150 145cc, MEL |
KWAN |
T Reg Mo: FBL50288, Acct Date: 2019/05/14, Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India International J;,L _
3 :s-mr Clm Created Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). TP Insurer; MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Ltd, (HJ). Worksh MET
: op: Looi's Motor Enterprise Pte. Ltd. (HQ) el
[A]
4 ﬂ”gﬂ' 201%  adj o Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): "ME"‘:"‘I"
' KWAN
[A]
| 5 73 Nav 2017 agj Next Rpt Changed  Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2019/05/30 iecso
KWAN
[A]
6 Tana U7 Adj Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Ad] decides. oo
KWAN
[A]
21 May 2018 : i
7 16:08 Label Added (30653): Direct Settlament, ME1
KWAN
[A]
B8 i;;‘:? 2019 agy adjuster Assigned  [None] -> MARCUS CHUA Hhoﬁ?
KWAN
, [A]
g 12W14v 2019 ag) Adjuster Assigned  MARCUS CHUA -> XING GUO QIANG 170
KWAN
from m{i]
| .- 24 Aug 2019 Cur:Req:0.00:PODS Liability: TBA Remarks: Kindly advise If there is any evidence from in
|19 15:31 Adj Mandate Request i Meantime, we are pending for evidence from third party. HS1AD
TONG
Date From 4|F > pateTo 4|73 »] audit Type | None vl o]
ACTIVITY
No record
‘Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History
Bill Rt My Bill Dats Act Type Aot Name TL'*FL: iy, nat | asf 2 Armount
| No billing Mtems

hitps-isingapore matimen com/claims/index cfm?lusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhisloryScassid=8248108axtid=304IBBACFID=5799842... 112



B/3172018 Mermen e-Claims
Print Received Message

This mail is associaled with

*FBL50288 (MPC2019D000049T)
[SLAB129M]
TP

KRISHNAMOORTHY IYYAPPAN
May 14 2018 7:00PM
[CHONG KOK POH]

Loal's Malor Enterprise Pte. Lid,

From india International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (I_SG), sent on 26/08/2019 09:13 AM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - FBL5028B - Claim Handler: Lalitha Krishnan

Maintained:Please note that ID had reported that he was hit on the rear by the TP m/cycle. As such, unless otherwise
proven we should deny liability in this case

hiips:/isingapore. marmen.com/claims/index.cim Husebox=SVCmailfuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=58356924ACFTOKEN=1 2628c04b0a44B45-FETO0,

1M



Hsiao Tnna {LHKAutn!

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 31 August 2019 12:38 PM

To: LOOI'S MOTOR

Subject: RE: Your Ref: FBL5028B *Our Ref CC4/11119008881/Gpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SLA B129M(IIl) AND FBL 50288 ON 14,/05/2019]

Attachments: Statement of SLAB129M pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Further to our below email.

Our insured had reported that he was hit on the rear by the your clinet. As such, unless otherwise proven we should
deny liability in this case.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues
of liability/damages, either party Is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #oz-25 | 5{408033)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 24 August 2019 3:30 PM

To: LOOI'S MOTOR <looisworkshop@gmail.com>

Subject: Your Ref: FBL5028B *Our Ref: CC4/11115008881,/Gpa3 |[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 8129M(IIl) AND FBL 5028B
ON 14/05/2019]

Your Ref: FBL50288B Without Prejudice
Our Ref: CC4/1I119008881/Gpa3

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLA 8129M(Ill) AND FBL 50288 ON 14/05/2019

We refer to the above matter.



" Please be informed that liability is unclear. Our insured driver reported that your client hit him from behind.
Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference.

As per |Il instruction, we would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our
necessary action.

Appreciate an early reply.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the lssues
of llability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsino Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-9197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408937)



Merimen

e-Claims Page 1 of |

..+CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING a
Cane Hotified Est Submmitted Adj Assigned &3 Rt Adj Subimitted Lra Alith'ed Status
|23 Moy 2019 it $41,000.00 | 581,000.00 Puling for ey
il H
e | 2ot act ot | e tstimanes | | _view ez | "w""'lml

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS
| Insured: CHONG KOK POH, [0 57705418
Main .
e ant:  |KRISHNAMOORTHY IVYAPPAN, ID: GI332845T
Vehicle Reg [ 14/05/2013 19:00 - :59
No.: FBLS0288 Date of Los%! | /55 Monthe and 7 Days From LTA Reg Dete (Man Yr]]
Claim Type: | TP / MPC2019D0000497 PoACHICOVET | 1 gMPCO001173
Ushice Rog.
No. SLAB129M m,_ MSD/VMS/15-500B82-WTT
{Insured): '
Exress;
Rugaire- | Lool's Motor Enterprisa Pra. Ltd. (HQ) No 55 Knki Bukit Place, Eunos Techpark, 416230 Kaki Bukit - Tel: 6741 1072
m India International Insurance Pte Lid (HQ) - Tel: E34TE100 .., [Handied by Lalitha Krlshnan - 6347 6139]
1;"’_11:‘:'" MSIG Insursnce (Singapors) Pe, Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +55 6827 7888
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by XING GUO QIANG] ... [Final Rpt due 30/05/201%]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compose Case Mait |
v 11150 (26/08/2019); Alert - Adj Mandate Maintained - FBL5028E - Claim Handier: Lalitha Krishnan

MO resu s

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS—
Due Date  Priorty  Type

View All | Searcn Tasks | Creste New Tusk | Compiete |
Subject Mandler  Assigned By  Completed On  Created On  Oone?

Task Group

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 3/12/2019
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Claim Documents

*FBL50288 (MPC2019D0000497)
[SLAB129M]
T
KRISHNAMODORTHY IYYAPPAN
May 14 2019 7:00PM

[CHONG KOK POH]
Looi's Motor Enterprise Pte. Ltd.
unmun:umnuj Upicad Phatas I l:nmnnn.nr] 'll'lﬂ

‘Photos/Images perpage IV} B4
(%o | Relabel/Reorder | LKX Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |24/08/19 15:27 | General View O | wurc | H
12 |24/08/19 15:27 | Genersl View 0| icavc | H
3 |2408/19 1527 | General View O wurs | &
4 |24/08/19 15:27 | General View 0| edaws | H
5 |24/08/1915:27 | General View Q| adrs | B
6 |24/08/1915:27 | Genersl View Q| wwrs |
7 | 24708018 15:27 | Genersl View @O | wedPs | M
B | 24/08/19 1527 | General View 0| wars | &
& |24/08/18 15:27 | Ganeral View 0 wars | M
in_. 74/08/19 15:27 | Genersl View 0| wars B

11 |24j0B/19 15:27 | Geners! View 0| wawa | M

12 | 24/08/19 15:27 | Genersl View 0D adwc | M

13 |24/08/19 15:27 | General View 0O wuwre A

14 |24/08/189 15:27 | General View 0| edws | B

IS |24/08/1915:27 | General View 0| warcs

16 |24/08/15 15:27 | Geners! View 0| wurs | &

17 | 24/08/19 15:27 | Genersl View D badws | M

18 | 24/08/19 15:37 | General View 0| dws B

19 |24/08/19 15:27 | Genersl View 0| sxrvs | A
0 |24/08/19 15:27 | General View 0| wars | BB
21 |24/08/18 15:27 | Genersl View 0D wers | B
22 |24/08/19 15:27 | Genaeral View 0| wadwc | &
71 |24/08/19 15:27 | General View D wurc | B
Documentation 1 per page =]
No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Aute Consultants Pt Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print

1 |21/085/16 16:09 | ACKNOWLEDGEMENT EMAIL TO ITI DD 21.05.2019 Load POF

7 |21/U5/19 16:09 | TP ESTIMATE Load POF

3 |21/05/19 16:09 | TP GIA REPORT Load POF

4 |23/05/19 19:01 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Lead POF

5 |02/11/1909:47 | Emall to TP dd 310819 Load POF

Wo | Finalized On India International Tnsurance Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall | Frint

I |22/05/1905:01 | Singapors Accident Statement O | Load poF

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST neset | Save | P
There are no document checklists configured.

Our Chocklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid (HQ)

Show Remarks Te: L] Handiing Insurer
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Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregne 15se0r1s8m

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sun@ikkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

Page | of 4

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC4/1Il18008881/GPA3Q2
Date: 03/12/2019

REFERENCE

Handling Insurer: 612 Intemational Insurance Ple. pojey D1SMPC0001173

Claimant Insured Vehicle

Vehicle No : FBLS0O28B No : SLAB126M

DateofLoss:  14/05/2019 Nature of Claim: TP Ciaim - MPC2019D0000497

R Fi I

Reg No: FBL50288

Make & Model: YAMAHA FZN150, 149cc Engine No: G3IE3E0040868

Reg. Date: 07/11/2016 (Man. Year: 2016) Chassis No:  MEIRG1611G2001891

Colour: Black Odometer: 0 km

Engine Capacity: 140 ce

Markel Value/New Car

Price: .

Sum Insured (SS§): Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Steering (Serviceabla); Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 100/80-17 Rear Tyre Size: 140/80 R17
Froni Lefi Side: MRF 5 mm Rear Left Sida: MRF 5 mm
Froni Right Side: 0 mm Rear Righl Side: 0 mm
The above values represant the remaining fyre treads ceplh
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’s Differance  Diff %
Parts 1,437.00 1,182.20 244 B0 17.04
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 300.00 120.00 180.00 60.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 1,737.00 1,312.20 424.80 24.45
Approved Total (Overridden) [S§) 1,000.00
(S5) 1,737.00 1.000.00 737.00 4243
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 121.59 70.00 51.59 42.43
Mett Amount (SS) 1,858.59 1,070.00 788.59 42.43
Global Sum Settlement (S5) 0.00

INSPECTION
Dale of Assignment:

Date Inspected:

Estimated Period of Repair,

21/06/2019
21/05/2019 Inspacied At:

20 days

Looi's Motor Enterprise Ple. Lid. (HQ)
No 55 Kaki Bukit Place, Eunos

T

Singapore 416230

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 3/12/2019
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Adjuster: XING GUO QIANG Manager: CHEW HSIAD TONG

NOTE. Thia report represents our findiogs al the fme and place of inspection sialed herem. Such inspection has been camed ow! (o the Dasr of our
knowledge and abilty but any olher liabiity under any other circumstances s heraby sxpressly ascluded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 02 Dec 2019)

Parts: NIA YAMAHA FZN150 148cc (Model not available in database)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Slandard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for FBL5028B)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the prinl code (above) on all estimale pages. running page
' numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

i_Fl_l_l_'_I_!_t!l‘ Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are preficed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *HEADLIGHT ASSY Distorted 260.00FL *185.00FL
2 1 *METER ASSY Distorted 250.00FL *250.00 FL
3 1 *SET SIGNAL FRONT Distorted 80.00FL *45.00FL
4 1 *COWLING Missing 120.00FL *120.00FL
5 1 “STAY Missing 180.00FL *180.00FL
B 1 *HANDLEBAR Benl 110,00 FL “BS.00FL
7T 1 *LEVER CLUTCH Cut 45.00FL "28.00 FL
B 1 *SET HANDLE GRIP Cut 55,00FL *5500FL
8 1 *BAR END Cut B.OOFL *8.00FL
0 1 *SET MIRROR Cut 80.00FL *30.00 FL
"1 “LEVER BRAKE Bent 32.00FL *32.00FL
12 1 *TOP BOX SHADA4S Cut 252.00FS *180.00 FS
13 1 *INNER COWL Missing 80,00 FL *00.00FL
14 1 *NUMBER PLATE Missing 15.00F5 *15.00FS

F=Franchisa part. §=Spcett. L=ListitemDisc

Sub Total (S%) 1.567.00 1,303.00

- List Item Discount on L Iltems 10.00/10.00% (S5%) 130,00 110,80

Total Parts (S$) 1,437.00 1,192.20

Report was unsubmitted during this print-oul. |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 3/12/2019
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellanecus lems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Parliculars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 LABOUR New 300.00 120.00
Gross Labour Cost (55) 300.00 120.00

Repor was unsubmifted during this print-out.

< END QF ESTIMATES >
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